EB-2023-0198: 1: Elizabeth Thomas

COST CLAIM NUMBER SUBMISSION DEADLINE DATE CLAIM STATUS
2085 April 26, 2024 Submitted

EB# OTHER EB#S PHASE #*

EB-2023-0198: Facilities: Leave to Construct

(New): Hydro One Networks Inc.

INTERVENOR OMPANY* INTERVENOR TYPE

Thomas, Elizabeth; +1 (867) 675-5802 x.458 Gwayakocchigewin Limited Tax Exempt ethomas@oktlaw.com Partnership, Toronto: Partnership

HST RATE ONTARIO EXCHANGE RATE COUNTRY

HST NUMBER LATE SUBMISSION ALLOWED EXTENSION DEADLINE DATE

No

PARTICIPANTS Participant Total (\$) Claim Total New Non-Filing Participant First, Last Name **Filing Participant Status** Hours Yes 5.587.85 23.00 Patrick Boileau Submitted 5,859.05 30.50 No Groux, Gaëlle; +1 (867) Submitted 675-5808 Ggroux@oktlaw.com No 2,162.82 6.60 Guirguis, Cathy; +1 (416) Submitted 981-9341 cguirguis@oktlaw.com No 8,159.73 24.90 MacLaren, Oliver; +1 (416) Submitted 981-9330 omaclaren@oktlaw.com Yes Matthew McPherson 589.86 1.80 Submitted TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT/OTHER FEES TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS **TOTAL HST** 19.442.00 345.00 2.572.31 **TOTAL CLAIM** TOTAL AMOUNT AWARDED 22,359.31 TOTAL HOURS CLAIMED TOTAL HOURS DISALLOWED 86.80 **REASON FOR REASON FOR REASON FOR DISALLOWANCE - 2 DISALLOWANCE DISALLOWANCE - 3** MAKE CHEQUE PAYABLE TO Patrick Boileau SEND PAYMENT TO ADDRESS **ATTENTION** 90 Anemki Drive, Suite 200

90 Anemki Drive, Suite 200 Thunder Bay, ON P7J1L3

SUBMIT SECTION

I am a representative of the Party. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim. The costs incurred and time spent are directly related to the Party's participation in the OEB Process referred to above.

This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in section 6.05 and 6.09 of the OEB's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

The information (fees and disbursements) filed in this cost claim is complete and accurate and in accordance with the OEB's Practice Direction for Cost Awards and Appendix A, the Cost Awards Tariff.

SUBMITTED BY Gaelle Groux DATE SUBMITTED April 26, 2024

Patrick Boileau

CASE EB-2023-0198: Facilities: Leave to Construct (New): Hydro One

Networks Inc.

COST CLAIM EB-2023-0198:1: Elizabeth Thomas

INTERVENOR NAME Thomas, Elizabeth; +1 (867) 675-5802 x.458 ethomas@oktlaw.com

PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS Submitted

FILING PARTICIPANT

NEW PARTICIPANT Yes

NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME Patrick

NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME Boileau

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE*

Consultant

YEAR CALLED TO BAR*

COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF **RELEVANT EXPERIENCE*** **HOURLY RATE** 200

15

HST RATE CHARGED*

13.00

CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST)

CV Attached

LAST CV DATE

April 26, 2024

OVERRIDE HOURLY RATE

Yes

HST NUMBER

HEARINGS

CONSULTATIONS Yes

No

DISBURSEMENTS

Yes

HEARINGS

Hearings Hours Hearings Subtotal (\$) **Hearings Total Tax (\$)** Hearings Total (\$) 23.00 4,600.00 598.00 5,198.00

	<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	Sub Total	HST Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
DISC	OVERY Read and Research Application and Evidence		200		13.00		
	Preparation of Interrogatories		200		13.00		
	Review Interrogatory Responses		200		13.00		
	Technical Conference Preparation		200		13.00		
	Technical Conference Attendance		200		13.00		
	Technical Conference Follow-up		200		13.00		
	Subtotal of DISCOVERY	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
PROC	CEDURAL		200		40.00		
	Preparation of Issues List Submission		200		13.00		
	Attendance at Issues List Conference		200		13.00		
	Preparation for a Confidentiality Request		200		13.00		
	Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality		200		13.00		
	Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		200		13.00		
	Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		200		13.00		
	Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		200		13.00		
	Review Procedural Documents		200		13.00		

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	Sub Total	<u>HST</u> Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Subtotal of PROCEDURAL	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
INTERVENOR EVIDENCE Preparation of Intervenor Evidence	3.00	200	600.00	13.00	78.00	678.00
Interrogatory Responses	11.00	200	2,200.00	13.00	286.00	2,486.00
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE	14.00	200	2,800.00	13.00	364.00	3,164.00
SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE Preparation for Settlement Conference		200		13.00		
Attendance at Settlement Conference		200		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		200		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		200		13.00		
Subtotal of SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE WRITTEN ARGUMENT	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
Written Submissions	5.50	200	1,100.00	13.00	143.00	1,243.00
Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT	5.50		1,100.00		143.00	1,243.00
ORAL ARGUMENT Preparation for Oral Hearing		200		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		200		13.00		
Oral Submissions		200		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		200		13.00		
Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
DECISION Review Decision		200		13.00		
Review Rate/Accounting Order		200		13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order		200		13.00		
Subtotal of DECISION	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
OTHER Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor Conferences)	3.50	200	700.00	13.00	91.00	791.00
Subtotal of OTHER	3.50		700.00		91.00	791.00
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES Total Service Provider Fees	23.00		4,600.00		598.00	5,198.00

Attachments

<u>Attachment</u> **Document Type Import Message** CV

Patrick Boileau CV North Vista - March

2024.pdf

Patrick Boileau - North Vista invoices - Office

and Admin Expenses.pdf

Patrick Boileau - North Vista invoices - Office

and Admin Expenses.pdf

Invoice

Time Docket

DISBURSEMENTS

Disbursement	Disbursement	Other Taxes/Tips	Disbursement
Subtotal(\$)	Total Tax(\$)	Total(\$)	Total(\$)
345.00	44.85	0.00	389.85

<u>Name</u>	ATT. REQ'D	ATT. PROV	<u>Qty</u>	<u>\$/</u> Unit	<u>Net</u> Cost	HST Rate	<u>HST</u>	Other Taxes/Tip	<u>Total</u>	Rationale/ Comment
Scanning/Photocopy (Internal)						13.00				
Scanning/Photocopy (External)						13.00				
Printing (Internal)						13.00				
Printing (External)						13.00				
Courier						13.00				
Teleconference						13.00				
Travel: Air						13.00				
Travel: Car Rental						13.00				
Travel: Gas						13.00				
Travel: Car Mileage –				0.40						
Southern Ontario Travel: Car Mileage –				0.41						
Northern Ontario Travel: Rail						13.00				
Travel (Other)						13.00				
• •										
Parking						13.00				
Taxi						13.00				
Accommodation						13.00				
Other	Yes	Yes	1.00	345.00	345.00	13.00	44.85		389.85	Office and Admin
Total Disbursements:					345.00		44.85	0.00	389.85	Expenses

Attachments

<u>Attachment</u> <u>Import Message</u>

Patrick Boileau - North Vista invoices - Office and Admin Expenses.pdf

Disbursements highlighted in the attachment

.

Attachments General Attachments

Patrick Boileau CV North Vista - March 2024.pdf

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

Attachment Patrick Boileau - North Vista invoices - Office and Admin Expenses.pdf	Document Type	<u>Claim Type</u> Disbursements	Import Message Disbursements highlighted in the attachment
Patrick Boileau CV North Vista - March 2024.pdf	CV	Hearings	
Patrick Boileau - North Vista invoices - Office and Admin Expenses pdf	Invoice	Hearings	
Patrick Boileau - North Vista invoices - Office and Admin Expenses.pdf	Time Docket	Hearings	



o/a North Vista Advisors 875 Tungsten St Unit C Thunder Bay, Ontario P7B 6H2

INVOICE

Invoice No.: 666

Date: 01-18-2024

Sold to: Ship to:

Gwayakocchigewin LP

90 Anemki Drive Suite 200 Thunder Bay, ON

Thunder Bay, ON P7J 1L3

Gwayakocchigewin LP 90 Anemki Drive Suite 200

Thunder Bay, ON P7J 1L3

Business No.: 847193117RT0001

Unit	Quantity	Description	Unit Price	Tax	Amount
		Billing for Services December 2023 - S92 Leave to Construct			
Hour Hour	11	Patrick Boileau Ginny M.	200.0 110.0	0 H 0 H	2,200.00
		Expenses			
		Office & Admin expenses 7.5%		н	165.00
		Subtotal:			2,365.00
		H - HST 13% GST/HST			307.45
Shipped By:		Tracking Number:			
Comment:	Interest at 1	% per month (12% per annum) will be charged on accounts over 30 o	days. Tota	I Amount	2,672.45



o/a North Vista Advisors 875 Tungsten St Unit C Thunder Bay, Ontario P7B 6H2

INVOICE

678 Invoice No.:

Date: 02-28-2024

Sold to: Ship to:

Gwayakocchigewin LP

90 Anemki Drive Suite 200

Thunder Bay, ON P7J 1L3

Gwayakocchigewin LP 90 Anemki Drive Suite 200

Thunder Bay, ON P7J 1L3

Business No.: 847193117RT0001

Unit	Quantity	Description	Unit Price	Tax	Amount
		Services for Janaury 2024 - LP- S92 Leave to Construct			
Hour	3	Patrick Boileau	200.00	н	600.00
		Expenses			
		Office and Admin Expense 7.5%		Н	45.00
		Subtotal:			645.00
		H - HST 13% GST/HST			83.85
Shipped By:		Tracking Number:			
Comment:	Interest at 1	% per month (12% per annum) will be charged on accounts over 30 c	days. Total	Amount	728.85



o/a North Vista Advisors 875 Tungsten St Unit C Thunder Bay, Ontario P7B 6H2

INVOICE

Invoice No.: 688

Date: 03-19-2024

Sold to: Ship to:

Gwayakocchigewin LP

90 Anemki Drive Suite 200 Thunder Bay, ON

Thunder Bay, ON P7J 1L3

Gwayakocchigewin LP 90 Anemki Drive Suite 200

Thunder Bay, ON P7J 1L3

Business No.: 847193117RT0001

Unit	Quantity	Description	Unit Price	Tax	Amount
		Billing for Services February 2024 - S92 Leave to Construct			
Hour Hour	5.5	Patrick Boileau Erin S.	200.00 95.00	H H	1,100.00
		Expenses			
		Office & Admin expenses 7.5%		н	82.50
		Subtotal:			1,182.50
		H - HST 13% GST/HST			153.73
Shipped By:		Tracking Number:			
Comment:	Interest at 1	% per month (12% per annum) will be charged on accounts over 30 o	days. Total	Amount	1,336.23
Sold By:					



o/a North Vista Advisors 875 Tungsten St Unit C Thunder Bay, Ontario P7B 6H2

INVOICE

Invoice No.: 691

Date: 04-24-2024

Total Amount

850.33

Sold to: Ship to:

Gwayakocchigewin LP

90 Anemki Drive Suite 200 Thunder Bay, ON

Thunder Bay, ON P7J 1L3

Gwayakocchigewin LP 90 Anemki Drive Suite 200

Thunder Bay, ON P7J 1L3

Business No.: 847193117RT0001

Comment:

Sold By:

Unit	Quantity	Description	Unit Price	Tax	Amount
		Billing for Services March & April 2024 - S92 Leave to Construct			
		March 2024			
our	1.5	Patrick Boileau	200.00	Н	300.00
lour	2.0	April 2024 Patrick Boileau	200.00	Н	400.00
		Expenses			
		Office & Admin expenses 7.5%		н	<mark>52.50</mark>
		Subtotal:			752.50
		H - HST 13% GST/HST			97.83
hipped By:		Tracking Number:			

Interest at 1% per month (12% per annum) will be charged on accounts over 30 days.



o/a North Vista Advisors 875 Tungsten St Unit C Thunder Bay, Ontario P7B 6H2

INVOICE

Invoice No.: 666

Date: 01-18-2024

Sold to: Ship to:

Gwayakocchigewin LP

90 Anemki Drive Suite 200 Thunder Bay, ON

Thunder Bay, ON P7J 1L3

Gwayakocchigewin LP 90 Anemki Drive Suite 200

Thunder Bay, ON P7J 1L3

Business No.: 847193117RT0001

Unit	Quantity	Description	Unit Price	Tax	Amount
		Billing for Services December 2023 - S92 Leave to Construct			
Hour Hour	11	Patrick Boileau Ginny M.	200.0 110.0	0 H 0 H	2,200.00
		Expenses			
		Office & Admin expenses 7.5%		н	165.00
		Subtotal:			2,365.00
		H - HST 13% GST/HST			307.45
Shipped By:		Tracking Number:			
Comment:	Interest at 1	% per month (12% per annum) will be charged on accounts over 30 o	days. Tota	I Amount	2,672.45



o/a North Vista Advisors 875 Tungsten St Unit C Thunder Bay, Ontario P7B 6H2

INVOICE

678 Invoice No.:

Date: 02-28-2024

Sold to: Ship to:

Gwayakocchigewin LP

90 Anemki Drive Suite 200

Thunder Bay, ON P7J 1L3

Gwayakocchigewin LP 90 Anemki Drive Suite 200

Thunder Bay, ON P7J 1L3

Business No.: 847193117RT0001

Unit	Quantity	Description	Unit Price	Tax	Amount
		Services for Janaury 2024 - LP- S92 Leave to Construct			
Hour	3	Patrick Boileau	200.00	н	600.00
		Expenses			
		Office and Admin Expense 7.5%		Н	45.00
		Subtotal:			645.00
		H - HST 13% GST/HST			83.85
Shipped By:		Tracking Number:			
Comment:	Interest at 1	% per month (12% per annum) will be charged on accounts over 30 c	days. Total	Amount	728.85



o/a North Vista Advisors 875 Tungsten St Unit C Thunder Bay, Ontario P7B 6H2

INVOICE

Invoice No.: 688

Date: 03-19-2024

Sold to: Ship to:

Gwayakocchigewin LP

90 Anemki Drive Suite 200 Thunder Bay, ON

Thunder Bay, ON P7J 1L3

Gwayakocchigewin LP 90 Anemki Drive Suite 200

Thunder Bay, ON P7J 1L3

Business No.: 847193117RT0001

Unit	Quantity	Description	Unit Price	Tax	Amount
		Billing for Services February 2024 - S92 Leave to Construct			
Hour Hour	5.5	Patrick Boileau Erin S.	200.00 95.00	H H	1,100.00
		Expenses			
		Office & Admin expenses 7.5%		н	82.50
		Subtotal:			1,182.50
		H - HST 13% GST/HST			153.73
Shipped By:		Tracking Number:			
Comment:	Interest at 1	% per month (12% per annum) will be charged on accounts over 30 o	days. Total	Amount	1,336.23
Sold By:					



o/a North Vista Advisors 875 Tungsten St Unit C Thunder Bay, Ontario P7B 6H2

INVOICE

Invoice No.: 691

Date: 04-24-2024

Total Amount

850.33

Sold to: Ship to:

Gwayakocchigewin LP

90 Anemki Drive Suite 200 Thunder Bay, ON

Thunder Bay, ON P7J 1L3

Gwayakocchigewin LP 90 Anemki Drive Suite 200

Thunder Bay, ON P7J 1L3

Business No.: 847193117RT0001

Comment:

Sold By:

Unit	Quantity	Description	Unit Price	Tax	Amount
		Billing for Services March & April 2024 - S92 Leave to Construct			
		March 2024			
our	1.5	Patrick Boileau	200.00	Н	300.00
lour	2.0	April 2024 Patrick Boileau	200.00	Н	400.00
		Expenses			
		Office & Admin expenses 7.5%		н	<mark>52.50</mark>
		Subtotal:			752.50
		H - HST 13% GST/HST			97.83
hipped By:		Tracking Number:			

Interest at 1% per month (12% per annum) will be charged on accounts over 30 days.



Patrick Boileau HBA, MSRE President – North Vista Advisors

Patrick grew up in Sudbury and received his Honours Degree in Business Administration from Wilfrid Laurier University. He worked at Brookfield Asset Management for several years, including two years in Brazil with the company's real estate and power development groups.

Patrick then completed his master's degree in real estate finance at the University of Florida.

Patrick spent several years in Toronto working in the real estate, and strategic investments groups at OMERS, a \$60 billion pension fund for Ontario municipal employees. Patrick was involved with the acquisitions of commercial properties, an engineering company, and two airports in Costa Rica. Patrick managed several interests for the pension fund including a significant holding in Porter Airlines.

Patrick also represented OMERS as a board member for ADC & HAS, an airport investment and management company based in Houston. The company completed several acquisitions and had a mandate to make \$150 million in airport investments throughout Latin America over a five-year period.

Patrick moved to Thunder Bay in 2010 to advise Goldcorp on various energy supply and infrastructure projects in Northern Ontario. He advised Goldcorp on the Red Lake Gas Pipeline Project, a \$40 million, 104 km pipeline to bring natural gas service to the residents, businesses, and industries of Red Lake. The project was commissioned in October 2012.

Patrick was also a founding Board Member for Wataynikaneyap Power and continues to act as a consultant to the 24 First Nation partnership. This project is currently being developed by a 24 First Nation partnership with Fortis Inc. The \$1.8 billion project is now under construction, with an expected completion in mid 2024. Patrick was also the project manager on the \$60 million Pikangikum Powerline Project, completed in 2018.

Patrick is currently acts as the Implementation Officer of the 8 First Nation partnership "Gwayakocchigewin LP" on the Waasigan Transmission Line Project, a \$1.2 billion transmission line project between Thunder Bay and Dryden. This project is being developed in partnership with Hydro One.



Patrick Boileau HBA, MSRE President – North Vista Advisors

Patrick grew up in Sudbury and received his Honours Degree in Business Administration from Wilfrid Laurier University. He worked at Brookfield Asset Management for several years, including two years in Brazil with the company's real estate and power development groups.

Patrick then completed his master's degree in real estate finance at the University of Florida.

Patrick spent several years in Toronto working in the real estate, and strategic investments groups at OMERS, a \$60 billion pension fund for Ontario municipal employees. Patrick was involved with the acquisitions of commercial properties, an engineering company, and two airports in Costa Rica. Patrick managed several interests for the pension fund including a significant holding in Porter Airlines.

Patrick also represented OMERS as a board member for ADC & HAS, an airport investment and management company based in Houston. The company completed several acquisitions and had a mandate to make \$150 million in airport investments throughout Latin America over a five-year period.

Patrick moved to Thunder Bay in 2010 to advise Goldcorp on various energy supply and infrastructure projects in Northern Ontario. He advised Goldcorp on the Red Lake Gas Pipeline Project, a \$40 million, 104 km pipeline to bring natural gas service to the residents, businesses, and industries of Red Lake. The project was commissioned in October 2012.

Patrick was also a founding Board Member for Wataynikaneyap Power and continues to act as a consultant to the 24 First Nation partnership. This project is currently being developed by a 24 First Nation partnership with Fortis Inc. The \$1.8 billion project is now under construction, with an expected completion in mid 2024. Patrick was also the project manager on the \$60 million Pikangikum Powerline Project, completed in 2018.

Patrick is currently acts as the Implementation Officer of the 8 First Nation partnership "Gwayakocchigewin LP" on the Waasigan Transmission Line Project, a \$1.2 billion transmission line project between Thunder Bay and Dryden. This project is being developed in partnership with Hydro One.



o/a North Vista Advisors 875 Tungsten St Unit C Thunder Bay, Ontario P7B 6H2

INVOICE

Invoice No.: 666

Date: 01-18-2024

Sold to: Ship to:

Gwayakocchigewin LP

90 Anemki Drive Suite 200 Thunder Bay, ON

Thunder Bay, ON P7J 1L3

Gwayakocchigewin LP 90 Anemki Drive Suite 200

Thunder Bay, ON P7J 1L3

Business No.: 847193117RT0001

Unit	Quantity	Description	Unit Price	Tax	Amount
		Billing for Services December 2023 - S92 Leave to Construct			
Hour Hour	11	Patrick Boileau Ginny M.	200.0 110.0	0 H 0 H	2,200.00
		Expenses			
		Office & Admin expenses 7.5%		н	165.00
		Subtotal:			2,365.00
		H - HST 13% GST/HST			307.45
Shipped By:		Tracking Number:			
Comment:	Interest at 1	% per month (12% per annum) will be charged on accounts over 30 o	days. Tota	I Amount	2,672.45



o/a North Vista Advisors 875 Tungsten St Unit C Thunder Bay, Ontario P7B 6H2

INVOICE

678 Invoice No.:

Date: 02-28-2024

Sold to: Ship to:

Gwayakocchigewin LP

90 Anemki Drive Suite 200

Thunder Bay, ON P7J 1L3

Gwayakocchigewin LP 90 Anemki Drive Suite 200

Thunder Bay, ON P7J 1L3

Business No.: 847193117RT0001

Unit	Quantity	Description	Unit Price	Tax	Amount
		Services for Janaury 2024 - LP- S92 Leave to Construct			
Hour	3	Patrick Boileau	200.00	н	600.00
		Expenses			
		Office and Admin Expense 7.5%		Н	45.00
		Subtotal:			645.00
		H - HST 13% GST/HST			83.85
Shipped By:		Tracking Number:			
Comment:	Interest at 1	% per month (12% per annum) will be charged on accounts over 30 c	days. Total	Amount	728.85



o/a North Vista Advisors 875 Tungsten St Unit C Thunder Bay, Ontario P7B 6H2

INVOICE

Invoice No.: 688

Date: 03-19-2024

Sold to: Ship to:

Gwayakocchigewin LP

90 Anemki Drive Suite 200 Thunder Bay, ON

Thunder Bay, ON P7J 1L3

Gwayakocchigewin LP 90 Anemki Drive Suite 200

Thunder Bay, ON P7J 1L3

Business No.: 847193117RT0001

Unit	Quantity	Description	Unit Price	Tax	Amount
		Billing for Services February 2024 - S92 Leave to Construct			
Hour Hour	5.5	Patrick Boileau Erin S.	200.00 95.00	H H	1,100.00
		Expenses			
		Office & Admin expenses 7.5%		н	82.50
		Subtotal:			1,182.50
		H - HST 13% GST/HST			153.73
Shipped By:		Tracking Number:			
Comment:	Interest at 1	% per month (12% per annum) will be charged on accounts over 30 o	days. Total	Amount	1,336.23
Sold By:					



o/a North Vista Advisors 875 Tungsten St Unit C Thunder Bay, Ontario P7B 6H2

INVOICE

Invoice No.: 691

Date: 04-24-2024

Total Amount

850.33

Sold to: Ship to:

Gwayakocchigewin LP

90 Anemki Drive Suite 200 Thunder Bay, ON

Thunder Bay, ON P7J 1L3

Gwayakocchigewin LP 90 Anemki Drive Suite 200

Thunder Bay, ON P7J 1L3

Business No.: 847193117RT0001

Comment:

Sold By:

Unit	Quantity	Description	Unit Price	Tax	Amount
		Billing for Services March & April 2024 - S92 Leave to Construct			
		March 2024			
our	1.5	Patrick Boileau	200.00	Н	300.00
lour	2.0	April 2024 Patrick Boileau	200.00	Н	400.00
		Expenses			
		Office & Admin expenses 7.5%		н	<mark>52.50</mark>
		Subtotal:			752.50
		H - HST 13% GST/HST			97.83
hipped By:		Tracking Number:			

Interest at 1% per month (12% per annum) will be charged on accounts over 30 days.

CASE

EB-2023-0198: Facilities: Leave to Construct (New): Hydro One Networks Inc.

COST CLAIM

EB-2023-0198 : 1 : Elizabeth Thomas

INTERVENOR NAME

Thomas, Elizabeth; +1 (867) 675-5802 x.458 ethomas@oktlaw.com

PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS

Submitted

FILING PARTICIPANT

Groux , Gaëlle; +1 (867) 675-5808 Ggroux@oktlaw.com NEW

PARTICIPANT

Nο

NON-FILING

PARTICIPANT F. NAME

NON-FILING

PARTICIPANT L. NAME

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE*

Legal Counsel

YEAR CALLED TO BAR*

2022

COMPLETED YEARS
PRACTICING/YEARS OF
RELEVANT EXPERIENCE*

1

HST RATE CHARGED*

13.00

CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST)

CV Attached

LAST CV DATE

April 25, 2024

OVERRIDE HOURLY RATE

HOURLY RATE

170

No

HST NUMBER

HEARINGS

Yes

CONSULTATIONS

No

DISBURSEMENTS

No

HEARINGS

Hearings Hours

Hearings Subtotal (\$)

Hearings Total Tax (\$) 674.05 Hearings Total (\$)

	30.50	5,185.00		674.05			5,859.05
	<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	Sub Total	<u>HST</u> Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
DISC	OVERY Read and Research Application and Evidence Preparation of Interrogatories	11.30	170 170	1,921.00	13.00 13.00	249.73	2,170.73
	Review Interrogatory Responses		170		13.00		
	Technical Conference Preparation		170		13.00		
	Technical Conference Attendance		170		13.00		
	Technical Conference Follow-up		170		13.00		
	Subtotal of DISCOVERY	11.30		1,921.00		249.73	2,170.73
PRO	Preparation of Issues List Submission Attendance at Issues List Conference Preparation for a Confidentiality Reque Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		170 170 170 170 170		13.00 13.00 13.00 13.00 13.00		
	Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		170		13.00		
	Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		170		13.00		
	Review Procedural Documents		170		13.00		

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly</u> <u>Rate</u>	Sub Total	HST Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Subtotal of PROCEDURAL	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
INTERVENOR EVIDENCE Preparation of Intervenor Evidence	0.90	170	153.00	13.00	19.89	172.89
Interrogatory Responses	9.00	170	1,530.00	13.00	198.90	1,728.90
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE	9.90	170	1,683.00	13.00	218.79	1,901.79
SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE	0.00		1,000.00		2100	1,0010
Preparation for Settlement Conference		170		13.00		
Attendance at Settlement Conference		170		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		170		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		170		13.00		
Subtotal of SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE WRITTEN ARGUMENT	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
Written Submissions	2.00	170	340.00	13.00	44.20	384.20
Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT	2.00		340.00		44.20	384.20
ORAL ARGUMENT Preparation for Oral Hearing		170		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		170		13.00		
Oral Submissions		170		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		170		13.00		
Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
DECISION						
Review Decision		170		13.00		
Review Rate/Accounting Order		170		13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order		170		13.00		
Subtotal of DECISION	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
OTHER Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor Conferences)	7.30	170	1,241.00	13.00	161.33	1,402.33
Subtotal of OTHER	7.30		1,241.00		161.33	1,402.33
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES Total Service Provider Fees	30.50		5,185.00		674.05	5,859.05

Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>

OEB Time Docket.pdf 83946U_Certificate of Standing_EN_2024-01-18.pdf **Document Type**

Time Docket CV

Import Message

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

<u>Attachment</u> <u>Document Type</u> <u>Claim Type</u> <u>Import Message</u>

OEB Time Docket.pdf Time Docket Hearings

83946U_Certificate of CV Hearings Standing_EN_2024-01-18.pdf

CONTACTFULLNAME	AMOUNT	BILLABLE HOURS	DATE	EARNER	EXPLANATION	INFO	INVOICE #	HOURS WORKED		
	•	•	•	•	DISCOVERY		•			
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 242.50	0.50	8/25/2023	ОМ	Email from P. Boileau re: Intervenor Application and reviewing leave to construct documents	FEE: OM 0.50 Hrs @ 485.00	40451	0.50	OM: O	Gaëlle Groux liver MacLaren Cathy Gurguis
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 1,455.00	3.00	8/29/2023	ОМ	Email from P. Boileau re: OEB Intervention; Reviewing Regulatory Filings; Email to Gaelle Groux re: Application required; Telephone with G. Groux re: Same; Reviewing past Intervention precedents; Emails to C. Guirguis re: Supervision	FEE: OM 3.00 Hrs @ 485.00	40451	3.00	MM: Mat	thew McPherson
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 174.00	0.60	8/29/2023	GG	Introductory Call with O. MacLaren.	FEE: GG 0.60 Hrs @ 290.00	40451	0.60		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 194.00	0.40	8/31/2023	ОМ	Emails from G. Groux re: Deadline for Intervention Application and Workplan for submission	FEE: OM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	40451	0.40		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 348.00	1.20	8/31/2023	GG	Researching rules for intervening in OEB procedures.	FEE: GG 1.20 Hrs @ 290.00	40451	1.20		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 97.00	0.20	9/1/2023	CG	Emails re precedent leave to intervene applications.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	0.20		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 638.00	2.20	9/1/2023	GG	Reading OEB submission documents and creating workplan for OEB intervenor submissions.	FEE: GG 2.20 Hrs @ 290.00	40893	2.20		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 388.00	0.80	9/5/2023	ОМ	Reviewing G. Groux emails; comments on workplan	FEE: OM 0.80 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	0.80		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 388.00	0.80	9/7/2023	ОМ	Email from P. Boileau re: Update on filing and reply re: Same; Reviewing G. Groux updates	FEE: OM 0.80 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	0.80		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 58.00	0.20	9/7/2023	GG	Correspondence with O. MacLaren about question for P. Boileau.	FEE: GG 0.20 Hrs @ 290.00	40893	0.20		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 203.00	0.70	9/8/2023	GG	Looking for documents about GLP FN traditional territories and impact of the line on the territories.	FEE: GG 0.70 Hrs @ 290.00	40694	0.70		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 290.00	1.00	9/10/2023	GG	Drafting OEB intervenor status request for GLP.	FEE: GG 1.00 Hrs @ 290.00	40893	1.00		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 582.00	1.20	9/11/2023	ОМ	Email from Gaelle and emails to P. Boileau re: Intervenor Application; Review and revise same; Review OEB rules	FEE: OM 1.20 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	1.20		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 48.50	0.10	9/12/2023	CG	Emails re preparing intervenor application.	FEE: CG 0.10 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	0.10		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 291.00	0.60	9/12/2023	ОМ	Emails re: Outstanding questions for the intervenor application; Email to P. Boileau re: LDML	FEE: OM 0.60 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	0.60		

Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	116.00	0.40	9/13/2023	GG	Drafting GLP's request for intervenor status in OEB hearing.	FEE: GG 0.40 Hrs @ 290.00	40694	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	194.00	0.40	9/14/2023	ОМ	Emails from Gaelle re: Filing Application and Project Impacts; Email to M. Pelletier re: Protection Committee studies	FEE: OM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	957.00	3.30	9/14/2023	GG	Draft GLP Intervenor Status submissions to OEB for Waasigan Project Leave to Construct	FEE: GG 3.30 Hrs @ 290.00	40694	3.30	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	116.00	0.40	9/14/2023	GG	Meeting with C. Laidlaw to understand GLP corporate structure and agreements.	FEE: GG 0.40 Hrs @ 290.00	40694	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	873.00	1.80	9/15/2023	ОМ	Reviewing final application and Rules for Intervention; Revising Same; Emails to Gaelle re: Submission	FEE: OM 1.80 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	1.80	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	145.00	0.50	9/15/2023	GG	Reviewing GLP Submissions to OEB	FEE: GG 0.50 Hrs @ 290.00	40694	0.50	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	9/18/2023	ОМ	Email to G. Groux and C. Guirguis re: Filing Instructions	FEE: OM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	203.00	0.70	9/19/2023	GG	Reviewing Patrick Boileau's comments and submitting the application for intervenor status.	FEE: GG 0.70 Hrs @ 290.00	40893	0.70	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	582.00	1.20	9/20/2023	CG	Reviewing revisions to application, emails with G Groux re same, reviewing emails with client.	FEE: CG 1.20 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	1.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	194.00	0.40	9/21/2023	ОМ	Reviewing Intervention Form from OEB; Emails to G. Groux re: Same	FEE: OM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	29.00	0.10	10/3/2023	GG	Correspondence with C. Guirguis.	FEE: GG 0.10 Hrs @ 290.00	41251	0.10	
	1	,			•	INTERVENOR EVIDENCE		•		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	291.00	0.60	11/10/2023	CG	Reviewing OEB procedural order.	FEE: CG 0.60 Hrs @ 485.00	41251	0.60	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	48.50	0.10	11/13/2023	CG	Emails re OEB procedural order.	FEE: CG 0.10 Hrs @ 485.00	41251	0.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	11/13/2023	ОМ	Email to G. Groux; Email to C. Guirguis re: Intervenor	FEE: OM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41251	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	29.00	0.10	11/13/2023	GG	Correspondence with C. Guirguis and O. MacLaren.	FEE: GG 0.10 Hrs @ 290.00	41251	0.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	48.50	0.10	11/14/2023	CG	Emails re summary of order and scheduling discussion.	FEE: CG 0.10 Hrs @ 485.00	41251	0.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	11/17/2023	ОМ	Emails re: Internal Call to review participation	FEE: OM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41251	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	291.00	0.60	11/20/2023	CG	Reviewing procedural order, meeting with G Groux and O McLaren re next steps on file.	FEE: CG 0.60 Hrs @ 485.00	41251	0.60	

Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 97.00	0.20	11/20/2023	ОМ	Emails re: Intervenor Submission Plans	FEE: OM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41251	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 319.00	1.10	11/20/2023	GG	Meeting with O. MacLaren and C. Guirguis to discuss OEB interrogatories	FEE: GG 1.10 Hrs @ 290.00	41251	1.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 48.50	0.10	11/21/2023	CG	Emails from G Groux, and P Boileau re interrogatories.	FEE: CG 0.10 Hrs @ 485.00	41251	0.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 58.00	0.20	11/21/2023	GG	Correspondence with P. Boileau	FEE: GG 0.20 Hrs @ 290.00	41251	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 841.00	2.90	11/22/2023	GG	Reviewing OEB Documents and developing interrogatories.	FEE: GG 2.90 Hrs @ 290.00	41251	2.90	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 377.00	1.30	11/23/2023	GG	Document Review of OEB documents in Hydro One's Waasigan Line Application	FEE: GG 1.30 Hrs @ 290.00	41251	1.30	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 194.00	0.40	11/28/2023	CG	Reviewing email from G. Groux re interrogatories, reviewing procedural order re extended deadlines, email re checking in with client.	FEE: CG 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	41251	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 58.00	0.20	11/28/2023	GG	Correspondence with C. Guirguis about OEB Interrogatories	FEE: GG 0.20 Hrs @ 290.00	41251	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 48.50	0.10	12/1/2023	CG	Emails re interrogatories.	FEE: CG 0.10 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 232.00	0.80	12/1/2023	GG	Reviewing OEB Interrogatories and e-mail to Patrick Boileau.	FEE: GG 0.80 Hrs @ 290.00	41509	0.80	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 145.50	0.30	12/5/2023	ОМ	Emails re: Interrogatories	FEE: OM 0.30 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.30	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 87.00	0.30	12/5/2023	GG	Meeting with C. Guirguis about Intervenor Submissions.	FEE: GG 0.30 Hrs @ 290.00	41509	0.30	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 97.00	0.20	12/6/2023	CG	Emails re interrogatories, reviewing same, response to O. MacLaren.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 194.00	0.40	12/6/2023	ОМ	Emails re: LTC Hearing	FEE: OM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 97.00	0.20	12/7/2023	CG	Emails re interrogatories, discussion re next steps.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 97.00	0.20	12/7/2023	ОМ	Emails re: LTC Hearing	FEE: OM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 97.00	0.20	12/10/2023	ОМ	Emails from G. Groux re: OEB Rules for Intervenors	FEE: OM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 464.00	1.60	12/10/2023	GG	Correspondence with O. MacLaren and C. Guirguis; research on OEB Rules.	FEE: GG 1.60 Hrs @ 290.00	41509	1.60	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 291.00	0.60	12/14/2023	ОМ	Emails re: OEB regulatory Process; Response to P. Boileau re: Same;	FEE: OM 0.60 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.60	

	_			1	1					
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	291.00	0.60	12/19/2023	ОМ	Reviewing Hydro One Interrogatory response to OEB, NOTL, Larry Richard; Correspondence with P. Boileau re: Same	FEE: OM 0.60 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.60	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	58.00	0.20	12/19/2023	GG	Reviewing regulatory affairs documents	FEE: GG 0.20 Hrs @ 290.00	41509	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	87.00	0.30	12/20/2023	GG	Reviewing new rules for licensing exemptions	FEE: GG 0.30 Hrs @ 290.00	41509	0.30	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	12/21/2023	ОМ	Email from G. Groux re: IESO exemption from Licensing Requirements	FEE: OM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	194.00	0.40	1/10/2024	ОМ	Reviewing L. Richards email re: adequacy of HONI responses	FEE: OM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	41840	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	194.00	0.40	1/16/2024	ОМ	Reviewing IESO response to Interrogatories	FEE: OM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	41840	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	87.00	0.30	1/21/2024	GG	Correspondence with OEB, O. MacLaren and C. Guirguis	FEE: GG 0.30 Hrs @ 290.00	41840	0.30	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	1/22/2024	ОМ	Email from G. Groux re: Request to Submit evidence and reply re: Same	FEE: OM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41840	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	1/23/2024	CG	Emails re submitting evidence.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41840	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	116.00	0.40	1/23/2024	GG	Correspondence with C. Guirguis and O. MacLaren.	FEE: GG 0.40 Hrs @ 290.00	41840	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	194.00	0.40	1/24/2024	ОМ	Emails with G. Groux re: Filing Evidence	FEE: OM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	41840	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	58.00	0.20	1/25/2024	GG	File OEB documents, review e-mails from O. Maclaren	FEE: GG 0.20 Hrs @ 290.00	41840	0.20	
		l				WRITTEN SUBMISSIONS			1	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	2/5/2024	CG	Reviewing correspondence from parties, procedural order from OEB, emails with G. Groux.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	42039	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	145.00	0.50	2/16/2024	GG	Correspondence with Oliver and Cathy about OEB submissions for GLP	FEE: GG 0.50 Hrs @ 290.00	42039	0.50	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	2/16/2024	CG	Reviewing emails from G Groux, reviewing procedural order, email re same to G Groux and O MacLaren.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	42039	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	194.00	0.40	2/16/2024	ОМ	Emails with G. Groux re: Procedural Order and HONI Agreements	FEE: OM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	42039	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	435.00	1.50	2/18/2024	GG	Summarizing HONI argument-in-chief and possible outline of GLP arguments.	FEE: GG 1.50 Hrs @ 290.00	42039	1.50	

Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	630.50	1.30	2/19/2024	ОМ	Reviewing emails and Gaelle summary of argument in Chief; Slack with C. Guirguis re: Same; Drafting email to P. Boileau re: Recommendation on making a submission	FEE: OM 1.30 Hrs @ 485.00	42039	1.30	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	2/21/2024	CG	Emails re filing letter re submissions, confer with O. MacLaren; messages with G Prokos re same.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	42039	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	485.00	1.00	2/21/2024	ОМ	Drafting submission to OEB and Emails with C. Guirguis and G. Prokos re: Same	FEE: OM 1.00 Hrs @ 485.00	42039	1.00	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	48.50	0.10	3/4/2024	CG	Emails re intervenor submissions, email from O. MacLaren re next steps.	FEE: CG 0.10 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	194.00	0.40	3/4/2024	ОМ	Email to G. Groux Re: reviewing applicant and intervenor submissions, researching law, and internal conference regarding proposed response	FEE: OM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	580.00	2.00	3/8/2024	GG	Drafting response to Submissions.	FEE: GG 2.00 Hrs @ 290.00	42334	2.00	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	291.00	0.60	3/8/2024	ОМ	Emails re: Hydro One reply to Submission; Reviewing Same	FEE: OM 0.60 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.60	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	388.00	0.80	3/11/2024	ОМ	Email from P. Boileau re: Submissions; Reviewing Same and Reply	FEE: OM 0.80 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.80	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	679.00	1.40	3/12/2024	ОМ	Reviewing and Revising G. Groux and email to P. Boileau re: Same; Emails re: Process for filing cost claims	FEE: OM 1.40 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	1.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	194.00	0.40	3/15/2024	ММ	Emails with O. MacLaren re assertions. Review submissions re same.	FEE: MM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	194.00	0.40	3/20/2024	CG	Emails re intervenor submissions and providing reply, reviewing summary of submissions, email with O MacLaren re next steps.	FEE: CG 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$:	1,067.00	2.20	3/20/2024	ОМ	Conference with G. Groux re intervenor submissions; Conference with M. McPherson re: Strategy; Update to C. Guirguis and instructions to g. Groux	FEE: OM 2.20 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	2.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	145.00	0.50	3/21/2024	GG	Researching Hearing Process for OEB Waasigan Leave to Construct Application.	FEE: GG 0.50 Hrs @ 290.00	42334	0.50	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	291.00	0.60	3/21/2024	ОМ	Update email to G. Groux re: submission requirements	FEE: OM 0.60 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.60	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	582.00	1.20	3/22/2024	ММ	Discussion with O. MacLaren re intervenor submissions	FEE: MM 1.20 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	1.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	3/22/2024	ОМ	Emails re: intervenor submissions; Instructions to G.	FEE: OM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.20	

Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 101.00	0.20	4/16/2024	CG	Emails re final decision from OEB, reviewing order.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 505.00		0.20	
					DECISION				
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 270.00	0.90	4/24/2024	GG		FEE: GG 0.90 Hrs @ 300.00		0.90	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 150.00	0.50	4/22/2024	GG	Working on cost claim submissions	FEE: GG 0.50 Hrs @ 300.00		0.50	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 50.50	0.10	4/17/2024	CG	Emails re submitting costs claims.	FEE: CG 0.10 Hrs @ 505.00		0.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 120.00	0.40	4/8/2024	GG	Researching OEB cost claim rules, and assigning some work to E. Thomas (assistant).	FEE: GG 0.40 Hrs @ 300.00		0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 101.00	0.20	4/1/2024	CG	Email from O. MacLaren and reviewing attached letter, email re same to G. Groux.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 505.00		0.20	
					OTHER ATTENDANCE				
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 48.50	0.10	3/28/2024	CG	Email from O. MacLaren re instructions from client re submissions.	FEE: CG 0.10 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 97.00	0.20	3/27/2024	CG	Reviewing OEB letter re procedural direction, email to G. Groux and O. MacLaren re same.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 388.00	0.80	3/26/2024	ОМ	Internal conference regarding proposed response; Reply to G. Groux re: Same and Email to P. Boileau	FEE: OM 0.80 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.80	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 97.00	0.20	3/26/2024	MM	Emails with G. Groux and O. MacLaren re letter to OEB.	FEE: MM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 145.50	0.30	3/26/2024	CG	Reviewing and comment on draft submissions and letter to OEB, email to G. Groux and O. MacLaren re same.	FEE: CG 0.30 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.30	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 291.00	0.60	3/25/2024	ОМ	Instructions to G. Groux re: internal conference regarding proposed response	FEE: OM 0.60 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.60	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 580.00	2.00	3/25/2024	GG	Researching Law and drafting letter	FEE: GG 2.00 Hrs @ 290.00	42334	2.00	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 48.50	0.10	3/25/2024	CG	Reviewing emails re submissions to OEB.	FEE: CG 0.10 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 290.00	1.00	3/24/2024	GG	Draft letter to OEB Registry RE intervenor submissions	FEE: GG 1.00 Hrs @ 290.00	42334	1.00	



The applicant:

in a practising status; or

(i)

c)

CERTIFICATE OF STANDING

I CERTIFY THAT our records indicate the following about:										
Name:	Gaëlle	Murni N	laira Groux ("the applicant")							
Addres	ss: 4902	2 49th St	treet 3rd Floor PO Box 1470 Yellowknife	NT X1A 2P1						
Our re	cords	date bad	ck to the applicant's original date of lie	cence unless other	rwise noted here:					
1.	Call a	nd Adn	nission:							
	a)	The ap	plicant was:							
admitted/licensed as a lawyer in this jurisdiction on March 31, 2022										
re-admitted/relicensed on after having ceased to be a lawyer member this jurisdiction on If re-admitted/relicensed, please explain circumstance										
	b)	To the best of our knowledge, the applicant is or has been a member of the Law Society in the following Canadian jurisdictions:								
		Provi	nce/Territory	Dates						
2.	Prese	nt Stat	us:							
	a)	The ap	plicant:							
		(i) ⊠ is a lawyer member of this Law Society today; or								
		• •	is not a member of this Law Society to since The applicant ceased to be reason(s):							
	b)	The applicant:								
			⊠ is not in arrears of any fees, costs, ch Law Society; or	arges or other amo	unts owing to the					
		(ii)	is in arrears as follows:							
			Nature of arrears	Owed since	Amount owing					

☑ is entitled/authorized to practise law in this jurisdiction and is currently

		(ii) is not entitled/authorized to practise law in this jurisdiction for the follow reason(s):								
	d)				r the Law Society's liability in ne terms and conditions of th					
3.	Profe	essional Co	onduct	Record:						
	a)	Complain	ts: the f	ollowing numbe	r of complaint files are open:	None ⊠ or				
	b)	Competency: the applicant has had the following conditions or restrictions imposed as a result of a competency review: None or								
	c)	Formal Disciplinary Proceedings: the applicant is or has been the subject of the following formal disciplinary proceedings (ongoing or concluded when there is a finding against the applicant): None or								
		Date	Nature of case and finding			Disposition				
4.	Custo (i) (ii)		licant h	as not been the	subject of a custodianship o	• '				
F	Duna	tion Conditi	•	n d Doctriction						
5.				nd Restriction	onditions or restrictions:	None ⊠ or				
	Date			e of conditions	Duration					
	Date	•	Nature	e or conditions	or restrictions	to				
6.	Perso		To the		vledge, the following are the saffecting the applicant.					
		Date		Place/ Jurisdiction	Charge	Disposition				
		Any current charges brought to the Society's attention would be reported in section 3(a).								

Any convictions resulting in disciplinary proceedings would be reported in section 3(c).

(ii)

2

	b)	Financial Difficulty: to the best of our knowledge, and dating back to the appli original date of licence, the applicant has been the subject of the following								
Janua		•		kruptcy and Insolvency Act:	None ⊠ or					
		(i)	an assignment u	nder Section 49;						
		(ii)	a petition for a re	ceiving order under Section 43;						
		(iii)	a proposal under	Section 50; or						
		(iv)	an application for consolidation order under Section 219 in the following							
		(11)	circumstances:							
		or nas	s reported to the Socie	ety the following financial difficulties:						
7.	Othe	r Rele	vant Information:		None ⊠ or					
☐ Th	nis docur	ment ha	as an Addendum							
Janua	ary 18, 2	2024		allisen Charan						
Date				Allison Cheron Director, Client Service Centre Law Society of Ontario						

Please note that no outside searches have been conducted by the Law Society of Ontario and that the information provided is strictly based on records available at the Law Society of Ontario.

CASE

EB-2023-0198: Facilities: Leave to Construct (New): Hydro One

Networks Inc.

COST CLAIM

EB-2023-0198:1:

Elizabeth Thomas

INTERVENOR NAME

Thomas, Elizabeth; +1 (867) 675-5802 x.458

ethomas@oktlaw.com

PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS

Submitted

FILING PARTICIPANT

Guirguis, Cathy; +1 (416) 981-9341

cguirguis@oktlaw.com

NEW

PARTICIPANT

NON-FILING

PARTICIPANT F. NAME

NON-FILING

PARTICIPANT L. NAME

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE*

Legal Counsel

YEAR CALLED TO BAR*

2008

COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF

RELEVANT EXPERIENCE*

15

HST RATE CHARGED*

13.00

CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST)

CV Attached

LAST CV DATE

April 25, 2024

OVERRIDE HOURLY RATE

HOURLY RATE

290

No

HST NUMBER

HEARINGS

Yes

CONSULTATIONS

No

DISBURSEMENTS

No

HEARINGS

Hearings Hours Hearings Subtotal (\$) **Hearings Total Tax (\$)** Hearings Total (\$) 6.60 1,914.00 248.82 2,162.82

,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,					_,
<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	Sub Total	HST Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
1.50	290	435.00	13.00	56.55	491.55
	290		13.00		
	290		13.00		
	290		13.00		
	290		13.00		
	290		13.00		
1.50		435.00		56.55	491.55
	290		13.00		
	290		13.00		
st	290		13.00		
1	290		13.00		
	290		13.00		
	290		13.00		
	290		13.00		
	290		13.00		
	1.50 1.50	1.50 290 290 290 290 290 290 290 290 290 290	Rate	Rate Rate 1.50 290 435.00 13.00 290 13.00	Rate

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	Sub Total	<u>HST</u> Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Subtotal of PROCEDURAL	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
INTERVENOR EVIDENCE Preparation of Intervenor Evidence	0.20	290	58.00	13.00	7.54	65.54
Interrogatory Responses	2.40	290	696.00	13.00	90.48	786.48
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE	2.60	290	754.00	13.00	98.02	852.02
SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE Preparation for Settlement Conference		290		13.00		
Attendance at Settlement Conference		290		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		290		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		290		13.00		
Subtotal of SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE WRITTEN ARGUMENT	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
Written Submissions	0.60	290	174.00	13.00	22.62	196.62
Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT	0.60		174.00		22.62	196.62
ORAL ARGUMENT Preparation for Oral Hearing		290		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		290		13.00		
Oral Submissions		290		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		290		13.00		
Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
DECISION Review Decision	0.20	290	58.00	13.00	7.54	65.54
Review Rate/Accounting Order		290		13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order		290		13.00		
Subtotal of DECISION	0.20		58.00		7.54	65.54
OTHER Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor Conferences)	1.70	290	493.00	13.00	64.09	557.09
Subtotal of OTHER	1.70		493.00		64.09	557.09
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES Total Service Provider Fees	6.60		1,914.00		248.82	2,162.82

Attachments

<u>Attachment</u> **Document Type** Import Message

OEB Time Docket.pdf Time Docket CV

Cathy Guirguis - CV (2023).pdf

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

<u>Attachment Document Type</u> <u>Claim Type</u> <u>Import Message</u>

OEB Time Docket.pdf Time Docket Hearings

Cathy Guirguis - CV (2023).pdf CV Hearings

CONTACTFULLNAME	AMOUNT	BILLABLE HOURS	DATE	EARNER	EXPLANATION	INFO	INVOICE #	HOURS WORKED			
	•	•		•	DISCOVERY			•			
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 242.50	0.50	8/25/2023	ОМ	Email from P. Boileau re: Intervenor Application and reviewing leave to construct documents	FEE: OM 0.50 Hrs @ 485.00	40451	0.50	OM: O	GG: Gaëlle Groux OM: Oliver MacLaren CG: Cathy Gurguis	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 1,455.00	3.00	8/29/2023	ОМ	Email from P. Boileau re: OEB Intervention; Reviewing Regulatory Filings; Email to Gaelle Groux re: Application required; Telephone with G. Groux re: Same; Reviewing past Intervention precedents; Emails to C. Guirguis re: Supervision	FEE: OM 3.00 Hrs @ 485.00	40451	3.00	MM: Mat	thew McPherson	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 174.00	0.60	8/29/2023	GG	Introductory Call with O. MacLaren.	FEE: GG 0.60 Hrs @ 290.00	40451	0.60			
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 194.00	0.40	8/31/2023	ОМ	Emails from G. Groux re: Deadline for Intervention Application and Workplan for submission	FEE: OM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	40451	0.40			
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 348.00	1.20	8/31/2023	GG	Researching rules for intervening in OEB procedures.	FEE: GG 1.20 Hrs @ 290.00	40451	1.20			
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 97.00	0.20	9/1/2023	CG	Emails re precedent leave to intervene applications.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	0.20			
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 638.00	2.20	9/1/2023	GG	Reading OEB submission documents and creating workplan for OEB intervenor submissions.	FEE: GG 2.20 Hrs @ 290.00	40893	2.20			
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 388.00	0.80	9/5/2023	ОМ	Reviewing G. Groux emails; comments on workplan	FEE: OM 0.80 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	0.80			
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 388.00	0.80	9/7/2023	ОМ	Email from P. Boileau re: Update on filing and reply re: Same; Reviewing G. Groux updates	FEE: OM 0.80 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	0.80			
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 58.00	0.20	9/7/2023	GG	Correspondence with O. MacLaren about question for P. Boileau.	FEE: GG 0.20 Hrs @ 290.00	40893	0.20			
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 203.00	0.70	9/8/2023	GG	Looking for documents about GLP FN traditional territories and impact of the line on the territories.	FEE: GG 0.70 Hrs @ 290.00	40694	0.70			
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 290.00	1.00	9/10/2023	GG	Drafting OEB intervenor status request for GLP.	FEE: GG 1.00 Hrs @ 290.00	40893	1.00			
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 582.00	1.20	9/11/2023	ОМ	Email from Gaelle and emails to P. Boileau re: Intervenor Application; Review and revise same; Review OEB rules	FEE: OM 1.20 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	1.20			
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 48.50	0.10	9/12/2023	CG	Emails re preparing intervenor application.	FEE: CG 0.10 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	0.10			
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 291.00	0.60	9/12/2023	ОМ	Emails re: Outstanding questions for the intervenor application; Email to P. Boileau re: LDML	FEE: OM 0.60 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	0.60			

Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	116.00	0.40	9/13/2023	GG	Drafting GLP's request for intervenor status in OEB hearing.	FEE: GG 0.40 Hrs @ 290.00	40694	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	194.00	0.40	9/14/2023	ОМ	Emails from Gaelle re: Filing Application and Project Impacts; Email to M. Pelletier re: Protection Committee studies	FEE: OM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	957.00	3.30	9/14/2023	GG	Draft GLP Intervenor Status submissions to OEB for Waasigan Project Leave to Construct	FEE: GG 3.30 Hrs @ 290.00	40694	3.30	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	116.00	0.40	9/14/2023	GG	Meeting with C. Laidlaw to understand GLP corporate structure and agreements.	FEE: GG 0.40 Hrs @ 290.00	40694	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	873.00	1.80	9/15/2023	ОМ	Reviewing final application and Rules for Intervention; Revising Same; Emails to Gaelle re: Submission	FEE: OM 1.80 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	1.80	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	145.00	0.50	9/15/2023	GG	Reviewing GLP Submissions to OEB	FEE: GG 0.50 Hrs @ 290.00	40694	0.50	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	9/18/2023	ОМ	Email to G. Groux and C. Guirguis re: Filing Instructions	FEE: OM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	203.00	0.70	9/19/2023	GG	Reviewing Patrick Boileau's comments and submitting the application for intervenor status.	FEE: GG 0.70 Hrs @ 290.00	40893	0.70	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	582.00	1.20	9/20/2023	CG	Reviewing revisions to application, emails with G Groux re same, reviewing emails with client.	FEE: CG 1.20 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	1.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	194.00	0.40	9/21/2023	ОМ	Reviewing Intervention Form from OEB; Emails to G. Groux re: Same	FEE: OM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	29.00	0.10	10/3/2023	GG	Correspondence with C. Guirguis.	FEE: GG 0.10 Hrs @ 290.00	41251	0.10	
	1	,			•	INTERVENOR EVIDENCE		•		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	291.00	0.60	11/10/2023	CG	Reviewing OEB procedural order.	FEE: CG 0.60 Hrs @ 485.00	41251	0.60	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	48.50	0.10	11/13/2023	CG	Emails re OEB procedural order.	FEE: CG 0.10 Hrs @ 485.00	41251	0.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	11/13/2023	ОМ	Email to G. Groux; Email to C. Guirguis re: Intervenor	FEE: OM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41251	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	29.00	0.10	11/13/2023	GG	Correspondence with C. Guirguis and O. MacLaren.	FEE: GG 0.10 Hrs @ 290.00	41251	0.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	48.50	0.10	11/14/2023	CG	Emails re summary of order and scheduling discussion.	FEE: CG 0.10 Hrs @ 485.00	41251	0.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	11/17/2023	ОМ	Emails re: Internal Call to review participation	FEE: OM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41251	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	291.00	0.60	11/20/2023	CG	Reviewing procedural order, meeting with G Groux and O McLaren re next steps on file.	FEE: CG 0.60 Hrs @ 485.00	41251	0.60	

Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 97.00	0.20	11/20/2023	ОМ	Emails re: Intervenor Submission Plans	FEE: OM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41251	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 319.00	1.10	11/20/2023	GG	Meeting with O. MacLaren and C. Guirguis to discuss OEB interrogatories	FEE: GG 1.10 Hrs @ 290.00	41251	1.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 48.50	0.10	11/21/2023	CG	Emails from G Groux, and P Boileau re interrogatories.	FEE: CG 0.10 Hrs @ 485.00	41251	0.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 58.00	0.20	11/21/2023	GG	Correspondence with P. Boileau	FEE: GG 0.20 Hrs @ 290.00	41251	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 841.00	2.90	11/22/2023	GG	Reviewing OEB Documents and developing interrogatories.	FEE: GG 2.90 Hrs @ 290.00	41251	2.90	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 377.00	1.30	11/23/2023	GG	Document Review of OEB documents in Hydro One's Waasigan Line Application	FEE: GG 1.30 Hrs @ 290.00	41251	1.30	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 194.00	0.40	11/28/2023	CG	Reviewing email from G. Groux re interrogatories, reviewing procedural order re extended deadlines, email re checking in with client.	FEE: CG 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	41251	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 58.00	0.20	11/28/2023	GG	Correspondence with C. Guirguis about OEB Interrogatories	FEE: GG 0.20 Hrs @ 290.00	41251	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 48.50	0.10	12/1/2023	CG	Emails re interrogatories.	FEE: CG 0.10 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 232.00	0.80	12/1/2023	GG	Reviewing OEB Interrogatories and e-mail to Patrick Boileau.	FEE: GG 0.80 Hrs @ 290.00	41509	0.80	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 145.50	0.30	12/5/2023	ОМ	Emails re: Interrogatories	FEE: OM 0.30 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.30	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 87.00	0.30	12/5/2023	GG	Meeting with C. Guirguis about Intervenor Submissions.	FEE: GG 0.30 Hrs @ 290.00	41509	0.30	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 97.00	0.20	12/6/2023	CG	Emails re interrogatories, reviewing same, response to O. MacLaren.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 194.00	0.40	12/6/2023	ОМ	Emails re: LTC Hearing	FEE: OM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 97.00	0.20	12/7/2023	CG	Emails re interrogatories, discussion re next steps.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 97.00	0.20	12/7/2023	ОМ	Emails re: LTC Hearing	FEE: OM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 97.00	0.20	12/10/2023	ОМ	Emails from G. Groux re: OEB Rules for Intervenors	FEE: OM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 464.00	1.60	12/10/2023	GG	Correspondence with O. MacLaren and C. Guirguis; research on OEB Rules.	FEE: GG 1.60 Hrs @ 290.00	41509	1.60	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 291.00	0.60	12/14/2023	ОМ	Emails re: OEB regulatory Process; Response to P. Boileau re: Same;	FEE: OM 0.60 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.60	

	_			1	1			1		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	291.00	0.60	12/19/2023	ОМ	Reviewing Hydro One Interrogatory response to OEB, NOTL, Larry Richard; Correspondence with P. Boileau re: Same	FEE: OM 0.60 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.60	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	58.00	0.20	12/19/2023	GG	Reviewing regulatory affairs documents	FEE: GG 0.20 Hrs @ 290.00	41509	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	87.00	0.30	12/20/2023	GG	Reviewing new rules for licensing exemptions	FEE: GG 0.30 Hrs @ 290.00	41509	0.30	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	12/21/2023	ОМ	Email from G. Groux re: IESO exemption from Licensing Requirements	FEE: OM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	194.00	0.40	1/10/2024	ОМ	Reviewing L. Richards email re: adequacy of HONI responses	FEE: OM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	41840	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	194.00	0.40	1/16/2024	ОМ	Reviewing IESO response to Interrogatories	FEE: OM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	41840	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	87.00	0.30	1/21/2024	GG	Correspondence with OEB, O. MacLaren and C. Guirguis	FEE: GG 0.30 Hrs @ 290.00	41840	0.30	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	1/22/2024	ОМ	Email from G. Groux re: Request to Submit evidence and reply re: Same	FEE: OM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41840	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	1/23/2024	CG	Emails re submitting evidence.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41840	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	116.00	0.40	1/23/2024	GG	Correspondence with C. Guirguis and O. MacLaren.	FEE: GG 0.40 Hrs @ 290.00	41840	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	194.00	0.40	1/24/2024	ОМ	Emails with G. Groux re: Filing Evidence	FEE: OM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	41840	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	58.00	0.20	1/25/2024	GG	File OEB documents, review e-mails from O. Maclaren	FEE: GG 0.20 Hrs @ 290.00	41840	0.20	
		l				WRITTEN SUBMISSIONS			1	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	2/5/2024	CG	Reviewing correspondence from parties, procedural order from OEB, emails with G. Groux.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	42039	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	145.00	0.50	2/16/2024	GG	Correspondence with Oliver and Cathy about OEB submissions for GLP	FEE: GG 0.50 Hrs @ 290.00	42039	0.50	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	2/16/2024	CG	Reviewing emails from G Groux, reviewing procedural order, email re same to G Groux and O MacLaren.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	42039	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	194.00	0.40	2/16/2024	ОМ	Emails with G. Groux re: Procedural Order and HONI Agreements	FEE: OM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	42039	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	435.00	1.50	2/18/2024	GG	Summarizing HONI argument-in-chief and possible outline of GLP arguments.	FEE: GG 1.50 Hrs @ 290.00	42039	1.50	

Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	630.50	1.30	2/19/2024	ОМ	Reviewing emails and Gaelle summary of argument in Chief; Slack with C. Guirguis re: Same; Drafting email to P. Boileau re: Recommendation on making a submission	FEE: OM 1.30 Hrs @ 485.00	42039	1.30	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	2/21/2024	CG	Emails re filing letter re submissions, confer with O. MacLaren; messages with G Prokos re same.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	42039	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	485.00	1.00	2/21/2024	ОМ	Drafting submission to OEB and Emails with C. Guirguis and G. Prokos re: Same	FEE: OM 1.00 Hrs @ 485.00	42039	1.00	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	48.50	0.10	3/4/2024	CG	Emails re intervenor submissions, email from O. MacLaren re next steps.	FEE: CG 0.10 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	194.00	0.40	3/4/2024	ОМ	Email to G. Groux Re: reviewing applicant and intervenor submissions, researching law, and internal conference regarding proposed response	FEE: OM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	580.00	2.00	3/8/2024	GG	Drafting response to Submissions.	FEE: GG 2.00 Hrs @ 290.00	42334	2.00	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	291.00	0.60	3/8/2024	ОМ	Emails re: Hydro One reply to Submission; Reviewing Same	FEE: OM 0.60 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.60	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	388.00	0.80	3/11/2024	ОМ	Email from P. Boileau re: Submissions; Reviewing Same and Reply	FEE: OM 0.80 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.80	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	679.00	1.40	3/12/2024	ОМ	Reviewing and Revising G. Groux and email to P. Boileau re: Same; Emails re: Process for filing cost claims	FEE: OM 1.40 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	1.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	194.00	0.40	3/15/2024	ММ	Emails with O. MacLaren re assertions. Review submissions re same.	FEE: MM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	194.00	0.40	3/20/2024	CG	Emails re intervenor submissions and providing reply, reviewing summary of submissions, email with O MacLaren re next steps.	FEE: CG 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$:	1,067.00	2.20	3/20/2024	ОМ	Conference with G. Groux re intervenor submissions; Conference with M. McPherson re: Strategy; Update to C. Guirguis and instructions to g. Groux	FEE: OM 2.20 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	2.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	145.00	0.50	3/21/2024	GG	Researching Hearing Process for OEB Waasigan Leave to Construct Application.	FEE: GG 0.50 Hrs @ 290.00	42334	0.50	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	291.00	0.60	3/21/2024	ОМ	Update email to G. Groux re: submission requirements	FEE: OM 0.60 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.60	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	582.00	1.20	3/22/2024	ММ	Discussion with O. MacLaren re intervenor submissions	FEE: MM 1.20 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	1.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	3/22/2024	ОМ	Emails re: intervenor submissions; Instructions to G.	FEE: OM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.20	

Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 101.00	0.20	4/16/2024	CG	Emails re final decision from OEB, reviewing order.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 505.00		0.20	
					DECISION				
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 270.00	0.90	4/24/2024	GG		FEE: GG 0.90 Hrs @ 300.00		0.90	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 150.00	0.50	4/22/2024	GG	Working on cost claim submissions	FEE: GG 0.50 Hrs @ 300.00		0.50	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 50.50	0.10	4/17/2024	CG	Emails re submitting costs claims.	FEE: CG 0.10 Hrs @ 505.00		0.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 120.00	0.40	4/8/2024	GG	Researching OEB cost claim rules, and assigning some work to E. Thomas (assistant).	FEE: GG 0.40 Hrs @ 300.00		0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 101.00	0.20	4/1/2024	CG	Email from O. MacLaren and reviewing attached letter, email re same to G. Groux.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 505.00		0.20	
					OTHER ATTENDANCE				
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 48.50	0.10	3/28/2024	CG	Email from O. MacLaren re instructions from client re submissions.	FEE: CG 0.10 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 97.00	0.20	3/27/2024	CG	Reviewing OEB letter re procedural direction, email to G. Groux and O. MacLaren re same.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 388.00	0.80	3/26/2024	ОМ	Internal conference regarding proposed response; Reply to G. Groux re: Same and Email to P. Boileau	FEE: OM 0.80 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.80	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 97.00	0.20	3/26/2024	MM	Emails with G. Groux and O. MacLaren re letter to OEB.	FEE: MM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 145.50	0.30	3/26/2024	CG	Reviewing and comment on draft submissions and letter to OEB, email to G. Groux and O. MacLaren re same.	FEE: CG 0.30 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.30	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 291.00	0.60	3/25/2024	ОМ	Instructions to G. Groux re: internal conference regarding proposed response	FEE: OM 0.60 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.60	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 580.00	2.00	3/25/2024	GG	Researching Law and drafting letter	FEE: GG 2.00 Hrs @ 290.00	42334	2.00	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 48.50	0.10	3/25/2024	CG	Reviewing emails re submissions to OEB.	FEE: CG 0.10 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 290.00	1.00	3/24/2024	GG	Draft letter to OEB Registry RE intervenor submissions	FEE: GG 1.00 Hrs @ 290.00	42334	1.00	

CATHY GUIRGUIS LAWYER

1534 Lochlin Trail · Mississauga, ON · L5G 3V7 416-629-4545 · cguirguis@oktlaw.com https://www.oktlaw.com/team-members/cathy-guirguis/

OVERVIEW

Ontario-based lawyer, practice focused on advancing Indigenous rights. Experience in Aboriginal and treaty rights litigation, appellate advocacy, and judicial review applications. Represent clients in environmental and regulatory hearings, as well as in negotiations about lands claims, rights, and resource development. Advise First Nations on administrative and governance matters.

LAW EXPERIENCE

present

October 2007 - Olthuis Kleer Townshend LLP, Toronto, ON

Joined as an articling student in 2007, as an associate in 2008 and as a partner in 2016.

Select Representative Work:

- Co-lead counsel representing the Saugeen Ojibway Nation in its Aboriginal title claim to water and claim about the Crown's fiduciary breach and failure to protect their land (2021 ONSC 4181 (CanLII) | Saugeen First Nation v. The Attorney General of Canada | CanLII), currently before the Ontario Court of Appeal;
- Lead counsel in a successful judicial review about Ontario's failure to adequately consult and accommodate the Saugeen Ojibway in respect of aggregate mining in their traditional territory, including the failure to pay reasonable costs of the First Nations' participation (Saugeen First Nation v. Ontario (MNRF), 2017 ONSC 3456 (CanLII));
- Represented the Assembly of Manitoba Chiefs in its intervention at the Supreme Court of Canada regarding the Crown's fiduciary duty to protect Indigenous lands in Williams Lake Indian Band v. Canada [2018] 1SCR 83.

present

January 2022 - Osgoode Hall Law School, Toronto, ON

Adjunct Faculty teaching Rights and Reconciliation: Indigenous Peoples and the Law (1L seminar).

SELECT SPEAKING ENGAGEMENTS

- Speaker, Aboriginal Law Update, Ontario Bar Association, June 22, 2022;
- Guest Lecturer, Effective Inclusive Legal Representation, University of Windsor, 2021 and 2023;
- Panelist, Legal Professionalism in Indigenous Practice Areas, Legal Voices Conference, Lincoln Alexander School of Law, November 13, 2021;
- Speaker, Dealing with Difficult People: The Difficult Witness, The Advocates Society, October 19, 2021;
- Guest Lecturer, Indigenous and Aboriginal Law, Lincoln Alexander School of Law, February 1, 2021;

- Speaker, "Colonization and Racism: How Legal Structures Affect the Health of Indigenous Peoples", Indigenous Health Conference (University of Toronto), December 3, 2020;
- Panelist, "Navigating Uncertainty", Career Panel Webcast, Middle Eastern Canadian Women Lawyers Association, June 10, 2020;
- Speaker, "The Duty to Consult and Accommodate: Moving Beyond Process", Advanced Administrative Law, Canadian Institute, October 24, 2017;
- Speaker, "Defining Aboriginal Title What the Implications of the Tsilhqot'in Decision are for Canadian Aboriginal Communities and Proponents", Canadian Institute, June 23, 2015;
- Speaker, "Managing lands for treaty rights: strategies for the duty to consult and cumulative impacts", presentation at As Long as the Rivers Flow, Treaty Rights Conference hosted by Athabasca Chipewyan First Nation and OKT LLP, 2014;
- Speaker, "Reconciliation and Infringement of Aboriginal and Treaty Rights: What is 'Justified'?", December 9, 2013, The Commons Institute's Mawai'omi: Investing in Aboriginal Canada Conference.

EDUCATION

2003-2007 Osgoode Hall Law School/York University, Joint LLB/MES (Master in Environmental Studies)

Awards and Honours:

- York International Internship Program Award (2004)
- York International Mobility Award (2004)
- Jim MacNeill Award (2003)

1993-2003 Carleton University, Bachelor of Journalism (High Honours) – Journalism and Human Rights

Awards and Honours:

- Deans' Honour List (2000, 2002)
- Entrance Scholarship for Academic Achievement (1999)
- William E Beckel Scholarship (2000)
- Clarence C. Gibson Scholarship (2002)

OTHER SELECT WORK AND VOLUNTEER EXPERIENCE

- Research Contract, Centre for Indigenous Environmental Resources, Winnipeg, MB
- Volunteer, Downsview Community Legal Services, Toronto, ON
- Volunteer, Community Legal Aid Services Programme (CLASP), Toronto, ON
- Researcher, Bangladesh Rural Advancement Committee (BRAC), Dhaka, Bangladesh
- Intern, CBC (The National and World View), Toronto, ON

LANGUAGES

• English (fluent), French (intermediate), Arabic (basic)

CASE

EB-2023-0198: Facilities: Leave to Construct (New): Hydro One Networks Inc.

COST CLAIM

EB-2023-0198:1: Elizabeth Thomas

INTERVENOR NAME

Thomas, Elizabeth; +1 (867) 675-5802 x.458 ethomas@oktlaw.com

PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS

Submitted

FILING PARTICIPANT

MacLaren, Oliver; +1 (416) 981-9330 omaclaren@oktlaw.com NEW

PARTICIPANT

NON-FILING

PARTICIPANT F. NAME

NON-FILING

PARTICIPANT L. NAME

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE*

Legal Counsel

YEAR CALLED TO BAR*

2008

COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF **RELEVANT EXPERIENCE***

15

HST RATE CHARGED*

13.00

CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST)

CV Attached

LAST CV DATE

April 25, 2024

OVERRIDE HOURLY RATE

HOURLY RATE

290

No

HST NUMBER

HEARINGS

Yes

CONSULTATIONS

No

DISBURSEMENTS

No

HEARINGS

Hearings Hours 24.90	Hearings Subto 7,221.00	otal (\$)		Hearings Total 938.73	Tax (\$)		ings Total (\$) 3,159.73
<u>Name</u>		<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	Sub Total	<u>HST</u> Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
DISCOVERY							
Read and Research Ap Evidence	pplication and	10.10	290	2,929.00	13.00	380.77	3,309.77
Preparation of Interrog	atories		290		13.00		
Review Interrogatory F	Responses		290		13.00		
Technical Conference	Preparation		290		13.00		
Technical Conference	Attendance		290		13.00		
Technical Conference	Follow-up		290		13.00		
Subtotal of DISCOVE	RY	10.10		2,929.00		380.77	3,309.77
PROCEDURAL							
Preparation of Issues I	List Submission		290		13.00		
Attendance at Issues L	ist Conference		290		13.00		
Preparation for a Confi	identiality Request		290		13.00		
Prepare Submissions	on Confidentiality		290		13.00		
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		290		13.00		
Prepare Submissions	on the Motion(s)		290		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing	on Motion(s)		290		13.00		
Review Procedural Do	cuments		290		13.00		

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	Sub Total	<u>HST</u> Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Subtotal of PROCEDURAL	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
INTERVENOR EVIDENCE Preparation of Intervenor Evidence	1.40	290	406.00	13.00	52.78	458.78
Interrogatory Responses	3.10	290	899.00	13.00	116.87	1,015.87
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE	4.50	290	1,305.00	13.00	169.65	1,474.65
SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE Preparation for Settlement Conference		290		13.00		
Attendance at Settlement Conference		290		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		290		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		290		13.00		
Subtotal of SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE WRITTEN ARGUMENT	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
Written Submissions	2.70	290	783.00	13.00	101.79	884.79
Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT	2.70		783.00		101.79	884.79
ORAL ARGUMENT Preparation for Oral Hearing		290		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		290		13.00		
Oral Submissions		290		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		290		13.00		
Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
DECISION Review Decision		290		13.00		
		290		13.00		
Review Rate/Accounting Order Prepare Submission on Rate Order		290		13.00		
Subtotal of DECISION	0.00	290	0.00	13.00	0.00	0.00
OTHER	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor Conferences)	7.60	290	2,204.00	13.00	286.52	2,490.52
Subtotal of OTHER	7.60		2,204.00		286.52	2,490.52
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES Total Service Provider Fees	24.90		7,221.00		938.73	8,159.73

Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>

OEB Time Docket.pdf Oliver MacLaren CV April 2024(4737302.1).pdf **Document Type**

Time Docket CV

Import Message

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

AttachmentDocument TypeClaim TypeImport MessageOEB Time Docket.pdfTime DocketHearings

Oliver MacLaren CV April 2024(4737302.1).pdf

CV Hearings

CONTACTFULLNAME	AMOUNT	BILLABLE HOURS	DATE	EARNER	EXPLANATION	INFO	INVOICE #	HOURS WORKED		
	•	•	•	•	DISCOVERY		•			
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 242.50	0.50	8/25/2023	ОМ	Email from P. Boileau re: Intervenor Application and reviewing leave to construct documents	FEE: OM 0.50 Hrs @ 485.00	40451	0.50	OM: O	Gaëlle Groux liver MacLaren Cathy Gurguis
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 1,455.00	3.00	8/29/2023	ОМ	Email from P. Boileau re: OEB Intervention; Reviewing Regulatory Filings; Email to Gaelle Groux re: Application required; Telephone with G. Groux re: Same; Reviewing past Intervention precedents; Emails to C. Guirguis re: Supervision	FEE: OM 3.00 Hrs @ 485.00	40451	3.00	MM: Mat	thew McPherson
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 174.00	0.60	8/29/2023	GG	Introductory Call with O. MacLaren.	FEE: GG 0.60 Hrs @ 290.00	40451	0.60		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 194.00	0.40	8/31/2023	ОМ	Emails from G. Groux re: Deadline for Intervention Application and Workplan for submission	FEE: OM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	40451	0.40		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 348.00	1.20	8/31/2023	GG	Researching rules for intervening in OEB procedures.	FEE: GG 1.20 Hrs @ 290.00	40451	1.20		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 97.00	0.20	9/1/2023	CG	Emails re precedent leave to intervene applications.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	0.20		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 638.00	2.20	9/1/2023	GG	Reading OEB submission documents and creating workplan for OEB intervenor submissions.	FEE: GG 2.20 Hrs @ 290.00	40893	2.20		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 388.00	0.80	9/5/2023	ОМ	Reviewing G. Groux emails; comments on workplan	FEE: OM 0.80 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	0.80		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 388.00	0.80	9/7/2023	ОМ	Email from P. Boileau re: Update on filing and reply re: Same; Reviewing G. Groux updates	FEE: OM 0.80 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	0.80		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 58.00	0.20	9/7/2023	GG	Correspondence with O. MacLaren about question for P. Boileau.	FEE: GG 0.20 Hrs @ 290.00	40893	0.20		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 203.00	0.70	9/8/2023	GG	Looking for documents about GLP FN traditional territories and impact of the line on the territories.	FEE: GG 0.70 Hrs @ 290.00	40694	0.70		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 290.00	1.00	9/10/2023	GG	Drafting OEB intervenor status request for GLP.	FEE: GG 1.00 Hrs @ 290.00	40893	1.00		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 582.00	1.20	9/11/2023	ОМ	Email from Gaelle and emails to P. Boileau re: Intervenor Application; Review and revise same; Review OEB rules	FEE: OM 1.20 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	1.20		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 48.50	0.10	9/12/2023	CG	Emails re preparing intervenor application.	FEE: CG 0.10 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	0.10		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 291.00	0.60	9/12/2023	ОМ	Emails re: Outstanding questions for the intervenor application; Email to P. Boileau re: LDML	FEE: OM 0.60 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	0.60		

Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	116.00	0.40	9/13/2023	GG	Drafting GLP's request for intervenor status in OEB hearing.	FEE: GG 0.40 Hrs @ 290.00	40694	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	194.00	0.40	9/14/2023	ОМ	Emails from Gaelle re: Filing Application and Project Impacts; Email to M. Pelletier re: Protection Committee studies	FEE: OM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	957.00	3.30	9/14/2023	GG	Draft GLP Intervenor Status submissions to OEB for Waasigan Project Leave to Construct	FEE: GG 3.30 Hrs @ 290.00	40694	3.30	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	116.00	0.40	9/14/2023	GG	Meeting with C. Laidlaw to understand GLP corporate structure and agreements.	FEE: GG 0.40 Hrs @ 290.00	40694	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	873.00	1.80	9/15/2023	ОМ	Reviewing final application and Rules for Intervention; Revising Same; Emails to Gaelle re: Submission	FEE: OM 1.80 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	1.80	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	145.00	0.50	9/15/2023	GG	Reviewing GLP Submissions to OEB	FEE: GG 0.50 Hrs @ 290.00	40694	0.50	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	9/18/2023	ОМ	Email to G. Groux and C. Guirguis re: Filing Instructions	FEE: OM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	203.00	0.70	9/19/2023	GG	Reviewing Patrick Boileau's comments and submitting the application for intervenor status.	FEE: GG 0.70 Hrs @ 290.00	40893	0.70	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	582.00	1.20	9/20/2023	CG	Reviewing revisions to application, emails with G Groux re same, reviewing emails with client.	FEE: CG 1.20 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	1.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	194.00	0.40	9/21/2023	ОМ	Reviewing Intervention Form from OEB; Emails to G. Groux re: Same	FEE: OM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	29.00	0.10	10/3/2023	GG	Correspondence with C. Guirguis.	FEE: GG 0.10 Hrs @ 290.00	41251	0.10	
	1	,			•	INTERVENOR EVIDENCE		•		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	291.00	0.60	11/10/2023	CG	Reviewing OEB procedural order.	FEE: CG 0.60 Hrs @ 485.00	41251	0.60	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	48.50	0.10	11/13/2023	CG	Emails re OEB procedural order.	FEE: CG 0.10 Hrs @ 485.00	41251	0.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	11/13/2023	ОМ	Email to G. Groux; Email to C. Guirguis re: Intervenor	FEE: OM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41251	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	29.00	0.10	11/13/2023	GG	Correspondence with C. Guirguis and O. MacLaren.	FEE: GG 0.10 Hrs @ 290.00	41251	0.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	48.50	0.10	11/14/2023	CG	Emails re summary of order and scheduling discussion.	FEE: CG 0.10 Hrs @ 485.00	41251	0.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	11/17/2023	ОМ	Emails re: Internal Call to review participation	FEE: OM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41251	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	291.00	0.60	11/20/2023	CG	Reviewing procedural order, meeting with G Groux and O McLaren re next steps on file.	FEE: CG 0.60 Hrs @ 485.00	41251	0.60	

Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 97.00	0.20	11/20/2023	ОМ	Emails re: Intervenor Submission Plans	FEE: OM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41251	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 319.00	1.10	11/20/2023	GG	Meeting with O. MacLaren and C. Guirguis to discuss OEB interrogatories	FEE: GG 1.10 Hrs @ 290.00	41251	1.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 48.50	0.10	11/21/2023	CG	Emails from G Groux, and P Boileau re interrogatories.	FEE: CG 0.10 Hrs @ 485.00	41251	0.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 58.00	0.20	11/21/2023	GG	Correspondence with P. Boileau	FEE: GG 0.20 Hrs @ 290.00	41251	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 841.00	2.90	11/22/2023	GG	Reviewing OEB Documents and developing interrogatories.	FEE: GG 2.90 Hrs @ 290.00	41251	2.90	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 377.00	1.30	11/23/2023	GG	Document Review of OEB documents in Hydro One's Waasigan Line Application	FEE: GG 1.30 Hrs @ 290.00	41251	1.30	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 194.00	0.40	11/28/2023	CG	Reviewing email from G. Groux re interrogatories, reviewing procedural order re extended deadlines, email re checking in with client.	FEE: CG 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	41251	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 58.00	0.20	11/28/2023	GG	Correspondence with C. Guirguis about OEB Interrogatories	FEE: GG 0.20 Hrs @ 290.00	41251	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 48.50	0.10	12/1/2023	CG	Emails re interrogatories.	FEE: CG 0.10 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 232.00	0.80	12/1/2023	GG	Reviewing OEB Interrogatories and e-mail to Patrick Boileau.	FEE: GG 0.80 Hrs @ 290.00	41509	0.80	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 145.50	0.30	12/5/2023	ОМ	Emails re: Interrogatories	FEE: OM 0.30 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.30	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 87.00	0.30	12/5/2023	GG	Meeting with C. Guirguis about Intervenor Submissions.	FEE: GG 0.30 Hrs @ 290.00	41509	0.30	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 97.00	0.20	12/6/2023	CG	Emails re interrogatories, reviewing same, response to O. MacLaren.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 194.00	0.40	12/6/2023	ОМ	Emails re: LTC Hearing	FEE: OM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 97.00	0.20	12/7/2023	CG	Emails re interrogatories, discussion re next steps.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 97.00	0.20	12/7/2023	ОМ	Emails re: LTC Hearing	FEE: OM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 97.00	0.20	12/10/2023	ОМ	Emails from G. Groux re: OEB Rules for Intervenors	FEE: OM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 464.00	1.60	12/10/2023	GG	Correspondence with O. MacLaren and C. Guirguis; research on OEB Rules.	FEE: GG 1.60 Hrs @ 290.00	41509	1.60	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 291.00	0.60	12/14/2023	ОМ	Emails re: OEB regulatory Process; Response to P. Boileau re: Same;	FEE: OM 0.60 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.60	

	_			1	1			1		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	291.00	0.60	12/19/2023	ОМ	Reviewing Hydro One Interrogatory response to OEB, NOTL, Larry Richard; Correspondence with P. Boileau re: Same	FEE: OM 0.60 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.60	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	58.00	0.20	12/19/2023	GG	Reviewing regulatory affairs documents	FEE: GG 0.20 Hrs @ 290.00	41509	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	87.00	0.30	12/20/2023	GG	Reviewing new rules for licensing exemptions	FEE: GG 0.30 Hrs @ 290.00	41509	0.30	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	12/21/2023	ОМ	Email from G. Groux re: IESO exemption from Licensing Requirements	FEE: OM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	194.00	0.40	1/10/2024	ОМ	Reviewing L. Richards email re: adequacy of HONI responses	FEE: OM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	41840	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	194.00	0.40	1/16/2024	ОМ	Reviewing IESO response to Interrogatories	FEE: OM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	41840	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	87.00	0.30	1/21/2024	GG	Correspondence with OEB, O. MacLaren and C. Guirguis	FEE: GG 0.30 Hrs @ 290.00	41840	0.30	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	1/22/2024	ОМ	Email from G. Groux re: Request to Submit evidence and reply re: Same	FEE: OM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41840	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	1/23/2024	CG	Emails re submitting evidence.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41840	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	116.00	0.40	1/23/2024	GG	Correspondence with C. Guirguis and O. MacLaren.	FEE: GG 0.40 Hrs @ 290.00	41840	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	194.00	0.40	1/24/2024	ОМ	Emails with G. Groux re: Filing Evidence	FEE: OM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	41840	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	58.00	0.20	1/25/2024	GG	File OEB documents, review e-mails from O. Maclaren	FEE: GG 0.20 Hrs @ 290.00	41840	0.20	
		l				WRITTEN SUBMISSIONS			1	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	2/5/2024	CG	Reviewing correspondence from parties, procedural order from OEB, emails with G. Groux.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	42039	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	145.00	0.50	2/16/2024	GG	Correspondence with Oliver and Cathy about OEB submissions for GLP	FEE: GG 0.50 Hrs @ 290.00	42039	0.50	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	2/16/2024	CG	Reviewing emails from G Groux, reviewing procedural order, email re same to G Groux and O MacLaren.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	42039	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	194.00	0.40	2/16/2024	ОМ	Emails with G. Groux re: Procedural Order and HONI Agreements	FEE: OM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	42039	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	435.00	1.50	2/18/2024	GG	Summarizing HONI argument-in-chief and possible outline of GLP arguments.	FEE: GG 1.50 Hrs @ 290.00	42039	1.50	

Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	630.50	1.30	2/19/2024	ОМ	Reviewing emails and Gaelle summary of argument in Chief; Slack with C. Guirguis re: Same; Drafting email to P. Boileau re: Recommendation on making a submission	FEE: OM 1.30 Hrs @ 485.00	42039	1.30	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	2/21/2024	CG	Emails re filing letter re submissions, confer with O. MacLaren; messages with G Prokos re same.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	42039	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	485.00	1.00	2/21/2024	ОМ	Drafting submission to OEB and Emails with C. Guirguis and G. Prokos re: Same	FEE: OM 1.00 Hrs @ 485.00	42039	1.00	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	48.50	0.10	3/4/2024	CG	Emails re intervenor submissions, email from O. MacLaren re next steps.	FEE: CG 0.10 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	194.00	0.40	3/4/2024	ОМ	Email to G. Groux Re: reviewing applicant and intervenor submissions, researching law, and internal conference regarding proposed response	FEE: OM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	580.00	2.00	3/8/2024	GG	Drafting response to Submissions.	FEE: GG 2.00 Hrs @ 290.00	42334	2.00	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	291.00	0.60	3/8/2024	ОМ	Emails re: Hydro One reply to Submission; Reviewing Same	FEE: OM 0.60 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.60	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	388.00	0.80	3/11/2024	ОМ	Email from P. Boileau re: Submissions; Reviewing Same and Reply	FEE: OM 0.80 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.80	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	679.00	1.40	3/12/2024	ОМ	Reviewing and Revising G. Groux and email to P. Boileau re: Same; Emails re: Process for filing cost claims	FEE: OM 1.40 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	1.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	194.00	0.40	3/15/2024	ММ	Emails with O. MacLaren re assertions. Review submissions re same.	FEE: MM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	194.00	0.40	3/20/2024	CG	Emails re intervenor submissions and providing reply, reviewing summary of submissions, email with O MacLaren re next steps.	FEE: CG 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$:	1,067.00	2.20	3/20/2024	ОМ	Conference with G. Groux re intervenor submissions; Conference with M. McPherson re: Strategy; Update to C. Guirguis and instructions to g. Groux	FEE: OM 2.20 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	2.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	145.00	0.50	3/21/2024	GG	Researching Hearing Process for OEB Waasigan Leave to Construct Application.	FEE: GG 0.50 Hrs @ 290.00	42334	0.50	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	291.00	0.60	3/21/2024	ОМ	Update email to G. Groux re: submission requirements	FEE: OM 0.60 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.60	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	582.00	1.20	3/22/2024	ММ	Discussion with O. MacLaren re intervenor submissions	FEE: MM 1.20 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	1.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	3/22/2024	ОМ	Emails re: intervenor submissions; Instructions to G.	FEE: OM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.20	

Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 101.00	0.20	4/16/2024	CG	Emails re final decision from OEB, reviewing order.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 505.00		0.20	
					DECISION				
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 270.00	0.90	4/24/2024	GG		FEE: GG 0.90 Hrs @ 300.00		0.90	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 150.00	0.50	4/22/2024	GG	Working on cost claim submissions	FEE: GG 0.50 Hrs @ 300.00		0.50	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 50.50	0.10	4/17/2024	CG	Emails re submitting costs claims.	FEE: CG 0.10 Hrs @ 505.00		0.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 120.00	0.40	4/8/2024	GG	Researching OEB cost claim rules, and assigning some work to E. Thomas (assistant).	FEE: GG 0.40 Hrs @ 300.00		0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 101.00	0.20	4/1/2024	CG	Email from O. MacLaren and reviewing attached letter, email re same to G. Groux.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 505.00		0.20	
					OTHER ATTENDANCE				
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 48.50	0.10	3/28/2024	CG	Email from O. MacLaren re instructions from client re submissions.	FEE: CG 0.10 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 97.00	0.20	3/27/2024	CG	Reviewing OEB letter re procedural direction, email to G. Groux and O. MacLaren re same.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 388.00	0.80	3/26/2024	ОМ	Internal conference regarding proposed response; Reply to G. Groux re: Same and Email to P. Boileau	FEE: OM 0.80 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.80	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 97.00	0.20	3/26/2024	MM	Emails with G. Groux and O. MacLaren re letter to OEB.	FEE: MM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 145.50	0.30	3/26/2024	CG	Reviewing and comment on draft submissions and letter to OEB, email to G. Groux and O. MacLaren re same.	FEE: CG 0.30 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.30	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 291.00	0.60	3/25/2024	ОМ	Instructions to G. Groux re: internal conference regarding proposed response	FEE: OM 0.60 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.60	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 580.00	2.00	3/25/2024	GG	Researching Law and drafting letter	FEE: GG 2.00 Hrs @ 290.00	42334	2.00	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 48.50	0.10	3/25/2024	CG	Reviewing emails re submissions to OEB.	FEE: CG 0.10 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 290.00	1.00	3/24/2024	GG	Draft letter to OEB Registry RE intervenor submissions	FEE: GG 1.00 Hrs @ 290.00	42334	1.00	

OLTHUIS KLEER TOWNSHEND LLP 250 University, 8th Floor Toronto, ON M5H 3E5

Oliver MacLaren, JD

Partner - Olthuis Kleer Townshend LLP

Oliver grew up in Edmonton and received his BA from the University of Alberta, and JD from the University of Calgary. He worked with the Chief Negotiator during the negotiation of the Indian Residential Schools Settlement and participated in the design of the National Truth and Reconciliation Commission.

Following law school, Oliver spent several years in Calgary working for Alberta and BC First Nations with oil and gas production occurring on their reserves. During this time, Oliver made appearances before energy regulatory tribunals, including the Alberta Energy Regulator and the Alberta Utilities Commission, and worked on submissions at all levels of court, including the Supreme Court of Canada.

Oliver moved to Toronto in 2011 and joined Olthuis Kleer Townshend LLP ("OKT") as an associate lawyer. In Toronto, Oliver built up a practice focused on indigenous economic development, particularly in the renewable energy sector including wind, solar, hydro, battery storage, and biomass. Starting with the 60MW McLean's Mountain Wind Farm on Manitoulin Island and continuing through numerous rounds of provincial energy procurements, Oliver has negotiated partnerships for many successful project bids, and closed dozens of transactions for his First Nation clients raising hundreds of millions of dollars in equity financing and negotiating government guarantees for the repayment of loans to ensure high returns and positive economic development experiences for his clients.

Aside from renewable energy, Oliver's practice has encompassed other transactions of national importance, including the purchase of the Hudson Bay Railway, the Port of Churchill, and related Tank Farm assets in northern Manitoba, off grid sustainable energy generation for isolated Alberta First Nations, and significant transactions in the offshore fishery on the East Coast and in the Nunavut mining sector.

Oliver also works as counsel to Gwayakocchigewin Limited Partnership, a limited partnership composed of 8 First Nations that negotiated the inaugural partnership in Hydro One Networks Inc.'s new indigenous engagement policy commitment of 50% indigenous ownership for all projects over \$100million. This project, the Waasigan project, is currently being developed by Gwayakocchigewin in partnership with Hydro One. The \$1.2 billion project has received its leave to construct, with an expected completion in late 2025. Oliver is also counsel to Caldwell First Nation on the \$224 million Chatham x

OLTHUIS KLEER TOWNSHEND LLP 250 University, 8th Floor Toronto, ON M5H 3E5

Lakeshore Transmission Project, with an estimated in service date of 4th quarter of 2024.

Oliver was made a partner at OKT in January 2016 and leads the firm's corporate practice group. He was a member of the firm's Management Committee from 2020 – 2023. Oliver is a member of the Ontario, Alberta, and Manitoba bars, and is a 2024 Lexpert Ranked Lawyer, listed as Repeatedly Recommended in the Lexpert Directory on Indigenous Law.

Matthew McPherson

CASE EB-2023-0198: Facilities: Leave to Construct (New): Hydro One

Networks Inc.

COST CLAIM EB-2023-0198:1: Elizabeth Thomas

INTERVENOR NAME Thomas, Elizabeth; +1 (867) 675-5802 x.458 ethomas@oktlaw.com

PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS Submitted

FILING PARTICIPANT NEW

PARTICIPANT

Yes

NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME

Matthew

NON-FILING

PARTICIPANT L. NAME

McPherson

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE*

Legal Counsel

YEAR CALLED TO BAR*

2008

COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF **RELEVANT EXPERIENCE***

15

HST RATE CHARGED*

13.00

CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST)

CV Attached

LAST CV DATE

April 25, 2024

OVERRIDE HOURLY RATE

HOURLY RATE

290

No

HST NUMBER

HEARINGS

Yes

CONSULTATIONS

No

DISBURSEMENTS

No

HEARINGS

Hearings Hours Hearings Subtotal (\$) **Hearings Total Tax (\$)** Hearings Total (\$) 1.80 522.00 67.86 589.86

	<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	Sub Total	HST Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
DISC	OVERY Read and Research Application and Evidence		290		13.00		
	Preparation of Interrogatories		290		13.00		
	Review Interrogatory Responses		290		13.00		
	Technical Conference Preparation		290		13.00		
	Technical Conference Attendance		290		13.00		
	Technical Conference Follow-up		290		13.00		
	Subtotal of DISCOVERY	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
PRO	CEDURAL						
	Preparation of Issues List Submission		290		13.00		
	Attendance at Issues List Conference		290		13.00		
	Preparation for a Confidentiality Request		290		13.00		
	Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality		290		13.00		
	Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		290		13.00		
	Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		290		13.00		
	Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		290		13.00		
	Review Procedural Documents		290		13.00		

	<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	Sub Total	HST Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
	Subtotal of PROCEDURAL	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
INTE	RVENOR EVIDENCE Preparation of Intervenor Evidence		290		13.00		
	Interrogatory Responses		290		13.00		
	Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE	0.00	290	0.00	13.00	0.00	0.00
SETT	LEMENT CONFERENCE Preparation for Settlement Conference		290		13.00		
	Attendance at Settlement Conference		290		13.00		
	Preparation of Settlement Proposal		290		13.00		
	Attendance at Presentation to Panel		290		13.00		
WRIT	Subtotal of SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE TEN ARGUMENT Written Submissions	0.00	290	0.00	13.00	0.00	0.00
	Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT	0.00	200	0.00	10.00	0.00	0.00
ORAI	ARGUMENT	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
0	Preparation for Oral Hearing		290		13.00		
	Attendance at Oral Hearing		290		13.00		
	Oral Submissions		290		13.00		
	Attendance at Oral Submissions		290		13.00		
	Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
DECI	SION Review Decision		290		13.00		
	Review Rate/Accounting Order		290		13.00		
	Prepare Submission on Rate Order		290		13.00		
	Subtotal of DECISION	0.00	200	0.00	10.00	0.00	0.00
ОТНЕ		0.00		3.33		0.00	
	Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor Conferences)	1.80	290	522.00	13.00	67.86	589.86
T 0	Subtotal of OTHER	1.80		522.00		67.86	589.86
TOTA	L SERVICE PROVIDER FEES Total Service Provider Fees	1.80		522.00		67.86	589.86

Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>

OEB Time Docket.pdf LSO - Certificate of Standing for Matthew McPherson Feb 26 2021.pdf.pdf **Document Type**

Time Docket CV

Import Message

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

Attachment Document Type Claim Type **Import Message** OEB Time Docket.pdf Time Docket Hearings CV

LSO - Certificate of Standing for Matthew McPherson Feb 26 2021.pdf.pdf

CONTACTFULLNAME	AMOUNT	BILLABLE HOURS	DATE	EARNER	EXPLANATION	INFO	INVOICE #	HOURS WORKED		
	•	•	•	•	DISCOVERY		•			
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 242.50	0.50	8/25/2023	ОМ	Email from P. Boileau re: Intervenor Application and reviewing leave to construct documents	FEE: OM 0.50 Hrs @ 485.00	40451	0.50	OM: O	Gaëlle Groux liver MacLaren Cathy Gurguis
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 1,455.00	3.00	8/29/2023	ОМ	Email from P. Boileau re: OEB Intervention; Reviewing Regulatory Filings; Email to Gaelle Groux re: Application required; Telephone with G. Groux re: Same; Reviewing past Intervention precedents; Emails to C. Guirguis re: Supervision	FEE: OM 3.00 Hrs @ 485.00	40451	3.00	MM: Mat	thew McPherson
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 174.00	0.60	8/29/2023	GG	Introductory Call with O. MacLaren.	FEE: GG 0.60 Hrs @ 290.00	40451	0.60		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 194.00	0.40	8/31/2023	ОМ	Emails from G. Groux re: Deadline for Intervention Application and Workplan for submission	FEE: OM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	40451	0.40		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 348.00	1.20	8/31/2023	GG	Researching rules for intervening in OEB procedures.	FEE: GG 1.20 Hrs @ 290.00	40451	1.20		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 97.00	0.20	9/1/2023	CG	Emails re precedent leave to intervene applications.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	0.20		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 638.00	2.20	9/1/2023	GG	Reading OEB submission documents and creating workplan for OEB intervenor submissions.	FEE: GG 2.20 Hrs @ 290.00	40893	2.20		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 388.00	0.80	9/5/2023	ОМ	Reviewing G. Groux emails; comments on workplan	FEE: OM 0.80 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	0.80		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 388.00	0.80	9/7/2023	ОМ	Email from P. Boileau re: Update on filing and reply re: Same; Reviewing G. Groux updates	FEE: OM 0.80 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	0.80		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 58.00	0.20	9/7/2023	GG	Correspondence with O. MacLaren about question for P. Boileau.	FEE: GG 0.20 Hrs @ 290.00	40893	0.20		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 203.00	0.70	9/8/2023	GG	Looking for documents about GLP FN traditional territories and impact of the line on the territories.	FEE: GG 0.70 Hrs @ 290.00	40694	0.70		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 290.00	1.00	9/10/2023	GG	Drafting OEB intervenor status request for GLP.	FEE: GG 1.00 Hrs @ 290.00	40893	1.00		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 582.00	1.20	9/11/2023	ОМ	Email from Gaelle and emails to P. Boileau re: Intervenor Application; Review and revise same; Review OEB rules	FEE: OM 1.20 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	1.20		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 48.50	0.10	9/12/2023	CG	Emails re preparing intervenor application.	FEE: CG 0.10 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	0.10		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 291.00	0.60	9/12/2023	ОМ	Emails re: Outstanding questions for the intervenor application; Email to P. Boileau re: LDML	FEE: OM 0.60 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	0.60		

Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	116.00	0.40	9/13/2023	GG	Drafting GLP's request for intervenor status in OEB hearing.	FEE: GG 0.40 Hrs @ 290.00	40694	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	194.00	0.40	9/14/2023	ОМ	Emails from Gaelle re: Filing Application and Project Impacts; Email to M. Pelletier re: Protection Committee studies	FEE: OM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	957.00	3.30	9/14/2023	GG	Draft GLP Intervenor Status submissions to OEB for Waasigan Project Leave to Construct	FEE: GG 3.30 Hrs @ 290.00	40694	3.30	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	116.00	0.40	9/14/2023	GG	Meeting with C. Laidlaw to understand GLP corporate structure and agreements.	FEE: GG 0.40 Hrs @ 290.00	40694	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	873.00	1.80	9/15/2023	ОМ	Reviewing final application and Rules for Intervention; Revising Same; Emails to Gaelle re: Submission	FEE: OM 1.80 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	1.80	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	145.00	0.50	9/15/2023	GG	Reviewing GLP Submissions to OEB	FEE: GG 0.50 Hrs @ 290.00	40694	0.50	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	9/18/2023	ОМ	Email to G. Groux and C. Guirguis re: Filing Instructions	FEE: OM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	203.00	0.70	9/19/2023	GG	Reviewing Patrick Boileau's comments and submitting the application for intervenor status.	FEE: GG 0.70 Hrs @ 290.00	40893	0.70	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	582.00	1.20	9/20/2023	CG	Reviewing revisions to application, emails with G Groux re same, reviewing emails with client.	FEE: CG 1.20 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	1.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	194.00	0.40	9/21/2023	ОМ	Reviewing Intervention Form from OEB; Emails to G. Groux re: Same	FEE: OM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	40694	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	29.00	0.10	10/3/2023	GG	Correspondence with C. Guirguis.	FEE: GG 0.10 Hrs @ 290.00	41251	0.10	
	1	,			•	INTERVENOR EVIDENCE		•		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	291.00	0.60	11/10/2023	CG	Reviewing OEB procedural order.	FEE: CG 0.60 Hrs @ 485.00	41251	0.60	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	48.50	0.10	11/13/2023	CG	Emails re OEB procedural order.	FEE: CG 0.10 Hrs @ 485.00	41251	0.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	11/13/2023	ОМ	Email to G. Groux; Email to C. Guirguis re: Intervenor	FEE: OM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41251	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	29.00	0.10	11/13/2023	GG	Correspondence with C. Guirguis and O. MacLaren.	FEE: GG 0.10 Hrs @ 290.00	41251	0.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	48.50	0.10	11/14/2023	CG	Emails re summary of order and scheduling discussion.	FEE: CG 0.10 Hrs @ 485.00	41251	0.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	11/17/2023	ОМ	Emails re: Internal Call to review participation	FEE: OM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41251	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	291.00	0.60	11/20/2023	CG	Reviewing procedural order, meeting with G Groux and O McLaren re next steps on file.	FEE: CG 0.60 Hrs @ 485.00	41251	0.60	

Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 97.00	0.20	11/20/2023	ОМ	Emails re: Intervenor Submission Plans	FEE: OM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41251	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 319.00	1.10	11/20/2023	GG	Meeting with O. MacLaren and C. Guirguis to discuss OEB interrogatories	FEE: GG 1.10 Hrs @ 290.00	41251	1.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 48.50	0.10	11/21/2023	CG	Emails from G Groux, and P Boileau re interrogatories.	FEE: CG 0.10 Hrs @ 485.00	41251	0.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 58.00	0.20	11/21/2023	GG	Correspondence with P. Boileau	FEE: GG 0.20 Hrs @ 290.00	41251	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 841.00	2.90	11/22/2023	GG	Reviewing OEB Documents and developing interrogatories.	FEE: GG 2.90 Hrs @ 290.00	41251	2.90	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 377.00	1.30	11/23/2023	GG	Document Review of OEB documents in Hydro One's Waasigan Line Application	FEE: GG 1.30 Hrs @ 290.00	41251	1.30	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 194.00	0.40	11/28/2023	CG	Reviewing email from G. Groux re interrogatories, reviewing procedural order re extended deadlines, email re checking in with client.	FEE: CG 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	41251	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 58.00	0.20	11/28/2023	GG	Correspondence with C. Guirguis about OEB Interrogatories	FEE: GG 0.20 Hrs @ 290.00	41251	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 48.50	0.10	12/1/2023	CG	Emails re interrogatories.	FEE: CG 0.10 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 232.00	0.80	12/1/2023	GG	Reviewing OEB Interrogatories and e-mail to Patrick Boileau.	FEE: GG 0.80 Hrs @ 290.00	41509	0.80	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 145.50	0.30	12/5/2023	ОМ	Emails re: Interrogatories	FEE: OM 0.30 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.30	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 87.00	0.30	12/5/2023	GG	Meeting with C. Guirguis about Intervenor Submissions.	FEE: GG 0.30 Hrs @ 290.00	41509	0.30	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 97.00	0.20	12/6/2023	CG	Emails re interrogatories, reviewing same, response to O. MacLaren.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 194.00	0.40	12/6/2023	ОМ	Emails re: LTC Hearing	FEE: OM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 97.00	0.20	12/7/2023	CG	Emails re interrogatories, discussion re next steps.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 97.00	0.20	12/7/2023	ОМ	Emails re: LTC Hearing	FEE: OM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 97.00	0.20	12/10/2023	ОМ	Emails from G. Groux re: OEB Rules for Intervenors	FEE: OM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 464.00	1.60	12/10/2023	GG	Correspondence with O. MacLaren and C. Guirguis; research on OEB Rules.	FEE: GG 1.60 Hrs @ 290.00	41509	1.60	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 291.00	0.60	12/14/2023	ОМ	Emails re: OEB regulatory Process; Response to P. Boileau re: Same;	FEE: OM 0.60 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.60	

	_			1	1			1		
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	291.00	0.60	12/19/2023	ОМ	Reviewing Hydro One Interrogatory response to OEB, NOTL, Larry Richard; Correspondence with P. Boileau re: Same	FEE: OM 0.60 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.60	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	58.00	0.20	12/19/2023	GG	Reviewing regulatory affairs documents	FEE: GG 0.20 Hrs @ 290.00	41509	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	87.00	0.30	12/20/2023	GG	Reviewing new rules for licensing exemptions	FEE: GG 0.30 Hrs @ 290.00	41509	0.30	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	12/21/2023	ОМ	Email from G. Groux re: IESO exemption from Licensing Requirements	FEE: OM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41509	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	194.00	0.40	1/10/2024	ОМ	Reviewing L. Richards email re: adequacy of HONI responses	FEE: OM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	41840	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	194.00	0.40	1/16/2024	ОМ	Reviewing IESO response to Interrogatories	FEE: OM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	41840	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	87.00	0.30	1/21/2024	GG	Correspondence with OEB, O. MacLaren and C. Guirguis	FEE: GG 0.30 Hrs @ 290.00	41840	0.30	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	1/22/2024	ОМ	Email from G. Groux re: Request to Submit evidence and reply re: Same	FEE: OM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41840	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	1/23/2024	CG	Emails re submitting evidence.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	41840	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	116.00	0.40	1/23/2024	GG	Correspondence with C. Guirguis and O. MacLaren.	FEE: GG 0.40 Hrs @ 290.00	41840	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	194.00	0.40	1/24/2024	ОМ	Emails with G. Groux re: Filing Evidence	FEE: OM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	41840	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	58.00	0.20	1/25/2024	GG	File OEB documents, review e-mails from O. Maclaren	FEE: GG 0.20 Hrs @ 290.00	41840	0.20	
		l				WRITTEN SUBMISSIONS			1	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	2/5/2024	CG	Reviewing correspondence from parties, procedural order from OEB, emails with G. Groux.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	42039	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	145.00	0.50	2/16/2024	GG	Correspondence with Oliver and Cathy about OEB submissions for GLP	FEE: GG 0.50 Hrs @ 290.00	42039	0.50	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	2/16/2024	CG	Reviewing emails from G Groux, reviewing procedural order, email re same to G Groux and O MacLaren.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	42039	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	194.00	0.40	2/16/2024	ОМ	Emails with G. Groux re: Procedural Order and HONI Agreements	FEE: OM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	42039	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	435.00	1.50	2/18/2024	GG	Summarizing HONI argument-in-chief and possible outline of GLP arguments.	FEE: GG 1.50 Hrs @ 290.00	42039	1.50	

Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	630.50	1.30	2/19/2024	ОМ	Reviewing emails and Gaelle summary of argument in Chief; Slack with C. Guirguis re: Same; Drafting email to P. Boileau re: Recommendation on making a submission	FEE: OM 1.30 Hrs @ 485.00	42039	1.30	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	2/21/2024	CG	Emails re filing letter re submissions, confer with O. MacLaren; messages with G Prokos re same.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	42039	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	485.00	1.00	2/21/2024	ОМ	Drafting submission to OEB and Emails with C. Guirguis and G. Prokos re: Same	FEE: OM 1.00 Hrs @ 485.00	42039	1.00	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	48.50	0.10	3/4/2024	CG	Emails re intervenor submissions, email from O. MacLaren re next steps.	FEE: CG 0.10 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	194.00	0.40	3/4/2024	ОМ	Email to G. Groux Re: reviewing applicant and intervenor submissions, researching law, and internal conference regarding proposed response	FEE: OM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	580.00	2.00	3/8/2024	GG	Drafting response to Submissions.	FEE: GG 2.00 Hrs @ 290.00	42334	2.00	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	291.00	0.60	3/8/2024	ОМ	Emails re: Hydro One reply to Submission; Reviewing Same	FEE: OM 0.60 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.60	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	388.00	0.80	3/11/2024	ОМ	Email from P. Boileau re: Submissions; Reviewing Same and Reply	FEE: OM 0.80 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.80	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	679.00	1.40	3/12/2024	ОМ	Reviewing and Revising G. Groux and email to P. Boileau re: Same; Emails re: Process for filing cost claims	FEE: OM 1.40 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	1.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	194.00	0.40	3/15/2024	ММ	Emails with O. MacLaren re assertions. Review submissions re same.	FEE: MM 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	194.00	0.40	3/20/2024	CG	Emails re intervenor submissions and providing reply, reviewing summary of submissions, email with O MacLaren re next steps.	FEE: CG 0.40 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$:	1,067.00	2.20	3/20/2024	ОМ	Conference with G. Groux re intervenor submissions; Conference with M. McPherson re: Strategy; Update to C. Guirguis and instructions to g. Groux	FEE: OM 2.20 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	2.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	145.00	0.50	3/21/2024	GG	Researching Hearing Process for OEB Waasigan Leave to Construct Application.	FEE: GG 0.50 Hrs @ 290.00	42334	0.50	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	291.00	0.60	3/21/2024	ОМ	Update email to G. Groux re: submission requirements	FEE: OM 0.60 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.60	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	582.00	1.20	3/22/2024	ММ	Discussion with O. MacLaren re intervenor submissions	FEE: MM 1.20 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	1.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$	97.00	0.20	3/22/2024	ОМ	Emails re: intervenor submissions; Instructions to G.	FEE: OM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.20	

Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 101.00	0.20	4/16/2024	CG	Emails re final decision from OEB, reviewing order.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 505.00		0.20	
					DECISION				
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 270.00	0.90	4/24/2024	GG		FEE: GG 0.90 Hrs @ 300.00		0.90	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 150.00	0.50	4/22/2024	GG	Working on cost claim submissions	FEE: GG 0.50 Hrs @ 300.00		0.50	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 50.50	0.10	4/17/2024	CG	Emails re submitting costs claims.	FEE: CG 0.10 Hrs @ 505.00		0.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 120.00	0.40	4/8/2024	GG	Researching OEB cost claim rules, and assigning some work to E. Thomas (assistant).	FEE: GG 0.40 Hrs @ 300.00		0.40	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 101.00	0.20	4/1/2024	CG	Email from O. MacLaren and reviewing attached letter, email re same to G. Groux.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 505.00		0.20	
					OTHER ATTENDANCE				
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 48.50	0.10	3/28/2024	CG	Email from O. MacLaren re instructions from client re submissions.	FEE: CG 0.10 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 97.00	0.20	3/27/2024	CG	Reviewing OEB letter re procedural direction, email to G. Groux and O. MacLaren re same.	FEE: CG 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 388.00	0.80	3/26/2024	ОМ	Internal conference regarding proposed response; Reply to G. Groux re: Same and Email to P. Boileau	FEE: OM 0.80 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.80	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 97.00	0.20	3/26/2024	MM	Emails with G. Groux and O. MacLaren re letter to OEB.	FEE: MM 0.20 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.20	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 145.50	0.30	3/26/2024	CG	Reviewing and comment on draft submissions and letter to OEB, email to G. Groux and O. MacLaren re same.	FEE: CG 0.30 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.30	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 291.00	0.60	3/25/2024	ОМ	Instructions to G. Groux re: internal conference regarding proposed response	FEE: OM 0.60 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.60	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 580.00	2.00	3/25/2024	GG	Researching Law and drafting letter	FEE: GG 2.00 Hrs @ 290.00	42334	2.00	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 48.50	0.10	3/25/2024	CG	Reviewing emails re submissions to OEB.	FEE: CG 0.10 Hrs @ 485.00	42334	0.10	
Gwayakocchigewin LP	\$ 290.00	1.00	3/24/2024	GG	Draft letter to OEB Registry RE intervenor submissions	FEE: GG 1.00 Hrs @ 290.00	42334	1.00	



The applicant:

in a practising status; or

(i)

c)

CERTIFICATE OF STANDING

I CEF	TIFY TI	HAT our records indicate the following about:	:								
Name	e: Matthe	ew James McPherson ("the applicant")									
Addre	ess: 8-25	50 University Ave, Toronto ON M5H 3E5									
Our r	ecords	date back to the applicant's original date	of licence unless otherwise noted here:								
1.	Call a	and Admission:									
	a)	The applicant was:									
		admitted/licensed as a lawyer in this juri	isdiction on <u>June 20, 2008</u>								
		re-admitted/relicensed on after ha	aving ceased to be a lawyer member in								
		this jurisdiction on If re-admitted/reli	icensed, please explain circumstances:								
	b)	To the best of our knowledge, the applicant is or has been a member of the Law Society in the following Canadian jurisdictions:									
		Province/Territory	Dates								
2.	Prese	ent Status:									
	a)	The applicant:									
		(i) 🔀 is a lawyer member of this Law S	Society today; or								
		(ii) is not a member of this Law Soci	iety today, and has not been a member								
		since The applicant ceased	to be a member for the following								
		reason(s):									
	b)	The applicant:									
	b)	· · · <u></u>	ts, charges or other amounts owing to the								
	b)	(i) 🗵 is not in arrears of any fees, cost	ts, charges or other amounts owing to the								

is entitled/authorized to practise law in this jurisdiction and is currently

	(ii) re		ntitled/authorize	d to practise law in this jur	isdiction for the follow					
d)	errors ar	The applicant is indemnified under the Law Society's liability insurance plan for errors and omissions, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy:								
	Yes 🛚	No 🗌								
Prof	essional (Conduct	Record:							
a)	Complai	nts: the f	ollowing numbe	r of complaint files are ope	n: None [
b)	Compet as a resu	or restrictions impo None [
c)	following	formal di	-	s: the applicant is or has be	•					
	Date		Nature of cas	e and finding	Disposition					
Cus	todianshi∣	o or irus	steesnip:							
Cus (i) (ii)	⊠ the a	oplicant h	as not been the	subject of a custodianship	•					
(i) (ii) Prac	⊠ the a	oplicant h	as not been the as been the sub	pject of a custodianship or t	rusteeship, as follow					
(i) (ii) Prac	the aptice Concapplicant ha	oplicant hoplicant h	as not been the as been the sub	pject of a custodianship or t	• •					
(i) (ii) Prace	the aptice Concapplicant ha	oplicant hoplicant h	as not been the as been the sub	nject of a custodianship or the state of a custodianship or th	rusteeship, as foll Non					

Any convictions resulting in disciplinary proceedings would be reported in section 3(c).

2

	b)		cial Difficulty: to the best of our knowledge, and dating back to the applicant's all date of licence, the applicant has been the subject of the following							
		•		kruptcy and Insolvency Act:	None ⊠ or					
		(i)	an assignment ur	nder Section 49;						
		(ii)	a petition for a re	ceiving order under Section 43;						
		(iii)	a proposal under	Section 50; or						
		(iv)	an application for consolidation order under Section 219 in the following circumstances:							
		or has	s reported to the Socie	ty the following financial difficulties:						
_	-									
7.	Othe	r Rele	vant Information:		None 🛛 or					
☐ Th	is docui	ment h	as an Addendum							
Febru	ary 26,	2021		alisen Cherch						
Date				Allison Cheron Director, Client Service Centre Law Society of Ontario						

Please note that no outside searches have been conducted by the Law Society of Ontario and that the information provided is strictly based on records available at the Law Society of Ontario.



CERTIFICATE OF STANDING

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT AND AUTHORIZATION

ha nila	_, have reviewed the information provided in the attached
	pared at my request by the Law Society of Ontario as a pre-
condition to my application for:	
(i) X call and admission on transfe	r; or
(ii) a mobility permit in your jurisc	diction; or
(iii) other (state purpose):	
I acknowledge that the information con-	tained in the Certificate is accurate and complete, and
I authorize the release of this information	on to the Law Society of the NWT I further
authorizethe Law Society of the NWT	Γ to make enquiries concerning my background,
character and fitness for admission to t	heir Bar, and I also authorize the disclosure of information
about myself to the Law Society of the	eNWT by any person or body possessing it, provided
that such information will be used for th	ne purpose of this application, and will be treated in strict
confidence except when disclosure is r	equired by law or your society's governing regulations.
March 15, 2021	ha nife
Date	Signature of Applicant