resitient

April 30, 2024

VIA RESS

Ontario Energy Board Attention: Registrar P.O. Box 2319, 2300 Yonge Street, 27th Floor Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

Dear Ms. Marconi,

Re: Enbridge Gas Inc. ("EGI") 2024 Rebasing Application Board File Number: EB-2022-0200

We are counsel to Three Fires Group Inc. ("**Three Fires**") in the above-noted proceeding (the "**Proceeding**"). Further to the Board's Procedural Order No. 8 dated April 16, 2024, please find enclosed Three Fires' Phase 1 total cost claim in respect of the Proceeding.

Cost claim. Three Fires respectfully requests an award of 100% of its eligible costs, given its strategic and principled participation in the Proceeding to date, reflecting the unique interests of otherwise unrepresented EGI customers and impacted Indigenous communities, including Chippewas of Kettle and Stony Point First Nation and Caldwell First Nation. Three Fires submits that this request is supported by the following considerations:

- (i) Three Fires has participated effectively in the Proceeding, taking a surgical, principled, and coordinated approach to matters related to the rights and concerns of affected First Nations and Indigenous communities and assisted in contributing to the Board's better understanding of such matters;
- (ii) Three Fires has ensured that its participation in the Proceeding has been focused on material issues and consistent with the scope of its intervention, as set out in its Notice of Intervention;
- (iii) Three Fires coordinated significantly with Ginoogaming First Nation to participate costeffectively in order to limit overlap and efficiently advance issues of mutual interest; and
- (iv) Three Fires has participated responsibly and engaged with other intervenors and Board Staff to avoid overlap, maximize efficiency, and ensure that its participation was not unduly repetitive and was focused on relevant and material issues.

We trust that this approach has maximized the efficient use of resources and the right of otherwise unrepresented and important EGI customers to be heard in a manner that is consistent with the Board's mandate and statutory objectives.

Total costs. Please note that as part of the interim cost claim process, Three Fires was awarded and paid \$67,407.34. The below table sets out the total outstanding cost claims amount for Phase 1 of the Proceeding.

Phase 1 total cost claim amount	\$146,951.43
Phase 1 interim credit amount	\$67,407.34
Phase 1 outstanding cost claim amount (Total cost claim – interim payment)	<u>\$79,544.09</u>

Three Fires respectfully requests a full award of eligible interim costs.

Sincerely,

indice

DT Vollmer

c. Vanessa Inis, EGI David Stevens, Aird & Berlis LLP Philip Lee, Three Fires Chief Mary Duckworth, Caldwell First Nation Larry Sault, Caldwell First Nation Don Richardson, Three Fires

EB-2022-0200 : 1 : Monika Pecnikova

COST CLAIM NUMBER 2075	SUBMISSION DEADLINE DATE April 30, 2024	CLAIM STATUS Approved by Finance
EB# EB-2022-0200 - Phase 1: Rates: Distribution: Enbridge Gas Inc.	OTHER EB#S	PHASE #* 1
INTERVENOR Pecnikova, Monika; +1 (647) 991-1190 monika@resilientllp.com	INTERVENOR COMPANY* Three Fires Group, Kettle Point: Corporation	INTERVENOR TYPE Full Registrant
HST RATE ONTARIO 13.00	EXCHANGE RATE	COUNTRY
HST NUMBER 712928407 RT0001	LATE SUBMISSION ALLOWED	EXTENSION DEADLINE DATE

PARTICIPANTS

<u>CIPANTS</u> Non-Filing Participant First, Last Name	Filing Participant	Total (\$)	Total Hours	Participant Claim Status
,	DeMarco, Lisa (Elisabeth) ; +1 (647) 991-1190 lisa@resilientllp.com	2,722.17	7.30	Submitted
,	Daube, Nicholas; +1 (647) 991-1190 nicholas@resilientllp.com	139,469.12	425.60	Submitted
,	Vollmer, Daniel; +1 (647) 991-1190 daniel@resilientllp.com	192.10	1.00	Submitted
,	Richardson, Don; +1 (226) 820-5086 don.richardson@threefiresgr	4,568.04	12.25	Submitted
	Non-Filing Participant First, Last Name , ,	Non-Filing Participant First, Last NameFiling Participant,DeMarco, Lisa (Elisabeth); +1 (647) 991-1190 lisa@resilientllp.com,Daube, Nicholas; +1 (647) 991-1190 nicholas@resilientllp.com,Vollmer, Daniel; +1 (647) 991-1190 daniel@resilientllp.com,Richardson, Don; +1 (226) 820-5086	Non-Filing Participant First, Last Name Filing Participant , DeMarco, Lisa (Elisabeth); 2,722.17 +1 (647) 991-1190 lisa@resilientllp.com . , Daube, Nicholas; +1 (647) 139,469.12 991-1190 . . , Vollmer, Daniel; +1 (647) 192.10 991-1190 . . , Vollmer, Daniel; +1 (647) 192.10 991-1190 . . , Richardson, Don; +1 (226) 4,568.04 820-5086 . . . , Richardson@threefiresgr .	Non-Filing Participant First, Last Name Filing Participant Total (\$) Hours Total Hours . DeMarco, Lisa (Elisabeth) ; +1 (647) 991-1190 lisa@resilientllp.com 2,722.17 7.30 . Daube, Nicholas; +1 (647) 139,469.12 425.60 . 991-1190 1190,409.12 100 . Non-Filing Participant 100 100 . 991-1190 1100 100 . Non-Filing Participant 1225

ATTACHMENTS

	Document	Import Message
Attachment	Туре	
Three Fires_Cost Claim_20240430.pdf	Cover	
	Letter	
TFG EB-2022-0200 Cost Claim 043020241012.pdf		

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT/OTHER FEES 130,045.50

TOTAL CLAIM 146,951.43

TOTAL HOURS CLAIMED 446.15

REASON FOR DISALLOWANCE

MAKE CHEQUE PAYABLE TO Resilient LLP

SEND PAYMENT TO ADDRESS 119 Baby Point Road Toronto, ON M6S 2G7

SUBMIT SECTION

I am a representative of the Party. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim. The costs incurred and time spent are directly related to the Party's participation in the OEB Process referred to above.

This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in section 6.05 and 6.09 of the OEB's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

The information (fees and disbursements) filed in this cost claim is complete and accurate and in accordance with the OEB's Practice Direction for Cost Awards and Appendix A, the Cost Awards Tariff.

SUBMITTED BY Daniel Vollmer DATE SUBMITTED April 30, 2024

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 0.00

TOTAL AMOUNT AWARDED

TOTAL HOURS DISALLOWED

REASON FOR DISALLOWANCE - 2 REASON FOR DISALLOWANCE - 3

ATTENTION

TOTAL HST 16,905.93

Lisa (Elisabeth) DeMarco

No

CASE EB-2022-0200 - Phase 1: Rates: Distribution: Enbridge Gas Inc.	COST CLAIM EB-2022-0200 : 1 : Monika Pecnikova	INTERVENOR NAME Pecnikova, Monika; +1 (647) 991-1190 monika@resilientllp.com	PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS Submitted
FILING PARTICIPANT DeMarco, Lisa (Elisabeth) ; +1 (647) 991-1190 lisa@resilientllp.com	NEW PARTICIPANT No	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME
SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE* Legal Counsel	YEAR CALLED TO BAR* 1997	COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF RELEVANT EXPERIENCE* 26	HOURLY RATE 330
HST RATE CHARGED* 13.00	CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST) CV Attached	LAST CV DATE April 29, 2024	OVERRIDE HOURLY RATE

HST NUMBER	HEARINGS	CONSULTATIONS	DISBURSEMENTS
712928407 RT0001	Yes	No	No

HEARINGS

Hea	arings Hours 7.30	Hearings Sub 2,409.00	total (\$)		Hearings Total 313.17	Tax (\$)		n gs Total (\$) ,722.17
	<u>Name</u>		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly</u> <u>Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST</u> Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
DISC	OVERY							
	Read and Research Application a Evidence	nd		330		13.00		
	Preparation of Interrogatories			330		13.00		
	Review Interrogatory Responses			330		13.00		
	Technical Conference Preparation	1		330		13.00		
	Technical Conference Attendance			330		13.00		
	Technical Conference Follow-up			330		13.00		
	Subtotal of DISCOVERY		0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
PRO	CEDURAL Preparation of Issues List Submis	sion	3.50	330	1,155.00	13.00	150.15	1,305.15
	Attendance at Issues List Conferent	ence		330		13.00		
	Preparation for a Confidentiality R	lequest		330		13.00		
	Prepare Submissions on Confider	ntiality		330		13.00		
	Preparation of Motion(s) Materials	6		330		13.00		
	Prepare Submissions on the Moti	on(s)		330		13.00		
	Attendance at Hearing on Motion	s)		330		13.00		
	Review Procedural Documents			330		13.00		

CC_Participant_Combined.rpt - last Update 20230601

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	Sub Total	<u>HST</u> Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Tota</u>
Subtotal of PROCEDURAL	3.50		1,155.00		150.15	1,305.1
NTERVENOR EVIDENCE Preparation of Intervenor Evidence		330		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		330		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE	0.00	330	0.00	13.00	0.00	0.00
	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
Preparation for Settlement Conference	0.70	330	231.00	13.00	30.03	261.03
Attendance at Settlement Conference		330		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal	1.30	330	429.00	13.00	55.77	484.77
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		330		13.00		
Subtotal of SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE	2.00		660.00		85.80	745.80
RITTEN ARGUMENT Written Submissions	1.80	330	594.00	13.00	77.22	671.2
Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT	1.80		594.00		77.22	671.2
RAL ARGUMENT Preparation for Oral Hearing		330		13.00		
		330		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing Oral Submissions						
		330		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		330		13.00		
	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.0
ECISION Review Decision		330		13.00		
Review Rate/Accounting Order		330		13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order		330		13.00		
Subtotal of DECISION	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.0
THER Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor		330		13.00		
Conferences) Subtotal of OTHER	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.0
OTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES						
Total Service Provider Fees	7.30		2,409.00		313.17	2,722.1

Attachments

Attachment	Document Type
EB-2022-0200_ Three Fires Group_Time	Time Docket
Sheets_Lisa DeMarco.pdf	
Lisa DeMarco_CV .pdf	CV

Import Message

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

Attachment

EB-2022-0200_ Three Fires Group_Time Sheets_Lisa DeMarco.pdf Lisa DeMarco_CV .pdf Document Type Time Docket <u>Claim Type</u> Hearings Import Message

Hearings

	EB-2022-0200_ Three Fires Group_Time Sheets_Lisa DeMarco							
Туре	Date	Hours	Description	Rate (\$)	Bill	able (\$)	User	Bill#
TimeEntry	01/09/2023	1.2	ICP - Call with N. Daube with detailed	\$330.00	\$	396.00	Lisa DeMarco	23131
			instructions on					
			Issues Conference;					
TimeEntry	01/13/2023	2.3	ICP - Communications with potential	\$330.00	\$	759.00	Lisa DeMarco	23131
			expert; Communications with D.					
			Richardson; Instructions to N. Daube;					
TimeEntry	05/18/2023	0.7	SCP - Instructions to N. Daube re	\$330.00	\$	231.00	Lisa DeMarco	23131
			settlement conference;					
TimeEntry	05/31/2023	1.3	SPP - Instructions to N. Daube re terms	\$330.00	\$	429.00	Lisa DeMarco	23131
			for settlement proposal relating to Issue					
			#4 (adequacy of consultations);					
TimeEntry	09/09/2023	1.8	APR - Review and revise final	\$330.00	\$	594.00	Lisa DeMarco	23185
			submissions; Instructions to N. Daube re					
			same; Communications with TFG;					
Total		7.3			\$ 2	2,409.00		

+1.647.991.1190 LISA@RESILIENTLLP.COM

OverviewGlobally recognized leader in climate change law and
policyNationally recognized leader in energy law and policy
(electricity, natural gas, energy storage, distributed energy
resources)Certified and experienced corporate director focussed on
Environmental and Social Governance (ESG), technical
innovation, procedural fairness, climate related financial
disclosures, indigenous opportunities, and best governance
practicesConsensus builder, creative thinker, advocate, trusted
strategic advisor to corporate executives and governments
around the world

EDUCATION	Institute of Corporate Directors, ICD.D Designation	2015
	Solicitor of the Rolls, England and Wales	2012
	Member of the Bar of Ontario	1997
	Osgoode Hall Law School, LL.B.	1995
	Vermont Law School, M.S.E.L., summa cum laude	1995
	University of Toronto, M.Sc.	1992
	Western University, B.Sc. (Hons.)	1990

SELECTED	Resilient LLP
LEGAL WORK	(formerly DeMarco Allan LLP)
	Senior Partner and CEO

2015 - Present Toronto, ON

- Recognized domestically and globally as a leader in both energy (electricity and oil and gas) and climate change law by Chamber's Global, Chambers Canada, Lexpert, International Who's Who, and Best Lawyers.
- Counsel to the International Emissions Trading Association (IETA) in a series of high-profile constitutional reference cases on federal

+1.647.991.1190 LISA@RESILIENTLLP.COM

carbon pricing legislation before the Supreme Court of Canada and the courts of appeal of Saskatchewan, Ontario, and Alberta.

- Founder of the Distributed Resource Coalition, including the Electric Vehicle Society, active on regulatory matters before the Ontario Energy Board.
- Counsel to a variety of reporting issuers, global name brands, private corporate entities and funds on carbon neutrality strategy, clean energy and/or carbon offset transactions.
- Co-founder of and counsel to Energy Storage Canada Advocacy Council, spearheading legal and technical aspects of licensing, regulatory, contractual development, and early procurement of energy storage in Ontario.
- Special advisor to the Ministry of Environment (Saskatchewan) on *Prairie Resilience: A Made-in-Saskatchewan Climate Change Strategy.*
- Special counsel to Minster of Energy (Ontario) on Energy East and Eastern Mainline proceedings before the National Energy Board (NEB).
- Strategic advice, legislative analysis (federal and provincial), legislative drafting, climate change and policy advice in relation to a project that includes Carbon Capture and Storage (CCS), development of a pipeline and enhanced oil recovery for SaskPower Boundary Dam Post Combustion CCS project.
- United Nations Framework Convention on Climate Change (UNFCCC) Treaty negotiations, implementation, and related International Finance Corporation (IFC) carbon transactions.
- Advised the IFC on virtually all carbon finance transactions undertaken under the IFC Netherlands Carbon Facility under the Clean Development Mechanism (CDM) in numerous international jurisdictions including Brazil, India, China, Thailand, Sri Lanka and Argentina.
- Counsel to Anwaatin group of 10 First Nations on groundbreaking Distributed Energy Resource settlement (energy storage plus solar) with Hydro One, giving rise to being awarded Lexpert Zenith Award, Agent of Change in Law.
- Appeared as counsel on behalf of various customers in numerous Enbridge and Union performance-based regulation (PBR) gas pipeline distribution rate cases and rebasing cost of service cases that have ensued over the last two decades.
- Counsel to one member of the three-member coalition for the East West tie that was successful in the regulatory proceedings before the Ontario Energy Board (OEB).
- Counsel to an electricity distributor, Haldimand Hydro on the sale of a utility to Hydro One.

+1.647.991.1190 LISA@RESILIENTLLP.COM

- Counsel to Energy Storage Ontario Advocacy Council on various transmission and distribution system code amendments and related OEB proceedings and IESO technical papers on energy storage.
- Counsel to a fuel importer on renewable fuels related matters.
- Counsel to the Association of Power Producers of Ontario (APPrO) and/or various renewable, biomass and gas-fired generators on discrete regulatory matters.
- Counsel to the Ontario Power Authority (OPA)/Independent Electricity System Operator (IESO) on environmental attribute/renewable energy credit (REC) matters and related analysis of all generation procurement contracts, industrial electricity incentives and contractual interpretation matters.
- Acted on Clean Energy Supply (CES) contracts for clients in early stages of their interpretation, analysis and understanding. Analyzed a number of Non-Utility Generator contracts affected by gas pipeline and related gas transportation and supply changes.
- Counsel to large industrial customers (APPrO's gas-fired electricity generators) on various OEB proceedings including leave to construct proceeding successfully leading argument on achieving transparency and obtaining disclosure of the recent Enbridge, Union, Gaz Metro, TransCanada Pipeline settlement agreement that makes precedent setting, fundamental changes to natural gas transmission, distribution, and toll regulation across much of Canada.
- Acted for each of the Ministry of Energy, the OPA and the IESO on various matters and numerous clients on rate regulation and policy hearings, virtually all of the OPA's programs, including conservation, demand management, Feed-In Tariff, Renewable Energy Standard Offer Program, Industrial Electricity Incentives, Environmental Attributes and Combined Heat and Power.
- Counsel to various wind power producers, solar power producers, power companies and industry organizations in proceedings before the NEB, the OEB and other federal and provincial energy regulators, acting for both project proponents and intervenors on various energy projects.
- Provided strategic advice on the development and drafting of greenhouse gas (GHG) regulations in provinces including British Columbia, Alberta, Ontario, Saskatchewan and P.E.I. and the Canadian, U.S., U.K. Chinese, Brazilian, Korean and Chilean federal levels.
- Development, acquisition, and conveyance of conventional and renewable energy projects, acting on behalf of project proponents, lenders, equity investors, local distribution companies (LDCs), contractors, aboriginal peoples, governments and quasi-government agencies, with particular expertise on all of Ontario's various

+1.647.991.1190 LISA@RESILIENTLLP.COM

programs and procurement contracts.

• Lead counsel to an Ontario LDC on its acquisition by Hydro One.

Norton Rose Fulbright LLP (merged with Macleod2012 – 2014Dixon LLP)Toronto, ONPartner

- Lead Sustainability and Climate Change International Business Group (Norton Rose Group).
- Acted for rate regulated applicants and other entities on distribution and Leave to Construct proceedings.
- California Cap and Trade Market: drafted precedent route to market agreements for large multi-national corporation and was a member of IETA legal team drafting a recently released precedent contract for California emissions market.
- Quebec Cap and Trade Legislation: provided legal analysis and advice to large multi-national energy company on registration and cross border issues.
- Counsel to NRStor Electricity Storage and acted on all aspects of negotiating and implementing precedent setting electricity storage project and related grid stability, reliability services through government off-take agreement in order to facilitate efficiencies and enhanced renewable energy supply and optimization.
- Acted on government off-take agreement for regulation/alternate generation control services, Engineering, Procurement and Construction (EPC) contract negotiation, all novel energy regulatory requirement determination and compliance and assistance with financing and implementation.
- Acted for B.C. government and Pacific Carbon Trust undertaking: strategic energy asset optimization analysis; political, technology and stakeholder strategy; high level government submissions and legislative drafting.

Macleod Dixon LLP Partner

2002 – 2012 Toronto, ON

- Head of Toronto Energy Group, Global Climate Change Group.
- Appeared successfully before the Divisional Court and the Ontario Court of Appeal on matters appealed from the OEB (Ramp Rate Market Rule Amendment (Divisional Court)) and appeal of the Gas Distribution Access Rule (Divisional Court, Court of Appeal).
- Counsel to customers on the landmark Enbridge gas storage and system case methodology rate cases that resulted in an all party

+1.647.991.1190 LISA@RESILIENTLLP.COM

settlements and rules for all gas utilities.

- Counsel to Rogers Communications on the electricity Rate Handbook proceeding and worked diligently to be able to achieve consensus among some 96 LDCs on the treatment of unmetered scattered load.
- Acted for a coalition of generators on the development of the EcoLogo Renewable Low Impact Electricity criteria and the related TerraChoice EcoLogo Guidelines and certification criteria.
- Pioneered first sale of RECs cross border from Canadian wind generator into Massachusetts REC Market.
- Developed precedent contracts for multinational oil, gas and power trading company for green and green gas energy marketing and sale of RECs, Environmental Attributes (EAs) and bundled green energy in Ontario (including TerraChoice certification and related branding).
- Developed precedent contracts for US-based multinational energy company for sale of RECs, related EAs and Verified Emission reductions in Ontario and Alberta.
- Counsel to large multi-national energy company on transactions through various auction platforms for sale of EA compliance and precompliance instruments in Alberta (discovering fundamental issue during due diligence that resulted in regulatory change).
- AgCert Restructuring Processes and Procedures: retained as special international regulatory and CDM counsel to assist with restructuring all relevant contracts and interaction with the Clean Development Mechanism Executive Board (CDM EB) (International Regulatory Body) on process and procedures to ensure due process, a fair right to be heard, and the rule of law reflected in its processes and decisions.
- Counsel to various developers, generators, suppliers on Caribbean Power Purchase and Sale.

Donahue Ernst & Young LLP

Senior Associate, Energy

Attorney General of Ontario (Ministry(ies) of Environment and Energy) Student at Law and Associate Lawyer

+1.647.991.1190 LISA@RESILIENTLLP.COM

SELECTED	Climate Economy Strategic Council - Member	2021 – Present
GOVERNANCE EXPERIENCE	International Emissions Trading Association, International organization with Fortune 500 company members - Board Member	2020 - Present
	International Emissions Trading Association, International organization with Fortune 500 company members - Chair navigating 300% growth and implementation of governance systems.	2021 - 2023
	Radicle Inc., Board Member, member of the Compensation Committee, acting governance expert	2020 - 2022
	Ontario Power Generation, Past Board Member, member of the Audit and Risk Committee(s), Generation Oversight Committee	2014 - 2019
	Ontario Energy Association, Past Board Member	2015 - 2017
	Mark Carney Taskforce on Scaling Voluntary Carbon Markets, appointed member of consultative Working Group	2020 - Present
	Maple Leaf Foods Inc., Expert Advisory Board on Climate Change	2019 - Present
	Positive Energy, Advisory Board	2018 - Present
	Canada Climate Law Initiative, University of British Columbia and York University, Canadian Climate Governance Expert	2018 - Present
	MaRS Climate Innovation Board, Advisory Board	2017 - Present
	CSA, Member of Expert Committee on Biomass Supply Chain Risk Standard	Completed 23.11.2020
	Various Government Expert Advisory Body Appointments including: Ontario Minister of Environment's Climate Change Action Group, Ontario Minister of Energy, Clean Energy Task Force, Premier McGuinty Climate Change Advisory Panel, British Columbia Offset Oversight Advisory Group, Ontario Chamber of Commerce, Advisory Council on Ontario's Economic Future, International Chamber of Commerce Climate Arbitration Initiative	Completed
	Toronto Atmospheric Fund , Investment Committee Former Member	2006 - 2015

+1.647.991.1190 LISA@RESILIENTLLP.COM

Lexxion international *Climate Change Law Review*, 2008 - Present Editorial Board

SELECTED REPORTS AND PUBLICATIONS

The New World of Climate Change and ESG Disclosure, with Jonathan McGillivray and Daniel Vollmer, Energy Review Quarterly, December 2020

Canada's Existential Crisis over Climate Change Regulation: Tempest in a Teapot?, with Jonathan McGillivray, Energy Regulation Quartely, 2019

Canadian Carbon Pricing: Where is it Going?, with Jonathan McGillivray, Energy Regulation Quarterly, October 2018

The Elephant in the Room: A Foreign Perspective on Potential Trump Administration Approaches to US International Climate Commitments, with Jonathan McGillivray, IETA Insights, April 26, 2017

Energy Storage: The Green Energy Silver Bullet?, Energy Regulation Quarterly, July 2014.

Ontario releases Long-Term Energy Plan: a prudent approach to renewables, energy sector stability and energy storage innovation, December 2013.

When trade and climate change measures collide: Reconciling progressive climate change measures with free trade and national sovereignty obligations, November 2013.

Canadian Challenges in Implementing The Kyoto Protocol: A Cause for Harmonization with Robert Routliffe and Heather Landymore, Alberta Law Review, 2004.

SELECTED Panelist, North American Carbon World (NACW) Session "COP28: Accomplishments, Failures and the Path Forward", San Francisco, March 21, 2024
PANELIST, North American Carbon World (NACW) Plenary "COP and Markets – Road through Baku and Beyond", San Francisco, March 21, 21, 2024

+1.647.991.1190 LISA@RESILIENTLLP.COM

2024

Moderator, GLOBE Forum Panel *"Authentically Green: Strategies for Proactive Sustainability Action"*, Vancouver, February 15, 2024

Moderator, UNFCCC COP28 Panel *"Impactful Climate Policy – Alberta's Carbon Pricing and Emissions Trading System"*, presented by Government of Alberta, Dubai, UAE, December 5, 2023

Panelist, UNFCCC COP28 Panel *"Towards a robust global carbon market: addressing Leakage and Linkage"*, presented by International Chamber of Commerce (ICC), Dubai, UAE, December 5, 2023

Panelist, UNFCCC COP28 Panel *"Unlocking Innovation to Lead in the Energy Transition"*, presented by Dynamo Hub Energy, Dubai, UAE, December 5, 2023

Panelist, UNFCCC COP28 Panel "The state of the Article 6 negotiations: What remains to be done to unlock engagement in 2024", presented by International Emissions Trading Association (IETA), Dubai, UAE, December 2, 2023

Speaker, UNFCCC COP28 Panel *"Synergies Unleashed: Bridging Article 6, VCM, and Exchange Dynamics for a Sustainable Future", presented by AirCarbon Exchange (ACX), Dubai, UAE, December 2, 2023*

Moderator, ESC Conference 2023 – *"Charging Net Zero with Energy Storage",* Toronto, October 3, 2023

Panelist, New York Climate Week, Panel presented by CTrees – *"Mitigating Risks in Nature-based Solutions"*, New York, September 21, 2023

Speaker, North America Climate Summit (NACS) 2023 Side Event – "Potential for Linking New York Cap & Invest with Other Programs, Existing and Emerging", New York, September 20, 2023

Moderator, North America Climate Summit (NACS) 2023 Plenary – "Net Zero to Net Negative: Navigating the Carbon Removals Landscape and Marketplace", New York, September 19, 2023

Speaker, The Foundation for Natural Resources and Energy Law Institute – "Navigating climate change and the quest for energy security through carbon markets and climate finance", Salt Lake City, Utah, July 20, 2023

Moderator, Innovate4Climate 2023 Conference Panel – "Unlocking the Full Potential of Innovative Marine CDR Through Robust MRV", Bilbao, Spain, May 24, 2023

Speaker, Innovate4Climate 2023 Conference Launch Event – "2023 Greenhouse Gas Market Sentiment Survey Report", Bilbao, Spain, May

+1.647.991.1190 LISA@RESILIENTLLP.COM

24, 2023

Speaker, Innovate4Climate 2023 Conference Panel – *"Financing the Coal Transition",* Bilbao, Spain, May 24, 2023

Panelist, CAMPUT 2023 Conference – *"New Game, New Rules",* Toronto, May 9, 2023

Speaker, Passive House Canada (PHC) Conference – *"In the face of Electrification: Opportunities and Challenges",* Hamilton, Canada, May 8, 2023

Moderator, 16th Special Institute on International Mining and Energy Law, Development, and Investment – *"Greenwashing, Causation and Collusion – Climate Change Claims and Litigation in the Spotlight"*, Mexico City, April 21, 2023

Panelist, World Bank Group – IMF Spring Meetings – *"Enabling Private Investment through Carbon Markets"*, Washington D.C., April 12, 2023

Panelist, North American Carbon World (NACW) Conference – "Updates on North American National Climate Policy", Anaheim, March 22, 2023

Moderator, North American Carbon World (NACW) Conference – "Outcomes from Negotiations at COP27 and Expectations for COP28", Anaheim, March 22, 2023

Speaker, BITS & BYTES Session# 13-2023 – "Deepen Your Carbon Credit Knowledge", Toronto, February 15, 2023

Moderator, World Bank Roundtable *"Defining the Legal Nature and Regulation of Carbon Markets";* Washington DC, November 30, 2022

Speaker, Climate Economy Summit Panel *"Insights from COP27",* hosted by Toronto Region Board of Trade, Toronto, November 24, 2022

Panelist, UNFCCC COP27 Panel *"Frontiers in Carbon Pricing"*, hosted by the Harvard Project on Climate Agreements, Sharm El Sheikh Egypt, November 16, 2022

Panelist, UNFCCC COP27 Panel *"Lessons from the VCM for Article 6",* hosted by Singapore Prime Minister's Office, Sharm El Sheikh Egypt, November 16, 2022

Speaker, UNFCCC COP27 Panel *"Innovative approached to accelerating climate tech adoption"*, presented by MaRS Discovery District, Sharm El Sheikh Egypt, November 8, 2022

Chair, Energy and Mines Summit 2022 – *"Navigating Carbon Offsets for Mines"*, Toronto, November 2, 2022

Panelist, ESC Conference 2022 - "Accelerating Canada's Energy

+1.647.991.1190 LISA@RESILIENTLLP.COM

Transition", Toronto, October 11, 2022

Moderator, North America Climate Summit (NACS) 2022 Panel *"Financial Institutions, Net Zero and Carbon Markets",* New York City, September 22, 2022

Moderator, North America Climate Summit (NACS) 2022 Plenary *"In Conversation With Catherine McKenna & Catherine Stewart"*, New York City, September 21, 2022

Speaker, Innovative 4 Climate 2022 Workshop, AirCarbon Exchange Panel – *"Is Blockchain/DeFi the Future for Carbon Credits?",* May 25, 2022

Speaker, North American Carbon World (NACW) Conference – *"From Glasgow to Sharm El-Sheikh: International Climate Action and Outlooks",* Anaheim, April 8, 2022

Speaker, North American Carbon World (NACW) Conference – *"Article 6 Rulebook: Next Steps and Future Expectations"*, Anaheim, April 8, 2022

Moderator, GLOBE Forum 2022 – *The Great Carbon Pricing Debate: Not "Whether" but "How"*, March 29, 2022

Keynote speaker, International Carbon Action Partnership (ICAP) webinar series ETS for Policy Practitioners session *"Legal implementation of Emission Trading"*, February 9, 2022

Panelist, ICROA Webinar – *"ICROA Debrief on Article 6 & the Voluntary Carbon Market"*, January 26, 2022

Speaker, APPrO 2021 The Electric Future 33rd Annual Canadian Power Conference – "*Putting Ontario's carbon pricing in context*", November 30, 2021

Speaker, IETA LIVE Carbon Markets Series - Article 6: "Has the Ministerial Engagement Moved Negotiations Forward?", July 29, 2021

Speaker, Public Policy Forum Panel – *"Towards a National Adaptation Strategy for Canada",* June 16, 2021

Moderator, Innovative 4 Climate 2021 Workshop – *"The Essential Role of Negative Emissions Technologies in Getting to Net Zero",* May 26, 2021

Speaker, Canada Climate Law Initiative, and the Saskatchewan Chamber of Commerce Lecture – *"Climate Risk Disclosure: What does it mean for Saskatchewan Businesses?"*, May 18, 2021

Moderator, CBA Environmental, Energy & Resources Law Summit – *"Carbon Pricing and Other Climate-Related Litigation",* May 6, 2021

Speaker, North American Carbon World (NACW) Conference – "Plenary: State of the North American Carbon World: Are we Really Prepared to

+1.647.991.1190 LISA@RESILIENTLLP.COM

Create a Low/ No Carbon World?", April 22, 2021

Speaker, GLOBE Capital 2021 - "Investing in Resilience", April 15, 2021

Moderator, OEA Speaker Series Webinar *"Integration of Carbon and Energy Markets"*, January 22, 2021

Panelist, Canada Climate Law Initiative Webinar *"Helping audit committees navigate the changing climate governance landscape",* January 13, 2021

Panelist, British Institute for International and Comparative Law Webinar *"Emissions Trading: International Law and Dispute Resolution"*, November 18, 2020

Moderator & Panelist, IETA & ICC Webinar *"Article 6 of the Paris Agreement – What is it and Why is it Important for Business"*, November 5, 2020

Panelist, Global Conference on Environmental Taxation – "The Fate of Canada's Carbon Pricing Framework: In the Hands of the Supreme Court of Canada", September 25, 2020

Expert Commentator, Corporate Knights: "Building Back Better by Topping Up our Green Power Sources, Storage and Connections", April 29, 2020

Panelist, GLOBE 2020 Canada Climate Law Initiative – "Bracing for the Storm: Climate Litigation Risk", Vancouver, February 13, 2020

Panelist, GLOBE 2020 – "Climate Inaction on Trial: The Future of Litigation, Youth Advocacy and Industry Response", Vancouver, February 11, 2020

Panelist, Climate Finance Cleantech Global Workshop – "Low Carbon Economy 2.0: Expert Advice", Toronto, January 16, 2020

Panelist, UNFCCC, COP25 - International Carbon Action Partnership/International Emissions Trading Association/World Bank Panel with senior officials from EU, Germany, IETA, and WTO – "*Meeting NDC's through carbon pricing: State of play and updates from key jurisdictions*", Madrid, Spain, December 4, 2019

Panelist, Ontario Association for Impact Assessment Annual Conference 2019 – "*The Expert Panel: Dialogue Toward a Low Carbon Future*", Toronto, October 30, 2019

Moderator, Energy Storage in Canada Conference – "Markets and Regulators: Frameworks on the Move", Toronto, October 2, 2019

Panelist, United Nations Green Climate Fund Event – "Role of and Challenges for International Financial Institutions and Other Institutional

+1.647.991.1190 LISA@RESILIENTLLP.COM

Investors in Climate Finance", Seoul, September 26, 2019

Panelist, IBA Annual Conference – "Climate change law in an increasingly (bi)polarised world", Seoul, September 23, 2019

Panelist, Clean Energy Ministerial – 10 – "Fire-Side" Discussion: Today's Realities & Challenges: Climate Action, Trade and Markets, Vancouver, May 28, 2019

Panelist, Carbon Pricing For Canadian Industry – "Pan-Canadian Carbon Regulations: What Industry Needs to Know"; Toronto, April 25, 2019

Speaker, World Bank workshop – "Introduction to private sector financial instruments that could be used to finance REDD+", Washington D.C., March 21, 2019.

Moderator, Carbon Pricing: A Driver of Innovation and Risk Mitigation at Embassy of Canada – "*Industry and Financial Sector Perspectives*", Washington D.C., March 19, 2019

Moderator, Globe Capital 2019 – "The Clean Economy: Investment in Tumultuous Times", Toronto, February 27, 2019

Panelist, OEA Speaker Series, Toronto – "A Made-in-Ontario Environment Policy", Toronto, December 11, 2018

Panelist, UNFCCC, COP 24 – "Lessons learned from market mechanisms for development of "Paris Rulebook", Katowice, Poland, December 6, 2018

Panelist, UNFCCC, COP 24 – "Financing the transformation: What actions are needed to improve the low-carbon investment climate for industries?", Katowice, Poland, December 5, 2018

Panelist, UNFCCC, COP 24 – "Avoiding Double Counting under the Paris Agreement", Katowice, Poland, December 5, 2018

Presenter, G7 2018 Strategic Dialogue of the Carbon Market Platform – Business and Governance for International Negotiators "*Corporate strategy, long term investments, acquisitions, divestitures and the necessity of internal carbon pricing … preferably supported by stable climate policy*", Halifax, Nova Scotia September 21, 2018

Panelist, Energy Storage in Canada: Powering Up – "*The Great Debate:* What will Drive the Future of Energy Storage: Market Revenue, Regulated Return or a Hybrid?", Toronto, September 20, 2018

Panelist, Global Climate Action Summit – "*Future of Capacity Building*", San Francisco, September 11, 2018

Presenter, IGUA Carbon Policy Workshop – "Status of international, continental and domestic carbon pricing", Montreal, August 29, 2018

+1.647.991.1190 LISA@RESILIENTLLP.COM

Panelist, IHS Markit Workshop - Energy *Transition and the Oil Sands* – *"The pace of global and local action"*, Toronto, May 24, 2018

Panelist, Positive Energy Conference - "*The Role of Public Authorities in Energy Decision-Making – Is Canada Getting the Balance Right*?", April 24, 2018

Keynote Presenter, Ontario Cap and Trade Forum - "*Putting the backstop into context for cap and trade participants*", April 19, 2018

Panelist, Global Methane Forum: "*Policy Drivers for Successful CCM Project Implementation*", April 17, 2018

Presenter, Ontario Mining Association Energy Committee Meeting, April 9, 2018

Moderator, GLOBE 2018 - "*The 2 Degree World: The Future of Stranded Assets",* Vancouver, March 15, 2018

Presenter, Alberta and Saskatchewan Climate Policy Developments and Implications for Renewables, Alberta and Saskatchewan Renewable Energy Finance Summit 2018, February 6, 2018

MEDIA HIGHLIGHTS	CBA National – Quoted in "Aligning climate and trade", June 15, 2020. Carbon Pulse – Quoted in "Quebec to intervene in Saskatchewan's Supreme Court appeal over Canada CO2 price", July 2019.
	CBC Radio – The House with Chris Hall, February 16, 2019, speaking on the Saskatchewan Constitutional Reference on Canada's Carbon Pricing Legislation.
	The Agenda with Steve Paikin, "A Heated Legal Climate Energy", September 11, 2018.
	International Bar Association – Quoted in "Disclosing the climate facts", June 26, 2018
	The Telegram – Quoted in "Billions of dollars in limbo as incoming Ontario premier nixes cap and trade", June 24, 2018.

+1.647.991.1190 LISA@RESILIENTLLP.COM

The New York Times – Quoted in "Diplomats Confront New Threat to Paris Climate Pact: Donald Trump" by coral Davenport, November 18, 2016.

The Agenda with Steve Paikin, "Heated about Hydro", January 7, 2016 Paris COP21 negotiations quoted in **Carbon Pulse, Business Europe** and various other published media, December 2015.

The Agenda with Steve Paikin, "Cap and Trade in Ontario", January 28, 2015.

Corporate Knights Magazine - Featured in "Top Women in Sustainability", November 2013.

York U Magazine – Cover and Featured in "Finding their Niche", Summer 2013.

RANKINGS AND RECOGNITIONS *Canadian Legal Lexpert Directory*, 2024 – Consistently Recommended (Energy [Oil & Gas]); Repeatedly Recommended (Environmental Law & Energy [Electricity]).

Chambers Canada 2024+: Nationwide – Environment.

The Best Lawyers in Canada 2024+ – Environmental Law, Energy Regulatory Law, and Energy Law.

Chambers Canada 2023+: Nationwide - Environment.

Who's Who Legal: Thought Leaders Global Elite 2022, 2020, 2019, 2018, 2017 - Environment/ Climate Change.

The Best Lawyers in Canada 2023+ – Energy Law + Environmental Law.

Who's Who Legal 2022+: Climate Change and Environment.

Chambers Global 2021+: Global-wide – Climate Change.

The Best Lawyers in Canada 2021+ - Environmental Law.

Women in Business Law Expert Guide 2020+ – "a leading Energy and Natural Resources practitioner in Canada".

Canadian Legal Lexpert Directory, 2022 – Consistently Recommended (Energy [Oil & Gas]); Repeatedly Recommended (Environmental Law & Energy [Electricity]).

Chambers Global 2020+: Global-wide – Climate Change. "a well-known and well-regarded practitioner"

Chambers Canada 2020+: Nationwide - Environment.

+1.647.991.1190 LISA@RESILIENTLLP.COM

Lexpert Zenith Awards 2019: Celebrating Change Agents in Law – Winner for Energy Storage Projects for Indigenous Communities. Lawyer Monthly Women in Law award, 2018.

Lexpert, Top 40 Under 40.

Nicholas Daube

CASE EB-2022-0200 - Phase 1: Rates: Distribution: Enbridge Gas Inc.	COST CLAIM EB-2022-0200 : 1 : Monika Pecnikova	INTERVENOR NAME Pecnikova, Monika; +1 (647) 991-1190 monika@resilientllp.com	PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS Submitted
FILING PARTICIPANT Daube, Nicholas; +1 (647) 991-1190 nicholas@resilientIlp.com	NEW PARTICIPANT No	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME
SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE* Legal Counsel	YEAR CALLED TO BAR* 2007	COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF RELEVANT EXPERIENCE* 17	HOURLY RATE 290
HST RATE CHARGED* 13.00	CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST) CV Provided within Previous 24 Months	LAST CV DATE June 15, 2022	OVERRIDE HOURLY RATE No
HST NUMBER 712928407 RT0001	HEARINGS Yes	CONSULTATIONS No	DISBURSEMENTS No

HEARINGS

Hearings Hours 425.60	Hearings Subtotal (\$) 123,424.00		Hearings Total 16,045.12	Tax (\$)		arings Total (\$) 39,469.12
<u>Name</u>	Hours	<u>Hourly</u> Rate	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST</u> Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
DISCOVERY Read and Research Applicatior Evidence	and	290		13.00		
Preparation of Interrogatories	17.80	290	5,162.00	13.00	671.06	5,833.06
Review Interrogatory Response	es	290		13.00		
Technical Conference Preparat	ion 14.30	290	4,147.00	13.00	539.11	4,686.11
Technical Conference Attendan	ce 32.80	290	9,512.00	13.00	1,236.56	10,748.56
Technical Conference Follow-u	o	290		13.00		
Subtotal of DISCOVERY	64.90		18,821.00		2,446.73	21,267.73
PROCEDURAL Preparation of Issues List Subn	nission 1.10	290	319.00	13.00	41.47	360.47
Attendance at Issues List Confe	erence 6.60	290	1,914.00	13.00	248.82	2,162.82
Preparation for a Confidentiality	/ Request	290		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on Confid	lentiality	290		13.00		
Preparation of Motion(s) Materi	als	290		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Me	otion(s)	290		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motio	on(s)	290		13.00		
Review Procedural Documents	2.20	290	638.00	13.00	82.94	720.94

CC_Participant_Combined.rpt - last Update 20230601

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly</u> <u>Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST</u> Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Subtotal of PROCEDURAL	9.90		2,871.00		373.23	3,244.23
INTERVENOR EVIDENCE Preparation of Intervenor Evidence		290		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		290		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance		290		13.00		
at Hearing Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE Preparation for Settlement Conference	20.40	290	5,916.00	13.00	769.08	6,685.08
Attendance at Settlement Conference	54.30	290	15,747.00	13.00	2,047.11	17,794.11
Preparation of Settlement Proposal	44.10	290	12,789.00	13.00	1,662.57	14,451.57
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		290		13.00		
Subtotal of SETTLEMENT	118.80		34,452.00		4,478.76	38,930.76
CONFERENCE WRITTEN ARGUMENT Written Submissions	65.80	290	19,082.00	13.00	2,480.66	21,562.66
Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT	65.80		19,082.00		2,480.66	21,562.66
ORAL ARGUMENT Preparation for Oral Hearing	79.60	290	23,084.00	13.00	3,000.92	26,084.92
Attendance at Oral Hearing	86.60	290	25,114.00	13.00	3,264.82	28,378.82
Oral Submissions		290		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		290		13.00		
Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT	166.20		48,198.00		6,265.74	54,463.74
DECISION Review Decision		290		13.00		
Review Rate/Accounting Order		290		13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order		290		13.00		
Subtotal of DECISION	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
OTHER Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor Conferences)		290		13.00		
Subtotal of OTHER	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES Total Service Provider Fees	425.60		123,424.00		16,045.12	139,469.12

Attachments

<u>Attachment</u> EB-2022-0200_ Three Fires Group_Time Sheets_Nicholas Daube.pdf Document Type Time Docket Import Message

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

Attachment

EB-2022-0200_ Three Fires Group_Time Sheets_Nicholas Daube.pdf

Document Type Time Docket

<u>Claim Type</u> Hearings

Import Message

		EB-20	022-0200_ Three Fires Group_Time Shee	ets_Nichola	as Da	aube		
Туре	Date	Hours	Description	Rate (\$)	Bill	able (\$)	User	Bill#
TimeEntry	01/09/2023	0.8	ICP - Preparing for issues conference;	\$ 290.00	\$	232.00	N. Daube	23131
Time Entry	01/09/2023	6.6	ICA - Attending issues conference;	\$ 290.00	\$	1,914.00	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	01/12/2023	0.4	Reviewing proposed issues list and emails from counsel for intervenors;	\$ 290.00	\$	116.00	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	01/12/2023	0.3	ICP - Reviewing potential need for expert witness;	\$ 290.00	\$	87.00	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	01/13/2023	0.4	Reviewing draft letter to OEB regarding potential retainer of expert;	\$ 290.00	\$	116.00	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	01/30/2023	0.3	Reviewing OEB decision regarding issues list;	\$ 290.00	\$	87.00	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	02/03/2023	0.7	IRP - Reviewing record in preparation for written interrogatories;	\$ 290.00	\$	203.00	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	02/07/2023	4.1	IRP - Preparing written interrogatories and reviewing record in support of preparation;	\$ 290.00	\$	1,189.00	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	02/09/2023	9.7	IRP - Drafting written interrogatories;	\$ 290.00	\$	2,813.00	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	02/10/2023	3.3	IRP - Drafting written interrogatories; discussing same with client and obtaining instructions;	\$ 290.00	\$	957.00	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	03/15/2023	2.6	TCP - Preparing for technical conference;	\$ 290.00	\$	754.00	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	03/20/2023	6.9	TCP - Preparing questions for technical conference;	\$ 290.00	\$	2,001.00	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	03/22/2023	6.4	TCA - Attending Day 1 of technical conference;	\$ 290.00	\$	1,856.00	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	03/22/2023	2.2	TCP - Preparing for Day 1 of technical conference;	\$ 290.00	\$	638.00	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	03/23/2023	0.4	TCP - Preparing for Day 2 of technical conference;	\$ 290.00	\$	116.00	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	03/23/2023	6.5	TCA - Attending Day 2 of technical conference;	\$ 290.00	\$	1,885.00	N. Daube	23131

TimeEntry	03/24/2023	56	TCA - Attending technical conference;	\$ 290.00) \$	1 624 00	N. Daube	23131
					-	•		
	03/27/2023		TCA - Attending technical conference;	\$ 290.00			N. Daube	23131
	03/28/2023		TCA - Attending technical conference;	\$ 290.00			N. Daube	23131
,	03/30/2023		TCA - Attending technical conference;	\$ 290.00			N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	04/24/2023	2.2	TCP - Reviewing IGUA and updated	\$ 290.00) \$	638.00	N. Daube	23131
			Guidehouse expert evidence;					
TimeEntry	04/27/2023	6.4	TCA - Attending technical conference;	\$ 290.00) \$	1,856.00	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	05/17/2023	3.6	SCP - Reviewing IGUA expert evidence	\$ 290.00) \$	1,044.00	N. Daube	23131
-			and preparing for settlement conference;					
TimeEntry	05/19/2023	1.6	SCP - Participating in call with clients to	\$ 290.00) \$	464.00	N. Daube	23131
			obtain instructions for upcoming					
			settlement conference and preparing					
			requested information to send to clients					
			following the call;					
TimeEntry	05/18/2023	2.2	SCP - Preparing for client call regarding	\$ 290.00) \$	638.00	N. Daube	23131
			upcoming settlement conference and					
			reviewing most recent evidence updates;					
			3 • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •					
TimeEntry	05/23/2023	4.4	SCP - Preparing for and attending	\$ 290.00) \$	1.276.00	N. Daube	23131
			discussion with other intervenors	,		,		
			regarding upcoming settlement					
			conference; drafting settlement					
			conference position for approval by					
			clients and circulation to other parties;					
TimeEntry	05/24/2023	47	SCP - Reviewing record and preparing	\$ 290.00) \$	1 363 00	N. Daube	23131
	00/24/2020	7.7	settlement conference position for client	φ 200.00	γ Ψ	1,000.00	N. Daube	20101
			review and instructions; drafting client					
			email providing update on recent					
			discussions with intervenors and					
			requesting instructions in advance of					
			settlement conference;					
			settlement comerence,					

TimeEntry	05/25/2023	2.9	SCP - Reviewing applicable law	\$ 29	0.00	\$ 841.00	N. Daube	23131
			regarding duty to consult;					
TimeEntry	05/26/2023	0.6	SCP - Finalizing and circulating	\$ 29	0.00	\$ 174.00	N. Daube	23131
			statement of position regarding					
			indigenous consultation to other					
			intervenors for purposes of settlement					
			conference;					
TimeEntry	05/29/2023		SCA - Attending settlement conference;	\$ 29		\$	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	05/30/2023	6.9	SCA - Attending day 2 of settlement	\$ 29	0.00	\$ 2,001.00	N. Daube	23131
			conference;					
TimeEntry	05/31/2023	2.8	SPP - Drafting terms for settlement	\$ 29	0.00	\$ 812.00	N. Daube	23131
			proposal relating to Issue #4 (adequacy					
			of consultations);					
TimeEntry	05/29/2023	0.4	SCP - Preparing for settlement	\$ 29	0.00	\$ 116.00	N. Daube	23131
			conference;					
TimeEntry	05/31/2023	3.6	SCA - Attending day 3 of settlement	\$ 29	0.00	\$ 1,044.00	N. Daube	23131
			conference;					
TimeEntry	06/01/2023		SCA - Attending settlement conference;	\$ 29		\$ 1	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	06/02/2023	2.7	SPP - Coordinating comments from other	\$ 29	0.00	\$ 783.00	N. Daube	23131
			intervenors concerning settlement					
			proposal on the issue of indigenous					
			consultations and revising draft terms of					
			reference for circulation to Enbridge in					
			context of settlement discussions;					
TimeEntry	06/02/2023	2.6	SCA - Participating in settlement	\$ 29	0.00	\$ 754.00	N. Daube	23131
			conference;					
TimeEntry	06/05/2023		SCA - Attending settlement conference;	\$ 29		\$	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	06/06/2023		SCA - Attending settlement conference;	\$ 29		\$,	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	06/07/2023	1.2	SPP - Drafting response to EGI	\$ 29	0.00	\$ 348.00	N. Daube	23131
			concerning proposals relating to Issue					
			#4, Indigenous Consultations;					

TimeEntry	06/07/2023	0.4	SPP - Obtaining client instructions regarding response to EGI concerning proposals relating to Issue #4, Indigenous Consultations;	\$ 290.00	\$ 116.00	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	06/07/2023	5.2	SCA - Participating in settlement conference;	\$ 290.00	\$ 1,508.00	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	06/08/2023	3.9	SCA - Participating in settlement conference;	\$ 290.00	\$ 1,131.00	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	06/08/2023	0.4	SPP - Obtaining updated instructions from client regarding Issue #4, Indigenous Consultations, for purposes of call with opposing counsel;	\$ 290.00	\$ 116.00	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	06/09/2023	6.3	SCA - Participating in settlement conference, including direct discussions with counsel to EGI regarding Issue #4, Indigenous consultations;	\$ 290.00	\$ 1,827.00	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	06/12/2023	0.7	SPP - Communication with client - Drafting client update regarding conclusion of settlement conference;	\$ 290.00	\$ 203.00	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	06/14/2023	1.4	SPP - Reviewing EGI settlement proposal regarding consultations and drafting recommendations regarding same to client;	\$ 290.00	\$ 406.00	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	06/14/2023	0.3	SPP - Obtaining telephone instructions from client regarding EGI settlement offer;	\$ 290.00	\$ 87.00	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	06/14/2023		SPP - Drafting responding settlement offer to EGI's most recent proposal in collaboration with Ginoogaming First Nation;	\$ 290.00	\$	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	06/15/2023	1	SPP - Exchanging emails with client regarding status of settlement discussions and to obtain instructions;	\$ 290.00	\$ 290.00	N. Daube	23131

TimeEntry	06/16/2023	1.7	SPP - Participating in settlement discussions with EGI regarding Issue #4;	\$ 290.00	\$ 493.00	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	06/16/2023	0.2	SPP - Participating in call with Mark Rubinstein to update intervenor group on status of negotiations relating to Issue #4;	\$ 290.00	\$ 58.00	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	06/16/2023	1.4	SPP- Attending settlement discussions with other intervenors regarding status of O&M agreement;	\$ 290.00	\$ 406.00	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	06/16/2023		SPP - Drafting email to client to provide update on settlement discussions and seeking instructions on next steps;	\$ 290.00	\$	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	06/16/2023	0.4	SPP - Drafting email to counsel for Ginoogaming regarding next steps in settlement discussions;	\$ 290.00	\$ 116.00	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	06/19/2023	0.8	SPP - Reviewing current draft of settlement agreement and drafting related client update;	\$ 290.00	\$ 232.00	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	06/20/2023	1.1	SPP - Reviewing settlement agreement with comments to intervenor group;	\$ 290.00	\$ 319.00	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	06/20/2023	1.7	SPP - Reviewing most recent settlement offer from EGI regarding Indigenous consultations, with comments to counsel for Ginoogaming and report to client requesting instructions;	\$ 290.00	\$ 493.00	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	06/21/2023	2.8	SPP - Drafting revised settlement agreement in relation to Issue #4;	\$ 290.00	\$ 812.00	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	06/23/2023	0.8	SPP- Participating in settlement call with EGI regarding Issue #4;	\$ 290.00	\$ 232.00	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	06/23/2023	0.5	SPP - Participating in call with and obtaining instructions from client regarding Issue #4;	\$ 290.00	\$ 145.00	N. Daube	23131

06/23/2023	0.2	SPP - Participating in call with counsel to	\$ 200.00	¢	58.00		23131
00/23/2023	0.2	SEC regarding Issue #4 and position of	φ 290.00	Ψ	56.00	N. Daube	23131
		other intervenors;					
06/23/2023	1.2	SPP - Drafting budget and related	\$ 290.00	\$	348.00	N. Daube	23131
		provisions for incorporation in Issue #4					
		settlement document;					
06/25/2023	0.5	SPP - Reviewing and commenting on	\$ 290.00	\$	145.00	N. Daube	23131
		most recent draft of settlement					
		agreement;					
06/26/2023	1.7	• • • •	\$ 290.00	\$	493.00	N. Daube	23131
		revisions to issue #4 settlement					
		agreement;					
06/27/2023	0.3		\$ 290.00	\$	87.00	N. Daube	23131
		<i></i>					
06/27/2023	0.3		\$ 290.00	\$	87.00	N. Daube	23131
		5 5					
		5					
06/27/2023	1.3		\$ 290.00	\$	377.00	N. Daube	23131
		-					
06/27/2023	0.6	5	\$ 290.00	\$	174.00	N. Daube	23131
		regarding issue #4 settlement agreement;					
06/27/2023	4.1	SPP - Drafting proposed amendments to	\$ 290.00	\$	1.189.00	N. Daube	23131
		.	+	Ŧ	.,		
		of communications with other intervenors;					
06/27/2023	0.8	SPP - Discussions and obtaining	\$ 290.00	\$	232.00	N. Daube	23131
	0.0	Ŭ	+ 200.00	Ť	_000		_0.01
		communications with other intervenors;					
	06/25/2023	06/23/2023 1.2 06/25/2023 0.5 06/26/2023 1.7 06/27/2023 0.3 06/27/2023 0.3 06/27/2023 0.3 06/27/2023 0.3 06/27/2023 0.3 06/27/2023 1.3 06/27/2023 1.4	SEC regarding Issue #4 and position of other intervenors;06/23/20231.206/23/20231.2SPP - Drafting budget and related provisions for incorporation in Issue #4 settlement document;06/25/20230.5SPP - Reviewing and commenting on most recent draft of settlement agreement;06/26/20231.7SPP - Reviewing and drafting proposed revisions to issue #4 settlement agreement;06/27/20230.3SPP - Calls and emails with counsel to School Energy Coalition regarding issue #4 settlement agreement;06/27/20230.3SPP - Calls and emails with counsel to Six Nations Natural Gas regarding issue #4 settlement agreement;06/27/20231.3SPP - Participating in video conference with intervenor group regarding issue #4 settlement agreement;06/27/20230.6SPP - Drafting various emails to EGI regarding issue #4 settlement agreement;06/27/20230.6SPP - Drafting proposed amendments to issue #4 settlement agreement;06/27/20230.8SPP - Discussions and obtaining instructions from client regarding proposed amendments to issue #4 settlement agreement on basis of communications with other intervenors;	SEC regarding Issue #4 and position of other intervenors;06/23/20231.2SPP - Drafting budget and related provisions for incorporation in Issue #4 settlement document;\$ 290.0006/25/20230.5SPP - Reviewing and commenting on most recent draft of settlement agreement;\$ 290.0006/26/20231.7SPP - Reviewing and drafting proposed revisions to issue #4 settlement agreement;\$ 290.0006/27/20230.3SPP - Calls and emails with counsel to School Energy Coalition regarding issue #4 settlement agreement;\$ 290.0006/27/20230.3SPP - Calls and emails with counsel to Six Nations Natural Gas regarding issue #4 settlement agreement;\$ 290.0006/27/20231.3SPP - Participating in video conference with intervenor group regarding issue #4 settlement agreement;\$ 290.0006/27/20230.6SPP - Drafting various emails to EGI regarding issue #4 settlement agreement;\$ 290.0006/27/20230.6SPP - Drafting proposed amendments to issue #4 settlement agreement;\$ 290.0006/27/20230.8SPP - Drafting proposed amendments to issue #4 settlement agreement;\$ 290.0006/27/20230.8SPP - Discussions and obtaining instructions from client regarding proposed amendments to issue #4 settlement agreement to basis of\$ 290.00	SEC regarding Issue #4 and position of other intervenors;06/23/20231.2SPP - Drafting budget and related provisions for incorporation in Issue #4 settlement document;\$ 290.00\$06/25/20230.5SPP - Reviewing and commenting on most recent draft of settlement agreement;\$ 290.00\$06/26/20231.7SPP - Reviewing and drafting proposed revisions to issue #4 settlement agreement;\$ 290.00\$06/27/20230.3SPP - Reviewing and drafting proposed revisions to issue #4 settlement agreement;\$ 290.00\$06/27/20230.3SPP - Calls and emails with counsel to School Energy Coalition regarding issue #4 settlement agreement;\$ 290.00\$06/27/20230.3SPP - Calls and emails with counsel to Six Nations Natural Gas regarding issue #4 settlement agreement;\$ 290.00\$06/27/20231.3SPP - Participating in video conference with intervenor group regarding issue #4 settlement agreement;\$ 290.00\$06/27/20230.6SPP - Drafting various emails to EGI regarding issue #4 settlement agreement;\$ 290.00\$06/27/20234.1SPP - Drafting proposed amendments to issue #4 settlement agreement on basis of communications with other intervenors;\$ 290.00\$06/27/20230.8SPP - Discussions and obtaining instructions from client regarding proposed amendments to issue #4 settlement agreement on basis of\$ 290.00\$	SEC regarding Issue #4 and position of other intervenors;SEC regarding Issue #4 and position of other intervenors;06/23/20231.2SPP - Drafting budget and related provisions for incorporation in Issue #4 settlement document;\$ 290.00\$ 348.0006/25/20230.5SPP - Reviewing and commenting on most recent draft of settlement agreement;\$ 290.00\$ 145.0006/26/20231.7SPP - Reviewing and drafting proposed revisions to issue #4 settlement agreement;\$ 290.00\$ 493.0006/27/20230.3SPP - Calls and emails with counsel to School Energy Coalition regarding issue #4 settlement agreement;\$ 290.00\$ 87.0006/27/20230.3SPP - Calls and emails with counsel to Six Nations Natural Gas regarding issue #4 settlement agreement;\$ 290.00\$ 87.0006/27/20230.3SPP - Participating in video conference with intervenor group regarding issue #4 settlement agreement;\$ 290.00\$ 87.0006/27/20231.3SPP - Drafting various emails to EGI regarding issue #4 settlement agreement;\$ 290.00\$ 174.0006/27/20230.6SPP - Drafting proposed amendments to issue #4 settlement agreement on basis of communications with other intervenors;\$ 290.00\$ 1,189.0006/27/20230.8SPP - Discussions and obtaining instructions from client regarding proposed amendments to issue #4 settlement agreement on basis of communications with other intervenors;\$ 290.00\$ 232.0006/27/20230.8SPP - Discussions and obtaining instructions from client regarding proposed amendments to issue	SEC regarding Issue #4 and position of other intervenors;SEC regarding Issue #4 and position of other intervenors;06/23/20231.2SPP - Drafting budget and related provisions for incorporation in Issue #4 settlement document;\$ 290.00\$ 348.00N. Daube06/25/20230.5SPP - Reviewing and commenting on most recent draft of settlement agreement;\$ 290.00\$ 145.00N. Daube06/26/20231.7SPP - Reviewing and drafting proposed revisions to issue #4 settlement agreement;\$ 290.00\$ 493.00N. Daube06/27/20230.3SPP - Calls and emails with counsel to School Energy Coalition regarding issue #4 settlement agreement;\$ 290.00\$ 87.00N. Daube06/27/20230.3SPP - Calls and emails with counsel to Six Nations Natural Gas regarding issue #4 settlement agreement;\$ 290.00\$ 87.00N. Daube06/27/20230.3SPP - Participating in video conference with intervenor group regarding issue #4 settlement agreement;\$ 290.00\$ 377.00N. Daube06/27/20231.3SPP - Drafting various emails to EGI regarding issue #4 settlement agreement;\$ 290.00\$ 174.00N. Daube06/27/20234.1SPP - Drafting proposed amendments to issue #4 settlement agreement;\$ 290.00\$ 1,189.00N. Daube06/27/20230.8SPP - Discussions and obtaining instructions from client regarding proposed amendments to issue #4 settlement agreement to basis of communications with other intervenors;\$ 290.00\$ 1,189.00N. Daube06/27/20230.8

TimeEntry	06/28/2023		SPP - Reviewing global settlement document and obtaining instructions from client to confirm settlement position;	\$ 290.00	\$ 319.00	N. Daube	23131
TimeEntry	06/29/2023		SPP - Calls with and obtaining instructions from client regarding issue #4 negotiations;	290	\$ 261.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	07/04/2023		SPP - Drafting summary of settlement of Issue #4 for client;	290	\$ 348.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	07/05/2023	0.3	SPP - Call with counsel to EGI regarding email from OEB staff clarifying settlement proposal;	290	\$ 87.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	07/05/2023		SPP - Participated in call with OEB staff and counsel to Enbridge regarding settlement proposal;	290	\$ 145.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	07/05/2023		SPP - Participated in two calls with counsel to Enbridge re settlement proposal;	290	\$ 174.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	07/05/2023	0.9	OHP - Preparing for upcoming hearing;	290	\$ 261.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	07/06/2023		OHP - Drafting edits for response to OEB staff letter regarding Indigenous consultations;	290	\$ 174.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	07/06/2023		OHP - Preparing for energy transition aspects of hearing;	290	\$ 1,421.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	07/07/2023		OHP - Preparing for hearing, evidence review and key points of cross examination;	290	\$ 1,914.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	07/10/2023	0.8	SPP - Participating in settlement discussions with OEB staff and Enbridge regarding resolution of Issue #4;	290	\$ 232.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	07/10/2023	7.2	OHP - Preparing for hearing;	290	\$ 2,088.00	N. Daube	23185

TimeEntry	07/11/2023	1.4	SPP - Engaging in settlement	290	\$ 406.00	N. Daube	23185
			discussions regarding Issue #4 dispute				
			resolution mechanism with Enbridge;				
TimeEntry	07/11/2023	7.6	OHP - Preparing for hearing;	290	2,204.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	07/12/2023		SPP - Participating in call with other	290	\$ 377.00	N. Daube	23185
-			intervenors regarding status of Issue #4				
			negotiations and negotiating revised text				
			with EGI and OEB Staff;				
TimeEntry	07/12/2023	7.7	OHP - Preparing for hearing;	290	\$ 2,233.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	07/13/2023	6.4	OHA - Attending hearing;	290	\$ 1,856.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	07/13/2023	0.8	OHP - Preparing opening statement for	290	\$ 232.00	N. Daube	23185
			hearing;				
TimeEntry	07/14/2023		OHA - Attending hearing;	290	\$ 1,769.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	07/16/2023	6.1	OHP - Preparing cross-examination for	290	\$ 1,769.00	N. Daube	23185
			panel #1 at hearing;				
TimeEntry	07/19/2023	1.2	OHP - Coordination with counsel to	290	\$ 348.00	N. Daube	23185
			Ginoogaing re: cross-examinations at				
			hearing;				
TimeEntry	07/19/2023	6.3	OHA - Attending hearing;	290	\$	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	07/18/2023	6.6	OHA - Attending hearing;	290	\$ 1,914.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	07/17/2023		OHA - Attending hearing;	290	\$ 1,827.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	07/18/2023	1.1	OHP - Preparing for day's cross-	290	\$ 319.00	N. Daube	23185
			examination of energy transition panel;				
TimeEntry	07/20/2023	6.1	OHA - Attending hearing;	290	\$ 1,769.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	07/21/2023	3.7	OHP - Preparing for upcoming panel on	290	\$ 1,073.00	N. Daube	23185
			equity thickness;				
TimeEntry	07/22/2023	1.8	OHP - Preparing for equity thickness	290	\$ 522.00	N. Daube	23185
			portion of hearing;				
TimeEntry	07/23/2023	1.4	OHP - Preparing for equity thickness	290	\$ 406.00	N. Daube	23185
			portion of hearing;				
TimeEntry	07/24/2023	2.7	OHP - Preparing cross-examination for	290	\$ 783.00	N. Daube	23185
			equity thickness panel;				
TimeEntry	07/24/2023	4.4	OHA - Attending hearing;	290	\$ 1,276.00	N. Daube	23185

TimeEntry	07/25/2023	0.6	OHP - Preparing for equity thickness cross-examination;	290	\$	174.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	07/25/2023	6.7	OHA - Attending hearing;	290	\$	1,943.00	N. Daube	23185
	07/26/2023	1.1	OHP - Preparing for equity thickness cross-examination and cross-examination of OEB expert;	290	•		N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	07/26/2023	5.9	OHA - Attending hearing;	290	\$	1,711.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	07/27/2023		OHP - Preparing for upcoming cross- examinations;	290	\$		N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	07/31/2023		OHA - Attending hearing virtually;	290	\$	783.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	07/31/2023		OHP - Preparing for upcoming cross- examinations;	290	•		N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	08/01/2023		OHP - Preparing for cross-examination on asset management plan;	290	•		N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	08/01/2023		OHA - Attending hearing;	290	\$	1,218.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	08/03/2023	4.6	OHA - Attending hearing;	290	\$	1,334.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	08/02/2023		OHP - Preparing for cross-examination on asset management plan;	290	\$	348.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	08/02/2023	4.8	OHA - Attending hearing;	290	\$	1,392.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	08/03/2023	1.7	OHP - Preparing for depreciation cross- examinations;	290	\$	493.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	08/04/2023		OHP - Preparing for depreciation cross- examination;	290	\$	754.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	08/08/2023	2.1	OHA - Attending hearing;	290	\$	609.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	08/08/2023	1.3	OHP - Preparing for depreciation cross- examination;	290	\$	377.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	08/09/2023	3.2	OHA - Attending hearing;	290	\$	928.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	08/10/2023	5.6	OHA - Attending hearing;	290	\$	1,624.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	08/09/2023	1.9	OHP - Preparing for depreciation cross- examination;	290	\$	551.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	08/11/2023	4.6	OHA - Attending hearing;	290	\$	1,334.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	08/17/2023		APR - Reviewing and organizing transcript evidence for final submissions;	290	\$	754.00	N. Daube	23185

TimeEntry	08/18/2023		APR - Reviewing and organizing	290	\$ 493.00	N. Daube	23185
			transcript evidence for final submissions;				
TimeEntry	08/21/2023	3.5	APR - Reviewing and organizing	290	\$ 1,015.00	N. Daube	23185
			evidence for written submissions;				
TimeEntry	08/23/2023	1.8	APR - Reviewing and organizing	290	\$ 522.00	N. Daube	23185
			evidence for written submissions;				
TimeEntry	08/24/2023	2.5	APR - Prepare final argument;	290	\$ 725.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	08/31/2023	6.2	APR - Prepare final argument;	290	\$ 1,798.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	09/08/2023		APR - Organizing and drafting final submissions;	290	\$ 2,059.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	09/09/2023		APR - Organizing and drafting final submissions;	290	\$ 1,827.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	09/10/2023	4.2	APR - Organizing and redrafting final submissions;	290	\$ 1,218.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	09/11/2023		APR - Organizing and redrafting final submissions;	290	\$ 1,044.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	09/12/2023	7.6	APR - and revising final submissions as per client;	290	\$ 2,204.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	09/13/2023		APR - Organizing and drafting final submissions as per client;	290	\$ 2,813.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	09/14/2023		APR - Finalize and submit final submissions;	290	\$ 1,537.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	09/18/2023	0.8	APR - Revising final argument;	290	\$ 232.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	09/19/2023		APR - Finalizing and filing written submissions;	290	\$ 841.00	N. Daube	23185
TimeEntry	01/30/2024		Reviewing EGI's reply submissions;	290	\$ 319.00	N. Daube	24127
Total		425.6			\$ 123,424.00		

Daniel Vollmer

CASE EB-2022-0200 - Phase 1: Rates: Distribution: Enbridge Gas Inc.	COST CLAIM EB-2022-0200 : 1 : Monika Pecnikova	INTERVENOR NAME Pecnikova, Monika; +1 (647) 991-1190 monika@resilientllp.com	PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS Submitted
FILING PARTICIPANT Vollmer, Daniel; +1 (647) 991-1190 daniel@resilientllp.com	NEW PARTICIPANT No	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME
SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE* Legal Counsel	YEAR CALLED TO BAR* 2020	COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF RELEVANT EXPERIENCE* 2	HOURLY RATE 170
HST RATE CHARGED* 13.00	CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST) CV Provided within Previous 24 Months	LAST CV DATE April 27, 2024	OVERRIDE HOURLY RATE No
HST NUMBER 712928407 RT0001	HEARINGS Yes	CONSULTATIONS No	DISBURSEMENTS No

HEARINGS

Hearings Hours 1.00	Hearings Subtotal (\$) 170.00		Hearings Total ⁻ 22.10	Tax (\$)	-	js Total (\$) 92.10
<u>Name</u>	Hours	<u>Hourly</u> <u>Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST</u> Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
DISCOVERY Read and Research Application an Evidence	nd	170		13.00		
Preparation of Interrogatories		170		13.00		
Review Interrogatory Responses		170		13.00		
Technical Conference Preparation		170		13.00		
Technical Conference Attendance		170		13.00		
Technical Conference Follow-up		170		13.00		
Subtotal of DISCOVERY	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
PROCEDURAL Preparation of Issues List Submiss	sion	170		13.00		
Attendance at Issues List Confere	nce	170		13.00		
Preparation for a Confidentiality R	equest	170		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on Confider	ntiality	170		13.00		
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		170		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motio	on(s)	170		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion	s)	170		13.00		
Review Procedural Documents		170		13.00		

CC_Participant_Combined.rpt - last Update 20230601

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly</u> <u>Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST</u> Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Subtotal of PROCEDURAL	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
INTERVENOR EVIDENCE Preparation of Intervenor Evidence		170		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		170		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE	0.00	170	0.00	13.00	0.00	0.00
	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE Preparation for Settlement Conference		170		13.00		
Attendance at Settlement Conference		170		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		170		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		170		13.00		
Subtotal of SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE WRITTEN ARGUMENT	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
Written Submissions		170		13.00		
Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
ORAL ARGUMENT Preparation for Oral Hearing	1.00	170	170.00	13.00	22.10	192.10
Attendance at Oral Hearing		170		13.00		
Oral Submissions		170		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		170		13.00		
Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT	1.00		170.00		22.10	192.10
DECISION Review Decision		170		13.00		
Review Rate/Accounting Order		170		13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order		170		13.00		
Subtotal of DECISION	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
OTHER Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor Conferences)		170		13.00		
Subtotal of OTHER	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES Total Service Provider Fees	1.00		170.00		22.10	192.10

Attachments

<u>Attachment</u> EB-2022-0200_Three Fires Group_Time Sheets_Daniel Vollmer.pdf Document Type Time Docket Import Message

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

Attachment

EB-2022-0200_Three Fires Group_Time Sheets_Daniel Vollmer.pdf Document Type Time Docket <u>Claim Type</u> Hearings Import Message

EB-2022-0200_Three Fires Group_Time Sheets_Daniel Vollmer

Туре	Date	Hours	Description	Rate (\$)	Billable (\$	User	Bill number
TimeEntry	08/09/2023	1	OHP - Assist N. Daube;	\$ 170.00	\$ 170.00	Daniel Vollmer	23185
Total		1			\$ 170.00		

Don Richardson

CASE EB-2022-0200 - Phase 1: Rates: Distribution: Enbridge Gas Inc.	COST CLAIM EB-2022-0200 : 1 : Monika Pecnikova	INTERVENOR NAME Pecnikova, Monika; +1 (647) 991-1190 monika@resilientllp.com	PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS Submitted
		NON-FILING	NON-FILING

FILING PARTICIPANT Richardson, Don; +1 (226) 820-5086 don.richardson@threefiresgroup.c om	NEW PARTICIPANT No	PARTICIPANT F. NAME	PARTICIPANT L. NAME
SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE* Consultant	YEAR CALLED TO BAR*	COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF RELEVANT EXPERIENCE* 25	HOURLY RATE 330
HST RATE CHARGED* 13.00	CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST) CV Attached	LAST CV DATE April 29, 2024	OVERRIDE HOURLY RATE No
HST NUMBER 712928407 RT0001	HEARINGS Yes	CONSULTATIONS No	DISBURSEMENTS No

HEARINGS

Hearings Hours 12.25	Hearings Subtotal (\$) 4,042.50		Hearings Total 525.54	Tax (\$)		gs Total (\$) 568.04
<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly</u> <u>Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST</u> Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
DISCOVERY Read and Research Application a Evidence	and	330		13.00		
Preparation of Interrogatories	1.50	330	495.00	13.00	64.35	559.35
Review Interrogatory Responses		330		13.00		
Technical Conference Preparatio	n 0.75	330	247.50	13.00	32.18	279.68
Technical Conference Attendance	e	330		13.00		
Technical Conference Follow-up		330		13.00		
Subtotal of DISCOVERY	2.25		742.50		96.53	839.03
PROCEDURAL Preparation of Issues List Submit	ssion	330		13.00		
Attendance at Issues List Confer	ence	330		13.00		
Preparation for a Confidentiality I	Request	330		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on Confide	ntiality	330		13.00		
Preparation of Motion(s) Material	s	330		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Mot	ion(s)	330		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion	(s)	330		13.00		
Review Procedural Documents	0.75	330	247.50	13.00	32.18	279.68

CC_Participant_Combined.rpt - last Update 20230601

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST</u> Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Tota</u>
Subtotal of PROCEDURAL	0.75		247.50		32.18	279.68
NTERVENOR EVIDENCE Preparation of Intervenor Evidence		330		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		330		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE	0.00	330	0.00	13.00	0.00	0.00
ETTLEMENT CONFERENCE	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
Preparation for Settlement Conference	1.00	330	330.00	13.00	42.90	372.90
Attendance at Settlement Conference		330		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal	8.25	330	2,722.50	13.00	353.93	3,076.43
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		330		13.00		
Subtotal of SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE /RITTEN ARGUMENT	9.25		3,052.50		396.83	3,449.3
Written Submissions		330		13.00		
Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.0
RAL ARGUMENT Preparation for Oral Hearing		330		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		330		13.00		
Oral Submissions		330		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		330		13.00		
Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.0
ECISION				40.00		
Review Decision		330		13.00		
Review Rate/Accounting Order		330		13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order		330		13.00		
Subtotal of DECISION	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.0
OTHER Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor Conferences)		330		13.00		
Subtotal of OTHER	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.0
OTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES	12.25		4,042.50		525.54	4,568.0

Attachments

Attachment	Document Type
EB-2022-0200_Three Fires Group_Time	Time Docket
Sheets_Don Richardson.pdf	
Invoice_1058_from_Three_Fires_Group_Inc.	Invoice
pdf	
DonRichardson_OEB_CV_2024.pdf	CV

Import Message

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

Attachment EB-2022-0200_Three Fires Group_Time	Document Type Time Docket	<u>Claim Type</u> Hearings	Import Message
Sheets_Don Richardson.pdf Invoice_1058_from_Three_Fires_Group_In	Invoice	Hearings	
c.pdf DonRichardson_OEB_CV_2024.pdf	CV	Hearings	

		EB-2	022-0200_ Three Fires Group_Time Sh	eet	s_Don R	icha	rdson		
Туре	Date	Hours	Description	Ra	ite (\$)	Billa	able (\$)	User	Bill#
TimeEntry	01/13/2023	0.75	Review of file re Intervenor status;	\$	330.00	\$	247.50	Don Richardson	1058
TimeEntry	02/10/2023	1.5	IRP - Review and commnet on	\$	330.00	\$	495.00	Don Richardson	1058
			interrogatories/ discussion with legal						
			counsel;						
TimeEntry	03/14/2023	0.75	TCP - Review of EGI responses to	\$	330.00	\$	247.50	Don Richardson	1058
			interrogatories/ discussion with legal counsel;						
TimeEntry	05/19/2023	1	SCP - Discussion with legal counsel - approach to settlement agreement;	\$	330.00	\$	330.00	Don Richardson	1058
TimeEntry	05/30/2023	0.5	SPP - Discussion with legal counsel - settlement agreement;	\$	330.00	\$	165.00	Don Richardson	1058
TimeEntry	06/01/2023	0.75	SPP - Review of contents for settlement agreement/ discussion with legal counsel;	\$	330.00	\$	247.50	Don Richardson	1058
TimeEntry	06/02/2023	0.5	SPP - Review of contents for settlement agreement/ discussion with legal counsel;	\$	330.00	\$	165.00	Don Richardson	1058
TimeEntry	06/05/2023	0.75	SPP - Review of settlement conference response re Rebasing Issue #4/ discussion with legal counsel;	\$	330.00	\$	247.50	Don Richardson	1058
TimeEntry	06/06/2023	0.75	SPP - Review of settlement conference response re Rebasing Issue #4/ discussion with legal counsel;	\$	330.00	\$	247.50	Don Richardson	1058
TimeEntry	06/07/2023	0.5	SPP - Review of settlement conference response re Rebasing Issue #4/ discussion with legal counsel;	\$	330.00	\$	165.00	Don Richardson	1058
TimeEntry	06/08/2023	0.25	SPP - Review of settlement agreement progress;	\$	330.00	\$	82.50	Don Richardson	1058
TimeEntry	06/09/2023	0.5	SPP - Review of settlement conference response re Rebasing Issue #4/ discussion with legal counsel;	\$	330.00	\$	165.00	Don Richardson	1058

Total		12.25			\$ 4	1,042.50		
TimeEntry	06/28/2023	0.25	SPP - Review of settlement conference response re Rebasing Issue #4/ discussion with legal counsel;	\$ 330.00	\$	82.50	Don Richardson	1058
	06/27/2023		SPP - Review of settlement conference response re Rebasing Issue #4/ discussion with legal counsel;	\$ 330.00		330.00	Don Richardson	1058
TimeEntry	06/21/2023	0.25	SPP - Review of settlement conference response re Rebasing Issue #4/ discussion with legal counsel;	\$ 330.00	\$	82.50	Don Richardson	1058
TimeEntry	06/20/2023	1.25	SPP - Review of settlement conference response re Rebasing Issue #4/ discussion with legal counsel;	\$ 330.00	\$	412.50	Don Richardson	1058
TimeEntry	06/15/2023	0.25	SPP - Review of settlement conference response re Rebasing Issue #4/ discussion with legal counsel;	\$ 330.00	\$	82.50	Don Richardson	1058
TimeEntry	06/12/2023	0.75	SPP - Review of settlement conference response re Rebasing Issue #4/ discussion with legal counsel;	\$ 330.00	\$	247.50	Don Richardson	1058

Three Fires Group Inc.

9119 West Ipperwash Rd, Unit A Kettle & Stony Point First Nation ON N0N 1J1 GST/HST Registration No.: 712928407 RT0001

INVOICE

BILL TO Resilient LLP 333 Bay Street, Suite 625

Toronto ON M5H 2R2

PROJECT NAME

EGI Rebasing - 2022-0200

DATE DESCRIPTION QTY Review of file re Intervenor status 13/01/2023 0.75 330.00 247.50 10/02/2023 Review and comment on interrogatories / discussion with 1.50 330.00 495.00 legal counsel Review of EGI responses to interogatories / discussion 14/03/2023 0.75 330.00 247.50 with legal counsel 19/05/2023 Discussion with legal counsel - approach to settlement 1 330.00 330.00 agreement 30/05/2023 Discussion with legal counsel - settlement agreement 0.50 330.00 165.00 01/06/2023 Review of contents for settlement agreement / discussion 0.75 330.00 247.50 with legal counsel 02/06/2023 Review of contents for settlement agreement / discussion 0.50 330.00 165.00 with legal counsel 05/06/2023 Review of settlement conference response re Rebasing 0.75 330.00 247.50 Issue #4 / discussion with legal counsel 330.00 Review of settlement conference response re Rebasing 0.75 247.50 06/06/2023 Issue #4 / discussion with legal counsel Review of settlement conference response re Rebasing 07/06/2023 0.50 330.00 165.00 Issue #4 / discussion with legal counsel 08/06/2023 Review of settlement agreement progress 0.25 330.00 82.50 09/06/2023 Review of settlement conference response re Rebasing 0.50 330.00 165.00 Issue #4 / discussion with legal counsel Review of settlement conference response re Rebasing 12/06/2023 0.75 330.00 247.50 Issue #4 / discussion with legal counsel 15/06/2023 Review of settlement conference response re Rebasing 0.25 330.00 82.50 Issue #4 / discussion with legal counsel 20/06/2023 Review of settlement conference response re Rebasing 1.25 330.00 412.50

Issue #4 / discussion with legal counsel

Bank Info for EFT/ACH Payment

Institute #: 003

Transit #: 07372

Acct #: 1001502

Please send bank confirmation to above email while you completed EFT/ACH



INVOICE # 1058 DATE 07/07/2023 DUE DATE 06/08/2023 TERMS Net 30

DATE	DESCRIPTION		QTY	RATE	AMOUNT	
21/06/2023	Review of settlement conference response re Rebasing Issue #4 / discussion with legal counsel		0.25	330.00	82.50	
27/06/2023	Review of settlement conference response re Rebasing Issue #4 / discussion with legal counsel		1	330.00	330.00	
28/06/2023	8 Review of settlement conference response re Rebasing Issue #4 / discussion with legal counsel		0.25	330.00	82.50	
All time billed - Don Richardson, Ph.D OEB rate \$330/hour		SUBTOTAL HST (ON) @ 13%	4,042.50 525.58			
		TOTAL BALANCE DUE	4,568.08			
		BALANCE DUE		\$4,	568.08	
TAX SUMM	ARY					

RATE	TAX	NET
HST (ON) @ 13%	525.58	4,042.50

Don Richardson, Ph.D.

C.V. – Ontario Energy Board Experience

2024

Dr. Richardson has over 30 years of experience as a skilled facilitator supporting project implementation, impact assessments and building agreements between energy, infrastructure and resource management project proponents, community/non-governmental organizations, government agencies, and rural/Indigenous communities. He fosters constructive engagement to create shared value between communities and infrastructure proponents.

Dr. Richardson has appeared as a witness several times in various regulatory proceedings and has presented before the Ontario Energy Board on a number of occasions. As a consultant to Anwaatin Inc., he is an experienced intervenor before the Board, representing the interest of Indigenous communities, Dr. Richardson has a high level of familiarity with the Ontario Energy Board's practice directions, rules of practice and procedure, filing requirements and related administrative guidance.

On behalf of Anwaatin Inc., the Three Fires Group, Minogi Corp., and other parties Dr. Richardson has been active in representing various Indigenous interests before the Ontario Energy Board in a number of electricity and natural gas proceedings and consultations. Dr. Richardson has assisted Anwaatin and its First Nation clients in being a pioneer of distributed energy resource (DERs) initiatives before the Board and helped to achieve the first landed grid energy storage projects to improve poor electricity reliability in vulnerable Indigenous communities (see EB-2017-0355, Decision and Order, August 23, 2018 and EB-2017-0049, Decision and Order, March 7, 2019).

Dr. Richardson aerved as the represent of Anwaatin in the Ontario Energy Board's Framework for Energy Innovation: Distributed Resources and Utility Incentives consultation (Board File No.: EB-2021-0118), and was recently appointed as a representative of Anwaatin to the Reliability and Power Quality Working Group (Board File No.: EB-2021-0307). He is or was an active participant in, among others, the following Board proceedings: EB-2021-0002; EB-2021-0004; EB-2020-0194; EB-2020-0212; and EB-2020-0106. Dr. Richardson also recently served as a member of the Ontario Energy Board's Adjudicative Modernization Committee which considers best practices and approaches to adjudication that enhance the OEB's efficiency and effectiveness in delivering on its mandate to regulate Ontario's energy sector as required under provincial legislation. Dr. Richardson is also a member of the Independent Electricity System Operator's Transmission-Distribution System Working Group (TWDG).

Dr. Richardson has experience with several large scale and small scale energy infrastructure development projects, and energy regulatory and policy matters, working on behalf of First Nation governments across Ontario. He has extensive experience navigating the deployment, use, and integration of DERs as well alleviating energy poverty in and around Indigenous communities. He is also a recipient of the Canadian Urban Institute's Brownie Award recognizing outstanding achievement in building and maintaining effective working partnerships with professionals, the local community and others involved in Brownfields redevelopment, and a Consulting Engineers of Ontario, Canada Award for Indigenous Traditional Knowledge achievements.