



April 30, 2024

**VIA RESS**

Ontario Energy Board  
**Attention: Registrar**  
P.O. Box 2319,  
2300 Yonge Street, 27<sup>th</sup> Floor  
Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

Dear Ms. Marconi,

**Re: Enbridge Gas Inc. ("EGI")  
2024 Rebasing Application  
Board File No.: EB-2022-0200**

We are counsel to Ginoogaming First Nation ("**GFN**") in the above-noted proceeding (the "**Proceeding**"). Further to the Board's Procedural Order No. 8 dated April 16, 2024, please find enclosed GFN's Phase 1 total cost claim in respect of the Proceeding.

**Submissions.** GFN respectfully requests an award of 100% of its eligible costs, given its strategic and principled participation in the Proceeding to date, reflecting the unique interests of EGI's northern and near-remote Indigenous customers and impacted First Nations. GFN submits that this request is supported by the following considerations:

- (i) GFN has participated effectively in the Proceeding, taking a surgical, principled, and coordinated approach to matters related to the rights and concerns of affected First Nations and Indigenous communities, including GFN, and assisted in contributing to the Board's better understanding of such matters;
- (ii) GFN has ensured that its participation in the Proceeding has been focused on material issues and consistent with the scope of its intervention, as set out in its Notice of Intervention;
- (iii) GFN coordinated significantly with other Indigenous intervenors to participate cost-effectively in order to limit overlap and efficiently advance issues of mutual interest; and
- (iv) GFN has participated responsibly and engaged with other intervenors and Board Staff to avoid overlap, maximize efficiency, and ensure that its participation was not unduly repetitive and was focused on relevant and material issues.

We trust that this approach has maximized the efficient use of resources and the right of otherwise unrepresented and important EGI customers to be heard in a manner that is consistent with the Board's mandate and statutory objectives.

**Phase 1 total cost claim.** Please note that as part of the interim cost claim process, GFN was awarded and paid \$42,385.00. The below table sets out the total outstanding cost claims amount for Phase 1 of the Proceeding.

Phase 1 total cost claim amount	\$70,403.00
Phase 1 interim credit amount	\$42,385.00
Phase 1 outstanding cost claim amount (Total cost claim – interim payment)	<b><u>\$28,018.00</u></b>

GFN respectfully requests a full award of eligible interim costs.

Sincerely,



DT Vollmer

- c. Vanessa Inis, EGI  
David Stevens, Aird & Berlis LLP  
Dennis M. O’Leary, Aird & Berlis LLP  
Kate Kempton, on behalf of GFN

# EB-2022-0200 : 1 : Monika Pecnikova

COST CLAIM NUMBER 2076	SUBMISSION DEADLINE DATE April 30, 2024	CLAIM STATUS Approved by Finance
EB# EB-2022-0200 - Phase 1: Rates: Distribution: Enbridge Gas Inc.	OTHER EB#S	PHASE #* 1
INTERVENOR Pecnikova, Monika; +1 (647) 991-1190 monika@resilientllp.com	INTERVENOR COMPANY* Ginoogaming First Nation, Longlac: Township/Municipality	INTERVENOR TYPE Tax Exempt
HST RATE ONTARIO 0.00	EXCHANGE RATE	COUNTRY Canada
HST NUMBER	LATE SUBMISSION ALLOWED No	EXTENSION DEADLINE DATE

## PARTICIPANTS

New	Non-Filing Participant First, Last Name	Filing Participant	Total (\$)	Total Hours	Participant Claim Status
No	,	DeMarco, Lisa (Elisabeth) ; +1 (647) 991-1190 lisa@resilientllp.com	462.00	1.40	Submitted
No	,	McGillivray, Jonathan; +1 (647) 991-1190 jonathan@resilientllp.com	414.00	1.80	Submitted
No	,	Vollmer, Daniel; +1 (647) 991-1190 daniel@resilientllp.com	52,377.00	308.10	Submitted
No	,	Kempton, Kate; +1 (416) 571-6775 kkempton@woodwardandco mpany.com	16,830.00	51.00	Submitted
No	,	Morris, Galen; +1 (647) 991-1190 gmmorris@woodwardandcom pany.com	320.00	3.20	Submitted

## ATTACHMENTS

Attachment	Document Type	Import Message
GFN_Cover Letter_Phase 1 Cost Claim_20240430.pdf	Cover Letter	
GFN EB-2022-0200 Cost Claim 043020241052.pdf		

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT/OTHER FEES  
70,403.00

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS  
0.00

TOTAL HST  
0.00

TOTAL CLAIM  
70,403.00

TOTAL AMOUNT AWARDED

TOTAL HOURS CLAIMED  
365.50

TOTAL HOURS DISALLOWED

REASON FOR  
DISALLOWANCE

REASON FOR  
DISALLOWANCE - 2

REASON FOR  
DISALLOWANCE - 3

MAKE CHEQUE PAYABLE TO  
Resilient LLP

SEND PAYMENT TO ADDRESS  
119 Baby Point Road  
Toronto, ON M6S 2G7

ATTENTION

**SUBMIT SECTION**

I am a representative of the Party. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim. The costs incurred and time spent are directly related to the Party's participation in the OEB Process referred to above.

This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in section 6.05 and 6.09 of the OEB's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

The information (fees and disbursements) filed in this cost claim is complete and accurate and in accordance with the OEB's Practice Direction for Cost Awards and Appendix A, the Cost Awards Tariff.

SUBMITTED BY  
Daniel Vollmer

DATE SUBMITTED  
April 30, 2024

<b>CASE</b> EB-2022-0200 - Phase 1: Rates: Distribution: Enbridge Gas Inc.	<b>COST CLAIM</b> EB-2022-0200 : 1 : Monika Pecnikova	<b>INTERVENOR NAME</b> Pecnikova, Monika; +1 (647) 991-1190 monika@resilientllp.com	<b>PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS</b> Submitted
<b>FILING PARTICIPANT</b> DeMarco, Lisa (Elisabeth) ; +1 (647) 991-1190 lisa@resilientllp.com	<b>NEW PARTICIPANT</b> No	<b>NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME</b>	<b>NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME</b>
<b>SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE*</b> Legal Counsel	<b>YEAR CALLED TO BAR*</b> 1997	<b>COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF RELEVANT EXPERIENCE*</b> 26	<b>HOURLY RATE</b> 330
<b>HST RATE CHARGED*</b> 0.00	<b>CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST)</b> CV Provided within Previous 24 Months	<b>LAST CV DATE</b> April 29, 2024	<b>OVERRIDE HOURLY RATE</b> No
<b>HST NUMBER</b>	<b>HEARINGS</b> Yes	<b>CONSULTATIONS</b> No	<b>DISBURSEMENTS</b> No

**HEARINGS**

<b>Hearings Hours</b> 1.40	<b>Hearings Subtotal (\$)</b> 462.00	<b>Hearings Total Tax (\$)</b> 0.00	<b>Hearings Total (\$)</b> 462.00
-------------------------------	---	--	--------------------------------------

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
<b>DISCOVERY</b>						
Read and Research Application and Evidence		330		0.00		
Preparation of Interrogatories		330		0.00		
Review Interrogatory Responses		330		0.00		
Technical Conference Preparation		330		0.00		
Technical Conference Attendance		330		0.00		
Technical Conference Follow-up		330		0.00		
<b>Subtotal of DISCOVERY</b>	<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>0.00</b>
<b>PROCEDURAL</b>						
Preparation of Issues List Submission		330		0.00		
Attendance at Issues List Conference		330		0.00		
Preparation for a Confidentiality Request		330		0.00		
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality		330		0.00		
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		330		0.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		330		0.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		330		0.00		
Review Procedural Documents		330		0.00		

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
<b>Subtotal of PROCEDURAL</b>	<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>0.00</b>
<b>INTERVENOR EVIDENCE</b>						
Preparation of Intervenor Evidence		330		0.00		
Interrogatory Responses		330		0.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing		330		0.00		
<b>Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE</b>	<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>0.00</b>
<b>SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE</b>						
Preparation for Settlement Conference		330		0.00		
Attendance at Settlement Conference		330		0.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		330		0.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		330		0.00		
<b>Subtotal of SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE</b>	<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>0.00</b>
<b>WRITTEN ARGUMENT</b>						
Written Submissions	1.20	330	396.00	0.00		396.00
<b>Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT</b>	<b>1.20</b>		<b>396.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>396.00</b>
<b>ORAL ARGUMENT</b>						
Preparation for Oral Hearing		330		0.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		330		0.00		
Oral Submissions		330		0.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		330		0.00		
<b>Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT</b>	<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>0.00</b>
<b>DECISION</b>						
Review Decision	0.20	330	66.00	0.00		66.00
Review Rate/Accounting Order		330		0.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order		330		0.00		
<b>Subtotal of DECISION</b>	<b>0.20</b>		<b>66.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>66.00</b>
<b>OTHER</b>						
Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor Conferences)		330		0.00		
<b>Subtotal of OTHER</b>	<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>0.00</b>
<b>TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES</b>						
<b>Total Service Provider Fees</b>	<b>1.40</b>		<b>462.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>462.00</b>

## Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
EB-2022-0200_GFN_Time Sheets_Lisa DeMarco.pdf	Time Docket	

**Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments**

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Claim Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
EB-2022-0200_ GFN_Time Sheets_Lisa DeMarco.pdf	Time Docket	Hearings	

**EB-2022-0200 \_ GFN \_ Time Sheets \_ Lisa DeMarco**

<b>Type</b>	<b>Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Rate (\$)</b>	<b>Billable (\$)</b>	<b>User</b>	<b>Bill#</b>
<b>TimeEntry</b>	08/11/2023	1.2	APR - Coordination call with GFN Team, K. Kempton;	\$ 330.00	\$ 396.00	L. DeMarco	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	01/03/2024	0.2	Review Decision - Email communications with K. Kempton; Instructions to D. Vollmer re executive summary for client;	\$ 330.00	\$ 66.00	L. DeMarco	24128
<b>Total</b>		<b>1.4</b>			<b>\$ 462.00</b>		

<b>CASE</b> EB-2022-0200 - Phase 1: Rates: Distribution: Enbridge Gas Inc.	<b>COST CLAIM</b> EB-2022-0200 : 1 : Monika Pecnikova	<b>INTERVENOR NAME</b> Pecnikova, Monika; +1 (647) 991-1190 monika@resilientllp.com	<b>PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS</b> Submitted
<b>FILING PARTICIPANT</b> McGillivray, Jonathan; +1 (647) 991-1190 jonathan@resilientllp.com	<b>NEW PARTICIPANT</b> No	<b>NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME</b>	<b>NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME</b>
<b>SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE*</b> Legal Counsel	<b>YEAR CALLED TO BAR*</b> 2017	<b>COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF RELEVANT EXPERIENCE*</b> 7	<b>HOURLY RATE</b> 230
<b>HST RATE CHARGED*</b> 0.00	<b>CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST)</b> CV Attached	<b>LAST CV DATE</b> April 29, 2024	<b>OVERRIDE HOURLY RATE</b> No
<b>HST NUMBER</b>	<b>HEARINGS</b> Yes	<b>CONSULTATIONS</b> No	<b>DISBURSEMENTS</b> No

## HEARINGS

<b>Hearings Hours</b> 1.80	<b>Hearings Subtotal (\$)</b> 414.00	<b>Hearings Total Tax (\$)</b> 0.00	<b>Hearings Total (\$)</b> 414.00
-------------------------------	---	--	--------------------------------------

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
<b>DISCOVERY</b>						
Read and Research Application and Evidence		230		0.00		
Preparation of Interrogatories	1.80	230	414.00	0.00		414.00
Review Interrogatory Responses		230		0.00		
Technical Conference Preparation		230		0.00		
Technical Conference Attendance		230		0.00		
Technical Conference Follow-up		230		0.00		
<b>Subtotal of DISCOVERY</b>	<b>1.80</b>		<b>414.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>414.00</b>
<b>PROCEDURAL</b>						
Preparation of Issues List Submission		230		0.00		
Attendance at Issues List Conference		230		0.00		
Preparation for a Confidentiality Request		230		0.00		
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality		230		0.00		
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		230		0.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		230		0.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		230		0.00		
Review Procedural Documents		230		0.00		

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
<b>Subtotal of PROCEDURAL</b>	<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>0.00</b>
<b>INTERVENOR EVIDENCE</b>						
Preparation of Intervenor Evidence		230		0.00		
Interrogatory Responses		230		0.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing		230		0.00		
<b>Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE</b>	<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>0.00</b>
<b>SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE</b>						
Preparation for Settlement Conference		230		0.00		
Attendance at Settlement Conference		230		0.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		230		0.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		230		0.00		
<b>Subtotal of SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE</b>	<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>0.00</b>
<b>WRITTEN ARGUMENT</b>						
Written Submissions		230		0.00		
<b>Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT</b>	<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>0.00</b>
<b>ORAL ARGUMENT</b>						
Preparation for Oral Hearing		230		0.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		230		0.00		
Oral Submissions		230		0.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		230		0.00		
<b>Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT</b>	<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>0.00</b>
<b>DECISION</b>						
Review Decision		230		0.00		
Review Rate/Accounting Order		230		0.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order		230		0.00		
<b>Subtotal of DECISION</b>	<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>0.00</b>
<b>OTHER</b>						
Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor Conferences)		230		0.00		
<b>Subtotal of OTHER</b>	<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>0.00</b>
<b>TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES</b>						
<b>Total Service Provider Fees</b>	<b>1.80</b>		<b>414.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>414.00</b>

## Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
EB-2022-0200_GFN_Time	Time Docket	
Sheets_Jonathan McGillivray.pdf		
Jonathan McGillivray CV .pdf	CV	

---

**Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments**

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Claim Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
EB-2022-0200_ GFN_Time Sheets_Jonathan McGillivray.pdf Jonathan McGillivray CV .pdf	Time Docket  CV	Hearings  Hearings	

**EB-2022-0200\_GFN\_Time Sheets\_Jonathan McGillivray**

<b>Type</b>	<b>Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Rate (\$)</b>	<b>Billable (\$)</b>	<b>User</b>	<b>Bill#</b>
<b>TimeEntry</b>	02/02/2023	1.2	IRP - Review and revise communications to client re application and evidence and preparation of interrogatories;	230	\$ 276.00	J. McGillivray	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	02/08/2023	0.6	IRP - Further revisions to communications to client re application and evidence and preparation of interrogatories;	230	\$ 138.00	J. McGillivray	23124
<b>Total</b>		<b>1.8</b>			<b>\$ 414.00</b>		

# JONATHAN MCGILLIVRAY

+1.647.208.2677 | JONATHAN@RESILIENTLLP.COM

## LEGAL AND ADVISORY WORK

**Resilient LLP**  
*Senior Associate*  
*Associate*

Toronto, ON  
2021–Present  
2017–2021

- Counsel to all types of participants in compliance and voluntary carbon markets transactions, including those involving carbon dioxide removals (nature and technology based), and voluntary-to-Paris compliance units.
- Advise on international climate policy, negotiations, and related transactions, including the United Nations Framework Convention on Climate Change (UNFCCC) negotiations and Article 6 of the Paris Agreement.
- Advise businesses, governments, NGOs, and First Nations in Canada and internationally on climate change law and policy, net-zero strategy, and all aspects of complex carbon markets and emissions trading matters.
- Assist provincial, state, federal, and national governments and ministries on climate and industrial emissions strategy, policy, legislative, and regulatory drafting.
- Counsel to various groups before the Ontario Energy Board on matters relating to distributed energy resources (DERs), non-wires alternatives, energy storage, electric vehicles, hydrogen, district energy, and renewable natural gas.
- Provide legal and governance advice to executive management, boards of directors, senior leadership, and sustainability officers in the areas of risk management and strategy, standards compliance, reporting and disclosure, sustainable finance, and socially responsible investment.

**McGill University Faculty of Law**  
*Tutorial Leader, Legal Methodology Program*

Montreal, QC  
2014–2015

- Facilitated tutorials to train first-year law students in research methods, memo writing and oral advocacy.
- Worked in teams to design legal research assignments, evaluate students' written work.

**Canadian Council for Public-Private Partnerships**  
*Research Analyst*

Toronto, ON  
2014

- Drafted infrastructure market guidance paper on the enforceability of exclusion clauses in tendering contracts.
- Developed a portfolio of legislation and policies affecting public-private partnerships.

**McGill University Faculty of Law**  
*Research Assistant*

Montreal, QC  
2013–2014

- Researched intergovernmental agreements and identified modern and authoritative legal sources to assist in updating academic works of Professor Johanne Poirier.

## OTHER EXPERIENCE

**Master of Arts, Climate and Society, Columbia Climate School**  
*Co-Lead of the Alumni Board*

2021–Present

- Leadership of alumni board dedicated to providing opportunities for Climate and Society students and alumni to connect with each other and the broader climate community.

**GreenPAC Future Fund**  
*Member of the Board of Directors and current Chair*

2018–Present

- Provide governance, oversight, and board chair support to GreenPAC, a not-for-profit

# JONATHAN MCGILLIVRAY

+1.647.208.2677 | JONATHAN@RESILIENTLLP.COM

organization working to support and elect environmental leaders to public office in Canada. GreenPAC's programs also include the Parliamentary Internship for the Environment and 100 Debates for the Environment.

**Ryerson University Centre for Urban Energy** Toronto, ON  
*Visiting Research Student* 2012

- Assessed the adaptation strategies of electric utilities for climate change-related extreme weather and authored a report on the topic for submission to Hydro One Networks Inc.

**Columbia University** New York, NY  
*Research Assistant, The Earth Institute* 2011–2012

- Investigated the relationship between climate variability and violence in Chad and Sudan as part of a study motivated by research that quantitatively linked El Niño and civil conflict.

**Columbia University** New York, NY  
*Teaching Assistant* 2011

- Taught the weekly laboratory component of an undergraduate climate science course.
- Evaluated students' work and tutored students one-on-one and in small groups.

**Central Student Association** Guelph, ON  
*Board Member* 2009–2010

- Governed the academic, financial, marketing and HR affairs of an organization serving 18,500 students.

**Association of Major Power Consumers in Ontario** Toronto, ON  
*Summer Student* 2008–2009

- Assisted in successful effort to make industrial electricity charges fairer and more efficient.
- Co-authored a technical study on electricity rates for industrial customers based on analyzed data.

**EDUCATION** **Call to the Bar of Ontario** January 2017

**McGill University, Bachelor of Laws / Bachelor of Civil Law (LL.B./B.C.L.)** 2015

- Academic Exchange: University of Turin, Italy (2015)
- Patricia Allen Award for Contributions to the Faculty (2015)
- Editor, McGill Journal of Sustainable Development Law (2012–2015)

**Columbia University, Master of Arts, Climate and Society** 2012

- Now the inaugural graduate program of the Columbia Climate School
- Co-Lead, Alumni Board (2021–Present)

**University of Guelph, Bachelor of Arts (Hons.), International Development** 2011

- Prize for Environment and Development (2011)

# JONATHAN MCGILLIVRAY

+1.647.208.2677 | JONATHAN@RESILIENTLLP.COM

## SELECTED PUBLICATIONS

- DeMarco, L., **McGillivray J.** and Vollmer, D. (2020) “The New World of Climate Change and ESG Disclosure”. Energy Regulation Quarterly (Volume 8, Issue 4) ([Full Article](#)).
- DeMarco, L. and **McGillivray J.** (2019) “Canada’s Existential Crisis over Climate Change Regulation: Tempest in a Teapot?”. Energy Regulation Quarterly (Volume 7, Issue 3) ([Full Article](#)).
- DeMarco, L. and **McGillivray J.** (2018) “Canadian Carbon Pricing: Where Is It Going?”. Energy Regulation Quarterly (Volume 6, Issue 3) ([Full Article](#)).
- DeMarco, L. and **McGillivray J.** (2017) “The Elephant in the Room: A Foreign Perspective on Potential Trump Administration Approaches to US International Climate Commitments”. IETA Insights, April 26, 2017 ([Full Article](#)).
- Allan, T. and **McGillivray J.** (2017) “Undelineated Built-Up Areas: A Gap That Could Undermine the Growth Plan”. Commissioned by the Neptis Foundation ([Full Report](#)).
- Allan, T. and **McGillivray, J.** (2016) “REVving Up: Legal & Policy Changes to Support EV Uptake—Leader Jurisdictions”. Proceedings of the EVS29 Symposium (June 19-22, 2016) ([Full Article](#)).

## SELECTED SPEAKING ENGAGEMENTS

- McGillivray, J.** (2022) Guest Lecture: “Institutions of Carbon Markets”, Land Economics, University of Guelph, Guelph, ON.
- McGillivray, J.** (2022) Guest Lecture: “Regulating the Low-Carbon Economy”, Energy Innovation and Entrepreneurship, Toronto Metropolitan University, Toronto, ON.
- McGillivray, J.** (2022) Panelist: “Net Zero: Where to Start?”, Discussion on Carbon Offsets. EY (Montreal).
- McGillivray, J.** (2022) Guest Lecture: “Climate Change Governance and Disclosure”, Corporate Governance, Thomson Rivers University Faculty of Law, Kamloops, BC (virtual).
- McGillivray, J.** (2021) Moderator: “A Debrief on COP 26”. GreenPAC.
- DeMarco, L. and **McGillivray, J.** (2021) Co-moderators: “Getting to NETs-Zero: The Integral Role of Negative Emissions Technologies in Meeting the Paris Goals”. Make Climate Action Everyone’s Business Forum, presented by the International Chamber of Commerce.
- McGillivray, J.** (2021) Panelist: “IETA LIVE Innovators Series: Scaling Carbon Removals”. International Emissions Trading Association, presented by Carbon Finance Labs and Green Certificate Company.
- DeMarco, L. and **McGillivray, J.** (2021) Co-moderators: “The Essential Role of Negative Emissions Technologies in Getting to Net-Zero”. Innovate4Climate 2021, presented by the World Bank Group.
- McGillivray, J.** (2021) Panelist: “Case Closed: Following the Supreme Court Verdict, What is the Future of Carbon Pricing in Canada?”. North American Carbon World 2021 Virtual Conference, presented by Climate Action Reserve.

# JONATHAN MCGILLIVRAY

+1.647.208.2677 | JONATHAN@RESILIENTLLP.COM

**McGillivray, J.** (2021) Guest Lecture: “Carbon Pricing 101”. Environmental Applied Science and Management Program, Ryerson University, Toronto, ON.

**McGillivray, J.** (2019) Panelist: “Climate Policy Outlook: Common Ground or Battleground?”, Hosted by International Emissions Trading Association, Sussex Strategy, ClearBlue Markets, PwC, Toronto, ON.

**McGillivray J.** (2019) Guest Lecture: “Regulating the Low-Carbon Economy”. Master of Engineering, Innovation and Entrepreneurship, Ryerson University, Toronto, ON.

**McGillivray, J.** (2019) Speaker: “Carbon Finance Benefit-Sharing Agreements and Pathways to Carbon Rights”. Forum: Exploring the Possibilities for Indigenous-led Conservation and Carbon Storage in Canada, University of Guelph, Guelph, ON. ([Report](#)).

**McGillivray, J.** (2018) Panelist: “Opportunities Across the Pond and Beyond”. ESA Energy Storage 28th Annual Conference & Expo, Energy Storage Association, Boston, MA.

**McGillivray, J.** (2018) Guest Lecture: “The Legal Response to Climate Change and Carbon Pricing in Ontario”. Environmental Applied Science and Management Program, Ryerson University, Toronto, ON.

**McGillivray, J.** (2016) Guest Lecture: “Climate Change Law and Ontario’s Cap and Trade Program”. Environmental Applied Science and Management Program, Ryerson University, Toronto, ON.

## AWARDS

### **The Best Lawyers in Canada: Ones to Watch**

- 2024 Edition

### **McGill Toronto Excellence Awards, 2023 – Rising Star Award**

- This award is [presented](#) to a McGill alumna/alumnus under the age of 35, who demonstrates early success in her/his profession and future leadership in her/his industry or field.

## LANGUAGES

French (full professional proficiency)

<b>CASE</b> EB-2022-0200 - Phase 1: Rates: Distribution: Enbridge Gas Inc.	<b>COST CLAIM</b> EB-2022-0200 : 1 : Monika Pecnikova	<b>INTERVENOR NAME</b> Pecnikova, Monika; +1 (647) 991-1190 monika@resilientllp.com	<b>PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS</b> Submitted
<b>FILING PARTICIPANT</b> Vollmer, Daniel; +1 (647) 991-1190 daniel@resilientllp.com	<b>NEW PARTICIPANT</b> No	<b>NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME</b>	<b>NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME</b>
<b>SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE*</b> Legal Counsel	<b>YEAR CALLED TO BAR*</b> 2020	<b>COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF RELEVANT EXPERIENCE*</b> 2	<b>HOURLY RATE</b> 170
<b>HST RATE CHARGED*</b> 0.00	<b>CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST)</b> CV Attached	<b>LAST CV DATE</b> April 27, 2024	<b>OVERRIDE HOURLY RATE</b> No
<b>HST NUMBER</b>	<b>HEARINGS</b> Yes	<b>CONSULTATIONS</b> No	<b>DISBURSEMENTS</b> No

**HEARINGS**

<b>Hearings Hours</b> 308.10	<b>Hearings Subtotal (\$)</b> 52,377.00	<b>Hearings Total Tax (\$)</b> 0.00	<b>Hearings Total (\$)</b> 52,377.00
---------------------------------	--	--	---

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
<b>DISCOVERY</b>						
Read and Research Application and Evidence		170		0.00		
Preparation of Interrogatories	18.30	170	3,111.00	0.00		3,111.00
Review Interrogatory Responses		170		0.00		
Technical Conference Preparation	16.70	170	2,839.00	0.00		2,839.00
Technical Conference Attendance	45.10	170	7,667.00	0.00		7,667.00
Technical Conference Follow-up		170		0.00		
<b>Subtotal of DISCOVERY</b>	<b>80.10</b>		<b>13,617.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>13,617.00</b>
<b>PROCEDURAL</b>						
Preparation of Issues List Submission	1.50	170	255.00	0.00		255.00
Attendance at Issues List Conference	7.80	170	1,326.00	0.00		1,326.00
Preparation for a Confidentiality Request		170		0.00		
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality		170		0.00		
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		170		0.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		170		0.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		170		0.00		
Review Procedural Documents	4.10	170	697.00	0.00		697.00

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
<b>Subtotal of PROCEDURAL</b>	<b>13.40</b>		<b>2,278.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>2,278.00</b>
<b>INTERVENOR EVIDENCE</b>						
Preparation of Intervenor Evidence		170		0.00		
Interrogatory Responses		170		0.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing		170		0.00		
<b>Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE</b>	<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>0.00</b>
<b>SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE</b>						
Preparation for Settlement Conference	9.10	170	1,547.00	0.00		1,547.00
Attendance at Settlement Conference	45.00	170	7,650.00	0.00		7,650.00
Preparation of Settlement Proposal	25.40	170	4,318.00	0.00		4,318.00
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		170		0.00		
<b>Subtotal of SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE</b>	<b>79.50</b>		<b>13,515.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>13,515.00</b>
<b>WRITTEN ARGUMENT</b>						
Written Submissions	26.30	170	4,471.00	0.00		4,471.00
<b>Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT</b>	<b>26.30</b>		<b>4,471.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>4,471.00</b>
<b>ORAL ARGUMENT</b>						
Preparation for Oral Hearing	22.60	170	3,842.00	0.00		3,842.00
Attendance at Oral Hearing	79.70	170	13,549.00	0.00		13,549.00
Oral Submissions		170		0.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		170		0.00		
<b>Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT</b>	<b>102.30</b>		<b>17,391.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>17,391.00</b>
<b>DECISION</b>						
Review Decision	4.00	170	680.00	0.00		680.00
Review Rate/Accounting Order		170		0.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order		170		0.00		
<b>Subtotal of DECISION</b>	<b>4.00</b>		<b>680.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>680.00</b>
<b>OTHER</b>						
Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor Conferences)	2.50	170	425.00	0.00		425.00
<b>Subtotal of OTHER</b>	<b>2.50</b>		<b>425.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>425.00</b>
<b>TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES</b>						
<b>Total Service Provider Fees</b>	<b>308.10</b>		<b>52,377.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>52,377.00</b>

## Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
EB-2022-0200_GFN_Time Sheets_Daniel Vollmer.pdf	Time Docket	
Daniel Vollmer CV (2024).pdf	CV	

---

**Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments**

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Claim Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
EB-2022-0200_ GFN_ Time Sheets_ Daniel Vollmer.pdf	Time Docket	Hearings	
Daniel Vollmer CV (2024).pdf	CV	Hearings	

EB-2022-0200_GFN_Time Sheets_Daniel Vollmer							
Type	Date	Hours	Description	Rate (\$)	Billable (\$)	User	Bill#
TimeEntry	01/04/2023	1.2	ICP - Review Procedural Order 1; communicate with K. Kempton re issues conference;	\$ 170.00	\$ 204.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
TimeEntry	01/06/2023	0.3	ICP - Email K. Kempton re issues conference;	\$ 170.00	\$ 51.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
TimeEntry	01/09/2023	7.8	ICA - Attend on Issues Conference;	\$ 170.00	\$ 1,326.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
TimeEntry	01/18/2023	0.6	IRP - Communications with K. Kempton re interrogatories;	\$ 170.00	\$ 102.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
TimeEntry	01/23/2023	0.5	IRP - Correspondence with K. Kempton;	\$ 170.00	\$ 85.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
TimeEntry	01/26/2023	1.3	IRP - Review application and evidence per K. Kempton;	\$ 170.00	\$ 221.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
TimeEntry	01/28/2023	0.4	IRP - Review application and evidence per K. Kempton;	\$ 170.00	\$ 68.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
TimeEntry	02/02/2023	1.5	IRP - Revise application and evidence and prepare summary for client per J. McGillivray;	\$ 170.00	\$ 255.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
TimeEntry	02/03/2023	0.8	IRP - Revise application and evidence and prepare summary for client;	\$ 170.00	\$ 136.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
TimeEntry	02/06/2023	1.6	IRP - Review evidence and application;	\$ 170.00	\$ 272.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
TimeEntry	02/06/2023	2.6	IRP - Revise application and evidence and prepare summary for client per K. Kempton;	\$ 170.00	\$ 442.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
TimeEntry	02/07/2023	1.4	IRP - Revise application and evidence and prepare summary for client per K. Kempton;	\$ 170.00	\$ 238.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
TimeEntry	02/08/2023	1	IRP - Prepare interrogatories;	\$ 170.00	\$ 170.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
TimeEntry	02/08/2023	1.1	IRP - Review evidence and application; correspond with client on same;	\$ 170.00	\$ 187.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
TimeEntry	02/09/2023	1.6	IRP - prepare interrogatories;	\$ 170.00	\$ 272.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
TimeEntry	02/10/2023	0.6	IRP - prepare interrogatories;	\$ 170.00	\$ 102.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
TimeEntry	03/07/2023	0.3	TCP - Review file;	\$ 170.00	\$ 51.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
TimeEntry	03/09/2023	1.3	TCP - Review interrogatory responses;	\$ 170.00	\$ 221.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
TimeEntry	03/10/2023	1	TCP - Review interrogatory responses;	\$ 170.00	\$ 170.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
TimeEntry	03/13/2023	2.3	TCP - Review interrogatory responses;	\$ 170.00	\$ 391.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
TimeEntry	03/14/2023	4.6	TCP - Review interrogatory responses;	\$ 170.00	\$ 782.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
TimeEntry	03/15/2023	3.2	TCP - Review interrogatory responses;	\$ 170.00	\$ 544.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124

<b>TimeEntry</b>	03/20/2023	1	TCP - Review interrogatory responses;	\$ 170.00	\$ 170.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	03/21/2023	3	TCP - Prepare for technical conference;	\$ 170.00	\$ 510.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	03/22/2023	7.7	TCA - Attend on technical conference (Day 1);	\$ 170.00	\$ 1,309.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	03/23/2023	7.8	TCA - Attend on technical conference (Day 2);	\$ 170.00	\$ 1,326.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	03/24/2023	7.8	TCA - Attend on technical conference (Day 3);	\$ 170.00	\$ 1,326.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	03/28/2023	6.8	TCA - Attend on technical conference (Day 5);	\$ 170.00	\$ 1,156.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	03/29/2023	7.8	TCA - Attend on technical conference (Day 6);	\$ 170.00	\$ 1,326.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	04/10/2023	0.5	APR - Review undertaking responses;	\$ 170.00	\$ 85.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	04/13/2023	2.5	OCA - Attend on Motions Hearing;	\$ 170.00	\$ 425.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	04/24/2023	3.3	IRP - Review Board staff / intervenor evidence;	\$ 170.00	\$ 561.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	04/27/2023	7.2	TCA - Attend on Technical Conference Updated Evidence (Day 1);	\$ 170.00	\$ 1,224.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	05/12/2023	0.8	SCP - call with N. Daube re strategy for upcoming settlement conference; review evidence;	\$ 170.00	\$ 136.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	05/18/2023	0.5	SCP - Call with L. DeMarco; N. Daube re settlement conference	\$ 170.00	\$ 85.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	05/18/2023	1.3	SCP - communications with K. Kempton re settlement conference; review evidence re same;	\$ 170.00	\$ 221.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	05/23/2023	2.9	SCP - Prepare for settlement conference; meeting with other intervenors re same;	\$ 170.00	\$ 493.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	05/23/2023	0.4	SCP - communications with N. Daube re settlement strategy;	\$ 170.00	\$ 68.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	05/23/2023	1.5	SCP - Prepare for settlement conference; review evidence;	\$ 170.00	\$ 255.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124

<b>TimeEntry</b>	05/24/2023	1.5	SCP - Communications with N. Daube re settlement conference strategy and proposals; assist N. Daube re joint GFN / Three Fires settlement proposals;	\$ 170.00	\$ 255.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	05/26/2023	0.2	SCP - Settlement conference preparation;	\$ 170.00	\$ 34.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	05/29/2023	8.5	SCA - Prepare and attend settlement conference (Day 1);	\$ 170.00	\$ 1,445.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	05/30/2023	5.1	SCA - Prepare and attend settlement conference (Day 2);	\$ 170.00	\$ 867.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	05/30/2023	1	SPP - Assist K. Kempton re preparing settlement proposal;	\$ 170.00	\$ 170.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	05/31/2023	2	SPP - Revise GFN / TFG settlement proposal per K. Kempton;	\$ 170.00	\$ 340.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	06/01/2023	6.6	SCA - Prepare and attend settlement conference (Day 4);	\$ 170.00	\$ 1,122.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	06/02/2023	6.2	SCA - Prepare and attend settlement conference (Day 5);	\$ 170.00	\$ 1,054.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	06/06/2023	3.4	SCA - Attend on settlement conference (Day 7);	\$ 170.00	\$ 578.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	06/07/2023	0.8	SPP - Call with K. Kempton, N. Daube, L. DeMarco re TFG/GFN Issue 4 proposal;	\$ 170.00	\$ 136.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	06/07/2023	5.6	SCA - Attend on settlement conference (Day 8);	\$ 170.00	\$ 952.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	06/08/2023	4.3	SCA - Attend on settlement conference (Day 9);	\$ 170.00	\$ 731.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	06/09/2023	0.8	SPP - Call with Enbridge, Three Fires, K. Kempton (GFN);	\$ 170.00	\$ 136.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	06/09/2023	0.4	SCA - Attend on settlement conference (Day 10);	\$ 170.00	\$ 68.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	06/05/2023	0.6	SPP - Review EGI response to Issue 4 settlement proposal;	\$ 170.00	\$ 102.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	06/14/2023	4.8	SPP - Review Issue 4 proposal from EGI;	\$ 170.00	\$ 816.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	06/16/2023	3.2	SCA - Attend on OEB settlement meeting with EGI and Intervenors;	\$ 170.00	\$ 544.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124

<b>TimeEntry</b>	06/16/2023	1.7	SCA - Attend in settlement meeting with EGI/TFG/GFN re Issue 4 proposal;	\$ 170.00	\$ 289.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	06/20/2023	2.3	SPP - Review settlement proposal;	\$ 170.00	\$ 391.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	06/21/2023	0.9	SPP - Review draft Issue 4 settlement proposal;	\$ 170.00	\$ 153.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	06/23/2023	1.8	SPP - Review EGI revisions to Issue 4 settlement proposal; prepare for call re same; attend on call with EGI, TFG, GFN;	\$ 170.00	\$ 306.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	06/25/2023	0.4	SPP - Review draft settlement proposal;	\$ 170.00	\$ 68.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	06/26/2023	0.6	SPP - Review revised EGI Issue 4 proposal;	\$ 170.00	\$ 102.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	06/26/2023	0.8	SPP - Review revised EGI Issue 4 proposal;	\$ 170.00	\$ 136.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	06/27/2023	2.3	SPP - Attend on call with other intervenors re Issue 4 settlement proposal;	\$ 170.00	\$ 391.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	06/28/2023	0.4	SPP - Review draft settlement proposal;	\$ 170.00	\$ 68.00	Daniel Vollmer	23124
<b>TimeEntry</b>	07/04/2023	0.4	SPP - Review questions from Board Staff re Issue 4 Settlement Proposal;	\$ 170.00	\$ 68.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	07/05/2023	0.1	SPP - Call with N. Daube re Issue 4 settlement proposal re Board Staff questions;	\$ 170.00	\$ 17.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	07/05/2023	1.2	SPP - Call with OEB Staff, EGI, TFG re Issue 4 settlement proposal;	\$ 170.00	\$ 204.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	07/05/2023	0.6	SPP - Correspondence with client re call with Board Staff re Issue 4 settlement proposal;	\$ 170.00	\$ 102.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	07/05/2023	0.3	SPP - Call with D. O'Leary / N. Daube re clarification letter to Board;	\$ 170.00	\$ 51.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	07/07/2023	0.6	SPP - Review and revise draft letter to OEB re clarification of Issue 4 settlement proposal;	\$ 170.00	\$ 102.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	07/07/2023	1.3	OHP - review panels and prepare time estimates;	\$ 170.00	\$ 221.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	07/10/2023	2.9	OHP - Review intervenor evidence; prepare for hearing;	\$ 170.00	\$ 493.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	07/10/2023	0.7	SPP - Call with EGI, TFG, GFN, Board Staff re Issue 4 proposal;	\$ 170.00	\$ 119.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	07/11/2023	1.2	SPP - Call with EGI / TFN / GFN;	\$ 170.00	\$ 204.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	07/11/2023	2.8	OHP - Review key evidence in preparation for hearing and cross examination;	\$ 170.00	\$ 476.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180

<b>TimeEntry</b>	07/12/2023	0.8	SPP - Discussion with intervenors re Issue 4 settlement; review OEB staff suggested revisions;	\$ 170.00	\$ 136.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	07/12/2023	2.8	OHP - Review client relevant evidence; Communications with client;	\$ 170.00	\$ 476.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	07/13/2023	7.4	OHA - Attend oral hearing (Day 1);	\$ 170.00	\$ 1,258.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	07/14/2023	7.2	OHA - Attend oral hearing (Day 2);	\$ 170.00	\$ 1,224.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	07/17/2023	7.2	OHA - Attend oral hearing (Day 3);	\$ 170.00	\$ 1,224.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	07/17/2023	1.4	OHP - Prepare cross examination for Panel 2 IGUA;	\$ 170.00	\$ 238.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	07/18/2023	6.5	OHA - Attend oral hearing (Day 4);	\$ 170.00	\$ 1,105.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	07/18/2023	2.1	OHP - Prepare materials for cross examination of A. Hopkins;	\$ 170.00	\$ 357.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	07/19/2023	7.1	OHA - Attend oral hearing (Day 5);	\$ 170.00	\$ 1,207.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	07/19/2023	1.4	OHP - Prepare cross examination materials for Panel 3;	\$ 170.00	\$ 238.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	07/20/2023	0.8	OHP - Prepare cross examination materials for Panel 3;	\$ 170.00	\$ 136.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	07/20/2023	6.9	OHA - Attend oral hearing (Day 6);	\$ 170.00	\$ 1,173.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	07/24/2023	5.4	OHA - Attend oral hearing (Day 7);	\$ 170.00	\$ 918.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	07/25/2023	1.2	OHA - Attend oral hearing (Day 8);	\$ 170.00	\$ 204.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	07/26/2023	4.8	OHA - Attend oral hearing (Day 9);	\$ 170.00	\$ 816.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	07/27/2023	7.3	OHA - Attend oral hearing (Day 10);	\$ 170.00	\$ 1,241.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	07/31/2023	4.5	OHA - Coordinate with counsel to TFG;	\$ 170.00	\$ 765.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	08/01/2023	0.7	OHA - Coordinate with counsel to TFG;	\$ 170.00	\$ 119.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	08/02/2023	6.4	OHP - Attend on hearing (Day 13);	\$ 170.00	\$ 1,088.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	08/08/2023	5	OHA - Attend on hearing (Day 15);	\$ 170.00	\$ 850.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	08/09/2023	5.9	OHA - Attend on hearing (Day 16);	\$ 170.00	\$ 1,003.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	08/10/2023	2.6	OHA - Attend on hearing (Day 17);	\$ 170.00	\$ 442.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	08/11/2023	0.7	OHP - Attend on hearing (Day 17);	\$ 170.00	\$ 119.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	08/18/2023	1.1	APR - Review EGI Final Argument;	\$ 170.00	\$ 187.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	08/22/2023	3.1	APR - Review evidence and record;	\$ 170.00	\$ 527.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	08/24/2023	0.5	APR - Review record and evidence;	\$ 170.00	\$ 85.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180

<b>TimeEntry</b>	08/29/2023	3.3	APR - Prepare final written submissions;	\$ 170.00	\$ 561.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	09/11/2023	3.1	APR - Prepare final arguments;	\$ 170.00	\$ 527.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	09/12/2023	8.6	APR - Prepare final arguments; Communications with and instructions from client;	\$ 170.00	\$ 1,462.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	09/13/2023	2.4	APR - Prepare final arguments reflecting client input;	\$ 170.00	\$ 408.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	10/12/2023	2.4	APR - Review EGI's reply argument;	\$ 170.00	\$ 408.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	10/13/2023	1.3	APR - Review EGI's reply argument;	\$ 170.00	\$ 221.00	Daniel Vollmer	23180
<b>TimeEntry</b>	01/03/2024	1	Review Decision and Order; prepare summary for client;	\$ 170.00	\$ 170.00	Daniel Vollmer	24128
<b>TimeEntry</b>	01/10/2024	0.3	Review Decision - Review order and decision; prepare summary for client;	\$ 170.00	\$ 51.00	Daniel Vollmer	24128
<b>TimeEntry</b>	01/11/2024	2.7	Review Decision - Review order and decision; prepare summary for client;	\$ 170.00	\$ 459.00	Daniel Vollmer	24128
<b>TimeEntry</b>	01/25/2024	0.9	Review procedural documents - Review EGI Notice of Appeal;	\$ 170.00	\$ 153.00	Daniel Vollmer	24128
<b>TimeEntry</b>	01/29/2024	1.9	Review procedural documents - Review EGI Motion to Review and Vary;	\$ 170.00	\$ 323.00	Daniel Vollmer	24128
<b>TimeEntry</b>	02/02/2024	1.3	Review procedural documents - Review Notice of Motion and Intervenor response;	\$ 170.00	\$ 221.00	Daniel Vollmer	24128
<b>Total</b>		<b>308.1</b>			<b>\$ 52,377.00</b>		

# DANIEL VOLLMER

+1.647.993.6338 DANIEL@RESILIENTLLP.COM

---

ON	EDUCATI	<b>Call to the Ontario Bar</b>	2020
		<b>Stellenbosch University</b> <i>Doctor of Laws, Public International Law</i>	2017
		<b>Stellenbosch University</b> <i>Bachelor of Laws</i> <ul style="list-style-type: none"><li>• Advanced Public International Law Distinction</li></ul>	2013
		<b>University of Denver</b> <b>Josef Korbel School of International Studies</b> <i>Bachelor of Arts, International Studies</i> <ul style="list-style-type: none"><li>• Hornbeck Scholar</li></ul>	2010

---

LEGAL WORK	<b>Resilient LLP</b> <i>Associate</i> <i>Articling Student (DeMarco Allan LLP)</i>	Toronto, ON 2021 – Present 2020 – 2021
	<ul style="list-style-type: none"><li>• Advise clients on corporate obligations with respect to the United Nations Declaration on the Rights of Indigenous Peoples (UNDRIP), the right to free, prior, and informed consent (FPIC) and the duty to consult and accommodate.</li><li>• Assist counsel with all types of participants in compliance and voluntary carbon markets transactions, including those involving carbon dioxide removals (nature and technology based), and voluntary-to-Paris compliance units.</li><li>• Assist in advising on international climate policy, negotiations, and related transactions, including the United Nations Framework Convention on Climate Change (UNFCCC) negotiations and Article 6 of the Paris Agreement.</li><li>• Assist with developing and preparing materials for client reporting service on United Nations Conference of the Parties (COP) climate negotiations and assist with preparing final report of outcomes and interpretation of COP decisions.</li><li>• Assist in advising clients on regulatory and legal requirements under national and subnational clean fuel regulations and standards.</li><li>• Prepare client bulletins and weekly reports on new and relevant developments in policy, legislation, and commercial developments related to climate, energy, environmental, social and governance (ESG) issues and developments, natural resources and Indigenous rights in Canada and internationally.</li><li>• Assist in advising clients on a variety of matters regarding climate change-related risks, climate, ESG, and net-zero strategies including carbon offsetting, compliance and regulatory matters.</li><li>• Assist provincial, state, federal, and national governments and ministries on climate and industrial emissions strategy, policy, legislative, and regulatory drafting.</li><li>• Assisted in a series of high-profile constitutional reference cases on federal carbon</li></ul>	

# DANIEL VOLLMER

+1.647.993.6338 DANIEL@RESILIENTLLP.COM

---

pricing legislation before the Supreme Court of Canada.

- Assist in advising businesses, NGOs and First Nations on energy and climate change law and policy.
- Assist in advising clients on regulatory and legal requirements under national and subnational clean fuel regulations and standards.
- Counsel to various groups before the Ontario Energy Board on matters relating to distributed energy resources (DERs), Indigenous rights, duty to consult and accommodate, non-wires alternatives, energy storage, electric vehicles, hydrogen, district energy, and renewable natural gas.
- Assist in advising various businesses on corporate finance, securities law compliance and corporate governance matter.
- Assist in advising on ESG reporting risks and climate-related disclosures.
- Advise clients on all regulatory and legal requirements for registering and participating in the linked California-Quebec Cap-and-Trade programs

## **International Bar Association** *Independent Legal Expert*

London, UK  
2019 – 2020

- Conducted research on the criminalization of sexual orientation through national legislation with an emphasis on Commonwealth countries.
- Advised on laws most frequently used to target LGBTQIA+ individuals and conducted a review of national and international jurisprudence challenging such laws.

## **International Bar Association's Human Rights Institute** *Legal Intern*

London, UK  
2019

- Awarded IBA Educational Trust grant.
- Conducted legal research for senior programme lawyer and deputy director on extractive industries, human rights violations, and attacks against the legal profession with focus areas of Africa, Southern Africa, and the United Nations human rights system.
- Drafted memos on relevant human rights cases and legal principles, assisted in the drafting and creation of capacity building programs for the protection and promotion of human rights and the legal profession in Southern Africa.
- UK Supreme Court trial observation of *Vedanta Resources Plc and Konkola Copper Mines Plc v Lungowe and Ors*.
- Drafted intervention letters, press releases, and open letters on behalf of IBAHRI regarding human rights violations, state obligations under international and

# DANIEL VOLLMER

+1.647.993.6338 DANIEL@RESILIENTLLP.COM

---

domestic law, and attacks against the legal profession in Zimbabwe, Sudan, Turkey, China, Nigeria, Iran, and the Democratic Republic of Congo.

- Conducted research and created database for “Toolkit on Lawyers at Risk” and training manual.

## **Fasken Martineau DuMoulin LLP**

Johannesburg, South Africa

*Winter Law Student*

2013

- Presented report on application of administrative law principles, jurisprudence, and statutes regarding mineral resource extraction legislation and beneficiation for mining department (South Africa).
- Drafted documents and compiled research for project finance department (Africa) on allocation of liability in international infrastructure projects.
- Completed rotations in mining and project finance departments.

## **Stellenbosch University Law Clinic**

Stellenbosch, South Africa

*Law Student*

2013

- Assisted with legal research and drafting on matters related to family law, wills and estates, and farm evictions.
- Drafted various legal documents including testamentary documents, affidavits, and notices of opposition.
- Assisted on consultations with clients and preparations for trial.
- Assisted with preparing documents, drafting affidavits, and interview and oral testimony preparation with law clinic and candidate attorneys.

---

## **OTHER EXPERIENCE**

### **OBA Natural Resources and Energy Law Section**

2020-Present

*Member-at-Large (2022-2023, 2020-2021)*

*Public Liaison (2021-2022)*

- Member and Public Liaison of the Ontario Bar Association’s NREL Section Executive.
- Curated and provided monthly updates to the Executive on proposed changes and amendments to relevant legislation and regulations.
- Assisted in planning and preparation of continuing professional development programming offered to membership and public.

### **OBA Sexual Orientation and Gender Identity Community**

2020-Present

*Member-at-Large*

# DANIEL VOLLMER

+1.647.993.6338 DANIEL@RESILIENTLLP.COM

---

- Member-at-large of the Ontario Bar Association's SOGIC Executive.
- Assisted with jurisdictional review of law society policies related to correct pronoun use and use of legal names for trans and non-binary articling students.
- Assisted and contributed to articles for membership on important legislative changes affecting 2SLGBTQ+ community.

---

## SELECTED PUBLICATIONS

DT **Vollmer** et al., (2022) "Global perspectives of Africa: Harnessing the Universal Periodic Review to process sexual and gender-based violence in SADC member states". *Stellenbosch Law Review* (Volume 33, Issue 1)

L. DeMarco, J. McGillivray and D. **Vollmer**, (2020) "The New World of Climate Change and ESG Disclosure". *Energy Regulation Quarterly* (Volume 8, Issue 4)

L. DeMarco and D. **Vollmer**, (2020) "The Good Fight". *IETA 2020 GHG Report*

D. **Vollmer**, (2019) "Reflections of an intern: Awaiting landmark decision in UK Supreme Court case on parent company liability". *International Bar Association*

DT **Vollmer**, (2017) "Queer families: An analysis of non-heteronormative family rights under the African human rights system". *Stellenbosch University*.

---

## SPEAKING PRESENTATIONS

Guest Lecturer, Ivey Business School, Special Topics in Mining Law, "*Climate Change and Mining*", University of Western Ontario. (January 2024)

Lecturer, Osgoode Hall Law School, Osgoode Certificate in ESG, Climate Risk & the Law "*Connecting Climate to Corporate ESG Strategy*", York University. (October 2023)

Guest Lecturer, Climate Change and Legal Change, "*The Legal Implications of Climate Change and Trading Emissions Credits*", University of Ottawa. (October 2023)

Lecturer, Osgoode Hall Law School, Osgoode Certificate in ESG, Climate Risk & the Law, "*Corporate ESG Specific to Climate*", York University. (November 2022)

Lecturer, Osgoode Hall Law School, Osgoode Certificate in ESG, Climate Risk & the Law, "*Corporate ESG Specific to Climate*", York University. (November 2021)

Conference Paper Co-Presenter, Stellenbosch University and the Centre for Human Rights, University of Pretoria, International Conference: The Responsiveness of the African human rights system to sexual and gender based violence, "*Global Perspectives of Africa: harnessing the Universal Periodic Review to process SGBV in SADC member states*", Stellenbosch University, South Africa. (August 2021)

Speaker, Centre for Trust, Peace and Social Relations Ph.D. Conference, "*Queer families: An analysis of non-heteronormative family rights under the African Human Rights System*", Coventry University, UK. (May 2017)

---

## AWARDS

*International Bar Association* – Educational Trust Grant

*LexisNexis and Stellenbosch University Faculty of Law* – 3<sup>rd</sup> Place (individual), 2<sup>nd</sup>

---

# DANIEL VOLLMER

+1.647.993.6338 DANIEL@RESILIENTLLP.COM

---

---

Place (Team), 2013 Mock Trial Competition

*Bowman Gilfillan* – 1<sup>st</sup> Place, 2012 Criminal Procedure Moot Court

---

## LANGUAGES

French (moderate proficiency)

Afrikaans (moderate proficiency)

Spanish (elementary proficiency)

---

<b>CASE</b> EB-2022-0200 - Phase 1: Rates: Distribution: Enbridge Gas Inc.	<b>COST CLAIM</b> EB-2022-0200 : 1 : Monika Pecnikova	<b>INTERVENOR NAME</b> Pecnikova, Monika; +1 (647) 991-1190 monika@resilientllp.com	<b>PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS</b> Submitted
<b>FILING PARTICIPANT</b> Kempton, Kate; +1 (416) 571-6775 kkempton@woodwardandcompany .com	<b>NEW PARTICIPANT</b> No	<b>NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME</b>	<b>NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME</b>
<b>SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE*</b> Legal Counsel	<b>YEAR CALLED TO BAR*</b> 2001	<b>COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF RELEVANT EXPERIENCE*</b> 21	<b>HOURLY RATE</b> 330
<b>HST RATE CHARGED*</b> 0.00	<b>CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST)</b> CV Provided within Previous 24 Months	<b>LAST CV DATE</b> July 12, 2023	<b>OVERRIDE HOURLY RATE</b> No
<b>HST NUMBER</b>	<b>HEARINGS</b> Yes	<b>CONSULTATIONS</b> No	<b>DISBURSEMENTS</b> No

**HEARINGS**

<b>Hearings Hours</b> 51.00	<b>Hearings Subtotal (\$)</b> 16,830.00	<b>Hearings Total Tax (\$)</b> 0.00	<b>Hearings Total (\$)</b> 16,830.00
--------------------------------	--	--	---

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
<b>DISCOVERY</b>						
Read and Research Application and Evidence		330		0.00		
Preparation of Interrogatories		330		0.00		
Review Interrogatory Responses	1.00	330	330.00	0.00		330.00
Technical Conference Preparation	2.60	330	858.00	0.00		858.00
Technical Conference Attendance	1.20	330	396.00	0.00		396.00
Technical Conference Follow-up		330		0.00		
<b>Subtotal of DISCOVERY</b>	<b>4.80</b>		<b>1,584.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>1,584.00</b>
<b>PROCEDURAL</b>						
Preparation of Issues List Submission	3.80	330	1,254.00	0.00		1,254.00
Attendance at Issues List Conference		330		0.00		
Preparation for a Confidentiality Request		330		0.00		
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality		330		0.00		
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		330		0.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		330		0.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		330		0.00		
Review Procedural Documents		330		0.00		

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
<b>Subtotal of PROCEDURAL</b>	<b>3.80</b>		<b>1,254.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>1,254.00</b>
<b>INTERVENOR EVIDENCE</b>						
Preparation of Intervenor Evidence		330		0.00		
Interrogatory Responses		330		0.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing		330		0.00		
<b>Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE</b>	<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>0.00</b>
<b>SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE</b>						
Preparation for Settlement Conference	4.60	330	1,518.00	0.00		1,518.00
Attendance at Settlement Conference		330		0.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal	34.70	330	11,451.00	0.00		11,451.00
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		330		0.00		
<b>Subtotal of SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE</b>	<b>39.30</b>		<b>12,969.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>12,969.00</b>
<b>WRITTEN ARGUMENT</b>						
Written Submissions	3.10	330	1,023.00	0.00		1,023.00
<b>Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT</b>	<b>3.10</b>		<b>1,023.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>1,023.00</b>
<b>ORAL ARGUMENT</b>						
Preparation for Oral Hearing		330		0.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		330		0.00		
Oral Submissions		330		0.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		330		0.00		
<b>Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT</b>	<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>0.00</b>
<b>DECISION</b>						
Review Decision		330		0.00		
Review Rate/Accounting Order		330		0.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order		330		0.00		
<b>Subtotal of DECISION</b>	<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>0.00</b>
<b>OTHER</b>						
Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor Conferences)		330		0.00		
<b>Subtotal of OTHER</b>	<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>0.00</b>
<b>TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES</b>						
<b>Total Service Provider Fees</b>	<b>51.00</b>		<b>16,830.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>16,830.00</b>

---

## Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
EB-2022-0200_GFN_Time Sheet_Kate Kempton.pdf	Time Docket	
6379 Ginoogaming bill 31 Jan-23 Inv 29797 (00607514xE1C2E).PDF	Invoice	
6379 Ginoogaming bill 28 Feb-23 Inv 30056 (00615385xE1C2E).PDF	Invoice	
6379 Ginoogaming bill 31 Mar-23 Inv 30438 (00625350xE1C2E).PDF	Invoice	
6379 Ginoogaming bill 30 Apr-23 Inv 30552 (00633019xE1C2E).PDF	Invoice	
6379 Ginoogaming bill 31 May-23 Inv 30791 (00640054xE1C2E).PDF	Invoice	
6379 Ginoogaming bill 30 June-23.pdf	Invoice	
6379 Ginoogaming bill 31 July-23 Inv 31394 (00654760xE1C2E).PDF	Invoice	
6379 Ginoogaming bill 30 Sept-23 Inv 32494 (00670084xE1C2E).PDF	Invoice	

---

## Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Claim Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
EB-2022-0200_GFN_Time Sheet_Kate Kempton.pdf	Time Docket	Hearings	
6379 Ginoogaming bill 31 Jan-23 Inv 29797 (00607514xE1C2E).PDF	Invoice	Hearings	
6379 Ginoogaming bill 28 Feb-23 Inv 30056 (00615385xE1C2E).PDF	Invoice	Hearings	
6379 Ginoogaming bill 31 Mar-23 Inv 30438 (00625350xE1C2E).PDF	Invoice	Hearings	
6379 Ginoogaming bill 30 Apr-23 Inv 30552 (00633019xE1C2E).PDF	Invoice	Hearings	
6379 Ginoogaming bill 31 May-23 Inv 30791 (00640054xE1C2E).PDF	Invoice	Hearings	
6379 Ginoogaming bill 30 June-23.pdf	Invoice	Hearings	
6379 Ginoogaming bill 31 July-23 Inv 31394 (00654760xE1C2E).PDF	Invoice	Hearings	
6379 Ginoogaming bill 30 Sept-23 Inv 32494 (00670084xE1C2E).PDF	Invoice	Hearings	

**EB-2022-0200\_ Ginoogaming First Nation\_ Time Sheet\_ Kate Kempton**

Type	Date	Hours		Description	Rate (\$)	Billable (\$)	User	Bill#
TimeEntry	01/18/2023	2.1	ICP	Emails with Resilient lawyer and review all materials from OEB	\$ 330.00	\$ 693.00	K. Kempton	29797
TimeEntry	01/30/2023	0.4	ICP	Review OEB issues list	\$ 330.00	\$ 132.00	K. Kempton	29797
TimeEntry	02/03/2023	1.3	ICP	Review and comment on Resilient memo on strategy for OEB proceeding.	\$ 330.00	\$ 429.00	K. Kempton	30056
TimeEntry	02/07/2023	1	TCP	Regulatory Processes & Hearing - review material from OEB re procedural order	\$ 330.00	\$ 330.00	K. Kempton	30056
TimeEntry	03/13/2023	0.7	TCP	Review material from OEB and from Resilient re: responses to interrogatories and next steps	\$ 330.00	\$ 231.00	K. Kempton	30438
TimeEntry	03/15/2023	0.5	TCP	Review material from Resilient on technical hearing and comment	\$ 330.00	\$ 165.00	K. Kempton	30438
TimeEntry	03/17/2023	0.4	TCP	Review OEB technical hearing procedural orders.	\$ 330.00	\$ 132.00	K. Kempton	30438
TimeEntry	03/22/2023	1.2	TCA	Attend OEB hearing; review materials sent by OEB for technical hearing issues	\$ 330.00	\$ 396.00	K. Kempton	30438
TimeEntry	03/23/2023	1.6	SCP	Review submissions to OEB on Enbridge rates	\$ 330.00	\$ 528.00	K. Kempton	30438
TimeEntry	03/27/2023	0.5	SCP	Review submissions on Rate issues	\$ 330.00	\$ 165.00	K. Kempton	30438
TimeEntry	04/24/2023	0.2	SCP	Emails with Resilient about next step in proceeding	\$ 330.00	\$ 66.00	K. Kempton	30552
TimeEntry	04/28/2023	1	IRR	Review interrogatory submissions of parties	\$ 330.00	\$ 330.00	K. Kempton	30552
TimeEntry	05/18/2023	0.3	SCP	Emails re: participation in settlement conference	\$ 330.00	\$ 99.00	K. Kempton	30791

<b>TimeEntry</b>	05/23/2023	2	SCP	Attend pre-settlement conference with intervenor counsel to discuss indigenous issues	\$ 330.00	\$ 660.00	K. Kempton	30791
<b>TimeEntry</b>	05/24/2023	0.5	SPP	Review and amend proposal for settlement conference, on indigenous consultation	\$ 330.00	\$ 165.00	K. Kempton	30791
<b>TimeEntry</b>	05/26/2023	1.3	SPP	Review submissions for settlement conference; instructions re: letter on GFN representatives	\$ 330.00	\$ 429.00	K. Kempton	30791
<b>TimeEntry</b>	05/29/2023	3.1	SPP	review certain filed materials on rates, emails re: next steps, attend OEB settlement conference	\$ 330.00	\$ 1,023.00	K. Kempton	30791
<b>TimeEntry</b>	05/31/2023	4.2	SPP	Participate in settlement conference re: indigenous engagement; draft terms of reference for engagement; emails	\$ 330.00	\$ 1,386.00	K. Kempton	30791
<b>TimeEntry</b>	05/31/2023	0.6	SPP	Emails re: settlement offer on indigenous participation.	\$ 330.00	\$ 198.00	K. Kempton	30791
<b>TimeEntry</b>	06/01/2023	0.7	SPP	review comments on term sheet and respond; emails re offer to EGI	\$ 330.00	\$ 231.00	K. Kempton	6379-63023
<b>TimeEntry</b>	06/02/2023	1.1	SPP	edits to term sheet on indigenous engagement; attend settlement conference	\$ 330.00	\$ 363.00	K. Kempton	6379-63023
<b>TimeEntry</b>	06/05/2023	0.4	SPP	review EGI response to our engagement proposal and email others re same	\$ 330.00	\$ 132.00	K. Kempton	6379-63023
<b>TimeEntry</b>	06/06/2023	0.2	SPP	emails with EGI re settlement of indigenous engagement issues	\$ 330.00	\$ 66.00	K. Kempton	6379-63023
<b>TimeEntry</b>	06/08/2023	0.5	SPP	Emails from EGI counsel re indigenous engagement; review settlement emails	\$ 330.00	\$ 165.00	K. Kempton	6379-63023
<b>TimeEntry</b>	06/09/2023	1	SPP	Call with EGI re settlement term sheet on indigenous engagement	\$ 330.00	\$ 330.00	K. Kempton	6379-63023
<b>TimeEntry</b>	06/13/2023	0.9	SPP	Review proposal from EGI and instruct G Morris on summary	\$ 330.00	\$ 297.00	K. Kempton	6379-63023

<b>TimeEntry</b>	06/14/2023	2.6	SPP	Review comparison chart on term sheets; calls with TFG counsel to go through changes to term sheet and make edits on same	\$ 330.00	\$ 858.00	K. Kempton	6379-63023
<b>TimeEntry</b>	06/16/2023	3.1	SPP	review edited term sheet and call with EGI reps re term sheet and next steps	\$ 330.00	\$ 1,023.00	K. Kempton	6379-63023
<b>TimeEntry</b>	06/22/2023	1	SPP	Yesterday and today review and edit versions of the indigenous engagement term sheet.	\$ 330.00	\$ 330.00	K. Kempton	6379-63023
<b>TimeEntry</b>	06/23/2023	2.5	SPP	Call with EGI and emails and budget calculations re indigenous engagement term sheet.	\$ 330.00	\$ 825.00	K. Kempton	6379-63023
<b>TimeEntry</b>	06/26/2023	0.6	SPP	Review edits to term sheet and emails with Resilient and intervenors re same.	\$ 330.00	\$ 198.00	K. Kempton	6379-63023
<b>TimeEntry</b>	06/27/2023	3.2	SPP	Revisions to term sheet; call with intervenors; call with N Daube; emails to EGI, intervenors, Resilient law, Chief; explain term sheet to client; do skim of full settlement package.	\$ 330.00	\$ 1,056.00	K. Kempton	6379-63023
<b>TimeEntry</b>	07/06/2023	0.5	SPP	Review letter to OEB re issue 4 and propose edit.	\$ 330.00	\$ 165.00	K. Kempton	31394
<b>TimeEntry</b>	07/07/2023	0.4	SPP	Review letters to OEB and edits re issue 4.	\$ 330.00	\$ 132.00	K. Kempton	31394
<b>TimeEntry</b>	07/10/2023	1.2	SPP	questions on Issue 4 settlement	\$ 330.00	\$ 396.00	K. Kempton	31394
<b>TimeEntry</b>	07/11/2023	2.8	SPP	counsel re dispute resolution changes to	\$ 330.00	\$ 924.00	K. Kempton	31394
<b>TimeEntry</b>	07/12/2023	2.3	SPP	drafts of amended term sheet for Issue	\$ 330.00	\$ 759.00	K. Kempton	31394
<b>TimeEntry</b>	09/15/2023	3.1	APR	Review and comment on submissions for GFN and supporting submission for the rate application.	\$ 330.00	\$ 1,023.00	K. Kempton	32494
<b>Total</b>		<b>51</b>				<b>\$ 16,830.00</b>		

# WOODWARD & COMPANY

LAWYERS LLP

VICTORIA OFFICE  
200 - 1022 Government Street  
Victoria, BC V8W 1X7  
T 250 383 2356  
F 250 380 6560

Our file: 6379  
Our invoice no.: 29797

January 31, 2023

In Account With:

Ginoogaming First Nation

PO Box 89

Longlac, ON P0T 2A0

Re: OEB Proceeding Against Enbridge Gas on Rate Rebasing

For Professional Services of Woodward & Company as follows:

DATE	INIT	HRS	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE
01/18/2023	KK	2.10	Emails with Resilient lawyer and review all materials from OEB.
01/30/2023	KK	0.40	Review OEB issues list.

Total for Professional Fees at our Standard Rate: 1,187.50

Professional Time Recorded:

KATE KEMPTON 2.50 1,187.50

Total Fees & Disbursements 1,187.50

Total H.S.T.: GST/HST Technical Information Bulletin, B-039R Exempt

Account Herein: 1,187.50

Woodward & Co. Lawyers LLP



Eamon Murphy\*

GST Registration No. 83380 1863 RT0001

This is an interim account. This account is subject to review by you and enforcement by us under the Legal Profession Act. If you have any concerns about our account, please feel welcome to contact us to discuss your concerns. Our account may be revised by us to correct errors or omissions.

Accounts are due and payable when issued. Accounts more than 45 days outstanding will have interest added at the rate of 2% per month. Please also note that if you provide us with a retainer to be held in our trust account from which we can pay our fees, we will provide you with a 5% discount on the legal fees portion of the bill.

Please note that our billable rates are determined based on a lawyer's practical experience and year of call, and are adjusted annually.

\*Denotes a Law Corporation.

# WOODWARD & COMPANY

LAWYERS LLP

VICTORIA OFFICE                      Our file: 6379  
200 - 1022 Government Street      Our invoice no.: 30056  
Victoria, BC V8W 1X7  
T 250 383 2356  
F 250 380 6560

February 28, 2023

In Account With:  
Ginoogaming First Nation  
PO Box 89  
Longlac, ON P0T 2A0

Re: OEB Proceeding Against Enbridge Gas on Rate Rebasing

For Professional Services of Woodward & Company as follows:

DATE	INIT	HRS	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE	
02/03/2023	KK	1.30	Review and comment on Resilient memo on strategy for OEB proceeding.	
02/07/2023	KK	1.00	Regulatory Processes & Hearing - review material from OEB re procedural order 4.	
<b>Total for Professional Fees at our Standard Rate:</b>				<b>1,092.50</b>

Professional Time Recorded:

KATE KEMPTON	2.30	1,092.50
--------------	------	----------

Total Fees & Disbursements **1,092.50**

Total H.S.T.: GST/HST Technical Information Bulletin, B-039R **Exempt**

Account Herein: **1,092.50**

Woodward & Co. Lawyers LLP

  
Eamon Murphy\*

GST Registration No. 83380 1863 RT0001

This is an interim account. This account is subject to review by you and enforcement by us under the Legal Profession Act. If you have any concerns about our account, please feel welcome to contact us to discuss your concerns. Our account may be revised by us to correct errors or omissions.

Accounts are due and payable when issued. Accounts more than 45 days outstanding will have interest added at the rate of 2% per month. Please also note that if you provide us with a retainer to be held in our trust account from which we can pay our fees, we will provide you with a 5% discount on the legal fees portion of the bill.

Please note that our billable rates are determined based on a lawyer's practical experience and year of call, and are adjusted annually.

\*Denotes a Law Corporation.

# WOODWARD & COMPANY

LAWYERS LLP

VICTORIA OFFICE  
200 - 1022 Government Street  
Victoria, BC V8W 1X7  
T 250 383 2356  
F 250 380 6560

Our file: 6379  
Our invoice no.: 30438

March 31, 2023

In Account With:

Ginoogaming First Nation

PO Box 89  
Longlac, ON P0T 2A0

Re: OEB Proceeding Against Enbridge Gas on Rate Rebasing

For Professional Services of Woodward & Company as follows:

DATE	INIT	HRS	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE
03/13/2023	KK	0.70	Review material from OEB and from Resilient re: responses to interrogatories and next steps.
03/15/2023	KK	0.50	Review material from Resilient on technical hearing and comment.
03/17/2023	KK	0.40	Review OEB technical hearing procedural orders.
03/22/2023	KK	1.20	Attend OEB hearing; review materials sent by OEB for technical hearing issues.
03/23/2023	KK	1.60	Review submissions to OEB on Enbridge rates.
03/27/2023	KK	0.50	Review submissions on Rate issues.

Total for Professional Fees at our Standard Rate: 2,327.50

Professional Time Recorded:

KATE KEMPTON 4.90 2,327.50

Total Fees & Disbursements 2,327.50

Total H.S.T.: GST/HST Technical Information Bulletin, B-039R Exempt

Account Herein:

2,327.50

Woodward & Co. Lawyers LLP

  
Alana DeGrave\*

*GST Registration No. 83380 1863 RT0001*

This is an interim account. This account is subject to review by you and enforcement by us under the Legal Profession Act. If you have any concerns about our account, please feel welcome to contact us to discuss your concerns. Our account may be revised by us to correct errors or omissions.

Accounts are due and payable when issued. Accounts more than 45 days outstanding will have interest added at the rate of 2% per month. Please also note that if you provide us with a retainer to be held in our trust account from which we can pay our fees, we will provide you with a 5% discount on the legal fees portion of the bill.

Please note that our billable rates are determined based on a lawyer's practical experience and year of call, and are adjusted annually.

\*Denotes a Law Corporation.

# WOODWARD & COMPANY

LAWYERS LLP

VICTORIA OFFICE  
200 - 1022 Government Street  
Victoria, BC V8W 1X7  
T 250 383 2356  
F 250 380 6560

Our file: 6379  
Our invoice no.: 30552

April 30, 2023

In Account With:  
Ginoogaming First Nation  
PO Box 89  
Longlac, ON P0T 2A0

Re: OEB Proceeding Against Enbridge Gas on Rate Rebasing

For Professional Services of Woodward & Company as follows:

DATE	INIT	HRS	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE
04/24/2023	KK	0.20	Emails with Resilient about next step in proceeding.
04/28/2023	KK	1.00	Review interrogatory submissions of parties.

Total for Professional Fees at our Standard Rate: 570.00

Professional Time Recorded:

KATE KEMPTON	1.20	570.00
--------------	------	--------

Total Fees & Disbursements 570.00

Total H.S.T.: GST/HST Technical Information Bulletin, B-039R Exempt

Account Herein: 570.00

Woodward & Co. Lawyers LLP

  
Alana DeGrave\*

GST Registration No. 83380 1863 RT0001

This is an interim account. This account is subject to review by you and enforcement by us under the Legal Profession Act. If you have any concerns about our account, please feel welcome to contact us to discuss your concerns. Our account may be revised by us to correct errors or omissions.

Accounts are due and payable when issued. Accounts more than 45 days outstanding will have interest added at the rate of 2% per month. Please also note that if you provide us with a retainer to be held in our trust account from which we can pay our fees, we will provide you with a 5% discount on the legal fees portion of the bill.

Please note that our billable rates are determined based on a lawyer's practical experience and year of call, and are adjusted annually.

\*Denotes a Law Corporation.

# WOODWARD & COMPANY

LAWYERS LLP

**VICTORIA OFFICE**

200 - 1022 Government Street  
Victoria, BC V8W 1X7  
T 250 383 2356  
F 250 380 6560

Our file: 6379  
Our invoice no.: 30791

May 31, 2023

**In Account With:**

**Ginoogaming First Nation**

PO Box 89  
Longlac, ON P0T 2A0

**Re: OEB Proceeding Against Enbridge Gas on Rate Rebasing**

**For Professional Services of Woodward & Company as follows:**

<i>DATE</i>	<i>INIT</i>	<i>HRS</i>	<i>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE</i>
05/18/2023	KK	0.30	Emails re: participation in settlement conference.
05/23/2023	KK	2.00	Attend pre-settlement conference with intervenor counsel to discuss indigenous issues.
05/24/2023	KK	0.50	Review and amend proposal for settlement conference, on indigenous consultation.
05/26/2023	KK	1.30	Review submissions for settlement conference; instructions re: letter on GFN representatives.
05/29/2023	KK	3.10	Attend OEB settlement conference, review certain filed materials on rates, emails re: next steps.
05/31/2023	KK	4.20	Participate in settlement conference re: indigenous engagement; draft terms of reference for engagement; emails.
05/31/2023	KK	0.60	Emails re: settlement offer on indigenous participation.

**Total for Professional Fees at our Standard Rate: 5,700.00**

**Professional Time Recorded:**

KATE KEMPTON 12.00 5,700.00

Total Fees & Disbursements

5,700.00

Total H.S.T.: GST/HST Technical Information Bulletin, B-039R

Exempt

Account Herein:

5,700.00

Woodward & Co. Lawyers LLP



Alana DeGrave\*

*GST Registration No. 83380 1863 RT0001*

This is an interim account. This account is subject to review by you and enforcement by us under the Legal Profession Act. If you have any concerns about our account, please feel welcome to contact us to discuss your concerns. Our account may be revised by us to correct errors or omissions.

Accounts are due and payable when issued. Accounts more than 45 days outstanding will have interest added at the rate of 2% per month. Please also note that if you provide us with a retainer to be held in our trust account from which we can pay our fees, we will provide you with a 5% discount on the legal fees portion of the bill.

Please note that our billable rates are determined based on a lawyer's practical experience and year of call, and are adjusted annually.

\*Denotes a Law Corporation.

# WOODWARD & COMPANY

LAWYERS LLP

**VICTORIA OFFICE**

200 - 1022 Government Street  
Victoria, BC V8W 1X7  
T 250 383 2356  
F 250 380 6560

Our file: 6379

Our invoice no.: 6379-63023

June 30, 2023

**In Account With:**

**Ginoogaming First Nation**

PO Box 89  
Longlac, ON P0T 2A0

**Re: OEB Proceeding Against Enbridge Gas on Rate Rebasing**

*For Professional Services of Woodward & Company as follows:*

<i>DATE</i>	<i>INIT</i>	<i>HRS</i>	<i>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE</i>
06/01/2023	KK	0.70	Review comments on term sheet and respond; emails re offer to EGI
06/02/2023	KK	1.10	Attend settlement conference; edits to term sheet on indigenous engagement
06/05/2023	KK	0.40	Review EGI response to our engagement proposal and email others re same
06/06/2023	KK	0.20	Emails with EGI re settlement of indigenous engagement issues
06/08/2023	KK	0.50	Emails from EGI counsel re indigenous engagement; review settlement emails
06/09/2023	KK	1.00	Call with EGI re settlement term sheet on indigenous engagement
06/13/2023	KK	0.90	Review proposal from EGI and instruct G Morris on summary
06/14/2023	KK	2.60	Review comparison chart on term sheets; calls with TFG counsel to go through changes to term sheet and make edits on same
06/14/2023	GM	3.20	Read/Respond to K Kempton email RE: Issue 4 Proposal comparison task. Draft document detailing substantive distances between parties' proposals re: issue 4: Indigenous Engagement.

06/16/2023	KK	3.10	Review edited term sheet and call with EGI reps re term sheet and next steps
06/22/2023	KK	1.00	Yesterday and today review and edit versions of the indigenous engagement term sheet
06/23/2023	KK	2.50	Call with EGI and emails and budget calculations re indigenous engagement term sheet
06/26/2023	KK	0.60	Review edits to term sheet and emails with Resilient and intervenors re same.
06/27/2023	KK	3.20	Revisions to term sheet; call with intervenors; call with N Daube; emails to EGI, intervenors, Resilient law, Chief; explain term sheet to client; do skim of full settlement package.

**Total for Professional Fees at our Standard Rate: 8,935.00**

Professional Time Recorded:

KATE KEMPTON	17.80	475.00	8,455.00
GALEN MORRIS	3.20	150.00	480.00

Total Fees & Disbursements **8,935.00**

Total H.S.T.: *GST/HST Technical Information Bulletin, B-039R* **Exempt**

Account Herein: **8,935.00**

Woodward & Co. Lawyers LLP



Kate Kempton\*

*GST Registration No. 83380 1863 RT0001*

This is an interim account. This account is subject to review by you and enforcement by us under the Legal Profession Act. If you have any concerns about our account, please feel welcome to contact us to discuss your concerns. Our account may be revised by us to correct errors or omissions.

Accounts are due and payable when issued. Accounts more than 45 days outstanding will have interest added at the rate of 2% per month. Please also note that if you provide us with a retainer to be held in our trust account from which we can pay our fees, we will provide you with a 5% discount on the legal fees portion of the bill.

Please note that our billable rates are determined based on a lawyer's practical experience and year of call, and are adjusted annually.

\*Denotes a Law Corporation.

# WOODWARD & COMPANY

LAWYERS LLP

**VICTORIA OFFICE**

200 - 1022 Government Street  
Victoria, BC V8W 1X7  
T 250 383 2356  
F 250 380 6560

File No.: 6379  
Invoice No.: 31394

July 31, 2023

**In Account With:**

**Ginoogaming First Nation**

PO Box 89  
Longlac, ON P0T 2A0

**Re: OEB Proceeding Against Enbridge Gas on Rate Rebasing**

*For Professional Services of Woodward & Company as follows:*

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INIT</u>	<u>HRS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE</u>
07/06/2023	KK	0.5	Review letter to OEB re issue 4 and propose edit.
07/07/2023	KK	0.4	Review letters to OEB and edits re issue 4.
07/10/2023	KK	1.2	Call with EGI and OEB staff re questions on Issue 4 settlement proposal; emails re same.
07/11/2023	KK	2.8	Calls with EGI counsel and intervenor counsel re dispute resolution changes to Issue 4 settlement; emails proposing language re same.
07/12/2023	KK	2.3	Calls with EGI and intervenors; review drafts of amended term sheet for Issue 4; emails.

Total for Professional Fees at our Standard Rate: 3,420.00

*Professional Time Recorded*

KATE KEMPTON 7.20 3,420.00

**ACCOUNT HEREIN: \$3,420.00**

Woodward & Co. Lawyers LLP



Alana DeGrave \*

*GST Registration No. 83380 1863 RT0001*

This account is subject to review by you and enforcement by us under the Legal Profession Act. The account may be revised by us to correct errors or omissions. If you have any concerns about this account, please contact us to discuss your concerns.

Accounts are due and payable when received. Accounts more than 45 days outstanding will have interest added at the rate of 2% per month. If you provide a retainer to be held in our trust account from which we can pay our fees, we will provide you with a 5% discount on the legal fees portion of the bill. Billable rates are determined based on a lawyer's practical experience and year of call, and are adjusted annually.

If either federal and/or provincial taxes are not listed in the above invoice, then this matter meets applicable tax exemption requirements, and those taxes have not been charged.

\*Denotes a Law Corporation.

# WOODWARD & COMPANY

LAWYERS LLP

VICTORIA OFFICE  
200 - 1022 Government Street  
Victoria, BC V8W 1X7  
T 250 383 2356  
F 250 380 6560

File No.: 6379  
Invoice No.: 32494

September 30, 2023

**In Account With:**

Ginoogaming First Nation  
PO Box 89  
Longlac, ON P0T 2A0

**Re: OEB Proceeding Against Enbridge Gas on Rate Rebasing**

**For Professional Services of Woodward & Company as follows:**

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INIT</u>	<u>HRS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE</u>
09/15/2023	KK	3.10	Review and comment on submissions for GFN and supporting submission for the rate application.

Total for Professional Fees at our Standard Rate: 1,472.50

Professional Time Recorded

KATE KEMPTON	3.10	1,472.50
--------------	------	----------

**ACCOUNT HEREIN:**

**\$1,472.50**

Woodward & Co. Lawyers LLP



**Alana DeGrave \***

GST Registration No. 83380 1863 RT0001

This account is subject to review by you and enforcement by us under the Legal Profession Act. The account may be revised by us to correct errors or omissions. If you have any concerns about this account, please contact us to discuss your concerns. Accounts are due and payable when received. Accounts more than 45 days outstanding will have interest added at the rate of 2% per month. If you provide a retainer to be held in our trust account from which we can pay our fees, we will provide you with a 5% discount on the legal fees portion of the bill. Billable rates are determined based on a lawyer's practical experience and year of call, and are adjusted annually. If either federal and/or provincial taxes are not listed in the above invoice, then this matter meets applicable tax exemption requirements, and those taxes have not been charged. \*Denotes a Law Corporation.

<b>CASE</b> EB-2022-0200 - Phase 1: Rates: Distribution: Enbridge Gas Inc.	<b>COST CLAIM</b> EB-2022-0200 : 1 : Monika Pecnikova	<b>INTERVENOR NAME</b> Pecnikova, Monika; +1 (647) 991-1190 monika@resilientllp.com	<b>PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS</b> Submitted
<b>FILING PARTICIPANT</b> Morris, Galen; +1 (647) 991-1190 gmmorris@woodwardandcompany.c om	<b>NEW PARTICIPANT</b> No	<b>NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME</b>	<b>NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME</b>
<b>SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE*</b> Articling Student/Paralegal	<b>YEAR CALLED TO BAR*</b>	<b>COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF RELEVANT EXPERIENCE*</b>	<b>HOURLY RATE</b> 100
<b>HST RATE CHARGED*</b> 0.00	<b>CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST)</b> CV Provided within Previous 24 Months	<b>LAST CV DATE</b> July 12, 2023	<b>OVERRIDE HOURLY RATE</b> No
<b>HST NUMBER</b>	<b>HEARINGS</b> Yes	<b>CONSULTATIONS</b> No	<b>DISBURSEMENTS</b> No

**HEARINGS**

<b>Hearings Hours</b> 3.20	<b>Hearings Subtotal (\$)</b> 320.00	<b>Hearings Total Tax (\$)</b> 0.00	<b>Hearings Total (\$)</b> 320.00
-------------------------------	---	--	--------------------------------------

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
<b>DISCOVERY</b>						
Read and Research Application and Evidence		100		0.00		
Preparation of Interrogatories		100		0.00		
Review Interrogatory Responses		100		0.00		
Technical Conference Preparation		100		0.00		
Technical Conference Attendance		100		0.00		
Technical Conference Follow-up		100		0.00		
<b>Subtotal of DISCOVERY</b>	<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>0.00</b>
<b>PROCEDURAL</b>						
Preparation of Issues List Submission		100		0.00		
Attendance at Issues List Conference		100		0.00		
Preparation for a Confidentiality Request		100		0.00		
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality		100		0.00		
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		100		0.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		100		0.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		100		0.00		
Review Procedural Documents		100		0.00		

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
<b>Subtotal of PROCEDURAL</b>	<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>0.00</b>
<b>INTERVENOR EVIDENCE</b>						
Preparation of Intervenor Evidence		100		0.00		
Interrogatory Responses		100		0.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing		100		0.00		
<b>Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE</b>	<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>0.00</b>
<b>SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE</b>						
Preparation for Settlement Conference		100		0.00		
Attendance at Settlement Conference		100		0.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal	3.20	100	320.00	0.00		320.00
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		100		0.00		
<b>Subtotal of SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE</b>	<b>3.20</b>		<b>320.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>320.00</b>
<b>WRITTEN ARGUMENT</b>						
Written Submissions		100		0.00		
<b>Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT</b>	<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>0.00</b>
<b>ORAL ARGUMENT</b>						
Preparation for Oral Hearing		100		0.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		100		0.00		
Oral Submissions		100		0.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		100		0.00		
<b>Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT</b>	<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>0.00</b>
<b>DECISION</b>						
Review Decision		100		0.00		
Review Rate/Accounting Order		100		0.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order		100		0.00		
<b>Subtotal of DECISION</b>	<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>0.00</b>
<b>OTHER</b>						
Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor Conferences)		100		0.00		
<b>Subtotal of OTHER</b>	<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>0.00</b>
<b>TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES</b>						
<b>Total Service Provider Fees</b>	<b>3.20</b>		<b>320.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>320.00</b>

## Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
EB-2022-0200_GFN_ Time Sheet_ Galen Morris.pdf	Time Docket	
6379 Ginoogaming bill 30 June-23.pdf	Invoice	

---

**Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments**

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Claim Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
EB-2022-0200_GFN_ Time Sheet_ Galen Morris.pdf	Time Docket	Hearings	
6379 Ginoogaming bill 30 June-23.pdf	Invoice	Hearings	

**EB-2022-0200\_ Ginoogaming First Nation\_ Time Sheet\_ Galen Morris**

Type	Date	Hours		Description	Rate (\$)	Billable (\$)	User	Bill#
TimeEntry	06/14/2023	3.2	SPP	Read/Respond to K Kempton email RE: Issue 4 Proposal comparison task. Draft document detailing substantive distances between parties' proposals re: issue 4: Indigenous Engagement	\$ 100.00	\$ 320.00	G. Morris	6379-63023
TimeEntry								
<b>Total</b>		<b>3.2</b>				<b>\$ 320.00</b>		

# WOODWARD & COMPANY

LAWYERS LLP

**VICTORIA OFFICE**

200 - 1022 Government Street  
Victoria, BC V8W 1X7  
T 250 383 2356  
F 250 380 6560

Our file: 6379

Our invoice no.: 6379-63023

June 30, 2023

**In Account With:**

**Ginoogaming First Nation**

PO Box 89  
Longlac, ON P0T 2A0

**Re: OEB Proceeding Against Enbridge Gas on Rate Rebasing**

*For Professional Services of Woodward & Company as follows:*

<i>DATE</i>	<i>INIT</i>	<i>HRS</i>	<i>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE</i>
06/01/2023	KK	0.70	Review comments on term sheet and respond; emails re offer to EGI
06/02/2023	KK	1.10	Attend settlement conference; edits to term sheet on indigenous engagement
06/05/2023	KK	0.40	Review EGI response to our engagement proposal and email others re same
06/06/2023	KK	0.20	Emails with EGI re settlement of indigenous engagement issues
06/08/2023	KK	0.50	Emails from EGI counsel re indigenous engagement; review settlement emails
06/09/2023	KK	1.00	Call with EGI re settlement term sheet on indigenous engagement
06/13/2023	KK	0.90	Review proposal from EGI and instruct G Morris on summary
06/14/2023	KK	2.60	Review comparison chart on term sheets; calls with TFG counsel to go through changes to term sheet and make edits on same
06/14/2023	GM	3.20	Read/Respond to K Kempton email RE: Issue 4 Proposal comparison task. Draft document detailing substantive distances between parties' proposals re: issue 4: Indigenous Engagement.

06/16/2023	KK	3.10	Review edited term sheet and call with EGI reps re term sheet and next steps
06/22/2023	KK	1.00	Yesterday and today review and edit versions of the indigenous engagement term sheet
06/23/2023	KK	2.50	Call with EGI and emails and budget calculations re indigenous engagement term sheet
06/26/2023	KK	0.60	Review edits to term sheet and emails with Resilient and intervenors re same.
06/27/2023	KK	3.20	Revisions to term sheet; call with intervenors; call with N Daube; emails to EGI, intervenors, Resilient law, Chief; explain term sheet to client; do skim of full settlement package.

**Total for Professional Fees at our Standard Rate: 8,935.00**

Professional Time Recorded:

KATE KEMPTON	17.80	475.00	8,455.00
GALEN MORRIS	3.20	150.00	480.00

Total Fees & Disbursements **8,935.00**

Total H.S.T.: *GST/HST Technical Information Bulletin, B-039R* **Exempt**

Account Herein: **8,935.00**

Woodward & Co. Lawyers LLP



Kate Kempton\*

*GST Registration No. 83380 1863 RT0001*

This is an interim account. This account is subject to review by you and enforcement by us under the Legal Profession Act. If you have any concerns about our account, please feel welcome to contact us to discuss your concerns. Our account may be revised by us to correct errors or omissions.

Accounts are due and payable when issued. Accounts more than 45 days outstanding will have interest added at the rate of 2% per month. Please also note that if you provide us with a retainer to be held in our trust account from which we can pay our fees, we will provide you with a 5% discount on the legal fees portion of the bill.

Please note that our billable rates are determined based on a lawyer's practical experience and year of call, and are adjusted annually.

\*Denotes a Law Corporation.