

April 30, 2024

Ms. Nancy Marconi Registrar Ontario Energy Board 2300 Yonge Street, 27th Floor Toronto, Ontario M4P 1E4

Dear Ms. Marconi:

Re: Enbridge Gas Inc. 2024 to 2028 Rates Application EB-2022-0200

Enclosed please find the cost claim of Environmental Defence in this matter. Please note that Environmental Defence did not make a separate request for cost reimbursement for the intervenor conference held by Enbridge or submit an interim cost claim. This was done for administrative efficiency and simplicity. Therefore, all such costs are included in this one final cost claim.

In our submission, the costs requested by Environmental Defence are very good value for money in relation to its contribution to this proceeding. Environmental Defence commissioned two expert reports, one jointly with the Green Energy Coalition by the Energy Futures Group and one independently by Drs. Howarth and Jacobson. Environmental Defence also conducted a deep and detailed examination of Enbridge's evidence, including the report by Guidehouse, including 124 pages of interrogatories, successful motions to obtain information initially withheld by the applicant, and active participation in the technical conference and hearing. When faced with these detailed questions, Guidehouse found problems in its analysis, which, when corrected, swung the results by \$140 billion. Environmental Defence made detailed submissions, which addressed many issues in addition to the expert evidence it commissioned.

We therefore ask this claim be approved in full.

Yours truly,

Kent Elson

cc: Parties to the above proceeding

Kent@ElsonAdvocacy.ca 1062 College St., Toronto, ON M6H 1A9

EB-2022-0200 : 1 : Kent Elson

COST CLAIM NUMBER 2083	SUBMISSION DEADLINE DATE April 30, 2024	CLAIM STATUS Approved by Finance
EB# EB-2022-0200 - Phase 1: Rates: Distribution: Enbridge Gas Inc.	OTHER EB#S	PHASE #* 1
INTERVENOR Elson, Kent; +1 (416) 906-7305 kent@elsonadvocacy.ca	INTERVENOR COMPANY* Environmental Defence Canada Inc., Toronto: Corporation	INTERVENOR TYPE Full Registrant
HST RATE ONTARIO 13.00	EXCHANGE RATE	COUNTRY
HST NUMBER 872151923RT0001	LATE SUBMISSION ALLOWED No	EXTENSION DEADLINE DATE

PARTICIPANTS

New	Non-Filing Participant First, Last Name	Filing Participant	Total (\$)	Total Hours	Participant Claim Status
No	,	Elson, Kent; +1 (416) 906-7305 kent@elsonadvocacy.ca	182,037.35	555.50	Submitted
No	,	Montgomery, Amanda; +1 (416) 906-7305 amanda@elsonadvocacy.ca	922.08	4.80	Submitted

ATTACHMENTS

Attachment	Document Type	Import Message
ED_LtrCostClaimCover_20240430.pdf	Cover Letter	
ED EB-2022-0200 Cost Claim 043020241505.pdf		

ED EB-2022-0200 Cost Claim 043020241507.pdf

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT/OTHER FEES 161.911.00

TOTAL CLAIM 182,959.43

TOTAL HOURS CLAIMED 560.30

REASON FOR DISALLOWANCE

MAKE CHEQUE PAYABLE TO Elson Advocacy

SEND PAYMENT TO ADDRESS 1062 College Street Toronto, Ontario M6H1A9

SUBMIT SECTION

I am a representative of the Party. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim. The costs incurred and time spent are directly related to the Party's participation in the OEB Process referred to above.

This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in section 6.05 and 6.09 of the OEB's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

The information (fees and disbursements) filed in this cost claim is complete and accurate and in accordance with the OEB's Practice Direction for Cost Awards and Appendix A, the Cost Awards Tariff.

SUBMITTED BY Kent Elson DATE SUBMITTED April 30, 2024

TOTAL HOURS DISALLOWED

REASON FOR DISALLOWANCE - 2 REASON FOR DISALLOWANCE - 3

ATTENTION

Page 2 of 2

TOTAL HST 21,048.43

Kent Elson

CASE EB-2022-0200 - Phase 1: Rates: Distribution: Enbridge Gas Inc. COST CLAIM EB-2022-0200 : 1 : Kent Elson

Yes

INTERVENOR NAME Elson, Kent; +1 (416) 906-7305 kent@elsonadvocacy.ca PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS Submitted

No

NON-FILING NON-FILING FILING PARTICIPANT NEW PARTICIPANT F. NAME PARTICIPANT L. NAME PARTICIPANT Elson, Kent; +1 (416) 906-7305 kent@elsonadvocacy.ca No SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE* YEAR CALLED TO BAR* COMPLETED YEARS HOURLY RATE Legal Counsel 2009 PRACTICING/YEARS OF 290 **RELEVANT EXPERIENCE*** 14 **HST RATE CHARGED* CV STATUS (FOR** LAST CV DATE **OVERRIDE** 13.00 CONSULTANT/ANALYST) HOURLY RATE **CV** Required No HST NUMBER HEARINGS CONSULTATIONS DISBURSEMENTS

No

HEARINGS

872151923RT0001

Hearings Hours 555.50	Hearing 161,09	s Subtotal (\$) 95.00		Hearings Total 20,942.35	Tax (\$)		rings Total (\$) 2,037.35
<u>Name</u>		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly</u> <u>Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST</u> Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
DISCOVERY							
Read and Research App Evidence	lication and	49.50	290	14,355.00	13.00	1,866.15	16,221.15
Preparation of Interrogate	ories	70.50	290	20,445.00	13.00	2,657.85	23,102.85
Review Interrogatory Res	sponses		290		13.00		
Technical Conference Pr	eparation	51.10	290	14,819.00	13.00	1,926.47	16,745.47
Technical Conference Att	tendance	39.60	290	11,484.00	13.00	1,492.92	12,976.92
Technical Conference Fo	llow-up		290		13.00		
Subtotal of DISCOVERY	•	210.70		61,103.00		7,943.39	69,046.39
PROCEDURAL							
Preparation of Issues Lis	t Submission	3.80	290	1,102.00	13.00	143.26	1,245.26
Attendance at Issues Lis	t Conference	6.00	290	1,740.00	13.00	226.20	1,966.20
Preparation for a Confide	entiality Request		290		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on	Confidentiality		290		13.00		
Preparation of Motion(s)	Materials	21.50	290	6,235.00	13.00	810.55	7,045.55
Prepare Submissions on	the Motion(s)	2.00	290	580.00	13.00	75.40	655.40
Attendance at Hearing or	n Motion(s)		290		13.00		
Review Procedural Docu	ments	0.40	290	116.00	13.00	15.08	131.08

CC_Participant_Combined.rpt - last Update 20230601

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	Sub Total	<u>HST</u> Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Subtotal of PROCEDURAL	33.70		9,773.00		1,270.49	11,043.49
INTERVENOR EVIDENCE Preparation of Intervenor Evidence	9.00	290	2,610.00	13.00	339.30	2,949.30
Interrogatory Responses	4.30	290	1,247.00	13.00	162.11	1,409.11
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing	40.00	290	2 957 99	13.00	504 44	4 250 44
	13.30		3,857.00		501.41	4,358.41
SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE Preparation for Settlement Conference	12.60	290	3,654.00	13.00	475.02	4,129.02
Attendance at Settlement Conference	56.80	290	16,472.00	13.00	2,141.36	18,613.36
Preparation of Settlement Proposal	7.00	290	2,030.00	13.00	263.90	2,293.90
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		290		13.00		
Subtotal of SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE WRITTEN ARGUMENT	76.40		22,156.00		2,880.28	25,036.28
Written Submissions	77.30	290	22,417.00	13.00	2,914.21	25,331.21
Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT	77.30		22,417.00		2,914.21	25,331.21
ORAL ARGUMENT Preparation for Oral Hearing	77.50	290	22,475.00	13.00	2,921.75	25,396.75
Attendance at Oral Hearing	61.00	290	17,690.00	13.00	2,299.70	19,989.70
Oral Submissions		290		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		290		13.00		
Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT	138.50		40,165.00		5,221.45	45,386.45
DECISION Review Decision	2.50	290	725.00	13.00	94.25	819.25
Review Rate/Accounting Order		290		13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order	3.10	290	899.00	13.00	116.87	1,015.87
Subtotal of DECISION	5.60		1,624.00		211.12	1,835.12
OTHER			,			,
Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor Conferences)		290		13.00		
Subtotal of OTHER	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES Total Service Provider Fees	555.50		161,095.00		20,942.35	182,037.35
Attachments						
Attachment ElsonAdvocacyInvoiceAndDockets.pdf	Document Ty Time Docket a		<u>lr</u>	nport Me	essage	

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

<u>Attachment</u> ElsonAdvocacyInvoiceAndDockets.pdf Document Type Time Docket and Invoice <u>Claim Type</u> Hearings Import Message



Invoice

Environmental Defence		April 10, 2024
33 Cecil Street Toronto, ON		
M5T 1N1	File #:	0151
	Inv #:	1311

RE: Enbridge rebasing case (2023)

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	LAWYER
Jun 16, 2022	Enbridge 2024 rebasing stakeholder session	2.00	KE
Jun 21, 2022	Call re intervenor coordination, potential experts, and planning for the Enbridge rebasing case	0.50	KE
Jun 22, 2022	Draft outline of questions/topics for potential expert in the Enbridge rebasing case; various correspondence	1.50	KE
Jun 23, 2022	Draft correspondence to potential expert for Enrbidge rebasing case	0.50	KE
Jun 24, 2022	Correspond with potential expert for the Enbridge rebasing case	0.10	KE
Jun 27, 2022	Call with potential expert for the rebasing case	1.00	KE
Jul 11, 2022	Correspondence re expert for Enbridge rebasing case	0.20	KE
Aug 4, 2022	Call with potential expert	1.00	KE
Aug 29, 2022	Review materials from potential expert	0.30	KE
Sep 20, 2022	Various correspondence re preparation for the Enbridge rebasing case	0.20	KE
Sep 21, 2022	Correspondence with intervenors re potential coordination on experts; review expert report of Dr. Hopkins	0.50	KE
Elson Advocacy Professional Corporation	Kent@ElsonAdvocacy.ca n 1062 College St., Lower Suite, Toronto, ON M6H 1A9	tel: fax:	416 906-7305 416 763-5435

Sep 28, 2022	Various correspondence re stakeholder meeting an intervenor coordination; review and annotate pathways study	2.30	KE
Oct 17, 2022	Attend intervenor meeting	1.50	KE
Oct 20, 2022	Stakeholder meeting	5.50	KE
Nov 1, 2022	Review application; various correspondence; call with intervenors	2.90	KE
Nov 2, 2022	Various correspondence	0.30	KE
Nov 4, 2022	Intervenor meeting; review materials in follow-up to meeting	0.70	KE
Nov 7, 2022	Call with C. Neme & D. Poch	1.00	KE
Nov 9, 2022	Review application	0.10	KE
Nov 10, 2022	Attend intervenor meeting; various follow-up correspondence	3.50	KE
Nov 14, 2022	Call with client rep	0.20	KE
Dec 1, 2022	Intervenor coordination meeting; follow-up correspondence	2.30	KE
	EB-2022-0200 - Draft and file intervention request	0.30	AM
Dec 21, 2022	Review procedural order and diarize dates	0.30	KE
Dec 22, 2022	Various correspondence	0.10	KE
Jan 4, 2023	Review application; prepare letter re potential expert	5.00	KE
Jan 5, 2023	Review application; various correspondence	0.40	KE
Jan 6, 2023	Review application; call with potential expert; various correspondence	1.80	KE
Jan 9, 2023	Review application (1.5 hr); attend issues hearing (6 hrs); various correspondence following up on issues conference (.3)	7.80	KE
Jan 10, 2023	Circulate wording re issues list from issues conference; call with BOMA re expert	1.20	KE

	evidence coordination; revise letter re expert; various correspondence		
Jan 11, 2023	Follow-up on issues conference; various correspondence; revise letter to the OEB	0.80	KE
Jan 12, 2023	Review application; draft IRs; various correspondence	2.50	KE
Jan 13, 2023	Various correspondence	0.50	KE
Jan 16, 2023	Revise, finalize and send correspondence re intervenor evidence	0.40	KE
Jan 31, 2023	Draft interrogatories	1.00	KE
Feb 1, 2023	Review application and draft interrogatories	8.20	KE
Feb 2, 2023	Draft interrogatories	5.00	KE
Feb 3, 2023	Draft interrogatories	6.90	KE
Feb 4, 2023	Draft interrogatories	5.40	KE
Feb 5, 2023	Draft interrogatories	5.80	KE
Feb 6, 2023	Draft interrogatories	6.20	KE
Feb 7, 2023	Draft IRs	7.80	KE
Feb 8, 2023	Draft interrogatories	6.30	KE
Feb 9, 2023	Draft interrogatories	8.00	KE
Feb 10, 2023	Draft interrogatories	6.50	KE
Feb 14, 2023	Review materials re viability of hydrogen in heating	0.50	KE
Feb 15, 2023	Review materials re design day assumptions	1.00	KE
Feb 16, 2023	Various correspondence	0.40	KE
Feb 17, 2023	Various correspondence in preparation for IR responses and next steps	0.50	KE

Mar 1, 2023	Various correspondence re Wilson Project	0.30	KE
Mar 3, 2023	Correspond with client	0.50	KE
Mar 9, 2023	Review interrogatory responses & prepare for technical conference	3.00	KE
Mar 10, 2023	Review interrogatories and prepare for technical conference	3.60	KE
Mar 12, 2023	Review interrogatories	2.80	KE
Mar 13, 2023	Review IRs; prepare for technical conference; call with potential experts	7.50	KE
Mar 14, 2023	Review interrogatory responses; prepare for technical conference; call with GEC; draft correspondence to Enbridge re technical conference information	4.50	KE
Mar 15, 2023	Review interrogatories and prepare for technical conference	5.50	KE
	Review and revise resolution	0.30	KE
Mar 18, 2023	Review Procedural Order #3 and diarize deadlines; various correspondence and preparation re technical conference	0.50	KE
Mar 20, 2023	Various correspondence and technical conference preparation	2.30	KE
Mar 21, 2023	Prepare for technical conference	3.00	KE
Mar 22, 2023	Prepare for technical conference; attend technical conference	8.00	KE
Mar 23, 2023	Prepare for and attend technical conference	8.00	KE
Mar 24, 2023	Attend technical conference	7.00	KE
Mar 26, 2023	Technical conference preparation	0.30	KE
	Prepare for technical conference; attend technical conference	8.10	KE
Mar 28, 2023	Prepare for technical conference; attend technical conference	5.00	KE

Mar 29, 2023	Various correspondence; attend technical conference	5.10	KE
Mar 30, 2023	Attend technical conference; various correspondence	1.50	KE
Apr 3, 2023	Various correspondence	0.20	KE
Apr 4, 2023	Various correspondence	0.80	KE
Apr 5, 2023	Various calls and correspondence	1.50	KE
Apr 7, 2023	Review materials and various correspondence re motions day; review undertaking responses	1.80	KE
Apr 8, 2023	Review undertaking responses	2.90	KE
Apr 9, 2023	Various correspondence	0.40	KE
Apr 10, 2023	Review undertaking responses; draft correspondence to the OEB re motions day	4.00	KE
Apr 11, 2023	Call with Enbridge re schedule changes; various correspondence re same	1.50	KE
Apr 13, 2023	Attend motions hearing (2 hrs); various correspondence; review procedural order and diarize deadlines	3.00	KE
Apr 17, 2023	Various correspondence	0.40	KE
Apr 18, 2023	Review Procedural Order #5 and diarize deadlines	0.40	KE
Apr 20, 2023	Review and comment on expert report	2.70	KE
Apr 21, 2023	Review and comment on expert evidence; review undertaking responses	4.60	KE
Apr 22, 2023	Review updated IRs; various correspondence	0.30	KE
Apr 24, 2023	Various correspondence; call with D. Poch re intervenor coordination	1.50	KE
Apr 25, 2023	Prepare for technical conference	3.50	KE
Apr 26, 2023	Prepare for technical conference	2.50	KE

Apr 27, 2023	Prepare for technical conference (1.5 hrs); attend technical conference (4 hrs)	5.50	KE
Apr 28, 2023	Review intervenor evidence and prepare IRs on intervenor evidence	2.50	KE
May 1, 2023	Various correspondence	0.20	KE
May 2, 2023	Various correspondence	0.30	KE
May 3, 2023	Call with C. Neme & D. Poch; correspond with client	1.70	KE
May 4, 2023	Review undertaking responses from the continued technical conference	0.80	KE
May 5, 2023	Review undertaking responses; various correspondence	0.50	KE
May 7, 2023	Review expert report	1.20	KE
May 8, 2023	Review expert report; call with C. Neme	1.10	KE
May 9, 2023	Correspondence re intervenor coordination	0.80	KE
May 15, 2023	Review IRRs	0.30	KE
May 16, 2023	Review IRRs; prepare pre-ADR questions; prepare ADR strategy document	3.00	KE
May 17, 2023	Review evidence of Dr. Asa Hopkins; draft interrogatories	3.50	KE
May 19, 2023	Prepare ADR memo for intervenor meeting on Tuesday	1.20	KE
May 23, 2023	Attend pre-ADR intervenor meeting; review and comment on IRRs	3.40	KE
May 24, 2023	Call with D. Poch & C. Neme; review IRRs	1.00	KE
May 25, 2023	Prepare for settlement conference	1.50	KE
May 26, 2023	Prepare detailed ADR memo	4.50	KE
May 29, 2023	Attend ADR	6.50	KE
May 30, 2023	Attend ADR	7.00	KE

May 31, 2023	Attend ADR	7.00	KE
Jun 1, 2023	Call with EG; attend ADR	7.50	KE
Jun 2, 2023	Attend ADR	7.00	KE
Jun 4, 2023	Prepare for ADR tomorrow	2.00	KE
Jun 5, 2023	Attend ADR	6.00	KE
Jun 6, 2023	Attend ADR; follow-up correspondence	6.00	KE
Jun 7, 2023	Attend ADR	4.00	KE
Jun 9, 2023	Attend ADR	4.00	KE
Jun 12, 2023	Review and comment on ADR materials	0.20	KE
Jun 13, 2023	Various correspondence; meeting with MO	0.80	KE
Jun 16, 2023	Various correspondence re ADR; attend ADR	0.80	KE
Jun 19, 2023	Attend continued ADR discussion; various correspondence; review and comment on ADR wording	1.00	KE
Jun 20, 2023	Various correspondence and edits re ADR; call re capital update; draft correspondence to the OEB re capital update issue	4.00	KE
Jun 23, 2023	Prepare for hearing	1.00	KE
Jun 24, 2023	Review draft two of settlement agreement; review procedural order and diarize dates	1.00	KE
Jun 25, 2023	Various correspondence	0.20	KE
Jun 27, 2023	Review evidence re updates necessary per capital update	0.50	KE
Jun 28, 2023	Prepare for hearing	1.50	KE
Jun 30, 2023	Meet with counsel re hearing coordination; various hearing preparation	1.40	KE
Jul 4, 2023	Prepare for hearing	6.00	KE

Jul 5, 2023	Prepare for hearing	1.00	KE
Jul 6, 2023	Prepare for hearing	1.20	KE
Jul 7, 2023	Prepare for hearing	2.00	KE
Jul 9, 2023	Prepare for hearing	3.00	KE
Jul 10, 2023	Prepare for hearing	1.80	KE
Jul 11, 2023	Prepare for hearing	8.00	KE
Jul 12, 2023	Correspondence re ADR issue (1 hr); prepare for hearing	6.00	KE
Jul 13, 2023	Prepare for hearing (2 hrs); attend hearing (7 hrs)	9.00	KE
Jul 14, 2023	Prepare for hearing (1.5 hrs); attend hearing (6.5 hrs)	8.00	KE
Jul 15, 2023	Prepare for hearing	1.00	KE
Jul 17, 2023	Prepare for hearing (2.5 hrs); attend hearing (3 hrs)	5.50	KE
Jul 18, 2023	Prepare for hearing (2.5 hrs); attend hearing (7 hrs)	9.50	KE
Jul 19, 2023	Prepare for hearing (2 hrs); attend hearing (6.5 hrs)	8.50	KE
Jul 20, 2023	Prepare for hearing (.5 hrs); attend hearing (6.5 hrs)	7.00	KE
Jul 21, 2023	Prepare for hearing	0.30	KE
Jul 24, 2023	Prepare for hearing	1.00	KE
Jul 25, 2023	Prepare for hearing (2.5 hrs); attend hearing (6 hrs)	8.50	KE
Jul 26, 2023	Prepare for hearing (2 hrs); attend hearing (4 hrs)	6.00	KE
Jul 27, 2023	Prepare for hearing (4 hrs); attend hearing (4.5 hrs)	8.50	KE
Jul 28, 2023	Prepare for hearing	4.00	KE

Jul 29, 2023	Prepare for hearing	1.50	KE
Jul 30, 2023	Prepare for hearing	1.70	KE
Jul 31, 2023	Prepare for hearing (6 hrs)	6.00	KE
Aug 1, 2023	Prepare for hearing (3 hrs); attend hearing (4 hrs)	7.00	KE
Aug 2, 2023	Prepare for hearing (1 hr); attend hearing (3 hrs)	4.00	KE
Aug 3, 2023	Various correspondence re undertaking issue	0.50	KE
Aug 7, 2023	Correspondence re undertaking issue	0.20	KE
Aug 8, 2023	Correspond with D. Stevens re undertaking issue; review undertaking responses	1.00	KE
Aug 9, 2023	Review transcripts	0.40	KE
Aug 10, 2023	Prepare for hearing	1.50	KE
Aug 11, 2023	Prepare for hearing (3 hrs); attend hearing (3 hrs)	6.00	KE
Aug 13, 2023	Hearing follow-up; draft correspondence re undertakings	0.60	KE
Aug 14, 2023	Draft correspondence to client	0.20	KE
Aug 15, 2023	Review and comment on undertaking responses	0.30	KE
Aug 16, 2023	Review undertaking responses; various correspondence	0.50	KE
Aug 17, 2023	Call re undertaking response; various correspondence	0.70	KE
Aug 18, 2023	Review transcripts	2.00	KE
Aug 21, 2023	Review materials and prepare submissions	4.00	KE
Aug 22, 2023	Prepare submissions	0.20	KE
Aug 23, 2023	Prepare submissions	3.50	KE

Aug 31, 2023	Correspond with D. Stevens; draft submissions	2.50	KE
Sep 3, 2023	Draft submissions	2.00	KE
Sep 5, 2023	Draft submissions	4.00	KE
Sep 11, 2023	Prepare submissions	4.30	KE
Sep 12, 2023	Prepare submissions	4.50	KE
Sep 13, 2023	Prepare submissions	8.00	KE
Sep 14, 2023	Prepare submissions	10.10	KE
Sep 15, 2023	Draft submissions	7.00	KE
Sep 16, 2023	Draft submissions	5.00	KE
Sep 17, 2023	Draft submissions	6.00	KE
Sep 18, 2023	Draft submissions	4.50	KE
Sep 19, 2023	Draft submissions	5.00	KE
	Revise submissions; correspond with K. Elson	4.50	AM
Oct 12, 2023	Review Enbridge reply	0.50	KE
Oct 20, 2023	Review Enbridge reply; draft update to client	1.10	KE
Nov 6, 2023	Review AMP	0.30	KE
Dec 14, 2023	Review Mass. decision; draft correspondence to the OEB	0.50	KE
Dec 19, 2023	Correspondence re decision release	0.20	KE
Dec 21, 2023	Review decision; draft correspondence to client	2.30	KE
Jan 23, 2024	Review and revise response to Enbridge letter re combining ED and GEC	0.70	KE
Jan 31, 2024	Prepare motion re ratepayer funding for lobbying issue	0.40	KE

	Amount Now Due		\$182,959.43
	Total Fees, Disbursements, & HST		\$182,959.43
	Total HST		\$21,048.43
	Total Fees & Disbursements		\$161,911.00
TOTALS			
	Total HST on Fees		\$21,048.43
	Total Hours and Fees	560.30	\$161,911.00
Apr 29, 2024	Draft correspondence re ELC issue	1.50	KE
Apr 22, 2024	Prepare letter to the OEB re non-compliance with decision	2.60	KE
Apr 16, 2024	Review rate order	0.10	KE
Apr 10, 2024	Review revised DRO	0.10	KE
Mar 1, 2024	Review draft rate order; review decision; draft submissions on DRO	2.20	KE
Feb 2, 2024	Draft letter re Evidence for EGI Motion to Review	1.50	KE
Feb 1, 2024	Draft motion re use of ratepayer funds	1.40	KE

HST # 75532 3078 RT0001 Total HST \$21,048.43

Amanda Montgomery

EB-2022-0200 - Phase 1: Rates: EB-2022-0200 : 1 : Kent Elson, Kent; +1 (416) CLAIM Distribution: Enbridge Gas Inc. Elson 906-7305 Submit kent@elsonadvocacy.ca Submit	I STATUS tted
---	------------------

FILING PARTICIPANT Montgomery, Amanda; +1 (416) 906-7305 amanda@elsonadvocacy.ca	NEW PARTICIPANT No	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME
SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE* Legal Counsel	YEAR CALLED TO BAR* 2020	COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF RELEVANT EXPERIENCE* 3	HOURLY RATE 170
HST RATE CHARGED* 13.00	CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST) CV Required	LAST CV DATE	OVERRIDE HOURLY RATE No
HST NUMBER 872151923RT0001	HEARINGS Yes	CONSULTATIONS No	DISBURSEMENTS No

HEARINGS

s Hours 4.80	Hearings Subtotal (\$) 816.00		Hearings Total 106.08	Tax (\$)		gs Total (\$) 022.08
ne	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly</u> <u>Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST</u> Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
	nd 0.30	170	51.00	13.00	6.63	57.63
paration of Interrogatories		170		13.00		
view Interrogatory Responses		170		13.00		
hnical Conference Preparation		170		13.00		
hnical Conference Attendance		170		13.00		
hnical Conference Follow-up		170		13.00		
ototal of DISCOVERY	0.30		51.00		6.63	57.63
JRAL paration of Issues List Submis	sion	170		13.00		
endance at Issues List Confere	nce	170		13.00		
paration for a Confidentiality R	equest	170		13.00		
pare Submissions on Confider	tiality	170		13.00		
paration of Motion(s) Materials		170		13.00		
pare Submissions on the Motio	on(s)	170		13.00		
endance at Hearing on Motion(s)	170		13.00		
view Procedural Documents		170		13.00		
	4.80 ne RY ad and Research Application ard dence paration of Interrogatories view Interrogatory Responses hnical Conference Preparation hnical Conference Attendance hnical Conference Follow-up ototal of DISCOVERY IRAL paration of Issues List Submiss endance at Issues List Confere paration for a Confidentiality R pare Submissions on Confiden paration of Motion(s) Materials pare Submissions on the Motion endance at Hearing on Motion(s)	4.80 816.00 Me Hours RY ad and Research Application and dence paration of Interrogatories view Interrogatory Responses hnical Conference Preparation hnical Conference Attendance hnical Conference Follow-up btotal of DISCOVERY 0.30 IRAL paration of Issues List Submission endance at Issues List Conference paration for a Confidentiality Request pare Submissions on Confidentiality paration of Motion(s) Materials pare Submissions on the Motion(s) endance at Hearing on Motion(s)	4.80816.00meHoursHourly RateRY ad and Research Application and dence paration of Interrogatories0.30170paration of Interrogatories170view Interrogatory Responses170hnical Conference Preparation170hnical Conference Preparation170hnical Conference Follow-up170ototal of DISCOVERY0.30JRAL paration of Issues List Submission170paration for a Confidentiality Request170paration of Motion(s) Materials170paration of Motion(s) Materials170pare Submissions on the Motion(s)170endance at Hearing on Motion(s)170	4.80816.00106.08neHoursHourly RateSub TotalRY add and Research Application and dence paration of Interrogatories0.3017051.00paration of Interrogatories17051.00iew Interrogatory Responses17051.00hnical Conference Preparation17051.00hnical Conference Follow-up17051.00total of DISCOVERY0.3051.00JRAL paration of Issues List Submission170paration of Issues List Conference170paration of Motion(s) Materials170paration of Motion(s) Materials170paration of Motion(s)170paration of Motion(s)170	4.80816.00106.08neHoursHourly RateSub TotalHST RateRY ad and Research Application and dence paration of Interrogatories0.3017051.0013.00da and Research Application and dence paration of Interrogatories0.3017051.0013.00da and Research Application and dence paration of Interrogatories17013.0013.00die unterrogatories17013.0013.00hnical Conference Preparation17013.00hnical Conference Follow-up17013.00hnical Conference Follow-up17013.00hnical Conference Follow-up17013.00hnical Conference Follow-up17013.00paration of Issues List Submission17013.00paration for a Confidentiality Request17013.00paration for a Confidentiality Request17013.00paration of Motion(s) Materials17013.00paration of Hearing on Motion(s)17013.00	4.80816.00106.08106.08meHoursHourly RateSub TotalHST RateHST RateRY ad and Research Application and dence paration of Interrogatories0.3017051.0013.006.63Paration of Interrogatories17013.0013.006.63Inical Conference Preparation17013.006.63Inical Conference Preparation17013.006.63Inical Conference Follow-up17013.006.63Inical Conference Follow-up17013.006.63Inical Conference Follow-up17013.006.63Inical Conference Follow-up17013.006.63Inical Conference Follow-up17013.006.63Inical Conference Follow-up17013.006.63Inical Conference17013.006.63Inical Conference17013.006.63Inical Conference17013.006.63Inical Conference17013.006.63Inical Conference17013.00100Inical Confidentiality Request17013.00Inical Confidentiality17013.00Inical Confidentiality17013.00Inical Confidentiality17013.00Inical Confidentiality17013.00Inical Confidentiality17013.00Inical Confidentiality17013.00Inical Confidentiality17013.00In

CC_Participant_Combined.rpt - last Update 20230601

Name	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly</u> <u>Rate</u>	Sub Total	<u>HST</u> Rate	HST	<u>Total</u>
Subtotal of PROCEDURAL	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
INTERVENOR EVIDENCE Preparation of Intervenor Evidence		170		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		170		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE	0.00	170	0.00	13.00	0.00	0.00
SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE Preparation for Settlement Conference		170		13.00		
Attendance at Settlement Conference		170		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		170		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		170		13.00		
Subtotal of SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE WRITTEN ARGUMENT	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
Written Submissions	4.50	170	765.00	13.00	99.45	864.45
Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT	4.50		765.00		99.45	864.45
ORAL ARGUMENT Preparation for Oral Hearing		170		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		170		13.00		
Oral Submissions		170		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		170		13.00		
Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
DECISION Review Decision		170		13.00		
Review Rate/Accounting Order		170		13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order		170		13.00		
Subtotal of DECISION	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
OTHER Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor Conferences)		170		13.00		
Subtotal of OTHER	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES Total Service Provider Fees	4.80		816.00		106.08	922.08
Attachments						
<u>Attachment</u>	Document Ty		<u>lr</u>	nport Me	<u>ssage</u>	
ElsonAdvocacyInvoiceAndDockets.pdf	Time Docket a	and Invoice				
Hearings, Consultations, Disbursement	s Attachment	ts				
Attachment	Document Ty	pe	<u>Claim</u>	Type	Import Mess	age

Document Type Time Docket and Invoice <u>Claim Type</u> Hearings



Invoice

Environmental Defence		April 10, 2024
33 Cecil Street Toronto, ON		
M5T 1N1	File #:	0151
	Inv #:	1311

RE: Enbridge rebasing case (2023)

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	LAWYER
Jun 16, 2022	Enbridge 2024 rebasing stakeholder session	2.00	KE
Jun 21, 2022	Call re intervenor coordination, potential experts, and planning for the Enbridge rebasing case	0.50	KE
Jun 22, 2022	Draft outline of questions/topics for potential expert in the Enbridge rebasing case; various correspondence	1.50	KE
Jun 23, 2022	Draft correspondence to potential expert for Enrbidge rebasing case	0.50	KE
Jun 24, 2022	Correspond with potential expert for the Enbridge rebasing case	0.10	KE
Jun 27, 2022	Call with potential expert for the rebasing case	1.00	KE
Jul 11, 2022	Correspondence re expert for Enbridge rebasing case	0.20	KE
Aug 4, 2022	Call with potential expert	1.00	KE
Aug 29, 2022	Review materials from potential expert	0.30	KE
Sep 20, 2022	Various correspondence re preparation for the Enbridge rebasing case	0.20	KE
Sep 21, 2022	Correspondence with intervenors re potential coordination on experts; review expert report of Dr. Hopkins	0.50	KE
Elson Advocacy Professional Corporation	Kent@ElsonAdvocacy.ca n 1062 College St., Lower Suite, Toronto, ON M6H 1A9	tel: fax:	416 906-7305 416 763-5435

Sep 28, 2022	Various correspondence re stakeholder meeting an intervenor coordination; review and annotate pathways study	2.30	KE
Oct 17, 2022	Attend intervenor meeting	1.50	KE
Oct 20, 2022	Stakeholder meeting	5.50	KE
Nov 1, 2022	Review application; various correspondence; call with intervenors	2.90	KE
Nov 2, 2022	Various correspondence	0.30	KE
Nov 4, 2022	Intervenor meeting; review materials in follow-up to meeting	0.70	KE
Nov 7, 2022	Call with C. Neme & D. Poch	1.00	KE
Nov 9, 2022	Review application	0.10	KE
Nov 10, 2022	Attend intervenor meeting; various follow-up correspondence	3.50	KE
Nov 14, 2022	Call with client rep	0.20	KE
Dec 1, 2022	Intervenor coordination meeting; follow-up correspondence	2.30	KE
	EB-2022-0200 - Draft and file intervention request	0.30	AM
Dec 21, 2022	Review procedural order and diarize dates	0.30	KE
Dec 22, 2022	Various correspondence	0.10	KE
Jan 4, 2023	Review application; prepare letter re potential expert	5.00	KE
Jan 5, 2023	Review application; various correspondence	0.40	KE
Jan 6, 2023	Review application; call with potential expert; various correspondence	1.80	KE
Jan 9, 2023	Review application (1.5 hr); attend issues hearing (6 hrs); various correspondence following up on issues conference (.3)	7.80	KE
Jan 10, 2023	Circulate wording re issues list from issues conference; call with BOMA re expert	1.20	KE

	evidence coordination; revise letter re expert; various correspondence		
Jan 11, 2023	Follow-up on issues conference; various correspondence; revise letter to the OEB	0.80	KE
Jan 12, 2023	Review application; draft IRs; various correspondence	2.50	KE
Jan 13, 2023	Various correspondence	0.50	KE
Jan 16, 2023	Revise, finalize and send correspondence re intervenor evidence	0.40	KE
Jan 31, 2023	Draft interrogatories	1.00	KE
Feb 1, 2023	Review application and draft interrogatories	8.20	KE
Feb 2, 2023	Draft interrogatories	5.00	KE
Feb 3, 2023	Draft interrogatories	6.90	KE
Feb 4, 2023	Draft interrogatories	5.40	KE
Feb 5, 2023	Draft interrogatories	5.80	KE
Feb 6, 2023	Draft interrogatories	6.20	KE
Feb 7, 2023	Draft IRs	7.80	KE
Feb 8, 2023	Draft interrogatories	6.30	KE
Feb 9, 2023	Draft interrogatories	8.00	KE
Feb 10, 2023	Draft interrogatories	6.50	KE
Feb 14, 2023	Review materials re viability of hydrogen in heating	0.50	KE
Feb 15, 2023	Review materials re design day assumptions	1.00	KE
Feb 16, 2023	Various correspondence	0.40	KE
Feb 17, 2023	Various correspondence in preparation for IR responses and next steps	0.50	KE

Mar 1, 2023	Various correspondence re Wilson Project	0.30	KE
Mar 3, 2023	Correspond with client	0.50	KE
Mar 9, 2023	Review interrogatory responses & prepare for technical conference	3.00	KE
Mar 10, 2023	Review interrogatories and prepare for technical conference	3.60	KE
Mar 12, 2023	Review interrogatories	2.80	KE
Mar 13, 2023	Review IRs; prepare for technical conference; call with potential experts	7.50	KE
Mar 14, 2023	Review interrogatory responses; prepare for technical conference; call with GEC; draft correspondence to Enbridge re technical conference information	4.50	KE
Mar 15, 2023	Review interrogatories and prepare for technical conference	5.50	KE
	Review and revise resolution	0.30	KE
Mar 18, 2023	Review Procedural Order #3 and diarize deadlines; various correspondence and preparation re technical conference	0.50	KE
Mar 20, 2023	Various correspondence and technical conference preparation	2.30	KE
Mar 21, 2023	Prepare for technical conference	3.00	KE
Mar 22, 2023	Prepare for technical conference; attend technical conference	8.00	KE
Mar 23, 2023	Prepare for and attend technical conference	8.00	KE
Mar 24, 2023	Attend technical conference	7.00	KE
Mar 26, 2023	Technical conference preparation	0.30	KE
	Prepare for technical conference; attend technical conference	8.10	KE
Mar 28, 2023	Prepare for technical conference; attend technical conference	5.00	KE

Mar 29, 2023	Various correspondence; attend technical conference	5.10	KE
Mar 30, 2023	Attend technical conference; various correspondence	1.50	KE
Apr 3, 2023	Various correspondence	0.20	KE
Apr 4, 2023	Various correspondence	0.80	KE
Apr 5, 2023	Various calls and correspondence	1.50	KE
Apr 7, 2023	Review materials and various correspondence re motions day; review undertaking responses	1.80	KE
Apr 8, 2023	Review undertaking responses	2.90	KE
Apr 9, 2023	Various correspondence	0.40	KE
Apr 10, 2023	Review undertaking responses; draft correspondence to the OEB re motions day	4.00	KE
Apr 11, 2023	Call with Enbridge re schedule changes; various correspondence re same	1.50	KE
Apr 13, 2023	Attend motions hearing (2 hrs); various correspondence; review procedural order and diarize deadlines	3.00	KE
Apr 17, 2023	Various correspondence	0.40	KE
Apr 18, 2023	Review Procedural Order #5 and diarize deadlines	0.40	KE
Apr 20, 2023	Review and comment on expert report	2.70	KE
Apr 21, 2023	Review and comment on expert evidence; review undertaking responses	4.60	KE
Apr 22, 2023	Review updated IRs; various correspondence	0.30	KE
Apr 24, 2023	Various correspondence; call with D. Poch re intervenor coordination	1.50	KE
Apr 25, 2023	Prepare for technical conference	3.50	KE
Apr 26, 2023	Prepare for technical conference	2.50	KE

Apr 27, 2023	Prepare for technical conference (1.5 hrs); attend technical conference (4 hrs)	5.50	KE
Apr 28, 2023	Review intervenor evidence and prepare IRs on intervenor evidence	2.50	KE
May 1, 2023	Various correspondence	0.20	KE
May 2, 2023	Various correspondence	0.30	KE
May 3, 2023	Call with C. Neme & D. Poch; correspond with client	1.70	KE
May 4, 2023	Review undertaking responses from the continued technical conference	0.80	KE
May 5, 2023	Review undertaking responses; various correspondence	0.50	KE
May 7, 2023	Review expert report	1.20	KE
May 8, 2023	Review expert report; call with C. Neme	1.10	KE
May 9, 2023	Correspondence re intervenor coordination	0.80	KE
May 15, 2023	Review IRRs	0.30	KE
May 16, 2023	Review IRRs; prepare pre-ADR questions; prepare ADR strategy document	3.00	KE
May 17, 2023	Review evidence of Dr. Asa Hopkins; draft interrogatories	3.50	KE
May 19, 2023	Prepare ADR memo for intervenor meeting on Tuesday	1.20	KE
May 23, 2023	Attend pre-ADR intervenor meeting; review and comment on IRRs	3.40	KE
May 24, 2023	Call with D. Poch & C. Neme; review IRRs	1.00	KE
May 25, 2023	Prepare for settlement conference	1.50	KE
May 26, 2023	Prepare detailed ADR memo	4.50	KE
May 29, 2023	Attend ADR	6.50	KE
May 30, 2023	Attend ADR	7.00	KE

May 31, 2023	Attend ADR	7.00	KE
Jun 1, 2023	Call with EG; attend ADR	7.50	KE
Jun 2, 2023	Attend ADR	7.00	KE
Jun 4, 2023	Prepare for ADR tomorrow	2.00	KE
Jun 5, 2023	Attend ADR	6.00	KE
Jun 6, 2023	Attend ADR; follow-up correspondence	6.00	KE
Jun 7, 2023	Attend ADR	4.00	KE
Jun 9, 2023	Attend ADR	4.00	KE
Jun 12, 2023	Review and comment on ADR materials	0.20	KE
Jun 13, 2023	Various correspondence; meeting with MO	0.80	KE
Jun 16, 2023	Various correspondence re ADR; attend ADR	0.80	KE
Jun 19, 2023	Attend continued ADR discussion; various correspondence; review and comment on ADR wording	1.00	KE
Jun 20, 2023	Various correspondence and edits re ADR; call re capital update; draft correspondence to the OEB re capital update issue	4.00	KE
Jun 23, 2023	Prepare for hearing	1.00	KE
Jun 24, 2023	Review draft two of settlement agreement; review procedural order and diarize dates	1.00	KE
Jun 25, 2023	Various correspondence	0.20	KE
Jun 27, 2023	Review evidence re updates necessary per capital update	0.50	KE
Jun 28, 2023	Prepare for hearing	1.50	KE
Jun 30, 2023	Meet with counsel re hearing coordination; various hearing preparation	1.40	KE
Jul 4, 2023	Prepare for hearing	6.00	KE

Jul 5, 2023	Prepare for hearing	1.00	KE
Jul 6, 2023	Prepare for hearing	1.20	KE
Jul 7, 2023	Prepare for hearing	2.00	KE
Jul 9, 2023	Prepare for hearing	3.00	KE
Jul 10, 2023	Prepare for hearing	1.80	KE
Jul 11, 2023	Prepare for hearing	8.00	KE
Jul 12, 2023	Correspondence re ADR issue (1 hr); prepare for hearing	6.00	KE
Jul 13, 2023	Prepare for hearing (2 hrs); attend hearing (7 hrs)	9.00	KE
Jul 14, 2023	Prepare for hearing (1.5 hrs); attend hearing (6.5 hrs)	8.00	KE
Jul 15, 2023	Prepare for hearing	1.00	KE
Jul 17, 2023	Prepare for hearing (2.5 hrs); attend hearing (3 hrs)	5.50	KE
Jul 18, 2023	Prepare for hearing (2.5 hrs); attend hearing (7 hrs)	9.50	KE
Jul 19, 2023	Prepare for hearing (2 hrs); attend hearing (6.5 hrs)	8.50	KE
Jul 20, 2023	Prepare for hearing (.5 hrs); attend hearing (6.5 hrs)	7.00	KE
Jul 21, 2023	Prepare for hearing	0.30	KE
Jul 24, 2023	Prepare for hearing	1.00	KE
Jul 25, 2023	Prepare for hearing (2.5 hrs); attend hearing (6 hrs)	8.50	KE
Jul 26, 2023	Prepare for hearing (2 hrs); attend hearing (4 hrs)	6.00	KE
Jul 27, 2023	Prepare for hearing (4 hrs); attend hearing (4.5 hrs)	8.50	KE
Jul 28, 2023	Prepare for hearing	4.00	KE

Jul 29, 2023	Prepare for hearing	1.50	KE
Jul 30, 2023	Prepare for hearing	1.70	KE
Jul 31, 2023	Prepare for hearing (6 hrs)	6.00	KE
Aug 1, 2023	Prepare for hearing (3 hrs); attend hearing (4 hrs)	7.00	KE
Aug 2, 2023	Prepare for hearing (1 hr); attend hearing (3 hrs)	4.00	KE
Aug 3, 2023	Various correspondence re undertaking issue	0.50	KE
Aug 7, 2023	Correspondence re undertaking issue	0.20	KE
Aug 8, 2023	Correspond with D. Stevens re undertaking issue; review undertaking responses	1.00	KE
Aug 9, 2023	Review transcripts	0.40	KE
Aug 10, 2023	Prepare for hearing	1.50	KE
Aug 11, 2023	Prepare for hearing (3 hrs); attend hearing (3 hrs)	6.00	KE
Aug 13, 2023	Hearing follow-up; draft correspondence re undertakings	0.60	KE
Aug 14, 2023	Draft correspondence to client	0.20	KE
Aug 15, 2023	Review and comment on undertaking responses	0.30	KE
Aug 16, 2023	Review undertaking responses; various correspondence	0.50	KE
Aug 17, 2023	Call re undertaking response; various correspondence	0.70	KE
Aug 18, 2023	Review transcripts	2.00	KE
Aug 21, 2023	Review materials and prepare submissions	4.00	KE
Aug 22, 2023	Prepare submissions	0.20	KE
Aug 23, 2023	Prepare submissions	3.50	KE

Aug 31, 2023	Correspond with D. Stevens; draft submissions	2.50	KE
Sep 3, 2023	Draft submissions	2.00	KE
Sep 5, 2023	Draft submissions	4.00	KE
Sep 11, 2023	Prepare submissions	4.30	KE
Sep 12, 2023	Prepare submissions	4.50	KE
Sep 13, 2023	Prepare submissions	8.00	KE
Sep 14, 2023	Prepare submissions	10.10	KE
Sep 15, 2023	Draft submissions	7.00	KE
Sep 16, 2023	Draft submissions	5.00	KE
Sep 17, 2023	Draft submissions	6.00	KE
Sep 18, 2023	Draft submissions	4.50	KE
Sep 19, 2023	Draft submissions	5.00	KE
	Revise submissions; correspond with K. Elson	4.50	AM
Oct 12, 2023	Review Enbridge reply	0.50	KE
Oct 20, 2023	Review Enbridge reply; draft update to client	1.10	KE
Nov 6, 2023	Review AMP	0.30	KE
Dec 14, 2023	Review Mass. decision; draft correspondence to the OEB	0.50	KE
Dec 19, 2023	Correspondence re decision release	0.20	KE
Dec 21, 2023	Review decision; draft correspondence to client	2.30	KE
Jan 23, 2024	Review and revise response to Enbridge letter re combining ED and GEC	0.70	KE
Jan 31, 2024	Prepare motion re ratepayer funding for lobbying issue	0.40	KE

	Amount Now Due		\$182,959.43
	Total Fees, Disbursements, & HST		\$182,959.43
	Total HST		\$21,048.43
	Total Fees & Disbursements		\$161,911.00
TOTALS			
	Total HST on Fees		\$21,048.43
	Total Hours and Fees	560.30	\$161,911.00
Apr 29, 2024	Draft correspondence re ELC issue	1.50	KE
Apr 22, 2024	Prepare letter to the OEB re non-compliance with decision	2.60	KE
Apr 16, 2024	Review rate order	0.10	KE
Apr 10, 2024	Review revised DRO	0.10	KE
Mar 1, 2024	Review draft rate order; review decision; draft submissions on DRO	2.20	KE
Feb 2, 2024	Draft letter re Evidence for EGI Motion to Review	1.50	KE
Feb 1, 2024	Draft motion re use of ratepayer funds	1.40	KE

HST # 75532 3078 RT0001 Total HST \$21,048.43