Colm Boyle T: 416-367-7273 cboyle@blg.com

John Vellone T: 416-367-6730 jvellone@blg.com Borden Ladner Gervais LLP Bay Adelaide Centre, East Tower 22 Adelaide Street West Toronto ON M5H 4E3 Canada T 416-367-6000 F 416-367-6749 blg.com



File No. 61604.51

May 28, 2024

VIA RESS registrar@oeb.ca

Ms. Nancy Marconi Ontario Energy Board 2300 Yonge Street, 27th Floor Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

Dear Ms. Marconi:

Re: Enbridge Gas Inc. ("EGI")

Panhandle Regional Expansion Project Leave to Construct - Cost Claim

Board File Number: EB-2022-0157

We are counsel to the Association of Power Producers of Ontario ("APPrO") in the above-noted proceeding. On May 14, 2024, the Ontario Energy Board ("OEB") issued a decision directing cost eligible intervenors to file their cost claims with the OEB. APPrO's cost claim has been prepared and filed through the OEB's online cost claim filing system in accordance with section 10 of the OEB Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

APPrO participated reasonably in the proceeding by focusing its involvement on issues directly relevant to its members and coordinated its participation with Atura Power. This ensured that its participation in the process would not unduly repetitive and was focused on relevant and material issues.

APPrO's participation contributed to a better understanding by the OEB of the issues in the proceeding. APPrO's arguments and interrogatories were cited throughout the OEB's decision, particularly in relation to forecasted electricity demand in the Panhandle region, applicability of the EBO 134 test and stage 3 benefits, impacts of contributions in aid of construction on its members and proposed conditions on the Panhandle Project approval. APPrO did not engage in conduct that tended to lengthen the process unnecessarily or engage in any inappropriate or irresponsible conduct.

In sum, this was a lengthy and contested proceeding that spanned nearly two years with substantial evidentiary revisions midway by Enbridge. Accordingly, APPrO requests reimbursement of its costs attached hereto.



Yours truly,

Colm Boyle

Colo Byle

EB-2022-0157: 2: Colm Boyle

COST CLAIM NUMBER SUBMISSION DEADLINE DATE **CLAIM STATUS** 2146 May 28, 2024 Approved by Finance EB# OTHER EB#S PHASE #* EB-2022-0157: Facilities: Leave to Construct (New): Enbridge Gas Inc. **INTERVENOR** INTERVENOR COMPANY* INTERVENOR TYPE Boyle, Colm; +1 (416) 367-7273 cboyle@blg.com Association of Power Producers Full Registrant of Ontario, Toronto: Cooperative HST RATE ONTARIO **EXCHANGE RATE COUNTRY** 13.00 Canada HST NUMBER LATE SUBMISSION ALLOWED EXTENSION DEADLINE DATE 125298802RT0001 Yes July 12, 2024

PAR1	ICIPANTS					Participant
New	Non-Filing	Participant First, Last Name	Filing Participant	Total (\$)	Total Hours	Claim Status
Yes	Brady	, Yauch		17,122.33	52.25	Submitted
No		,	Vellone, John; +1 (416) 367-6730 jvellone@blg.com	13,075.23	39.90	Submitted
Yes	Will	, Hu	, 0 0	8,048.99	41.90	Submitted
No		,	Boyle, Colm; +1 (416) 367-7273 cboyle@blg.com	20,480.12	78.80	Submitted

ATTACHMENTS

Attachment	Document Type	Import Message
BLG Panhandle Invoices Combined (Final).pdf	Invoice	
APPrO_Cost Claim Cover_Panhandle_20240528.pdf	Cover Letter	
APPRO EB-2022-0157 Cost Claim 052820241435.pdf		
APPrO Cost Claim Panhandle - Power Advisory (UPDATED 20240531).pdf	Time Docket	
1-APPrO-BrandyYauch invoices.pdf	Invoice	Attached by M.Svistun
APPRO EB-2022-0157 Cost Claim 052820240000.pdf		
APPRO EB-2022-0157 Cost Claim 071220242300.pdf		

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT/OTHER FEES 51,970.50

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 0.00

TOTAL HST 6,756.17

TOTAL CLAIM 58,726.67

TOTAL AMOUNT AWARDED

TOTAL HOURS CLAIMED

212.85

TOTAL HOURS DISALLOWED

REASON FOR REASON FOR REASON FOR DISALLOWANCE - 2 DISALLOWANCE - 3

MAKE CHEQUE PAYABLE TO

Association of Power Producers of Ontario

SEND PAYMENT TO ADDRESS

ATTENTION

P.O. Box 756 Toronto, ON M5C2K1

SUBMIT SECTION

I am a representative of the Party. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim. The costs incurred and time spent are directly related to the Party's participation in the OEB Process referred to above.

This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in section 6.05 and 6.09 of the OEB's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

The information (fees and disbursements) filed in this cost claim is complete and accurate and in accordance with the OEB's Practice Direction for Cost Awards and Appendix A, the Cost Awards Tariff.

SUBMITTED BY

Colm Boyle

DATE SUBMITTED

July 12, 2024

Brady Yauch

CASE EB-2022-0157: Facilities: Leave to Construct (New): Enbridge Gas Inc.

COST CLAIM EB-2022-0157:2:Colm Boyle

INTERVENOR NAME Boyle, Colm; +1 (416) 367-7273 cboyle@blg.com **PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS** Submitted

FILING PARTICIPANT

NEW PARTICIPANT

NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME Brady

NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME Yauch

Yes

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE*

Consultant

YEAR CALLED TO BAR*

COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF **RELEVANT EXPERIENCE*** **HOURLY RATE** 290

12

HST RATE CHARGED*

13.00

CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST)

CV Attached

LAST CV DATE

May 28, 2024

OVERRIDE HOURLY RATE

No

HST NUMBER 125298802RT0001 **HEARINGS**

Yes

CONSULTATIONS

No

DISBURSEMENTS

No

HEARINGS

Hearings Hours Hearings Subtotal (\$) **Hearings Total Tax (\$)** Hearings Total (\$) 52.25 15,152.50 1,969.83 17,122.33 **HST** Name Sub Total HST Total Hours Hourly Rate Rate **DISCOVERY** Read and Research Application and 290 13.00 Evidence Preparation of Interrogatories 22.00 290 6,380.00 13.00 829.40 7,209.40 **Review Interrogatory Responses** 4.00 290 1,160.00 13.00 150.80 1,310.80 **Technical Conference Preparation** 290 13.00 5.00 290 13.00 **Technical Conference Attendance** 1,450.00 188.50 1,638.50 13.00 Technical Conference Follow-up 290 Subtotal of DISCOVERY 31.00 8,990.00 10,158.70 1,168.70 **PROCEDURAL** Preparation of Issues List Submission 290 13.00 Attendance at Issues List Conference 290 13.00 Preparation for a Confidentiality Request 290 13.00 Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality 290 13.00 290 13.00 Preparation of Motion(s) Materials Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s) 290 13.00 Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s) 290 13.00 **Review Procedural Documents** 290 13.00

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	Sub Total	HST Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Subtotal of PROCEDURAL	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
INTERVENOR EVIDENCE Preparation of Intervenor Evidence		290		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		290		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE	e 0.00	290	0.00	13.00	0.00	0.00
SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE Preparation for Settlement Conference		290		13.00		
Attendance at Settlement Conference		290		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		290		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		290		13.00		
Subtotal of SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE WRITTEN ARGUMENT	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
Written Submissions	4.25	290	1,232.50	13.00	160.23	1,392.73
Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT	4.25		1,232.50		160.23	1,392.73
ORAL ARGUMENT Preparation for Oral Hearing	17.00	290	4,930.00	13.00	640.90	5,570.90
Attendance at Oral Hearing		290		13.00		
Oral Submissions		290		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		290		13.00		
Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT	17.00		4,930.00		640.90	5,570.90
DECISION Review Decision		290		13.00		
Review Rate/Accounting Order		290		13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order		290		13.00		
Subtotal of DECISION	0.00	200	0.00	10.00	0.00	0.00
OTHER Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor Conferences)		290		13.00		
Subtotal of OTHER	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES Total Service Provider Fees	52.25		15,152.50		1,969.83	17,122.33

Attachments

<u>Attachment</u> **Document Type** Import Message

APPrO Cost Claim Panhandle - Power

Advisory.pdf CV - Brady Yauch.pdf

Time Docket and Invoice

CV

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

Attachment Document Type Claim Type Hmport Message

APPrO Cost Claim Panhandle - Power Time Docket and Invoice Hearings

Advisory.pdf

CV Hearings

Power Advisory LLC - Time Entry

Date Start: 7/1/2022 | Date End: 5/27/2024 | Clients: Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON | Projects: Panhandle expansion application | Users: All | Client Type: All | Project Type: All | Location: All | Billing Method: All | Paid Status: All | Group By: Project

Project	Date	Client	Project Type	User	Category	Activity	Description	Total Time
Panhandle expansion application	09-07-202	23 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON	T - Time & Materials	Brady Yauch	Discovery	Read and R	Reviewed evidence to draft IRs	6.00
Panhandle expansion application	09-08-202	23 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON	T - Time & Materials	Brady Yauch	Discovery	Read and R	Completed evidence review, drafted IRs and met with clients to discuss strategy	6.00
Panhandle expansion application	09-19-202	23 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON	T - Time & Materials	Brady Yauch	Discovery	IRs	Met with IESO to discuss Panhandle	0.50
Panhandle expansion application	10-05-202	23 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON	T - Time & Materials	Brady Yauch	Discovery	IRs	Reviewed IR responses	5.00
Panhandle expansion application	10-06-202	23 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON	T - Time & Materials	Brady Yauch	Discovery	IRs	Meeting with members and preparation and review of IRs	4.00
Panhandle expansion application	10-19-20	23 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON	T - Time & Materials	Brady Yauch	Discovery	IRs	Met with Atura and others. Reviewed opening statement and updated information for cross examination	7.00
Panhandle expansion application	10-19-20	23 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON	T - Time & Materials	Roy Hrab	Oral Hearing	preparation	Enbridge Gas Proceedings Call w/ BLG, APPrO, Capital Power, Atura, Dentons	1.00
Panhandle expansion application	11-09-202	23 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON	T - Time & Materials	Brady Yauch	Oral Hearing	preparation	Meeting with group to discuss hearing	1.00
Panhandle expansion application	11-23-202	23 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON	T - Time & Materials	Brady Yauch	Oral Hearing	preparation	Met to discuss argument and other issues	0.50
Panhandle expansion application	12-14-20	23 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON	T - Time & Materials	Brady Yauch	Submissions	Written	Reviewed and drafted comments for final argument	5.00
								36.00

CASE

EB-2022-0157: Facilities: Leave to Construct (New): Enbridge Gas Inc.

COST CLAIM

EB-2022-0157 : 2 : Colm

Boyle

INTERVENOR NAME

Boyle, Colm; +1 (416) 367-7273 cboyle@blg.com PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS

Submitted

FILING PARTICIPANT

Vellone, John; +1 (416) 367-6730 jvellone@blg.com

PARTICIPANT No.

NEW

NON-FILING

PARTICIPANT F. NAME

NON-FILING

PARTICIPANT L. NAME

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE*

Legal Counsel

YEAR CALLED TO BAR*

2008

COMPLETED YEARS
PRACTICING/YEARS OF
RELEVANT EXPERIENCE*

15

HST RATE CHARGED*

13.00

CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST)

CV Required

LAST CV DATE

OVERRIDE HOURLY RATE

HOURLY RATE

290

No

HST NUMBER 125298802RT0001

HEARINGS

Yes

CONSULTATIONS

No

DISBURSEMENTS

No

HEARINGS

Hearings Hours 39.90	Hearings Sul 11,571.00			Hearings Total 1,504.23	Tax (\$)		gs Total (\$) 075.23
<u>Name</u>		<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	Sub Total	HST Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
DISCOVERY							
Read and Research Appl Evidence	ication and	0.10	290	29.00	13.00	3.77	32.77
Preparation of Interrogate	ories		290		13.00		
Review Interrogatory Res	sponses		290		13.00		
Technical Conference Pre	eparation		290		13.00		
Technical Conference Att	endance		290		13.00		
Technical Conference Fo	llow-up		290		13.00		
Subtotal of DISCOVERY		0.10		29.00		3.77	32.77
PROCEDURAL Preparation of Issues List	t Submission		290		13.00		
Attendance at Issues List	Conference		290		13.00		
Preparation for a Confide	ntiality Request		290		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on	Confidentiality		290		13.00		
Preparation of Motion(s)	Materials		290		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on	the Motion(s)		290		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing or	n Motion(s)		290		13.00		
Review Procedural Docu	ments	1.40	290	406.00	13.00	52.78	458.78

	<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	Sub Total	HST Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
	Subtotal of PROCEDURAL	1.40		406.00		52.78	458.78
INTE	RVENOR EVIDENCE Preparation of Intervenor Evidence		290		13.00		
	Interrogatory Responses		290		13.00		
	Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE	0.00	290	0.00	13.00	0.00	0.00
SETT	LEMENT CONFERENCE Preparation for Settlement Conference		290		13.00		
	Attendance at Settlement Conference		290		13.00		
	Preparation of Settlement Proposal		290		13.00		
	Attendance at Presentation to Panel		290		13.00		
	Subtotal of SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
WRIT	TEN ARGUMENT Written Submissions	15.60	290	4,524.00	13.00	588.12	5,112.12
	Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT	15.60		4,524.00		588.12	5,112.12
ORAL	- ARGUMENT Preparation for Oral Hearing	6.60	290	1,914.00	13.00	248.82	2,162.82
	Attendance at Oral Hearing	16.20	290	4,698.00	13.00	610.74	5,308.74
	Oral Submissions		290		13.00		
	Attendance at Oral Submissions		290		13.00		
	Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT	22.80		6,612.00		859.56	7,471.56
DECI	SION Review Decision		290		13.00		
	Review Rate/Accounting Order		290		13.00		
	Prepare Submission on Rate Order		290		13.00		
	Subtotal of DECISION	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
OTHE	Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor Conferences)		290		13.00		
	Subtotal of OTHER	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
TOTA	L SERVICE PROVIDER FEES Total Service Provider Fees	39.90		11,571.00		1,504.23	13,075.23

Attachments

<u>Attachment Document Type</u> <u>Import Message</u>

APPrO Cost Claim Panhandle - BLG.pdf Time Docket

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

<u>Attachment</u> <u>Document Type</u> <u>Claim Type</u> <u>Import Message</u>

APPrO Cost Claim Panhandle - BLG.pdf Time Docket Hearings

Date TKPR Name	Client Name	Matter Name	Bs Hrs Phase Code	Narrative Proj
8/4/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	4.1 Read and Research	Draft notice of intervention; email correspondence with J. Vellone and D. Butters re same.
8/5/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.8 Read and Research	Attendance on filing notice of intervention; email correspondence with J. Vellone and D. Butters re same.
8/31/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.2 Preparation of interrogatories	Email correspondence with B. Yauch re interrogatories.
8/5/2022 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Read and Research	Review and instruct C. Boyle re notice of intervention letter.
10/6/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	1.8 Technical conference prep	Review proceeding and assessment of any outstanding questions for the technical conference; prepare for and brief attendance at technical conference.
10/19/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.9 Technical conference prep	Meeting with B. Yauch re update to D. Butters; prepare for and attendance with D. Butters to update status of file.
10/24/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.3 Technical conference prep	Email correspondence with D. Butters re next steps in Panhandle proceeding.
10/25/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Technical conference prep	Email correspondence with B. Yauch re conversation with Autura Power on strategy.
10/26/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.2 Review procedural docs	Review email correspondence from R. Higgin and I. Mondrow re cost of capital decision for natural gas transmitters in Quebec.
8/12/2022 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.3 Review procedural docs	Review Procedural Order No. 1; see confirmation of instructions from D. Butters re intention not to file evidence.
11/1/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Review decision	Review OEB decision on confidentiality of Enbridge filing.
10/5/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.7 Technical conference prep	Prepare for and attendance on conference call with B. Yauch to discuss roles and responsibilities at the upcoming technical conference.
11/2/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Review procedural docs	Review correspondence from Enbridge and K. Elson requesting an extension to the timeline for filing.
9/1/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	3.9 Preparation of interrogatories	Attendance on preparing, finalizing and filing interrogatories to Enbridge.
11/3/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.4 Review procedural docs	Review the Pollution Probe letter of comment and references cited; email to B. Yauch re same.
		, ,	·	Review filings by other interveners on topics of discussion at technical conference; email correspondence with B. Yauch on topics of discussion for APPrO at
9/29/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	1.5 Technical conference prep	technical conference; attendance on filing letter with OEB on technical conference topics of APPrO to participate.
11/7/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.4 Written submissions	Phone call with B. Yauch to discuss strategy for submissions.
11/8/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Review procedural docs	Review application by Enbridge to review decision on confidentiality.
11/29/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.3 Written submissions	Phone call with B. Yauch re draft of argument.
12/1/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.2 Review decision	Review OEB decision on confidential treatment of Enbridge filings.
12/21/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.4 Review procedural docs	Email correspondence with D. Butters and Atura re next steps after procedural order no. 1 and CIAC submissions by interveners.
12/19/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.5 Review procedural docs	Attendance on conference call with D. Butters and Atura re submission on CIAC response.
12/5/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.2 Read and Research	Review correspondence from OEB re request for abeyance by EGI; email correspondence with D. Butters and T. Yauch re same.
1/8/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.3 Review procedural docs	Review proceeding materials and draft email to M. Kitchen at Enbridge on behalf of D. Butters.
11/4/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Other	Attendance on email correspondence.
2/2/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Read and Research	Review letter correspondence from Enbridge re further application deferral to 2024.
6/16/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.2 Read and Research	Email correspondence from Enbridge re updated filing.
0/40/2022 Paula Cales	Association of Davida Deciderate	Fabridas Daubardla Dainfarrannat LTC (FD 2022 0457)	2.4. Dood and Doorson	Attacher and the second and the seco
8/10/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	2.1 Read and Research	Attendance on reviewing updates to panhandle proceeding and procedural order; draft summary slides indicating key take aways from Panhandle Project.
8/12/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	1.3 Read and Research	Finalize presentation summarizing key issues for APPrO members.
8/18/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Review decision	Review OEB decision on intervention requests by SEC and Kitchener Utilities.
9/29/2022 Boylo Colm	Accociation of Dower Producers	Enhridge Danhandle Beinfersement LTC /ED 2022 0157\	1 F. Road and Research	Email correspondence re updates to Enbridge evidence and submissions on oral and written hearing proposal by OEB panel; review proceeding and research EBO
8/28/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	1.5 Read and Research	134 and 188; provide advice re same.
8/30/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	1.8 Prepartion of issues list submission	Review and analysis of letter from IGUA, OEB and Pollution Probe re format of hearing for issues list; review EGI evidence; draft letter on submission on form of
8/30/2023 Boyle, Colm 9/2/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Review decision	hearing for issues list; email correspondence with D. Butters re same. Review OEB decision on confidentiality of certain EGI undertaking responses.
3/2/2023 Boyle, Colli	Association of Fower Froducers	Elibridge Falliandie Reiliorcement LTC (LB-2022-0137)	0.1 Review decision	Review evidence in proceeding to prepare IRs; update presentation of APPrO members seeking instructions on IRs and evidence; attendance at meeting with D.
9/8/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	2.9 Read and Research	Butters and APPrO members to discuss strategy; email correspondence re same.
9/8/2023 Vellone, John		Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.6 Review procedural docs	Call with client group re next steps on panhandle reinforcement.
9/10/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	2.3 Preparation of interrogatories	Attendance on drafting IRs and email correspondence with D. Butters and B. Yauch re same.
9/18/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.3 Preparation of interrogatories	Advice to D. Butters in response to inquiry about IRs and timing letter by Enbridge.
9/25/2023 Hu, Will	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	2.7 Written submissions	Conducting legal research on OEB decisions on contribution in aid of construction and the economic tests under EBO 134, issued by the OEB.
9/27/2023 Hu, Will	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	2.9 Written submissions	Conducting legal research on OEB decisions on contribution in aid of construction and the economic tests under EBO 134, issued by the OEB.
9/28/2023 Hu, Will	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	4.9 Written submissions	Conducting legal research on OEB decisions on contribution in aid of construction and the economic tests under EBO 134, issued by the OEB.
.,,				Conducting legal research on OEB decisions on contribution in aid of construction and the economic tests under EBO 134, issued by the OEB and drafting a legal
9/29/2023 Hu, Will	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	7.2 Written submissions	memo on this issue.
				Conducting legal research on OEB decisions on contribution in aid of construction and the economic tests under EBO 134, issued by the OEB, and drafting a legal
10/2/2023 Hu, Will	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	2.5 Written submissions	memo on this issue.
10/3/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.2 Preparation of interrogatories	Review correspondence from EGI re updates to IRs responses.
			_	Review and summarize IR responses in PowerPoint presentation; prepare for and attendance at meeting with APPrO members on current status of Panhandle
10/6/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	2.5 Preparation of interrogatories	proceeding.
40/2/2022		5 . D D : (22.14.11	Conducting legal research on OEB decisions on contribution in aid of construction and the economic tests under EBO 134, issued by the OEB, and drafting a legal
10/3/2023 Hu, Will	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	3.3 Written submissions	memo on this issue. Conduction local research on OEB desirions on contribution in aid of construction and the economic tests under ERO 124 issued by the OEB, and drafting a local
10/4/2023 Hu, Will	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	5.4 Written submissions	Conducting legal research on OEB decisions on contribution in aid of construction and the economic tests under EBO 134, issued by the OEB, and drafting a legal memo on this issue.
10/4/2023 110, 11111	Association of Fower Froducers	Enbluge Falliandie Reimorcement LTC (LB-2022-0137)	J.4 WITEEN SUBMISSIONS	Attendance on drafting opening statement; reviewing evidence and preparing for oral hearing; email correspondence with APPrO members re briefing on position
10/17/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	5.1 Preparation for oral hearing	in oral hearing.
, ,		0		Prepare for and attendance on conference call with Atura and Capital Power; phone call with B. Yauch to prepare for same; post call debrief with J. Vellone; email
10/19/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	1.6 Preparation for oral hearing	correspondence re same.
10/30/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.5 Review procedural docs	Review and analysis of procedural order 8; email correspondence re same on oral hearing.
, ,		<u> </u>	p	Email correspondence with H. Newland; instructions to coordinate meeting with APPrO members on hearing strategy; review IRP framework filed by EGI in relation
10/31/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.4 Preparation for oral hearing	to Panhandle project in EB-2020-0091.
11/3/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Preparation for oral hearing	Attendance on email correspondence from EGI regarding reply evidence to ED.
		<u> </u>	,	Review correspondence from FRPO responding to APPrO submission on IR request; review and analysis of Greenhouses expert report; attendance on email
11/6/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.8 Preparation for oral hearing	correspondence.
/ - /		3		·

11/7/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Preparation for oral hearing	Review letter correspondence from EGI on FRPO request for information; email correspondence regarding same.
11/8/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.4 Preparation for oral hearing	Phone call with L. Ing of OEB; email correspondence with D. Butters and B. Yauch; internal meeting with J. Vellone to discuss hybrid hearing arrangements.
11/13/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	7 Attendance at oral hearing	Attend day 1 of the Panhandle oral hearing.
11/12/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	4 Prepare for oral hearing	Prepare for tomorrow's oral hearing (opening statement and cross).
11/17/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.5 Review procedural docs	Call with D. Butters and L. Deeg re next steps following the oral hearing.
11/23/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.5 Written submissions	Attendance on conference call with B. Yauch and J. Vellone to discuss written argument.
11/23/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.4 Written submissions	Call with B. Yauch and C. Boyle; discuss next steps re final argument.
11/14/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	5.2 Attendance at oral hearing	Attend day 2 of the leave to construct (virtually).
11/15/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	4 Attendance at oral hearing	Attend day 3 of the oral hearing (virtual).
11/15/2025 Vellotte, 301111	7.550clation of Fower Froducers	Enonage ramanate neimoreement are (ab 2022 0137)	4 Attendance at ordinearing	Conduct legal research of historical Panhandle Leave to Construct decisions cited by Industrial Gas Users Association's counsel at the cross-examination of EB-2022-
				0157; review these cases and distinguish them from the Panhandle Reinforcement LTC EB-2022-0157 in terms of whether contributions in aid of construction were
11/23/2023 Hu, Will	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	7 Written submissions	required or needed.
11/23/2023 11u, WIII	Association of Fower Froducers	Elibridge Failliandie Reilliorcement LTC (LB-2022-0137)	/ Written submissions	required of freeded.
				Continue to conduct legal research of historical Panhandle Leave to Construct decisions cited by Industrial Gas Users Association's counsel at the cross-examination
44/24/2222 11 14/11		5 . D D : (LTC (50 2022 0457)	C.W	of EB-2022-0157 and review these cases and distinguish them from the Panhandle Reinforcement LTC EB-2022-0157 in terms of whether contributions in aid of
11/24/2023 Hu, Will	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	6 Written submissions	construction were required or needed; summarize the findings and argumentation strategies into a memo, for J. Vellone to form legal arguments re EB-2022-0157.
10/5/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.5 Preparation for oral hearing	Prep call in advance of upcoming oral hearing.
10/6/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	1 Preparation for oral hearing	Prepare for upcoming oral hearing, working with Atura counsel to minimize duplication.
9/11/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	1 Preparation of interrogatories	Attendance on finalizing IRs and submitting to OEB.
12/6/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.5 Read and Research	Review proceeding record and email to J. Vellone on CIAC breakdown.
12/12/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	7.9 Written submissions	Attendance on drafting argument.
12/14/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	7.5 Written submissions	Attendance on drafting and finalizing argument; review arguments filed by other interveners.
11/9/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.8 Preparation for oral hearing	Attend Panhandle strategy call hosted by APPrO and including Atura and Capital Power; coordinate next steps in advance of oral hearing.
11/7/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.3 Preparation for oral hearing	Review OVGV evidence.
12/10/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	3.6 Written submissions	Draft APPrO Submissions.
12/12/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	4.1 Written submissions	Drafting submissions for Panhandle proceeding; send same to C. Boyle for his input.
12/15/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.6 Written submissions	Review submissions of other parties; various correspondence re same.
12/14/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	2.3 Written submissions	Assist towards finalizing APPrO submissions.
12/13/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	4.6 Written submissions	Drafting and revising the APPrO submissions.
12/13/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	5.7 Written submissions	Attendance on drafting and finalizing argument; email correspondence with client regarding same.
11/24/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.5 Written submissions	Attendance on conference call with J. Vellone and B. Yauch regarding strategy on pipeline submissions.
11/11/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	3 Preparation for oral hearing	Draft cross examination for APPrO; email correspondence with J. Vellone regarding same.
11/9/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	1.4 Preparation for oral hearing	Prepare for and attendance on conference call to discuss strategy for cross examination and opening statements at oral hearing.
11/4/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	1.7 Preparation of interrogatories	Attendance on reviewing request by FRPO for additional IR; draft letter response to same; email correspondence with client regarding same.
11/5/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	1 Preparation of interrogatories	Draft response letter to FRPO request for additional IRs on model simulations.
1/16/2024 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Review procedural docs	Review letter from EGI regarding extension request.
1/17/2024 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Review decision	Review OEB decision granting extension request to EGI argument.
1/29/2024 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Written submissions	Email correspondence from Enbridge enclosing reply argument.
2/5/2024 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.2 Written submissions	Review of letter from EGI replying to ED surrebuttal.
2/15/2024 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Review decision	Attendance on reviewing OEB decision on ED request for additional evidence.
4/18/2024 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers of Ontari	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Review decision	Review email correspondence from D. Butters re status of panhandle decision.
5/7/2024 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers of Ontari	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	3.9 Review decision	Draft summary of current status of Panhandle proceeding for APPrO members and discuss implications of Bill 165 and why decision is delayed.
5/14/2024 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers of Ontari	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	1.5 Review decision	Review Panhandle decision.

Will Hu

CASE
EB-2022-0157: Facilities: Leave
to Construct (New): Enbridge Gas
Inc.

COST CLAIM EB-2022-0157 : 2 : Colm Boyle INTERVENOR NAME Boyle, Colm; +1 (416) 367-7273 cboyle@blg.com PARTICIPANT
CLAIM STATUS
Submitted

FILING PARTICIPANT

NEW
PARTICIPANT
Yes

NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME Will NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME Hu

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE*

Legal Counsel

YEAR CALLED TO BAR*

2023

COMPLETED YEARS
PRACTICING/YEARS OF
RELEVANT EXPERIENCE*

0

HST RATE CHARGED*

13.00

CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST)

CV Required

LAST CV DATE

OVERRIDE HOURLY RATE

HOURLY RATE

170

No

HST NUMBER 125298802RT0001

HEARINGS

Yes

CONSULTATIONS

No

DISBURSEMENTS

No

HEARINGS

 Hearings Hours
 Hearings Subtotal (\$)
 Hearings Total Tax (\$)
 Hearings Total (\$)

 41.90
 7,123.00
 925.99
 8,048.99

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate		ST HST	<u>Total</u>
DISCOVERY Read and Research Application and Evidence		170	13.	00	
Preparation of Interrogatories		170	13.	00	
Review Interrogatory Responses		170	13.	00	
Technical Conference Preparation		170	13.	00	
Technical Conference Attendance		170	13.	00	
Technical Conference Follow-up		170	13.	00	
Subtotal of DISCOVERY	0.00		0.00	0.00	0.00
PROCEDURAL Preparation of Issues List Submission		170	13.	00	
Attendance at Issues List Conference		170	13.	00	
Preparation for a Confidentiality Request		170	13.	00	
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality		170	13.	00	
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		170	13.	00	
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		170	13.	00	
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		170	13.	00	
Review Procedural Documents		170	13.	00	

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	Sub Total	HST Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Subtotal of PROCEDURAL	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
INTERVENOR EVIDENCE Preparation of Intervenor Evidence		170		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		170		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE	0.00	170	0.00	13.00	0.00	0.00
SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE Preparation for Settlement Conference		170		13.00		
Attendance at Settlement Conference		170		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		170		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		170		13.00		
Subtotal of SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE WRITTEN ARGUMENT	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
Written Submissions	41.90	170	7,123.00	13.00	925.99	8,048.99
Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT	41.90		7,123.00		925.99	8,048.99
ORAL ARGUMENT Preparation for Oral Hearing		170		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		170		13.00		
Oral Submissions		170		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		170		13.00		
Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
DECISION Review Decision		170		13.00		
Review Rate/Accounting Order		170		13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order		170		13.00		
Subtotal of DECISION	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
OTHER Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor Conferences)		170		13.00		
Subtotal of OTHER	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES Total Service Provider Fees	41.90		7,123.00		925.99	8,048.99
Attachments						
Attachment APPrO Cost Claim Panhandle - BLG.pdf	Document Ty Time Docket	<u>pe</u>	<u>In</u>	nport Mes	<u>ssage</u>	

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

<u>Attachment Document Type Claim Type Import Message</u>

APPrO Cost Claim Panhandle - BLG.pdf Time Docket Hearings

Date TKPR Name	Client Name	Matter Name	Bs Hrs Phase Code	Narrative Proj
8/4/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	4.1 Read and Research	Draft notice of intervention; email correspondence with J. Vellone and D. Butters re same.
8/5/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.8 Read and Research	Attendance on filing notice of intervention; email correspondence with J. Vellone and D. Butters re same.
8/31/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.2 Preparation of interrogatories	Email correspondence with B. Yauch re interrogatories.
8/5/2022 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Read and Research	Review and instruct C. Boyle re notice of intervention letter.
10/6/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	1.8 Technical conference prep	Review proceeding and assessment of any outstanding questions for the technical conference; prepare for and brief attendance at technical conference.
10/19/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.9 Technical conference prep	Meeting with B. Yauch re update to D. Butters; prepare for and attendance with D. Butters to update status of file.
10/24/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.3 Technical conference prep	Email correspondence with D. Butters re next steps in Panhandle proceeding.
10/25/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Technical conference prep	Email correspondence with B. Yauch re conversation with Autura Power on strategy.
10/26/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.2 Review procedural docs	Review email correspondence from R. Higgin and I. Mondrow re cost of capital decision for natural gas transmitters in Quebec.
8/12/2022 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.3 Review procedural docs	Review Procedural Order No. 1; see confirmation of instructions from D. Butters re intention not to file evidence.
11/1/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Review decision	Review OEB decision on confidentiality of Enbridge filing.
10/5/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.7 Technical conference prep	Prepare for and attendance on conference call with B. Yauch to discuss roles and responsibilities at the upcoming technical conference.
11/2/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Review procedural docs	Review correspondence from Enbridge and K. Elson requesting an extension to the timeline for filing.
9/1/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	3.9 Preparation of interrogatories	Attendance on preparing, finalizing and filing interrogatories to Enbridge.
11/3/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.4 Review procedural docs	Review the Pollution Probe letter of comment and references cited; email to B. Yauch re same.
		, ,	·	Review filings by other interveners on topics of discussion at technical conference; email correspondence with B. Yauch on topics of discussion for APPrO at
9/29/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	1.5 Technical conference prep	technical conference; attendance on filing letter with OEB on technical conference topics of APPrO to participate.
11/7/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.4 Written submissions	Phone call with B. Yauch to discuss strategy for submissions.
11/8/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Review procedural docs	Review application by Enbridge to review decision on confidentiality.
11/29/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.3 Written submissions	Phone call with B. Yauch re draft of argument.
12/1/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.2 Review decision	Review OEB decision on confidential treatment of Enbridge filings.
12/21/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.4 Review procedural docs	Email correspondence with D. Butters and Atura re next steps after procedural order no. 1 and CIAC submissions by interveners.
12/19/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.5 Review procedural docs	Attendance on conference call with D. Butters and Atura re submission on CIAC response.
12/5/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.2 Read and Research	Review correspondence from OEB re request for abeyance by EGI; email correspondence with D. Butters and T. Yauch re same.
1/8/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.3 Review procedural docs	Review proceeding materials and draft email to M. Kitchen at Enbridge on behalf of D. Butters.
11/4/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Other	Attendance on email correspondence.
2/2/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Read and Research	Review letter correspondence from Enbridge re further application deferral to 2024.
6/16/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.2 Read and Research	Email correspondence from Enbridge re updated filing.
0/40/2022 Paula Cales	Association of Davida Deciderate	Fabridas Daubardla Dainfarrannat LTC (FD 2022 0457)	2.4. Dood and Doorson	Attacher and the second and the seco
8/10/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	2.1 Read and Research	Attendance on reviewing updates to panhandle proceeding and procedural order; draft summary slides indicating key take aways from Panhandle Project.
8/12/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	1.3 Read and Research	Finalize presentation summarizing key issues for APPrO members.
8/18/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Review decision	Review OEB decision on intervention requests by SEC and Kitchener Utilities.
9/29/2022 Boylo Colm	Accociation of Dower Producers	Enhridge Danhandle Beinfersement LTC /ED 2022 0157\	1 F. Road and Research	Email correspondence re updates to Enbridge evidence and submissions on oral and written hearing proposal by OEB panel; review proceeding and research EBO
8/28/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	1.5 Read and Research	134 and 188; provide advice re same.
8/30/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	1.8 Prepartion of issues list submission	Review and analysis of letter from IGUA, OEB and Pollution Probe re format of hearing for issues list; review EGI evidence; draft letter on submission on form of
8/30/2023 Boyle, Colm 9/2/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Review decision	hearing for issues list; email correspondence with D. Butters re same. Review OEB decision on confidentiality of certain EGI undertaking responses.
3/2/2023 Boyle, Colli	Association of Fower Froducers	Elibridge Falliandie Reiliorcement LTC (LB-2022-0137)	0.1 Review decision	Review evidence in proceeding to prepare IRs; update presentation of APPrO members seeking instructions on IRs and evidence; attendance at meeting with D.
9/8/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	2.9 Read and Research	Butters and APPrO members to discuss strategy; email correspondence re same.
9/8/2023 Vellone, John		Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.6 Review procedural docs	Call with client group re next steps on panhandle reinforcement.
9/10/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	2.3 Preparation of interrogatories	Attendance on drafting IRs and email correspondence with D. Butters and B. Yauch re same.
9/18/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.3 Preparation of interrogatories	Advice to D. Butters in response to inquiry about IRs and timing letter by Enbridge.
9/25/2023 Hu, Will	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	2.7 Written submissions	Conducting legal research on OEB decisions on contribution in aid of construction and the economic tests under EBO 134, issued by the OEB.
9/27/2023 Hu, Will	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	2.9 Written submissions	Conducting legal research on OEB decisions on contribution in aid of construction and the economic tests under EBO 134, issued by the OEB.
9/28/2023 Hu, Will	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	4.9 Written submissions	Conducting legal research on OEB decisions on contribution in aid of construction and the economic tests under EBO 134, issued by the OEB.
.,,				Conducting legal research on OEB decisions on contribution in aid of construction and the economic tests under EBO 134, issued by the OEB and drafting a legal
9/29/2023 Hu, Will	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	7.2 Written submissions	memo on this issue.
				Conducting legal research on OEB decisions on contribution in aid of construction and the economic tests under EBO 134, issued by the OEB, and drafting a legal
10/2/2023 Hu, Will	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	2.5 Written submissions	memo on this issue.
10/3/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.2 Preparation of interrogatories	Review correspondence from EGI re updates to IRs responses.
			_	Review and summarize IR responses in PowerPoint presentation; prepare for and attendance at meeting with APPrO members on current status of Panhandle
10/6/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	2.5 Preparation of interrogatories	proceeding.
40/2/2022		5 . D D : (22.14.11	Conducting legal research on OEB decisions on contribution in aid of construction and the economic tests under EBO 134, issued by the OEB, and drafting a legal
10/3/2023 Hu, Will	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	3.3 Written submissions	memo on this issue. Conduction local research on OEB desirions on contribution in aid of construction and the economic tests under ERO 124 issued by the OEB, and drafting a local
10/4/2023 Hu, Will	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	5.4 Written submissions	Conducting legal research on OEB decisions on contribution in aid of construction and the economic tests under EBO 134, issued by the OEB, and drafting a legal memo on this issue.
10/4/2023 110, 11111	Association of Fower Froducers	Enbluge Falliandie Reimorcement LTC (LB-2022-0137)	J.4 WITEEN SUBMISSIONS	Attendance on drafting opening statement; reviewing evidence and preparing for oral hearing; email correspondence with APPrO members re briefing on position
10/17/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	5.1 Preparation for oral hearing	in oral hearing.
, ,		0		Prepare for and attendance on conference call with Atura and Capital Power; phone call with B. Yauch to prepare for same; post call debrief with J. Vellone; email
10/19/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	1.6 Preparation for oral hearing	correspondence re same.
10/30/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.5 Review procedural docs	Review and analysis of procedural order 8; email correspondence re same on oral hearing.
, ,		<u> </u>	p	Email correspondence with H. Newland; instructions to coordinate meeting with APPrO members on hearing strategy; review IRP framework filed by EGI in relation
10/31/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.4 Preparation for oral hearing	to Panhandle project in EB-2020-0091.
11/3/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Preparation for oral hearing	Attendance on email correspondence from EGI regarding reply evidence to ED.
		<u> </u>	,	Review correspondence from FRPO responding to APPrO submission on IR request; review and analysis of Greenhouses expert report; attendance on email
11/6/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.8 Preparation for oral hearing	correspondence.
/ - /		3		·

11/7/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Preparation for oral hearing	Review letter correspondence from EGI on FRPO request for information; email correspondence regarding same.
11/8/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.4 Preparation for oral hearing	Phone call with L. Ing of OEB; email correspondence with D. Butters and B. Yauch; internal meeting with J. Vellone to discuss hybrid hearing arrangements.
11/13/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	7 Attendance at oral hearing	Attend day 1 of the Panhandle oral hearing.
11/12/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	4 Prepare for oral hearing	Prepare for tomorrow's oral hearing (opening statement and cross).
11/17/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.5 Review procedural docs	Call with D. Butters and L. Deeg re next steps following the oral hearing.
11/23/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.5 Written submissions	Attendance on conference call with B. Yauch and J. Vellone to discuss written argument.
11/23/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.4 Written submissions	Call with B. Yauch and C. Boyle; discuss next steps re final argument.
11/14/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	5.2 Attendance at oral hearing	Attend day 2 of the leave to construct (virtually).
11/15/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	4 Attendance at oral hearing	Attend day 3 of the oral hearing (virtual).
11/15/2025 Vellotte, 301111	7.550clation of Fower Froducers	Enotinge Farmanaie Neimoreement Ere (Eb 2022 0137)	4 Attendance at ordinearing	Conduct legal research of historical Panhandle Leave to Construct decisions cited by Industrial Gas Users Association's counsel at the cross-examination of EB-2022-
				0157; review these cases and distinguish them from the Panhandle Reinforcement LTC EB-2022-0157 in terms of whether contributions in aid of construction were
11/23/2023 Hu, Will	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	7 Written submissions	required or needed.
11/23/2023 11u, WIII	Association of Fower Froducers	Elibridge Failliandie Reilliorcement LTC (LB-2022-0137)	/ Written submissions	required of freeded.
				Continue to conduct legal research of historical Panhandle Leave to Construct decisions cited by Industrial Gas Users Association's counsel at the cross-examination
44/24/2222 11 14/11		5 . D D : (LTC (50 2022 0457)	C.W	of EB-2022-0157 and review these cases and distinguish them from the Panhandle Reinforcement LTC EB-2022-0157 in terms of whether contributions in aid of
11/24/2023 Hu, Will	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	6 Written submissions	construction were required or needed; summarize the findings and argumentation strategies into a memo, for J. Vellone to form legal arguments re EB-2022-0157.
10/5/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.5 Preparation for oral hearing	Prep call in advance of upcoming oral hearing.
10/6/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	1 Preparation for oral hearing	Prepare for upcoming oral hearing, working with Atura counsel to minimize duplication.
9/11/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	1 Preparation of interrogatories	Attendance on finalizing IRs and submitting to OEB.
12/6/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.5 Read and Research	Review proceeding record and email to J. Vellone on CIAC breakdown.
12/12/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	7.9 Written submissions	Attendance on drafting argument.
12/14/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	7.5 Written submissions	Attendance on drafting and finalizing argument; review arguments filed by other interveners.
11/9/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.8 Preparation for oral hearing	Attend Panhandle strategy call hosted by APPrO and including Atura and Capital Power; coordinate next steps in advance of oral hearing.
11/7/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.3 Preparation for oral hearing	Review OVGV evidence.
12/10/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	3.6 Written submissions	Draft APPrO Submissions.
12/12/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	4.1 Written submissions	Drafting submissions for Panhandle proceeding; send same to C. Boyle for his input.
12/15/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.6 Written submissions	Review submissions of other parties; various correspondence re same.
12/14/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	2.3 Written submissions	Assist towards finalizing APPrO submissions.
12/13/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	4.6 Written submissions	Drafting and revising the APPrO submissions.
12/13/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	5.7 Written submissions	Attendance on drafting and finalizing argument; email correspondence with client regarding same.
11/24/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.5 Written submissions	Attendance on conference call with J. Vellone and B. Yauch regarding strategy on pipeline submissions.
11/11/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	3 Preparation for oral hearing	Draft cross examination for APPrO; email correspondence with J. Vellone regarding same.
11/9/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	1.4 Preparation for oral hearing	Prepare for and attendance on conference call to discuss strategy for cross examination and opening statements at oral hearing.
11/4/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	1.7 Preparation of interrogatories	Attendance on reviewing request by FRPO for additional IR; draft letter response to same; email correspondence with client regarding same.
11/5/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	1 Preparation of interrogatories	Draft response letter to FRPO request for additional IRs on model simulations.
1/16/2024 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Review procedural docs	Review letter from EGI regarding extension request.
1/17/2024 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Review decision	Review OEB decision granting extension request to EGI argument.
1/29/2024 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Written submissions	Email correspondence from Enbridge enclosing reply argument.
2/5/2024 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.2 Written submissions	Review of letter from EGI replying to ED surrebuttal.
2/15/2024 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Review decision	Attendance on reviewing OEB decision on ED request for additional evidence.
4/18/2024 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers of Ontari	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Review decision	Review email correspondence from D. Butters re status of panhandle decision.
5/7/2024 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers of Ontari	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	3.9 Review decision	Draft summary of current status of Panhandle proceeding for APPrO members and discuss implications of Bill 165 and why decision is delayed.
5/14/2024 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers of Ontari	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	1.5 Review decision	Review Panhandle decision.

CASE
EB-2022-0157: Facilities: Leave
to Construct (New): Enbridge Gas
Inc.

e as COST CLAIM EB-2022-0157 : 2 : Colm Boyle INTERVENOR NAME Boyle, Colm; +1 (416) 367-7273 cboyle@blg.com PARTICIPANT
CLAIM STATUS
Submitted

FILING PARTICIPANT
Boyle, Colm; +1 (416) 367-7273
cboyle@blg.com

NEW PARTICIPANT No NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE*
Legal Counsel

YEAR CALLED TO BAR* 2015

COMPLETED YEARS
PRACTICING/YEARS OF
RELEVANT EXPERIENCE*
9

HOURLY RATE 230

HST RATE CHARGED*

13.00

CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST) CV Required LAST CV DATE

OVERRIDE HOURLY RATE No

HST NUMBER 125298802RT0001

HEARINGS Yes CONSULTATIONS No DISBURSEMENTS

No

HEARINGS

Hearings Subtotal (\$) **Hearings Hours Hearings Total Tax (\$)** Hearings Total (\$) 78.80 18,124.00 2,356.12 20,480.12 **HST** Name Hourly Sub Total HST Hours Rate Rate

Total **DISCOVERY** Read and Research Application and 13.70 230 3.151.00 13.00 409.63 3.560.63 Evidence Preparation of Interrogatories 13.10 230 3,013.00 13.00 391.69 3,404.69 **Review Interrogatory Responses** 230 13.00 **Technical Conference Preparation** 5.30 230 1,219.00 13.00 158.47 1,377.47 230 13.00 **Technical Conference Attendance** Technical Conference Follow-up 230 13.00 Subtotal of DISCOVERY 32.10 7,383.00 959.79 8,342.79 **PROCEDURAL** Preparation of Issues List Submission 1.80 230 414.00 13.00 53.82 467.82 Attendance at Issues List Conference 230 13.00 Preparation for a Confidentiality Request 230 13.00 Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality 230 13.00 230 Preparation of Motion(s) Materials 13.00 Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s) 230 13.00 Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s) 230 13.00 **Review Procedural Documents** 2.60 230 598.00 13.00 77.74 675.74

ļ	<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	Sub Total	HST Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
:	Subtotal of PROCEDURAL	4.40		1,012.00		131.56	1,143.56
	VENOR EVIDENCE Preparation of Intervenor Evidence		230		13.00		
I	Interrogatory Responses		230		13.00		
ä	Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE	0.00	230	0.00	13.00	0.00	0.00
_	EMENT CONFERENCE Preparation for Settlement Conference		230		13.00		
,	Attendance at Settlement Conference		230		13.00		
ı	Preparation of Settlement Proposal		230		13.00		
,	Attendance at Presentation to Panel		230		13.00		
(Subtotal of SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE EN ARGUMENT	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
	Written Submissions	23.10	230	5,313.00	13.00	690.69	6,003.69
;	Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT	23.10		5,313.00		690.69	6,003.69
_	ARGUMENT Preparation for Oral Hearing	12.90	230	2,967.00	13.00	385.71	3,352.71
,	Attendance at Oral Hearing		230		13.00		
(Oral Submissions		230		13.00		
,	Attendance at Oral Submissions		230		13.00		
;	Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT	12.90		2,967.00		385.71	3,352.71
DECISI	ON Review Decision	6.20	230	1,426.00	13.00	185.38	1,611.38
ı	Review Rate/Accounting Order		230		13.00		
I	Prepare Submission on Rate Order		230		13.00		
;	Subtotal of DECISION	6.20		1,426.00		185.38	1,611.38
	R Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor Conferences)	0.10	230	23.00	13.00	2.99	25.99
	Subtotal of OTHER	0.10		23.00		2.99	25.99
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES Total Service Provider Fees		78.80		18,124.00		2,356.12	20,480.12

Attachments

<u>Attachment Document Type</u> <u>Import Message</u>

APPrO Cost Claim Panhandle - BLG.pdf Time Docket

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

<u>Attachment Document Type</u> <u>Claim Type</u> <u>Import Message</u>

APPrO Cost Claim Panhandle - BLG.pdf Time Docket Hearings

Date TKPR Name	Client Name	Matter Name	Bs Hrs Phase Code	Narrative Proj
8/4/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	4.1 Read and Research	Draft notice of intervention; email correspondence with J. Vellone and D. Butters re same.
8/5/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.8 Read and Research	Attendance on filing notice of intervention; email correspondence with J. Vellone and D. Butters re same.
8/31/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.2 Preparation of interrogatories	Email correspondence with B. Yauch re interrogatories.
8/5/2022 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Read and Research	Review and instruct C. Boyle re notice of intervention letter.
10/6/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	1.8 Technical conference prep	Review proceeding and assessment of any outstanding questions for the technical conference; prepare for and brief attendance at technical conference.
10/19/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.9 Technical conference prep	Meeting with B. Yauch re update to D. Butters; prepare for and attendance with D. Butters to update status of file.
10/24/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.3 Technical conference prep	Email correspondence with D. Butters re next steps in Panhandle proceeding.
10/25/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Technical conference prep	Email correspondence with B. Yauch re conversation with Autura Power on strategy.
10/26/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.2 Review procedural docs	Review email correspondence from R. Higgin and I. Mondrow re cost of capital decision for natural gas transmitters in Quebec.
8/12/2022 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.3 Review procedural docs	Review Procedural Order No. 1; see confirmation of instructions from D. Butters re intention not to file evidence.
11/1/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Review decision	Review OEB decision on confidentiality of Enbridge filing.
10/5/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.7 Technical conference prep	Prepare for and attendance on conference call with B. Yauch to discuss roles and responsibilities at the upcoming technical conference.
11/2/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Review procedural docs	Review correspondence from Enbridge and K. Elson requesting an extension to the timeline for filing.
9/1/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	3.9 Preparation of interrogatories	Attendance on preparing, finalizing and filing interrogatories to Enbridge.
11/3/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.4 Review procedural docs	Review the Pollution Probe letter of comment and references cited; email to B. Yauch re same.
				Review filings by other interveners on topics of discussion at technical conference; email correspondence with B. Yauch on topics of discussion for APPrO at
9/29/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	1.5 Technical conference prep	technical conference; attendance on filing letter with OEB on technical conference topics of APPrO to participate.
11/7/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.4 Written submissions	Phone call with B. Yauch to discuss strategy for submissions.
11/8/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Review procedural docs	Review application by Enbridge to review decision on confidentiality.
11/29/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.3 Written submissions	Phone call with B. Yauch re draft of argument.
12/1/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.2 Review decision	Review OEB decision on confidential treatment of Enbridge filings.
12/21/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.4 Review procedural docs	Email correspondence with D. Butters and Atura re next steps after procedural order no. 1 and CIAC submissions by interveners.
12/19/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.5 Review procedural docs	Attendance on conference call with D. Butters and Atura re submission on CIAC response.
12/5/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.2 Read and Research	Review correspondence from OEB re request for abeyance by EGI; email correspondence with D. Butters and T. Yauch re same.
1/8/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.3 Review procedural docs	Review proceeding materials and draft email to M. Kitchen at Enbridge on behalf of D. Butters.
11/4/2022 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Other	Attendance on email correspondence.
2/2/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Read and Research	Review letter correspondence from Enbridge re further application deferral to 2024.
6/16/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.2 Read and Research	Email correspondence from Enbridge re updated filing.
8/10/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	2.1 Read and Research	Attendance on reviewing updates to panhandle proceeding and procedural order; draft summary slides indicating key take aways from Panhandle Project.
8/12/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	1.3 Read and Research	Finalize presentation summarizing key issues for APPrO members.
8/18/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Review decision	Review OEB decision on intervention requests by SEC and Kitchener Utilities.
				Email correspondence re updates to Enbridge evidence and submissions on oral and written hearing proposal by OEB panel; review proceeding and research EBO
8/28/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	1.5 Read and Research	134 and 188; provide advice re same.
				Review and analysis of letter from IGUA, OEB and Pollution Probe re format of hearing for issues list; review EGI evidence; draft letter on submission on form of
8/30/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	1.8 Prepartion of issues list submission	hearing for issues list; email correspondence with D. Butters re same.
9/2/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Review decision	Review OEB decision on confidentiality of certain EGI undertaking responses. Review evidence in proceeding to prepare IRs; update presentation of APPrO members seeking instructions on IRs and evidence; attendance at meeting with D.
9/8/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	2.9 Read and Research	Butters and APPrO members to discuss strategy; email correspondence re same.
9/8/2023 Vellone, John		Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157) Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.6 Review procedural docs	Call with client group re next steps on panhandle reinforcement.
9/10/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	2.3 Preparation of interrogatories	Attendance on drafting IRs and email correspondence with D. Butters and B. Yauch re same.
9/18/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.3 Preparation of interrogatories	Advice to D. Butters in response to inquiry about IRs and timing letter by Enbridge.
9/25/2023 Hu, Will	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	2.7 Written submissions	Conducting legal research on OEB decisions on contribution in aid of construction and the economic tests under EBO 134, issued by the OEB.
9/27/2023 Hu, Will	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	2.9 Written submissions	Conducting legal research on OEB decisions on contribution in aid of construction and the economic tests under EBO 134, issued by the OEB.
9/28/2023 Hu, Will	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	4.9 Written submissions	Conducting legal research on OEB decisions on contribution in aid of construction and the economic tests under EBO 134, issued by the OEB.
3, 23, 2323,	7.5500.00.00.00.00.00.00.00.00.00.00.00		ns whiteen submissions	Conducting legal research on OEB decisions on contribution in aid of construction and the economic tests under EBO 134, issued by the OEB and drafting a legal
9/29/2023 Hu, Will	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	7.2 Written submissions	memo on this issue.
				Conducting legal research on OEB decisions on contribution in aid of construction and the economic tests under EBO 134, issued by the OEB, and drafting a legal
10/2/2023 Hu, Will	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	2.5 Written submissions	memo on this issue.
10/3/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.2 Preparation of interrogatories	Review correspondence from EGI re updates to IRs responses. Review and summarize IR responses in PowerPoint presentation; prepare for and attendance at meeting with APPrO members on current status of Panhandle
10/6/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	2.5 Preparation of interrogatories	proceeding.
•				Conducting legal research on OEB decisions on contribution in aid of construction and the economic tests under EBO 134, issued by the OEB, and drafting a legal
10/3/2023 Hu, Will	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	3.3 Written submissions	memo on this issue. Conducting legal research on OEB decisions on contribution in aid of construction and the economic tests under EBO 134, issued by the OEB, and drafting a legal
10/4/2023 Hu, Will	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	5.4 Written submissions	memo on this issue.
				Attendance on drafting opening statement; reviewing evidence and preparing for oral hearing; email correspondence with APPrO members re briefing on position
10/17/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	5.1 Preparation for oral hearing	in oral hearing. Prepare for and attendance on conference call with Atura and Capital Power; phone call with B. Yauch to prepare for same; post call debrief with J. Vellone; email
10/19/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	1.6 Preparation for oral hearing	correspondence re same.
10/30/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.5 Review procedural docs	Review and analysis of procedural order 8; email correspondence re same on oral hearing.
-,,	III III III III III III III III III II			Email correspondence with H. Newland; instructions to coordinate meeting with APPrO members on hearing strategy; review IRP framework filed by EGI in relation
10/31/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.4 Preparation for oral hearing	to Panhandle project in EB-2020-0091.
11/3/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Preparation for oral hearing	Attendance on email correspondence from EGI regarding reply evidence to ED.
		3	,	Review correspondence from FRPO responding to APPrO submission on IR request; review and analysis of Greenhouses expert report; attendance on email
11/6/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.8 Preparation for oral hearing	correspondence.
		2 2 2 2 7 7 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2		

11/7/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Preparation for oral hearing	Review letter correspondence from EGI on FRPO request for information; email correspondence regarding same.
11/8/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.4 Preparation for oral hearing	Phone call with L. Ing of OEB; email correspondence with D. Butters and B. Yauch; internal meeting with J. Vellone to discuss hybrid hearing arrangements.
11/13/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	7 Attendance at oral hearing	Attend day 1 of the Panhandle oral hearing.
11/12/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	4 Prepare for oral hearing	Prepare for tomorrow's oral hearing (opening statement and cross).
11/17/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.5 Review procedural docs	Call with D. Butters and L. Deeg re next steps following the oral hearing.
11/23/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.5 Written submissions	Attendance on conference call with B. Yauch and J. Vellone to discuss written argument.
11/23/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.4 Written submissions	Call with B. Yauch and C. Boyle; discuss next steps re final argument.
11/14/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	5.2 Attendance at oral hearing	Attend day 2 of the leave to construct (virtually).
11/15/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	4 Attendance at oral hearing	Attend day 3 of the oral hearing (virtual).
11/15/2025 Vellotte, 301111	7.550clation of Fower Froducers	Enotinge Farmanaie Neimoreement Ere (Eb 2022 0137)	4 Attendance at ordinearing	Conduct legal research of historical Panhandle Leave to Construct decisions cited by Industrial Gas Users Association's counsel at the cross-examination of EB-2022-
				0157; review these cases and distinguish them from the Panhandle Reinforcement LTC EB-2022-0157 in terms of whether contributions in aid of construction were
11/23/2023 Hu, Will	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	7 Written submissions	required or needed.
11/23/2023 11u, WIII	Association of Fower Froducers	Elibridge Failliandie Reilliorcement LTC (LB-2022-0137)	/ Written submissions	required of freeded.
				Continue to conduct legal research of historical Panhandle Leave to Construct decisions cited by Industrial Gas Users Association's counsel at the cross-examination
44/24/2222 11 14/11		5 . D D : (LTC (50 2022 0457)	6.14.11	of EB-2022-0157 and review these cases and distinguish them from the Panhandle Reinforcement LTC EB-2022-0157 in terms of whether contributions in aid of
11/24/2023 Hu, Will	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	6 Written submissions	construction were required or needed; summarize the findings and argumentation strategies into a memo, for J. Vellone to form legal arguments re EB-2022-0157.
10/5/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.5 Preparation for oral hearing	Prep call in advance of upcoming oral hearing.
10/6/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	1 Preparation for oral hearing	Prepare for upcoming oral hearing, working with Atura counsel to minimize duplication.
9/11/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	1 Preparation of interrogatories	Attendance on finalizing IRs and submitting to OEB.
12/6/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.5 Read and Research	Review proceeding record and email to J. Vellone on CIAC breakdown.
12/12/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	7.9 Written submissions	Attendance on drafting argument.
12/14/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	7.5 Written submissions	Attendance on drafting and finalizing argument; review arguments filed by other interveners.
11/9/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.8 Preparation for oral hearing	Attend Panhandle strategy call hosted by APPrO and including Atura and Capital Power; coordinate next steps in advance of oral hearing.
11/7/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.3 Preparation for oral hearing	Review OVGV evidence.
12/10/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	3.6 Written submissions	Draft APPrO Submissions.
12/12/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	4.1 Written submissions	Drafting submissions for Panhandle proceeding; send same to C. Boyle for his input.
12/15/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.6 Written submissions	Review submissions of other parties; various correspondence re same.
12/14/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	2.3 Written submissions	Assist towards finalizing APPrO submissions.
12/13/2023 Vellone, John	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	4.6 Written submissions	Drafting and revising the APPrO submissions.
12/13/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	5.7 Written submissions	Attendance on drafting and finalizing argument; email correspondence with client regarding same.
11/24/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.5 Written submissions	Attendance on conference call with J. Vellone and B. Yauch regarding strategy on pipeline submissions.
11/11/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	3 Preparation for oral hearing	Draft cross examination for APPrO; email correspondence with J. Vellone regarding same.
11/9/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	1.4 Preparation for oral hearing	Prepare for and attendance on conference call to discuss strategy for cross examination and opening statements at oral hearing.
11/4/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	1.7 Preparation of interrogatories	Attendance on reviewing request by FRPO for additional IR; draft letter response to same; email correspondence with client regarding same.
11/5/2023 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	 Preparation of interrogatories 	Draft response letter to FRPO request for additional IRs on model simulations.
1/16/2024 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Review procedural docs	Review letter from EGI regarding extension request.
1/17/2024 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Review decision	Review OEB decision granting extension request to EGI argument.
1/29/2024 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Written submissions	Email correspondence from Enbridge enclosing reply argument.
2/5/2024 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.2 Written submissions	Review of letter from EGI replying to ED surrebuttal.
2/15/2024 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Review decision	Attendance on reviewing OEB decision on ED request for additional evidence.
4/18/2024 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers of Ontari	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	0.1 Review decision	Review email correspondence from D. Butters re status of panhandle decision.
5/7/2024 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers of Ontari	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	3.9 Review decision	Draft summary of current status of Panhandle proceeding for APPrO members and discuss implications of Bill 165 and why decision is delayed.
5/14/2024 Boyle, Colm	Association of Power Producers of Ontari	Enbridge Panhandle Reinforcement LTC (EB-2022-0157)	1.5 Review decision	Review Panhandle decision.