

EB-2022-0157 : 2 : Michael Buonaguro

COST CLAIM NUMBER
2115

SUBMISSION DEADLINE DATE
May 28, 2024

CLAIM STATUS
Submitted

EB#
EB-2022-0157: Facilities: Leave to Construct
(New): Enbridge Gas Inc.

OTHER EB#S

PHASE #*
2

INTERVENOR
Buonaguro, Michael; +1 (416) 767-1666
mrb@mrb-law.com

INTERVENOR COMPANY*
Ontario Greenhouse Vegetable
Growers, Leamington:
Corporation

INTERVENOR TYPE
Full Registrant

HST RATE ONTARIO
13.00

EXCHANGE RATE

COUNTRY

HST NUMBER
82029 2415 RT0001

LATE SUBMISSION ALLOWED
Yes

EXTENSION DEADLINE DATE
July 05, 2024

PARTICIPANTS

New	Non-Filing Participant First, Last Name	Filing Participant	Total (\$)	Total Hours	Participant Claim Status
No	,	Buonaguro, Michael; +1 (416) 767-1666 mrb@mrb-law.com	43,144.53	115.70	Submitted
Yes	Robert , Petro		13,268.67	49.00	Submitted

ATTACHMENTS

Attachment	Document Type	Import Message
OGVG_COST_20240528_EB-2022-0147.pdf	Cover Letter	
OGVG EB-2022-0157 Cost Claim 052820240809.pdf		
6-OGVG Mileage.pdf	Travel: Car Mileage – Northern Ontario	attached by M. Svistun

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT/OTHER FEES
49,451.00

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS
472.19

TOTAL HST
6,490.01

TOTAL CLAIM
56,413.20

TOTAL AMOUNT AWARDED

TOTAL HOURS CLAIMED
164.70

TOTAL HOURS DISALLOWED

REASON FOR
DISALLOWANCE

REASON FOR
DISALLOWANCE - 2

REASON FOR
DISALLOWANCE - 3

MAKE CHEQUE PAYABLE TO
Michael R. Buonaguro

SEND PAYMENT TO ADDRESS
Michael Buonaguro
24 Humber Trail
Toronto, Ontario
M6S 4C1

ATTENTION

SUBMIT SECTION

I am a representative of the Party. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim. The costs incurred and time spent are directly related to the Party's participation in the OEB Process referred to above.

This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in section 6.05 and 6.09 of the OEB's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

The information (fees and disbursements) filed in this cost claim is complete and accurate and in accordance with the OEB's Practice Direction for Cost Awards and Appendix A, the Cost Awards Tariff.

SUBMITTED BY
Michael Buonaguro

DATE SUBMITTED
July 05, 2024

CASE EB-2022-0157: Facilities: Leave to Construct (New): Enbridge Gas Inc.	COST CLAIM EB-2022-0157 : 2 : Michael Buonaguro	INTERVENOR NAME Buonaguro, Michael; +1 (416) 767-1666 mrb@mrb-law.com	PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS Submitted
FILING PARTICIPANT Buonaguro, Michael; +1 (416) 767-1666 mrb@mrb-law.com	NEW PARTICIPANT No	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME
SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE* Legal Counsel	YEAR CALLED TO BAR* 2002	COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF RELEVANT EXPERIENCE* 22	HOURLY RATE 330
HST RATE CHARGED* 13.00	CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST) CV Required	LAST CV DATE	OVERRIDE HOURLY RATE No
HST NUMBER 82029 2415 RT0001	HEARINGS Yes	CONSULTATIONS No	DISBURSEMENTS No

HEARINGS

Hearings Hours 115.70	Hearings Subtotal (\$) 38,181.00	Hearings Total Tax (\$) 4,963.53	Hearings Total (\$) 43,144.53
---------------------------------	--	--	---

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
DISCOVERY						
Read and Research Application and Evidence	3.50	330	1,155.00	13.00	150.15	1,305.15
Preparation of Interrogatories	7.00	330	2,310.00	13.00	300.30	2,610.30
Review Interrogatory Responses	3.00	330	990.00	13.00	128.70	1,118.70
Technical Conference Preparation	3.40	330	1,122.00	13.00	145.86	1,267.86
Technical Conference Attendance	12.00	330	3,960.00	13.00	514.80	4,474.80
Technical Conference Follow-up	4.50	330	1,485.00	13.00	193.05	1,678.05
Subtotal of DISCOVERY	33.40		11,022.00		1,432.86	12,454.86
PROCEDURAL						
Preparation of Issues List Submission		330		13.00		
Attendance at Issues List Conference		330		13.00		
Preparation for a Confidentiality Request		330		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality		330		13.00		
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		330		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		330		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		330		13.00		
Review Procedural Documents		330		13.00		

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Subtotal of PROCEDURAL	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
INTERVENOR EVIDENCE						
Preparation of Intervenor Evidence	3.30	330	1,089.00	13.00	141.57	1,230.57
Interrogatory Responses	3.50	330	1,155.00	13.00	150.15	1,305.15
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing	3.50	330	1,155.00	13.00	150.15	1,305.15
Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE	10.30		3,399.00		441.87	3,840.87
SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE						
Preparation for Settlement Conference		330		13.00		
Attendance at Settlement Conference		330		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		330		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		330		13.00		
Subtotal of SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
WRITTEN ARGUMENT						
Written Submissions	29.50	330	9,735.00	13.00	1,265.55	11,000.55
Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT	29.50		9,735.00		1,265.55	11,000.55
ORAL ARGUMENT						
Preparation for Oral Hearing	18.50	330	6,105.00	13.00	793.65	6,898.65
Attendance at Oral Hearing	23.00	330	7,590.00	13.00	986.70	8,576.70
Oral Submissions		330		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		330		13.00		
Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT	41.50		13,695.00		1,780.35	15,475.35
DECISION						
Review Decision	1.00	330	330.00	13.00	42.90	372.90
Review Rate/Accounting Order		330		13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order		330		13.00		
Subtotal of DECISION	1.00		330.00		42.90	372.90
OTHER						
Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor Conferences)		330		13.00		
Subtotal of OTHER	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES						
Total Service Provider Fees	115.70		38,181.00		4,963.53	43,144.53

Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
1015.pdf	Time Docket and Invoice	
931.pdf	Time Docket and Invoice	

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Claim Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
1015.pdf	Time Docket and Invoice	Hearings	
931.pdf	Time Docket and Invoice	Hearings	

Michael R. Buonaguro Barrister and Solicitor

24 Humber Trail
Toronto, Ontario M6S 4C1

Ph:(416) 767-1666

Fax:(416) 767-1666

Ontario Greenhouse Vegetable Growers

May 15, 2024

Attention: File #: 05-491
Inv #: 1015

RE: EB-2022-0157 EGI-Panhandle Regional Expansion Project

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Sep-07-23	Review evidence update, draft IRs.	3.00	990.00	MRB
Oct-16-23	Preparation for hearing.	2.00	660.00	MRB
Oct-17-23	Call from OEB, emails to client, call with client.	1.50	495.00	MRB
Oct-18-23	Preperation for hearing, emails to client, conference with client.	3.00	990.00	MRB
Oct-31-23	preperation for hearing.	2.00	660.00	MRB
Nov-03-23	Review draft evidence.	1.50	495.00	MRB
Nov-04-23	Ca from OGVG re evidence.	0.30	99.00	MRB
Nov-05-23	Review draft evidence.	0.50	165.00	MRB
Nov-06-23	Review draft evidence.	1.00	330.00	MRB
Nov-07-23	Witness preperation.	1.50	495.00	MRB
Nov-08-23	Preperation for hearing.	2.00	660.00	MRB
Nov-10-23	Preperation for hearing, meeting with witness.	4.00	1,320.00	MRB

Nov-11-23	Preperation for hearing.	1.00	330.00	MRB
Nov-12-23	Preperation for hearing.	2.00	660.00	MRB
Nov-13-23	Attendance at hearing.	7.50	2,475.00	MRB
	Preperation for hearing.	2.00	660.00	MRB
Nov-14-23	Attendance at hearing.	7.50	2,475.00	MRB
	Prepration for hairng.	1.00	330.00	MRB
Nov-15-23	Attendance at hearing.	8.00	2,640.00	MRB
Nov-19-23	Review material for UTs.	2.00	660.00	MRB
Nov-21-23	Call with witness re undertakings.	1.00	330.00	MRB
Nov-22-23	Review UT responses.	0.50	165.00	MRB
Nov-30-23	Drafting argument.	3.00	990.00	MRB
Dec-05-23	Drafting argument.	3.00	990.00	MRB
Dec-07-23	Drafting argument.	4.00	1,320.00	MRB
Dec-08-23	Drafting argument.	4.00	1,320.00	MRB
Dec-11-23	Drafting argument.	3.00	990.00	MRB
Dec-12-23	Drafting argument.	6.00	1,980.00	MRB
	Drafting argument.	1.00	330.00	MRB
Dec-13-23	Drafting argument.	4.00	1,320.00	MRB
Dec-14-23	Finalize argument.	1.50	495.00	MRB
May-14-24	Review decision, email to client.	1.00	330.00	MRB
	Totals	85.30	<u>\$28,149.00</u>	
	Total GST on Fees		3,659.37	

Total Fee & Disbursements	\$31,808.37
Previous Balance	11,336.16
Previous Payments	11,336.16
Balance Now Due	\$31,808.37

TAX ID Number 830059879
Total GST \$3,659.37

PAYMENT DETAILS

Jun-16-23	On Account of Fees and Disbursements	11,336.16
Total Payments		\$11,336.16

Michael R. Buonaguro Barrister and Solicitor

24 Humber Trail
Toronto, Ontario M6S 4C1

Ph:(416) 767-1666

Fax:(416) 767-1666

Ontario Greenhouse Vegetable Growers

February 13, 2023

Attention:

File #: 05-491

Inv #: 931

RE: EB-2022-0157 EGI-Panhandle Regional Expansion Project

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Jul-26-22	Email from client, review application, draft notice, discussion with client, file Intervention.	1.00	330.00	MRB
Jul-28-22	Review application.	2.50	825.00	MRB
Aug-30-22	Review application material, draft IRs.	2.00	660.00	MRB
Sep-01-22	Review application material, draft IRs.	2.00	660.00	MRB
Sep-28-22	Review IRRs.	3.00	990.00	MRB
Sep-29-22	Review IRRs, draft and send TCQ.	1.50	495.00	MRB
Oct-04-22	Review new proposed evidence, email to client.	1.00	330.00	MRB
Oct-05-22	Conference call lwith client.	0.40	132.00	MRB
Oct-06-22	Preparation for Technical Conference.	0.50	165.00	MRB
	Attendance at Technical Conference.	7.50	2,475.00	MRB
Oct-07-22	Attendance at technical conference.	4.50	1,485.00	MRB
Dec-05-22	Review TC UTs, reply evidence, reply IRRs from EGI.	2.50	825.00	MRB

Dec-08-22	Review email from IGUA, research re EBO 134.	2.00	660.00	MRB
	Totals	30.40	<u>\$10,032.00</u>	
	Total GST on Fees		1,304.16	
	Total Fee & Disbursements			<u>\$11,336.16</u>
	Balance Now Due			<u>\$11,336.16</u>

TAX ID Number 830059879

Total GST \$1,304.16

Robert Petro

CASE EB-2022-0157: Facilities: Leave to Construct (New): Enbridge Gas Inc.	COST CLAIM EB-2022-0157 : 2 : Michael Buonaguro	INTERVENOR NAME Buonaguro, Michael; +1 (416) 767-1666 mrb@mrb-law.com	PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS Submitted
FILING PARTICIPANT	NEW PARTICIPANT Yes	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME Robert	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME Petro
SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE* Consultant	YEAR CALLED TO BAR*	COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF RELEVANT EXPERIENCE* 8	HOURLY RATE 230
HST RATE CHARGED* 13.00	CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST) CV Attached	LAST CV DATE May 27, 2024	OVERRIDE HOURLY RATE No
HST NUMBER 82029 2415 RT0001	HEARINGS Yes	CONSULTATIONS No	DISBURSEMENTS Yes

HEARINGS

Hearings Hours 49.00	Hearings Subtotal (\$) 11,270.00	Hearings Total Tax (\$) 1,465.10	Hearings Total (\$) 12,735.10
--------------------------------	--	--	---

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
DISCOVERY						
Read and Research Application and Evidence		230		13.00		
Preparation of Interrogatories		230		13.00		
Review Interrogatory Responses		230		13.00		
Technical Conference Preparation		230		13.00		
Technical Conference Attendance		230		13.00		
Technical Conference Follow-up		230		13.00		
Subtotal of DISCOVERY	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
PROCEDURAL						
Preparation of Issues List Submission		230		13.00		
Attendance at Issues List Conference		230		13.00		
Preparation for a Confidentiality Request		230		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality		230		13.00		
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		230		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		230		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		230		13.00		
Review Procedural Documents		230		13.00		

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Subtotal of PROCEDURAL	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
INTERVENOR EVIDENCE						
Preparation of Intervenor Evidence	19.00	230	4,370.00	13.00	568.10	4,938.10
Interrogatory Responses	11.00	230	2,530.00	13.00	328.90	2,858.90
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing		230		13.00		
Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE	30.00		6,900.00		897.00	7,797.00
SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE						
Preparation for Settlement Conference		230		13.00		
Attendance at Settlement Conference		230		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		230		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		230		13.00		
Subtotal of SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
WRITTEN ARGUMENT						
Written Submissions		230		13.00		
Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
ORAL ARGUMENT						
Preparation for Oral Hearing	11.00	230	2,530.00	13.00	328.90	2,858.90
Attendance at Oral Hearing	8.00	230	1,840.00	13.00	239.20	2,079.20
Oral Submissions		230		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		230		13.00		
Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT	19.00		4,370.00		568.10	4,938.10
DECISION						
Review Decision		230		13.00		
Review Rate/Accounting Order		230		13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order		230		13.00		
Subtotal of DECISION	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
OTHER						
Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor Conferences)		230		13.00		
Subtotal of OTHER	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES						
Total Service Provider Fees	49.00		11,270.00		1,465.10	12,735.10

Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
Robert_Petro_CV_20240527.PDF	CV	
Docket-Petro.pdf	Time Docket and Invoice	

DISBURSEMENTS

Disbursement Subtotal(\$)	Disbursement Total Tax(\$)	Other Taxes/Tips Total(\$)	Disbursement Total(\$)
472.19	61.38	0.00	533.57

<u>Name</u>	<u>ATT. REQ'D</u>	<u>ATT. PROV</u>	<u>Qty</u>	<u>\$/ Unit</u>	<u>Net Cost</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Other Taxes/Tip</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Rationale/ Comment</u>
Scanning/Photocopy (Internal)						13.00				
Scanning/Photocopy (External)						13.00				
Printing (Internal)						13.00				
Printing (External)						13.00				
Courier						13.00				
Teleconference						13.00				
Travel: Air						13.00				
Travel: Car Rental						13.00				
Travel: Gas	No	Yes				13.00				
Travel: Car Mileage – Southern Ontario	Yes	Yes	750.00	0.40	265.49		34.51		300.00	
Travel: Car Mileage – Northern Ontario				0.41						
Travel: Rail						13.00				
Travel (Other)	Yes	Yes	2.00	3.35	6.70	13.00	0.87		7.57	subway fare from/to hotel
Parking						13.00				
Taxi						13.00				
Accommodation	Yes	Yes	1.00	200.00	200.00	13.00	26.00		226.00	Actual cost higher, receipt attached.
Other	No	No				13.00				
Total Disbursements:					472.19		61.38	0.00	533.57	

Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
OEB Reciepts.pdf	Receipts for hotel and meals
GAS.png	Picture of Gas receipts

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Claim Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
Robert_Petro_CV_20240527.PDF	CV	Hearings	
OEB Reciepts.pdf		Disbursements	Receipts for hotel and meals
GAS.png		Disbursements	Picture of Gas receipts
Docket-Petro.pdf	Time Docket and Invoice	Hearings	

Robert Andrew Petro

901-1445 Ouellette Ave.
Windsor, Ontario, Canada, N8X 1K1
1-519-990-7857
robert.petro@outlook.com

EDUCATION:

- 2014 Ph.D. University of Windsor (Physics)
Dissertation Title: “Modern Applications of Novel Electroless Plating Techniques”
Advisor: Dr. Mordechay Schlesinger
- 2007 B.Sc. University of Windsor (Physics & High Technology – Honors)
- 2003 High School École Secondaire L’Essor – (French-English Bilingual Diploma)

EMPLOYMENT

1) TECHNICAL EMPLOYMENT

- | | |
|---------------------------|--|
| Feb 2021 – Present | Energy, Infrastructure, and Environment Coordinator, Ontario Greenhouse and Vegetable Growers |
| Oct 2020 – Present | Senior Regulatory Affairs Associate, Tersano Inc. |
| Apr 2019 – Present | Director of Science and Innovation, Prodigie – innovation evolved |
| June 2019 – Feb 2020 | Chemical Control Center Assistant, University of Windsor |
| Oct 2018 – Mar 2019 | Scientific Advisor, Prodigie – innovation evolved |
| Oct 2018 – Mar 2019 | Business Development Specialist, Mitacs |
| May 2018 – Oct 2018 | Director of Innovation, Prodigie – innovation evolved |
| Mar 2018 – Oct 2018 | Chemical Control Technician, University of Windsor |
| Nov 2017 – Apr 2018 | Compounder, International Nutrient Technologies, Windsor, Canada |
| Jan 2017 – Apr 2017 | Special Projects, University of Windsor |
| June 2016 – Dec 2016 | Project Assistant for Program Development, University of Windsor |
| Sept 2015 – Dec 2015 | Physics Laboratory Coordinator, University of Windsor |

2) RESEARCH EMPLOYMENT

- | | |
|---------------------------|---|
| Oct 2020 – Present | R&D Engineer, Tersano Inc. |
| Oct 2015 – Dec 2016 | Post-Doctoral Fellow, University of Windsor |
| Nov 2014 – Oct 2015 | Visiting Research Scholar, Johns Hopkins University |
| Aug 2014 – Sept 2015 | Post-Doctoral Fellow, University of Windsor |
| Sept 2008 – July 2014 | Research Assistant, Ph.D. Dissertation, University of Windsor |

3) TEACHING EMPLOYMENT

- a) Instructorships
- | | |
|----------------------|---|
| Jan 2020 – Apr 2020 | Sessional Instructor, Introductory Physics II, University of Windsor |
| Jan 2020 – Apr 2020 | Sessional Instructor, Introductory Physics II, University of Windsor |
| May 2019 – Aug 2019 | Sessional Instructor, Introductory Physics II, University of Windsor |
| Apr 2019 – June 2019 | Grade 9 & 10 General Science Teacher, Académie Ste. Cécile International School |
| Sept 2018 – Dec 2018 | Sessional Instructor, Introductory Physics I, University of Windsor |
| Apr 2018 – Aug 2018 | Course Development, Design and Application of Thin Films, University of Windsor |

Apr 2017 – Aug 2017 Sessional Instructor, Introductory Physics II, University of Windsor

b) Teaching Assistantships

Jan 2016 – Apr 2016 Lab Instructor, Introductory Physics II, University of Windsor
Jan 2019 – Apr 2019 Lab Instructor, Introductory Physics II, University of Windsor
Sept 2017 – Dec 2017 Lab Instructor, Introductory Physics I, University of Windsor
Jan 2016 – Apr 2016 Lab Instructor, Introductory Physics II, University of Windsor
Jan 2015 – Apr 2015 Lab Instructor, Introductory Physics II, University of Windsor
Jan 2014 – Apr 2014 Lab Instructor, Introductory Physics II, University of Windsor
Sept 2011 – Dec 2011 Lab Instructor, Electromagnetic (EM) Waves, University of Windsor
Sept 2008 – Apr 2012 Lab Instructor for Introductory Physics (for Life Sciences), University of Windsor

4) OTHER EMPLOYMENT

PATENTS

Issued

2014 Mordechay Schlesinger and Robert Petro, Selective Electroless Deposition of Gold onto Silicon, US patent number 8,900,998, Filed: November 19, 2013, Granted: December 2, 2014

Filed

2014 Mordechay Schlesinger and Robert Petro, Single Solution for Electro-Electroless Deposition of Metals, International Filing Number: PCT/CA2014/000472 (USA, Canada, EPO (Europe))
2013 Mordechay Schlesinger and Robert Petro; Process for Electroless Deposition on Magnesium Using a Nickel Hydrate Plating Bath; Filing Number: CA2806047, US 20130216721 [Combined into: High Alkaline Plating process for highly reactive metals, PCT/CA2011/001146]
2011 Mordechay Schlesinger and Robert Petro; High Alkaline Plating process for highly reactive metals; International Filing Number: PCT/CA2011/001146 (USA, Canada, EPO (Europe), Mexico, Brazil, China, Korea, Japan)

PUBLICATIONS & PRESENTATIONS

1) Book Chapters

2013 Petro, R., Schlesinger, M. (2013) Applications of Electrochemistry in Medicine, p1-33, in Modern Aspects of Electrochemistry Volume 56: Applications of Electrochemistry in Medicine (ed M. Schlesinger), Springer US. doi: 10.1007/978-1-4614-6148-7_1
2010 Petro, R., Schlesinger, M. and Song, G.-L. Ionic Liquid Treatments for Enhanced Corrosion Resistance of Magnesium-Based Substrates, p665-686, in Modern Electroplating, Fifth Edition (eds M. Schlesinger and M. Paunovic), John Wiley & Sons, Inc., Hoboken, NJ, USA. doi: 10.1002/9780470602638.ch30

2) Peer-Reviewed Articles

2017 Robert Petro, “Developments in Co(Ni-P) Hybrid Electro-Electroless Deposited (HEED) Alloys and Composites”, ECS Transactions, 75(34): 61-66

- 2015 Robert Petro, Pavel Borodulin, T. E. Schlesinger, and Mordechay Schlesinger, “Liquid Exfoliated Graphene: A Practical Method for Increasing Loading and Producing Thin Films, ECS Journal of Solid State Science and Technology, 5(2): P1-P5
- 2015 Robert Petro and Mordechay Schlesinger, “Deposition of Cobalt-Nickel Hybrid Electro-Electroless Deposited (HEED) Modulated Multilayers”, Journal of The Electrochemical Society, 162(4): D154-D158
- 2014 Robert Petro and Mordechay Schlesinger, “Development of Hybrid Electro-Electroless Deposit (HEED) Coatings and Applications”, Journal of The Electrochemical Society, 161(10): D1-D6
- 2013 Robert Petro and Mordechay Schlesinger, “Direct Electroless Deposition of Ni-P-Zn Films on AZ91D Mg Alloy”, Journal of The Electrochemical Society, 160(9): D349-D353
- 2012 Robert Petro and Mordechay Schlesinger, “Direct Electroless Deposition of Low Phosphorous Ni-P Films on AZ91D Mg Alloy”, Journal of The Electrochemical Society, 159(7), p. D455-D461
- 2011 Robert Petro and Mordechay Schlesinger, “Direct Electroless Deposition of Nickel Boron Alloys and Copper on Aluminum Containing Magnesium Alloys”, Electrochemical and Solid-State Letters, 14(4), p.D37-D40

3) Unpublished Manuscripts

- 2017 Stephanie Frowley, Robert Petro, Chitra Rangan, “Qualitative measurements of electrolyte stability and breakdown conditions”

4) Academic Presentations

- 2016 R. Petro, “Developments in Hybrid Electro-Electroless Deposition (HEED)”, 230th Meeting of the Electrochemical Society, Honolulu, Hawaii
- 2015 R. Petro and M. Schlesinger, “Hybrid Electro-Electroless Deposition (HEED)”, 228th Meeting of the Electrochemical Society, Phoenix, Arizona



7 West Cafe
 7 Charles Street West
 Toronto, Ontario
 M4Y-1R4
 (416)928-9011
 GST# 885 9415-9RT
Table #204-2
 Trans #: 1871565 Serv: Shivan
 11/14/2023 10:41 PM # Cust: 1

Quan	Description	Cost
1	Truffle Mushroom Pizza	\$24.00
Net Total:		\$24.00
HST		\$3.12

TOTAL: \$27.12
Amount Due: \$27.12
 Paid: \$24.00

Delightfully urban
 & nocturnal staff,
 to serve and please
 Open 24 hours
 365 days a year

Omai Restaurant
 3 Baldwin St
 Toronto, Ontario
 Canada, M5T1L1
 Tel: 6473417766
 Printed November 15, 2023 at 5:57 PM

November 15, 2023 at 5:57 PM Order #: 9593
Table: 14, 2 guests

Croquette	\$12.00
Futomaki	\$18.00
Food Total	\$30.00
Sub Total	\$30.00
HST 13%	\$3.90
Total	\$33.90

@omai.restaurant | omairestaurant.ca
 HST # 743924128

1 of 1
 December 05, 2023

Reservation Number 457966

Send to Robert Petro
 901-1445 Ouellette Ave
 Windsor, ON N8X-1K1

Phone 519-990-7857

Guest Name Robert Petro **Arrival Date** 23-11-14 **Departure Date** 23-11-15

Room Information 2207 - Luxury 1 King 2 Doubles

Bill To Petro, Robert
 901-1445 Ouellette Ave
 Windsor, ON N8X-1K1

Phone 519-990-7857

Folio Number 713239

Trans Date	Description	Voucher	Amount
Charges			
23-11-14	Flexible Rate	01-2207	230.85
23-11-14	Harmonized Sales Tax	01-2207	30.01
23-11-14	Municipal Accommodations Tax	01-2207	13.85
23-11-14	Harmonized Sales Tax - MAT	01-2207	1.80
23-11-14	Parking Charge	-	36.00
23-11-14	Harmonized Sales Tax	-	4.68
23-11-14	Parking Card	2207 35871	25.00
23-11-15	Parking Card Adjustment	2207	-25.00
Total Charges			317.19
Payments			
23-11-14	Visa	2207 0000509393	-317.19
Total Payments			-317.19
Balance Due:			0.00

Total Tax	
Harmonized Sales Tax	\$34.69
Harmonized Sales Tax - MAT	\$1.80
Municipal Accommodations Tax	\$13.85
Total	\$50.34

HST #: R10096290.

I have received the goods and / or services in the amount shown hereon. I agree that my liability for this bill is not waived and agree to be held personally liable in the event that the indicated person, company, or association fails to pay for any part or the full amount of these charges. If a credit card charge, I further agree to perform the obligations set forth in the cardholder's agreement with the issuer.