Colm Boyle T: 416-367-7273 cboyle@blg.com

John Vellone T: 416-367-6730 jvellone@blg.com

File No. 61604.50

June 13, 2025

<u>VIA RESS</u> registrar@oeb.ca

Ms. Nancy Marconi Ontario Energy Board 2300 Yonge Street, 27th Floor Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

Dear Ms. Marconi:

Re: Enbridge Gas Inc. ("EGI") 2024 Rebasing Application – Phase 2 Board File Number: EB-2024-0111

We are counsel to the Association of Power Producers of Ontario ("**APPrO**") in the above-noted proceeding. On May 29, 2025, the Ontario Energy Board ("**OEB**") issued Decision and Order EB-2024-0111 directing cost eligible intervenors to file their cost claims with the OEB. APPrO's cost claim has been prepared and filed through the OEB's online cost claim filing system in accordance with section 10 of the OEB Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

APPrO participated reasonably in the process by focusing its involvement in the proceeding on issues directly relevant to its members. For example, once the majority of the issues of interest to APPrO members were resolved through the Settlement Proposal, APPrO minimized any further engagement in the proceeding. This ensured that its participation in the process would not unduly repetitive and was focused on relevant and material issues. This is evident in APPrO's cost claim being significantly lower than many other interveners that filed cost claims in this proceeding, including interveners that joined the proceedings late.

Phase 2 of the proceedings involved a 4-day technical conference and 10 days of settlement conference. APPrO's participation contributed to a better understanding by the OEB of the issues in the proceeding, and in particular storage and cost allocation. APPrO did not engage in conduct that tended to lengthen the process unnecessarily or engage in any inappropriate or irresponsible conduct.

As is evident from the attached timesheets, many of the time entries spanned multiple cost claim categories and cannot be easily separated. In such a case, time entries have been allocated to a single cost claim category.

Yours truly,

Borden Ladner Gervais LLP Bay Adelaide Centre, East Tower 22 Adelaide Street West Toronto ON M5H 4E3 Canada T 416-367-6000 F 416-367-6749 blo com





Cola Byle

Colm Boyle

EB-2024-0111 : 1 : Colm Boyle

COST CLAIM NUMBER 2748	SUBMISSION DEADLINE DATE June 13, 2025	CLAIM STATUS Approved by Finance
EB# EB-2024-0111: Rates: Distribution: Enbridge Gas Inc.	OTHER EB#S	PHASE #* 1
INTERVENOR Boyle, Colm; +1 (416) 367-7273 cboyle@blg.com	INTERVENOR COMPANY* Association of Power Producers of Ontario, Toronto: Cooperative	INTERVENOR TYPE Full Registrant
HST RATE ONTARIO 13.00	EXCHANGE RATE	COUNTRY
HST NUMBER 125298802RT0001	LATE SUBMISSION ALLOWED	EXTENSION DEADLINE DATE

PARTICIPANTS

New	Non-Filing Participant First, Last Name	Filing Participant	Total (\$)	Total Hours	Participant Claim Status
No	,	Yauch, Brady; +1 (416) 822-6884 byauch@poweradvisoryllc.co m	34,067.82	99.50	Submitted
No	,	Boyle, Colm; +1 (416) 367-7273 cboyle@blg.com	12,093.16	42.30	Submitted
Yes	John , Vellone		547.82	1.60	Submitted

ATTACHMENTS

	Document	Import Message
Attachment	Туре	
APPrO_Cost Claim Cover_EGI COS_20250613.pdf	Cover	
	Letter	
APPRO EB-2024-0111 Cost Claim 061320252358.pdf		

TOTAL CLAIM 46,708.80

TOTAL HOURS CLAIMED 143.40

REASON FOR DISALLOWANCE

MAKE CHEQUE PAYABLE TO Association of Power Producers of Ontario

SEND PAYMENT TO ADDRESS P.O. Box 756 Toronto, ON M5C2K1

SUBMIT SECTION

I am a representative of the Party. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim. The costs incurred and time spent are directly related to the Party's participation in the OEB Process referred to above.

This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in section 6.05 and 6.09 of the OEB's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

The information (fees and disbursements) filed in this cost claim is complete and accurate and in accordance with the OEB's Practice Direction for Cost Awards and Appendix A, the Cost Awards Tariff.

SUBMITTED BY Colm Boyle DATE SUBMITTED June 13, 2025

TOTAL AMOUNT AWARDED

TOTAL HOURS DISALLOWED

REASON FOR DISALLOWANCE - 2 REASON FOR DISALLOWANCE - 3

ATTENTION

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 0.00 TOTAL HST 5,373.60

Brady Yauch

CASE
EB-2024-0111: Rates:
Distribution: Enbridge Gas Inc.

COST CLAIM EB-2024-0111 : 1 : Colm Boyle

INTERVENOR NAME Boyle, Colm; +1 (416) 367-7273 cboyle@blg.com

PARTICIPANT **CLAIM STATUS** Submitted

303

OVERRIDE

No

HOURLY RATE

NON-FILING NON-FILING FILING PARTICIPANT NEW PARTICIPANT F. NAME PARTICIPANT L. NAME Yauch, Brady; +1 (416) 822-6884 PARTICIPANT byauch@poweradvisoryllc.com No SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE* YEAR CALLED TO BAR* COMPLETED YEARS HOURLY RATE Consultant PRACTICING/YEARS OF **RELEVANT EXPERIENCE*** 12 **HST RATE CHARGED* CV STATUS (FOR** LAST CV DATE 13.00 CONSULTANT/ANALYST) April 30, 2024 CV Provided within Previous 24 Months

HST NUMBER HEARINGS CONSULTATIONS DISBURSEMENTS 125298802RT0001 Yes No No

HEARINGS

Hearir	ngs Hours 99.50	Hearings Subtotal (\$) 30,148.50		Hearings Total 3,919.32	Tax (\$)		rings Total (\$) 34,067.82
<u>N</u>	ame	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly</u> <u>Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST</u> Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
DISCOV							
	ead and Research Application ar vidence	nd 15.50	303	4,696.50	13.00	610.55	5,307.05
	reparation of Interrogatories	3.00	303	909.00	13.00	118.17	1,027.17
R	eview Interrogatory Responses		303		13.00		
Te	echnical Conference Preparation	2.50	303	757.50	13.00	98.48	855.98
Te	echnical Conference Attendance		303		13.00		
Te	echnical Conference Follow-up	7.00	303	2,121.00	13.00	275.73	2,396.73
S	ubtotal of DISCOVERY	28.00		8,484.00		1,102.93	9,586.93
PROCE							
P	reparation of Issues List Submiss	sion	303		13.00		
A	ttendance at Issues List Conferen	nce	303		13.00		
P	reparation for a Confidentiality Re	equest	303		13.00		
P	repare Submissions on Confiden	tiality	303		13.00		
P	reparation of Motion(s) Materials		303		13.00		
P	repare Submissions on the Motic	n(s)	303		13.00		
A	ttendance at Hearing on Motion(s) 1.00	303	303.00	13.00	39.39	342.39
R	eview Procedural Documents		303		13.00		

CC Participant Combined.rpt - last Update 20230601

	Name	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly</u> <u>Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST</u> Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
	Subtotal of PROCEDURAL	1.00		303.00		39.39	342.39
INTE	RVENOR EVIDENCE Preparation of Intervenor Evidence		303		13.00		
	Interrogatory Responses		303		13.00		
	Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE	0.00	303	0.00	13.00	0.00	0.00
0		0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
SETT	LEMENT CONFERENCE Preparation for Settlement Conference	19.50	303	5,908.50	13.00	768.11	6,676.61
	Attendance at Settlement Conference	47.00	303	14,241.00	13.00	1,851.33	16,092.33
	Preparation of Settlement Proposal	4.00	303	1,212.00	13.00	157.56	1,369.56
	Attendance at Presentation to Panel		303		13.00		
WRIT	Subtotal of SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE TEN ARGUMENT	70.50		21,361.50		2,777.00	24,138.50
	Written Submissions		303		13.00		
	Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
ORA	ARGUMENT Preparation for Oral Hearing		303		13.00		
	Attendance at Oral Hearing		303		13.00		
	Oral Submissions		303		13.00		
	Attendance at Oral Submissions		303		13.00		
	Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
DECI			202		40.00		
	Review Decision		303		13.00		
	Review Rate/Accounting Order		303		13.00		
	Prepare Submission on Rate Order		303		13.00		
	Subtotal of DECISION	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
OTHE	ER Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor Conferences)		303		13.00		
	Subtotal of OTHER	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
ΤΟΤΑ	L SERVICE PROVIDER FEES Total Service Provider Fees	99.50		30,148.50		3,919.32	34,067.82

Attachments

Attachment

Brady Yauch - Power Advisory - Phase 2 Timesheet.pdf Document Type Time Docket and Invoice

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

Attachment

Brady Yauch - Power Advisory - Phase 2 Timesheet.pdf Document Type Time Docket and Invoice <u>Claim Type</u> Hearings

Power Advisory LLC - Time Entry

Date Start: 2/1/2024 | Date End: 10/31/2024 | Projects: Phase 3 Enbridge COS Rate Application | Users: All | Client Type: All | Project Type: All | Location: All | Billing Method: All | Paid Status: All | Group By: Project

Project	Entry Date	Client	User	Category	Description	Billable Time	Hourly Rate	Billable Amt	Categorization
Phase 2 Enbridge COS Rate Application	02-09-202	4 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON	Brady Yauch	Discovery	Met with Dave and BLG lawyers to discuss phase 2	1.50	\$303.00	\$454.50	Read and Research
Phase 2 Enbridge COS Rate Application	06-06-202	4 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON	Brady Yauch	Discovery	Discussed strategy for hearing and wrote emails to clients	1.00	\$303.00	\$303.00	Read and Research
Phase 2 Enbridge COS Rate Application	06-14-202	4 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON	Brady Yauch	Discovery	Reviewed evidence and updated IRs for Phase 2	6.00	\$303.00	\$1,818.00	Read and Research
Phase 2 Enbridge COS Rate Application	07-17-202	4 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON	Brady Yauch	Discovery	Phase 2 reviewed IRs for technical conference	3.00	\$303.00	\$909.00	IRs
Phase 2 Enbridge COS Rate Application	07-19-202	4 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON	Brady Yauch	Discovery	Met with Atura to discuss Phase 2 technical conference	1.00	\$303.00	\$303.00	Tech Conf Prep
Phase 2 Enbridge COS Rate Application	07-19-202	4 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON	Brady Yauch	Discovery	Provided comments to BLG in preparation of technical conference	1.50	\$303.00	\$454.50	Tech Conf Prep
Phase 2 Enbridge COS Rate Application	07-29-202	4 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON	Brady Yauch	Discovery	Reviewed transcripts and evidence	3.00	\$303.00	\$909.00	Tech Conf Follow Up
Phase 2 Enbridge COS Rate Application	07-30-202	4 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON	Brady Yauch	Discovery	Meeting with clients to discuss strategy	1.00	\$303.00	\$303.00	Tech Conf Follow Up
Phase 2 Enbridge COS Rate Application	07-30-202	4 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON	Brady Yauch	Discovery	Reviewed evidence and prepared for meeting with clients	3.00	\$303.00	\$909.00	Read and Research
Phase 2 Enbridge COS Rate Application	08-01-202	4 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON	Brady Yauch	Discovery	Reviewed technical conference transcripts	3.00	\$303.00	\$909.00	Tech Conf Follow Up
Phase 2 Enbridge COS Rate Application	08-14-202	4 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON	Brady Yauch	Discovery	Prepared memo for clients prior to settlement conference	4.00	\$303.00	\$1,212.00	Prep for Settlement Conf
Phase 2 Enbridge COS Rate Application	08-15-202	4 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON	Brady Yauch	Discovery	Review of expert evidence as part of Phase 2	4.00	\$303.00	\$1,212.00	Read and Research
Phase 2 Enbridge COS Rate Application	08-16-202	4 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON	Brady Yauch	Procedural	Attended motion	1.00	\$303.00	\$303.00	Attendance at Hearing on Motion
Phase 2 Enbridge COS Rate Application	08-16-202	4 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON	Brady Yauch	Settlement Conference	Prepared memo for clients for Settlement Conference and reviewed materials	4.00	\$303.00	\$1,212.00	Prep for Settlement Conf
Phase 2 Enbridge COS Rate Application		4 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON		Settlement Conference	Met with group to discuss settlement conference as well as reviewed materials	2.00	\$303.00	\$606.00	Prep for Settlement Conf
Phase 2 Enbridge COS Rate Application Phase 2 Enbridge COS Rate Application		4 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON 4 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON	,	Settlement Conference Settlement Conference	Reviewing materials in preparation of Settlement conference for Phase 2 Reviewed materials in preparation of the Phase 2 Settlement conference	4.00 4.00	\$303.00 \$303.00	\$1,212.00 \$1,212.00	Prep for Settlement Conf Prep for Settlement Conf
Phase 2 Enbridge COS Rate Application		4 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON		Settlement Conference	attended settlement conference for phase 2 and reviewed materials	8.00	\$303.00	\$2,424.00	Attendance at Settlement Conference
Phase 2 Enbridge COS Rate Application		4 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON		Settlement Conference	Attended settlement conference of phase 2 and reviewed materials	7.00	\$303.00	\$2,121.00	Attendance at Settlement Conference
Phase 2 Enbridge COS Rate Application		4 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON		Settlement Conference	Attended settlement conference	2.00	\$303.00	\$606.00	Attendance at Settlement Conference
Phase 2 Enbridge COS Rate Application Phase 2 Enbridge COS Rate Application		4 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON	,	Settlement Conference	Attended settlement conference for Phase 2 and reviewed responses and spoke to client.	5.00	\$303.00	\$1.515.00	Attendance at Settlement Conference
Phase 2 Enonoge COS Rate Application	05-13-202	4 Borden Launer Gervais LLF ON	brauy rauch	Settlement conference	Attended settlement conference for Phase 2 and reviewed responses and spoke to client.	5.00	\$303.00	\$1,515.00	Attendance at Settlement Conference
Phase 2 Enbridge COS Rate Application	09-16-202	4 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON	Brady Yauch	Settlement Conference	Discussions and emails with client regarding Phase 2 settlement	3.00	\$303.00	\$909.00	Prep of Settlement Proposal
Phase 2 Enbridge COS Rate Application	09-17-202	4 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON	Brady Yauch	Settlement Conference	Discussion with Client, attended settlement conference and reviewed material for Phase 2	3.50	\$303.00	\$1,060.50	Attendance at Settlement Conference
Phase 2 Enbridge COS Rate Application	09-18-202	4 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON	Brady Yauch	Settlement Conference	Attended settlement conference and discussed positions with client	5.50	\$303.00	\$1,666.50	Attendance at Settlement Conference
Phase 2 Enbridge COS Rate Application	09-19-202	4 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON	Brady Yauch	Settlement Conference	Attended settlement conference and reviewed materials	2.50	\$303.00	\$757.50	Attendance at Settlement Conference
Phase 2 Enbridge COS Rate Application	09-20-202	4 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON	Brady Yauch	Settlement Conference	Attended settlement conference and reviewed materials	3.50	\$303.00	\$1,060.50	Attendance at Settlement Conference
Phase 2 Enbridge COS Rate Application	10-06-202	4 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON	Brady Yauch	Settlement Conference	Reviewed file in preparation of settlement conference	1.50	\$303.00	\$454.50	Prep for Settlement Conf
Phase 2 Enbridge COS Rate Application	10-07-202	4 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON	Brady Yauch	Settlement Conference	Attended settlement conference	2.50	\$303.00	\$757.50	Attendance at Settlement Conference
Phase 2 Enbridge COS Rate Application	10-08-202	4 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON	Brady Yauch	Settlement Conference	Attended settlement conference and discussed with client	3.50	\$303.00	\$1,060.50	Attendance at Settlement Conference
Phase 2 Enbridge COS Rate Application	10-09-202	4 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON	Brady Yauch	Settlement Conference	Attended the Phase II settlement conference and reviewed submissions	4.00	\$303.00	\$1,212.00	Attendance at Settlement Conference
Phase 2 Enbridge COS Rate Application	10-21-202	4 Borden Ladner Gervais LLP ON	Brady Yauch	Settlement Conference	Reviewed settlement agreement	1.00	\$303.00	\$303.00	Prep of Settlement Proposal
Totals For Phase 3 Enbridge COS Rate Application	ı					99.50		\$30,148.5	D

Grand Total 99.50

99.50 \$30,148.50

Colm Boyle

CASE EB-2024-0111: Rates: Distribution: Enbridge Gas Inc.	COST CLAIM EB-2024-0111 : 1 : Colm Boyle	INTERVENOR NAME Boyle, Colm; +1 (416) 367-7273 cboyle@blg.com	PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS Submitted
FILING PARTICIPANT Boyle, Colm; +1 (416) 367-7273 cboyle@blg.com	NEW PARTICIPANT No	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME
SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE* Legal Counsel	YEAR CALLED TO BAR* 2015	COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF RELEVANT EXPERIENCE* 9	HOURLY RATE 253
HST RATE CHARGED* 13.00	CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST) CV Required	LAST CV DATE	OVERRIDE HOURLY RATE No
HST NUMBER	HEARINGS	CONSULTATIONS	DISBURSEMENTS

No

No

125298802RT0001

Yes

HEARINGS

Hea	arings Hours 42.30	Hearings Subt 10,701.90	otal (\$)		Hearings Total 1,391.26	Tax (\$)		rings Total (\$) 2,093.16
	<u>Name</u>		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly</u> <u>Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST</u> Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
DISC	OVERY							
	Read and Research Application a Evidence	nd	2.30	253	581.90	13.00	75.65	657.55
	Preparation of Interrogatories		1.20	253	303.60	13.00	39.47	343.07
	Review Interrogatory Responses		1.20	253	303.60	13.00	39.47	343.07
	Technical Conference Preparation	1	2.30	253	581.90	13.00	75.65	657.55
	Technical Conference Attendance		23.90	253	6,046.70	13.00	786.07	6,832.77
	Technical Conference Follow-up		2.30	253	581.90	13.00	75.65	657.55
	Subtotal of DISCOVERY		33.20		8,399.60		1,091.96	9,491.56
PRO	CEDURAL Preparation of Issues List Submis	sion	1.70	253	430.10	13.00	55.91	486.01
	Attendance at Issues List Conference	ence		253		13.00		
	Preparation for a Confidentiality F	lequest		253		13.00		
	Prepare Submissions on Confider	ntiality		253		13.00		
	Preparation of Motion(s) Materials	6		253		13.00		
	Prepare Submissions on the Moti	on(s)		253		13.00		
	Attendance at Hearing on Motion	s)		253		13.00		
	Review Procedural Documents			253		13.00		

CC_Participant_Combined.rpt - last Update 20230601

	<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	Sub Total	<u>HST</u> Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
	Subtotal of PROCEDURAL	1.70		430.10		55.91	486.01
INTE	RVENOR EVIDENCE Preparation of Intervenor Evidence	0.70	253	177.10	13.00	23.02	200.12
	Interrogatory Responses		253		13.00		
	Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE	0.70	253	177.10	13.00	23.02	200.12
SETT	LEMENT CONFERENCE Preparation for Settlement Conference	1.20	253	303.60	13.00	39.47	343.07
	Attendance at Settlement Conference	2.10	253	531.30	13.00	69.07	600.37
	Preparation of Settlement Proposal	2.40	253	607.20	13.00	78.94	686.14
	Attendance at Presentation to Panel		253		13.00		
WRIT	Subtotal of SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE TEN ARGUMENT Written Submissions	5.70	253	1,442.10	13.00	187.48	1,629.58
	Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
ORAI	L ARGUMENT Preparation for Oral Hearing Attendance at Oral Hearing		253 253		13.00 13.00		
	Oral Submissions		253		13.00		
	Attendance at Oral Submissions		253		13.00		
	Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
DECI	SION Review Decision		253		13.00		
	Review Rate/Accounting Order		253		13.00		
	Prepare Submission on Rate Order		253		13.00		
	Subtotal of DECISION	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
отне	ER						
	Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor Conferences)	1.00	253	253.00	13.00	32.89	285.89
	Subtotal of OTHER	1.00		253.00		32.89	285.89
ΤΟΤΑ	L SERVICE PROVIDER FEES Total Service Provider Fees	42.30		10,701.90		1,391.26	12,093.16
	ichments	Document Ty	/D0	Ir	nport Me	66300	
_	- JV and CPB - Phase 2.pdf	Time Docket		<u> </u>		<u>33846</u>	

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

Attachment BLG - JV and CPB - Phase 2.pdf

Document Type Time Docket and Invoice <u>Claim Type</u> Hearings

Joh 561 Boy 561 Boy 561 Boy 561 Boy 561 Boy 561 Boy	,	061604 061604 061604 061604 061604	000050 000050 000050 000050	0.1 0.2 1.5 0.7	PP090CommunicationPP090CommunicationPP090CommunicationPP070SubmissionsPP090Communication	PP091 PP092 PP092 PP071 PP092	With Other Parties Written Submissions	698370216 698381934 698381934 698381934	Discussion of Phase 2. Review letter correspondence from Environmental Defence re meter charges. Review correspondence from K. Elson re EGI retail activities. Research and draft letter response to issues in	Technical conference preparation Other attendance Other attendance Preparation of Issues
561 Boy 561 Boy	yle, Colm yle, Colm yle, Colm yle, Colm yle, Colm yle, Colm	061604 061604 061604 061604	000050 000050 000050	0.2 1.5 0.7	PP090 Communication PP070 Submissions	PP092 PP071	With Other Parties Written Submissions	698381934	Defence re meter charges. Review correspondence from K. Elson re EGI retail activities.	Other attendance Other attendance
561 Βογ 561 Βογ 561 Βογ 561 Βογ 561 Βογ 561 Βογ	yle, Colm yle, Colm yle, Colm yle, Colm yle, Colm	061604 061604 061604 061604	000050 000050 000050	0.2 1.5 0.7	PP090 Communication PP070 Submissions	PP092 PP071	With Other Parties Written Submissions	698381934	Defence re meter charges. Review correspondence from K. Elson re EGI retail activities.	Other attendance
561 Βογ 561 Βογ 561 Βογ 561 Βογ 561 Βογ	yle, Colm yle, Colm yle, Colm yle, Colm	061604 061604 061604	000050	1.5 0.7	PP070 Submissions	PP071	Written Submissions		Review correspondence from K. Elson re EGI retail activities.	
561 Βογ 561 Βογ 561 Βογ 561 Βογ 561 Βογ	yle, Colm yle, Colm yle, Colm yle, Colm	061604 061604 061604	000050	1.5 0.7	PP070 Submissions	PP071	Written Submissions		activities.	
561 Βογ 561 Βογ 561 Βογ 561 Βογ	yle, Colm yle, Colm yle, Colm	061604 061604	000050	0.7		_		698405480		Preparation of Issues
561 Βογ 561 Βογ 561 Βογ 561 Βογ	yle, Colm yle, Colm yle, Colm	061604 061604	000050	0.7		_		698405480	Research and draft letter response to issues in	Preparation of Issues
561 Βογ 561 Βογ 561 Βογ	yle, Colm yle, Colm	061604			PP090 Communication	PP092	Mith Other Derti			
561 Βογ 561 Βογ 561 Βογ	yle, Colm yle, Colm	061604			PP090 Communication	PP092	With Other Derti		Phase 2 of COS proceeding.	List Submission
561 Boy 561 Boy	yle, Colm		000050	0.2			With Other Parties	698405480	Attendance on Phase 2 matters including expert	Preparation of
561 Boy 561 Boy	yle, Colm		000050	0.2					evidence and coordinating with other interveners.	Intervener Evidence
561 Boy 561 Boy	yle, Colm		000050	0.2		00074		600 405 400		D ()
561 Boy		061604			PP070 Submissions	PP0/1	Written Submissions	698405480	Review Enbridge submissions on issues list.	Preparation of Issues
561 Boy		061604	000050	0.1	PP090 Communication	PP092	With Other Parties	698405480	Deview correspondence from ECI to moving	List Submission Other attendance
	vla Colm		000050	0.1	PP090 Communication	PP092	with Other Parties	698405480	Review correspondence from EGI re moving	Other attendance
		061604	000050	0.2	PP080 Other Attendance	PP081	Other Attendance	698405480	Enbridge Sustain to affiliate. Review Environmental Defence filing.	Other attendance
561 Roy	yie, collin	001004	000030	0.5	FF000 Other Attenuance	FFUOL	Other Attendance	050405400	Keview Litvironmental Defence ming.	Other attenuance
	yle, Colm	061604	000050	0.4	PP120 Decision	PP121	Review	698472159	Review OEB procedural order; email	Technical Conference
	, -,								correspondence to coordinate same with B. Yauch.	Preparation
561 Boy	yle, Colm	061604	000050	0.6	PP090 Communication	PP091	With Client	698472159	Phone call with B. Yauch to discuss next steps in	Technical Conference
									proceeding.	Preparation
561 Boy	yle, Colm	061604	000050	0.1	PP090 Communication	PP092	With Other Parties	698472159	Review evidence proposal from OEB Staff.	Read and research
										application and
										evidence
561 Boy	yle, Colm	061604	000050	2.2	PP010 Review Application	PP011	Review Application	698472159	Review and analysis of storage issues in updated	Read and research
					and Evidence		and Evidence		evidence for Phase 2 of Cost of Service Proceeding;	application and
									email summary of evidence to APPrO members.	evidence
561 Boy	yle, Colm	061604	000050	0.3	PP090 Communication	PP091	With Client	698472159	•	Technical Conference
							<u>eul 1 1</u>		•	Preparation
561 Boy	yle, Colm	061604	000050	0.1	PP080 Other Attendance	PP081	Other Attendance	698434468	•	Technical Conference
FC4 D	ula Calua	001004	000050	0.0	DD000 Other Attendence	00001		600424460	· ·	Preparation
561 Boy	yie, Colm	061604	000050	0.9	PP080 Other Attendance	PP081	Other Attendance	698434468		Technical Conference
									•	Preparation
									•	
									comerence.	
561 Boy	vle Colm	061604	000050	65	PP080 Other Attendance	PP081	Other Attendance	698434468	Attendance at technical conference for Phase 2	Technical Conference
501 001	jie, contr	001004	000000	0.5	The other Attendance	11001		00000000000	Attendance at technical concrete for Flase 2.	Attendance
561 Boy	vle. Colm	061604	000050	0.9	PP080 Other Attendance	PP081	Other Attendance	698434468	Phone call with B. Yauch and APPrO re strategy for	Technical Conference
_0,	, -,								technical conference.	Follow-Up
561 Boy	yle, Colm	061604	000050	4.3	PP080 Other Attendance	PP081	Other Attendance	698434468	Attendance at technical conference.	Technical Conference
- /										Attendance
561 Boy	yle, Colm	061604	000050	10	PP080 Other Attendance	PP081	Other Attendance	698434468	Attendance at technical conference and prepare	Technical Conference
556 556 556	51 Bo 51 Bo 51 Bo 51 Bo 51 Bo 51 Bo	51 Boyle, Colm 51 Boyle, Colm 51 Boyle, Colm 51 Boyle, Colm 51 Boyle, Colm 51 Boyle, Colm	51 Boyle, Colm 061604 51 Boyle, Colm 061604	51 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 51 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050	51 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.3 51 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.1 51 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.1 51 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.9 51 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 6.5 51 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.9 51 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.9 51 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 4.3	and Evidence and Evidence Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.3 PP090 Communication Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.1 PP080 Other Attendance Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.9 PP080 Other Attendance Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 6.5 PP080 Other Attendance Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.9 PP080 Other Attendance Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 4.3 PP080 Other Attendance	and Evidence and Evidence Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.3 PP090 Communication PP091 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.1 PP080 Other Attendance PP081 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.9 PP080 Other Attendance PP081 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 6.5 PP080 Other Attendance PP081 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.9 PP080 Other Attendance PP081 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.9 PP080 Other Attendance PP081 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 4.3 PP080 Other Attendance PP081	and Evidenceand Evidenceand Evidence31Boyle, Colm0616040000500.3PP090CommunicationPP091With Client31Boyle, Colm0616040000500.1PP080Other AttendancePP081Other Attendance31Boyle, Colm0616040000500.9PP080Other AttendancePP081Other Attendance31Boyle, Colm0616040000500.9PP080Other AttendancePP081Other Attendance31Boyle, Colm0616040000506.5PP080Other AttendancePP081Other Attendance31Boyle, Colm0616040000500.9PP080Other AttendancePP081Other Attendance31Boyle, Colm0616040000500.9PP080Other AttendancePP081Other Attendance31Boyle, Colm0616040000504.3PP080Other AttendancePP081Other Attendance32Boyle, Colm0616040000504.3PP080Other AttendancePP081Other Attendance	and Evidenceand Evidenceand Evidence31Boyle, Colm0616040000500.3PP090CommunicationPP091With Client69847215931Boyle, Colm0616040000500.1PP080Other AttendancePP081Other Attendance69843446831Boyle, Colm0616040000500.9PP080Other AttendancePP081Other Attendance69843446831Boyle, Colm0616040000500.9PP080Other AttendancePP081Other Attendance69843446831Boyle, Colm0616040000506.5PP080Other AttendancePP081Other Attendance69843446831Boyle, Colm0616040000500.9PP080Other AttendancePP081Other Attendance69843446831Boyle, Colm0616040000500.9PP080Other AttendancePP081Other Attendance69843446831Boyle, Colm0616040000504.3PP080Other AttendancePP081Other Attendance69843446831Boyle, Colm0616040000504.3PP080Other AttendancePP081Other Attendance69843446832Boyle, Colm0616040000504.3PP080Other AttendancePP081Other Attendance698434468	and Evidenceand Evidenceand Evidenceevidenceevidence for Phase 2 of Cost of Service Proceeding; email summary of evidence to APPrO members.51Boyle, Colm0616040000500.3PP090CommunicationPP091With Client698472159Update memorandum to client on current status and next steps.51Boyle, Colm0616040000500.1PP080Other AttendancePP081Other Attendance698434468Email correspondence with B. Yauch re preparations for technical conference.51Boyle, Colm0616040000500.9PP080Other AttendancePP081Other Attendance698434468Phone call with B. Yauch re technical conference; review email and letter correspondence re same; email to OEB enclosing time estimate for technical conference; begin preparing for technical conference.PP081Other Attendance698434468Attendance at technical conference for Phase 2.51Boyle, Colm0616040000506.5PP080Other AttendancePP081Other Attendance698434468Attendance at technical conference for Phase 2.51Boyle, Colm0616040000500.9PP080Other AttendancePP081Other Attendance698434468Phone call with B. Yauch and APPrO re strategy for technical conference.51Boyle, Colm0616040000500.9PP080Other AttendancePP081Other Attendance698434468Attendance at technical conference.51Boyle, Colm0616040000500.9PP080 <t< td=""></t<>

7/26/2024	32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	0.2	PP080	Other Attendance	PP081	Other Attendance	698434468	Email to APPrO outlining key issues from Phase 2 technical conference for discussion.	Technical Conference Follow-Up
7/20/2024	32561	Davila Calm	061604	000050	0.3	00000	Other Attendance	PP081	Other Attendance	698434468	Phone call with B. Yauch re technical conference	I
7/29/2024	52501	Boyle, Colm	001004	000050	0.5	PP060	Other Attenuance	PPU01	Other Attenuance	090454400		Technical Conference
7/25/2024	225.64	Davida Calar	061604	000050	2	00000		00001		600424460	and strategy for debrief call.	Follow-Up
7/25/2024	32561		061604	000050	3			PP081	Other Attendance	698434468	Attendance at technical conference.	Technical Conference Attendance
7/30/2024	32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	0.9	PP080	Other Attendance	PP081	Other Attendance	698434468	Prepare for and attendance on a conference call	Technical Conference
											with APPrO to discuss technical conference and	Follow-Up
											strategy for settlement conference.	
7/30/2024	25204	Vellone,	061604	000050	0.5	PP050	Settlement	PP051	Preparation for	698434468	Attend client and interested member briefing re	Preparation for
		John					Conference / ADR		Settlement		Phase 2 of Enbridge rate application; establish	Settlement Conference
									Conference		process to obtain instructions from members on	
											settlement parameters in advance of the settlement	
											conference.	
8/2/2024	32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	0.5	PP020	Discovery	PP022	Review	698434468	Review undertaking responses from Enbridge.	Review Interrogatory
-, , -		- / - /							Interrogatory			Responses
									Responses			
6/6/2024	25204	Vellone,	061604	000050	0.5	PP010	Review Application	PP011	Review Application	698472159	Attend call with D. Butters on Phase 2 of Enbridge	Preparation for
		John					and Evidence		and Evidence		COS to obtain client input on issues of interest to	Settlement Conference
											APPrO members and approach to Phase 2.	
8/15/2024	32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	0.2	PP100	Motions	PP102	Prepare	698434468	Attendance on email correspondence with client	Other attendance
									Submissions on the		regarding HRAI motion.	
									Motion(s)			
8/19/2024	32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	0.1	PP050	Settlement	PP051	Preparation for	698434468	Email correspondence with B. Yauch re settlement	Preparation for
							Conference / ADR		Settlement		conference.	Settlement Conference
									Conference			
8/16/2024	32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	0.4	PP050	Settlement	PP051	Preparation for	698434468	Review summary slides prepared by B. Yauch and	Preparation for
							Conference / ADR		Settlement		comments on same for positions at settlement	Settlement Conference
									Conference		conference.	
6/19/2024	32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	1.2	PP020	Discovery	PP021	Preparation of	698434468	Attendance on reviewing IRs of other parties and	Preparation of
									Interrogatories		finalize APPrO and file IRs.	Interrogatories
7/9/2024	32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	0.7	PP020	Discovery	PP022	Review	698434468	Review IR responses from EGI. Email	Review Interrogatory
							,		Interrogatory		correspondence with B. Yauch regarding same.	Responses
									Responses			
9/10/2024	32561	Bovle. Colm	061604	000050	0.7	PP050	Settlement	PP053	Preparation of	698448266	Phone call with B. Yauch re settlement conference;	Preparation for
-, -, -		- / - /					Conference / ADR		Settlement Proposal		conference call with J. Vellone, B. Yauch and C.	Settlement Conference
							,,				Anderson re position at settlement conference.	
9/13/2024	32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	21	PP050	Settlement	PP052	Attendance at	698448266	Attendance at Phase 2 settlement conference.	Attendance at
5, 13, 2024	52501	Soyie, contr	501004	000000			Conference / ADR	11002	Settlement	555 10200		Settlement Conference
							concrence / ADK		Conference			
9/16/2024	32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	0.4	PPOSO	Settlement	PP051	Preparation for	698448266	Attendance on conference call to discuss settlement	Prenaration of
5, 10, 2024	32301	boyie, colli	001004	000000	0.4	11050	Conference / ADR	11031	Settlement	050440200	conference and settlement proposal.	Settlement Proposal
							conterence / ADR		Conference		comerence and settlement proposal.	Settlement Proposal
9/17/2024	32561	Roylo Colm	061604	000050	0.2	DDOEO	Settlement			600110760	Phone call with C. Anderson and P. Vaush to discuss	Proparation of
9/1//2024	32301	Boyle, Colm	001004	000050	0.2	PP050		PP051		698448266	Phone call with C. Anderson and B. Yauch to discuss	1
							Conference / ADR		Settlement		settlement.	Settlement Proposal
									Conference			

9/3/2024	32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	1	PP050	Settlement	PP051	Preparation for	698448266	Attendance on conference call with client to discuss Preparation of	
							Conference / ADR		Settlement		positions on upcoming settlement conference for	Settlement Proposal
									Conference		Phase 2.	
9/4/2024	32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	0.8	PP050	Settlement	PP051	Preparation for	698463361	Attendance on conference call to obtain	Preparation of
							Conference / ADR		Settlement		instructions for settlement conference.	Settlement Proposal
									Conference			
12/6/2024	32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	0.1	PP140	Procedural	PP148	Review procedural	698485053	Review Procedural Order No. 9.	Other attendance
									documents			

John Vellone

CASE	COST CLAIM	INTERVENOR NAME	PARTICIPANT
EB-2024-0111: Rates:	EB-2024-0111 : 1 : Colm	Boyle, Colm; +1 (416)	CLAIM STATUS
Distribution: Enbridge Gas Inc.	Boyle	367-7273 cboyle@blg.com	Submitted
FILING PARTICIPANT	NEW	NON-FILING	NON-FILING
	PARTICIPANT	PARTICIPANT F. NAME	PARTICIPANT L. NAME
	Yes	John	Vellone
SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE* Legal Counsel	YEAR CALLED TO BAR* 2008	COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF RELEVANT EXPERIENCE* 16	HOURLY RATE 303
HST RATE CHARGED* 13.00	CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST) CV Required	LAST CV DATE	OVERRIDE HOURLY RATE No
HST NUMBER	HEARINGS	CONSULTATIONS	DISBURSEMENTS
125298802RT0001	Yes	No	No

HEARINGS

Hearings Hours 1.60	Hearings Subtotal (\$) 484.80		Hearings Total 63.02	Tax (\$)		n gs Total (\$) 547.82
<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly</u> <u>Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST</u> Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
DISCOVERY Read and Research Application Evidence	and	303		13.00		
Preparation of Interrogatories		303		13.00		
Review Interrogatory Responses	S	303		13.00		
Technical Conference Preparation	on 0.60	303	181.80	13.00	23.63	205.43
Technical Conference Attendance	ce	303		13.00		
Technical Conference Follow-up	,	303		13.00		
Subtotal of DISCOVERY	0.60		181.80		23.63	205.43
PROCEDURAL Preparation of Issues List Subm	ission	303		13.00		
Attendance at Issues List Confe	rence	303		13.00		
Preparation for a Confidentiality	Request	303		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on Confide	entiality	303		13.00		
Preparation of Motion(s) Materia	lls	303		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Mo	tion(s)	303		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion	n(s)	303		13.00		
Review Procedural Documents		303		13.00		

CC_Participant_Combined.rpt - last Update 20230601

Name	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly</u> <u>Rate</u>	Sub Total	<u>HST</u> Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Subtotal of PROCEDURAL	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
INTERVENOR EVIDENCE Preparation of Intervenor Evidence		303		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		303		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE	0.00	303	0.00	13.00	0.00	0.00
SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE Preparation for Settlement Conference	1.00	303	303.00	13.00	39.39	342.39
Attendance at Settlement Conference		303		13.00		0.2.00
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		303		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		303		13.00		
Subtotal of SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE WRITTEN ARGUMENT	1.00		303.00		39.39	342.39
Written Submissions		303		13.00		
Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
ORAL ARGUMENT Preparation for Oral Hearing		303		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		303		13.00		
Oral Submissions		303		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		303		13.00		
Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
DECISION Review Decision		303		13.00		
Review Rate/Accounting Order		303		13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order		303		13.00		
Subtotal of DECISION	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
OTHER Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor Conferences) Subtotal of OTHER	0.00	303	0.00	13.00	0.00	0.00
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES Total Service Provider Fees	1.60		484.80		63.02	547.82
Attachments						
<u>Attachment</u> BLG - JV and CPB - Phase 2.pdf	Document Ty Time Docket a		<u>lr</u>	nport Mes	<u>ssage</u>	
Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements	s Attachment	te				

Attachment BLG - JV and CPB - Phase 2.pdf Document Type Time Docket and Invoice <u>Claim Type</u> Hearings

25204 32561 32561 32561	Vellone, John Boyle, Colm Boyle, Colm	061604 061604		0.6	PP090 Communication	PP091	With Client	698370216	Discussion of Phase 2.	Technical conference
32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050							
32561		061604	000050							preparation
	Boyle Colm		000050	0.1	PP090 Communication	PP092	With Other Parties	698381934	Review letter correspondence from Environmental	Other attendance
	Boyle Colm								Defence re meter charges.	
22561	boyle, com	061604	000050	0.2	PP090 Communication	PP092	With Other Parties	698381934	Review correspondence from K. Elson re EGI retail	Other attendance
22561									activities.	
52501	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	1.5	PP070 Submissions	PP071	Written Submissions	698405480	Research and draft letter response to issues in	Preparation of Issues
									Phase 2 of COS proceeding.	List Submission
32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	0.7	PP090 Communication	PP092	With Other Parties	698405480	Attendance on Phase 2 matters including expert	Preparation of
									evidence and coordinating with other interveners.	Intervener Evidence
225.64		064604	000050	0.0		00074		600 405 400		D (1
32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	0.2	PP070 Submissions	PP071	Written Submissions	698405480	Review Endridge submissions on issues list.	Preparation of Issues
225.01	Davila Calm	001004	000050	0.1	DD000 Communication	0000	With Other Dertica	C0040F400	Deview entropy and an as from FCI to maying	List Submission Other attendance
32301	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	0.1	PP090 Communication	PP092	with Other Parties	698405480		Other attendance
22561	Poulo Colm	061604	000050	0.2	PP090 Other Attendance	00091	Other Attendance	609105190	~	Other attendance
52501	Boyle, Collin	001004	000050	0.5	PP080 Other Attendance	PP001	Other Attendance	096405460	Review Environmental Defence ming.	Other attenuance
32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	0.4	PP120 Decision	PP121	Review	698472159	Review OFB procedural order: email	Technical Conference
	,-,								•	Preparation
										reputation
32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	0.6	PP090 Communication	PP091	With Client	698472159	Phone call with B. Yauch to discuss next steps in	Technical Conference
									proceeding.	Preparation
32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	0.1	PP090 Communication	PP092	With Other Parties	698472159	Review evidence proposal from OEB Staff.	Read and research
										application and
										evidence
32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	2.2	PP010 Review Application	n PP011	Review Application	698472159	Review and analysis of storage issues in updated	Read and research
					and Evidence		and Evidence		evidence for Phase 2 of Cost of Service Proceeding;	application and
									email summary of evidence to APPrO members.	evidence
32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	0.3	PP090 Communication	PP091	With Client	698472159		Technical Conference
							<u>au</u>		•	Preparation
32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	0.1	PP080 Other Attendance	PP081	Other Attendance	698434468	•	Technical Conference
225.64	Davida, Calua	061604	000050	0.0	DD000 Others Attendence	00001		600424460	• •	Preparation
32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	0.9	PP080 Other Attendance	PP081	Other Attendance	698434468		Technical Conference
									•	Preparation
									0	
									comerence.	
32561	Boyle Colm	061604	000050	6.5	PP080 Other Attendance	PP081	Other Attendance	698434468	Attendance at technical conference for Phase 2	Technical Conference
52501	boyic, com	001004	000050	0.5		11001	other Attendance	050151100		Attendance
32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	0.9	PP080 Other Attendance	PP081	Other Attendance	698434468	Phone call with B. Yauch and APPrO re strategy for	Technical Conference
	, ,								technical conference.	Follow-Up
32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	4.3	PP080 Other Attendance	PP081	Other Attendance	698434468	Attendance at technical conference.	Technical Conference
										Attendance
32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	10	PP080 Other Attendance	PP081	Other Attendance	698434468	Attendance at technical conference and prepare	Technical Conference
									questions for Panel 4 re unregulated storage.	Attendance
	32561 32561 32561 32561 32561 32561 32561	32561Boyle, Colm32561Boyle, Colm	32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604	32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050	32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.1 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.3 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.4 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.4 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.4 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.1 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.1 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.3 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.3 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.1 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.9 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 6.5 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.9 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.9 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604	32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.1 PP090 Communication 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.3 PP080 Other Attendance 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.4 PP120 Decision 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.6 PP090 Communication 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.1 PP090 Communication 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.1 PP090 Communication 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 2.2 PP010 Review Application and Evidence 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.1 PP080 Other Attendance 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.9 PP080 Other Attendance 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.9 PP080 Other Attendance 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604	32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.1 PP090 Communication PP092 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.3 PP080 Other Attendance PP081 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.4 PP120 Decision PP121 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.6 PP090 Communication PP091 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.1 PP090 Communication PP091 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.1 PP090 Communication PP092 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 2.2 PP010 Review Application PP011 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.3 PP090 Communication PP091 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.9 PP080 Other Attendance PP081 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604	322561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.1 PP090 Communication PP092 With Other Parties 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.3 PP080 Other Attendance PP081 Other Attendance 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.4 PP120 Decision PP121 Review 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.6 PP090 Communication PP091 With Client 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.1 PP090 Communication PP091 With Client 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.1 PP090 Communication PP091 Review Application and Evidence 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.3 PP090 Communication PP091 With Client 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.1 PP080 Other Attendance PP081 Other Attendance 32561 <t< td=""><td>32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.1 PP090 Communication PP092 With Other Parties 698405480 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.3 PP080 Other Attendance PP081 Other Attendance 698405480 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.4 PP120 Decision PP121 Review 698472159 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.4 PP090 Communication PP091 With Other Parties 698472159 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.1 PP090 Communication PP091 With Other Parties 698472159 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.2 PP010 Review Application and Evidence PP091 With Client 698472159 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.1 PP080 Communication PP081 Other Attendance 698434468 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604</td><td>32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.2 PP070 Submissions PP071 Written Submissions 698405480 Review Enbridge submissions on issues list. 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.1 PP080 Other Attendance 698405480 Review Correspondence from EGI re moving Enbridge Submission to affiliate. 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.4 PP120 Decision PP121 Review 698472159 Review CEB procedural order; email correspondence to coordinate same with B. Yauch. 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.4 PP120 Decision PP121 Review 698472159 Review CEB procedural order; email correspondence to coordinate same with B. Yauch. 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.1 PP090 Communication PP091 With Other Parties 698472159 Review evidence proposal from OEB Staff. 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.3 PP090 Communication PP011 Review Application and Evidence 698472159 Review and analysis of storage issues in upd</td></t<>	32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.1 PP090 Communication PP092 With Other Parties 698405480 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.3 PP080 Other Attendance PP081 Other Attendance 698405480 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.4 PP120 Decision PP121 Review 698472159 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.4 PP090 Communication PP091 With Other Parties 698472159 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.1 PP090 Communication PP091 With Other Parties 698472159 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.2 PP010 Review Application and Evidence PP091 With Client 698472159 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.1 PP080 Communication PP081 Other Attendance 698434468 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604	32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.2 PP070 Submissions PP071 Written Submissions 698405480 Review Enbridge submissions on issues list. 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.1 PP080 Other Attendance 698405480 Review Correspondence from EGI re moving Enbridge Submission to affiliate. 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.4 PP120 Decision PP121 Review 698472159 Review CEB procedural order; email correspondence to coordinate same with B. Yauch. 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.4 PP120 Decision PP121 Review 698472159 Review CEB procedural order; email correspondence to coordinate same with B. Yauch. 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.1 PP090 Communication PP091 With Other Parties 698472159 Review evidence proposal from OEB Staff. 32561 Boyle, Colm 061604 000050 0.3 PP090 Communication PP011 Review Application and Evidence 698472159 Review and analysis of storage issues in upd

7/26/2024	32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	0.2	PP080	Other Attendance	PP081	Other Attendance	698434468	Email to APPrO outlining key issues from Phase 2 technical conference for discussion.	Technical Conference Follow-Up
7/20/2024	32561	Davila Calm	061604	000050	0.3	00000	Other Attendance	PP081	Other Attendance	698434468	Phone call with B. Yauch re technical conference	I
7/29/2024	52501	Boyle, Colm	001004	000050	0.5	PP060	Other Attenuance	PPU01	Other Attenuance	090454400		Technical Conference
7/25/2024	225.64	Davida Calua	061604	000050	2	00000		00001		600424460	and strategy for debrief call.	Follow-Up
7/25/2024	32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	3			PP081	Other Attendance	698434468	Attendance at technical conference.	Technical Conference Attendance
7/30/2024	32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	0.9	PP080	Other Attendance	PP081	Other Attendance	698434468	Prepare for and attendance on a conference call	Technical Conference
											with APPrO to discuss technical conference and	Follow-Up
											strategy for settlement conference.	
7/30/2024	25204	Vellone,	061604	000050	0.5	PP050	Settlement	PP051	Preparation for	698434468	Attend client and interested member briefing re	Preparation for
		John					Conference / ADR		Settlement		Phase 2 of Enbridge rate application; establish	Settlement Conference
									Conference		process to obtain instructions from members on	
											settlement parameters in advance of the settlement	
											conference.	
8/2/2024	32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	0.5	PP020	Discovery	PP022	Review	698434468	Review undertaking responses from Enbridge.	Review Interrogatory
-, , -		-, -,							Interrogatory			Responses
									Responses			
6/6/2024	25204	Vellone,	061604	000050	0.5	PP010	Review Application	PP011	Review Application	698472159	Attend call with D. Butters on Phase 2 of Enbridge	Preparation for
		John					and Evidence		and Evidence		COS to obtain client input on issues of interest to	Settlement Conference
											APPrO members and approach to Phase 2.	
8/15/2024	32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	0.2	PP100	Motions	PP102	Prepare	698434468	Attendance on email correspondence with client	Other attendance
									Submissions on the		regarding HRAI motion.	
									Motion(s)			
8/19/2024	32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	0.1	PP050	Settlement	PP051	Preparation for	698434468	Email correspondence with B. Yauch re settlement	Preparation for
							Conference / ADR		Settlement		conference.	Settlement Conference
									Conference			
8/16/2024	32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	0.4	PP050	Settlement	PP051	Preparation for	698434468	Review summary slides prepared by B. Yauch and	Preparation for
							Conference / ADR		Settlement		comments on same for positions at settlement	Settlement Conference
									Conference		conference.	
6/19/2024	32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	1.2	PP020	Discovery	PP021	Preparation of	698434468	Attendance on reviewing IRs of other parties and	Preparation of
									Interrogatories		finalize APPrO and file IRs.	Interrogatories
7/9/2024	32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	0.7	PP020	Discovery	PP022	Review	698434468	Review IR responses from EGI. Email	Review Interrogatory
							,		Interrogatory		correspondence with B. Yauch regarding same.	Responses
									Responses			
9/10/2024	32561	Bovle. Colm	061604	000050	0.7	PP050	Settlement	PP053	Preparation of	698448266	Phone call with B. Yauch re settlement conference;	Preparation for
-, -, -		-,-,					Conference / ADR		Settlement Proposal		conference call with J. Vellone, B. Yauch and C.	Settlement Conference
							,,				Anderson re position at settlement conference.	
9/13/2024	32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	21	PP050	Settlement	PP052	Attendance at	698448266	Attendance at Phase 2 settlement conference.	Attendance at
5, 13, 2024	52501	Sorre, contra	501004	000000			Conference / ADR	11002	Settlement	555 10200		Settlement Conference
							concrence / ADK		Conference			
9/16/2024	32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	0.4	PPOSO	Settlement	PP051	Preparation for	698448266	Attendance on conference call to discuss settlement	Prenaration of
5, 10, 2024	32301	boyie, collin	001004	000000	0.4	11050	Conference / ADR	11031	Settlement	050440200	conference and settlement proposal.	Settlement Proposal
							conterence / ADR		Conference		comerence and settlement proposal.	Settlement Proposal
9/17/2024	32561	Royla Calm	061604	000050	0.2	DDOEO	Settlement			600110760	Phone call with C. Anderson and P. Vauch to discuss	Proparation of
9/1//2024	32301	Boyle, Colm	001004	000050	0.2	PP050		PP051		698448266	Phone call with C. Anderson and B. Yauch to discuss	1
							Conference / ADR		Settlement		settlement.	Settlement Proposal
									Conference			

9/3/2024	32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	1	PP050	Settlement	PP051	Preparation for	698448266	Attendance on conference call with client to discuss Preparation of	
							Conference / ADR		Settlement		positions on upcoming settlement conference for	Settlement Proposal
									Conference		Phase 2.	
9/4/2024	32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	0.8	PP050	Settlement	PP051	Preparation for	698463361	Attendance on conference call to obtain	Preparation of
							Conference / ADR		Settlement		instructions for settlement conference.	Settlement Proposal
									Conference			
12/6/2024	32561	Boyle, Colm	061604	000050	0.1	PP140	Procedural	PP148	Review procedural	698485053	Review Procedural Order No. 9.	Other attendance
									documents			