EB-2024-0200 : 1 : Maria Ciciretto

COST CLAIM NUMBER 2634	SUBMISSION DEADLINE DATE April 08, 2025	CLAIM STATUS Approved by Finance
EB# EB-2024-0200: Facilities: Leave to Construct (New): Enbridge Gas Inc.	OTHER EB#S	PHASE #* 1
INTERVENOR Ciciretto, Maria; +1 (416) 369-7335 maria.ciciretto@gowlingwlg.com	INTERVENOR COMPANY* Industrial Gas Users Association, Ottawa: Corporation	INTERVENOR TYPE Full Registrant
HST RATE ONTARIO 13.00	EXCHANGE RATE	COUNTRY Canada
HST NUMBER 89659 3323 RT0001	LATE SUBMISSION ALLOWED	EXTENSION DEADLINE DATE

PARTICIPANTS

New	Non-Filing Participant First, Last Name	Filing Participant	Total (\$)	Total Hours	Participant Claim Status
No	,	Mondrow, lan; +1 (416) 369-4670 ian.mondrow@gowlingwlg.c om	7,868.19	21.10	Submitted

ATTACHMENTS

Attachment	Document Type	Import Message
IGUA EB-2024-0200 Cost Claim 040820251542.pdf		
IGUA EB-2024-0200 Cost Claim 04082025.pdf		This is the revised report minus duplicate pages.
TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT/OTHER FEES 6,963.00	TOTAL DISBURSEMEN 0.00	TS TOTAL HST 905.19
TOTAL CLAIM 7,868.19	TOTAL AMOUNT AWARE	DED
TOTAL HOURS CLAIMED 21.10	TOTAL HOURS DISALLOV	WED
REASON FOR DISALLOWANCE	REASON FOR DISALLOWANCE - 2	REASON FOR DISALLOWANCE - 3
MAKE CHEQUE PAYABLE TO Industrial Gas Users Association		
SEND PAYMENT TO ADDRESS 851 Industrial Avenue, P.O. Box 30, Ottawa, Ontario k	<1G 4L3	ATTENTION Jacob Irving, President

SUBMIT SECTION

I am a representative of the Party. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim. The costs incurred and time spent are directly related to the Party's participation in the OEB Process referred to above.

This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in section 6.05 and 6.09 of the OEB's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

The information (fees and disbursements) filed in this cost claim is complete and accurate and in accordance with the OEB's Practice Direction for Cost Awards and Appendix A, the Cost Awards Tariff.

SUBMITTED BY lan Mondrow DATE SUBMITTED April 08, 2025

lan Mondrow

CASE EB-2024-0200: Facilities: Leave to Construct (New): Enbridge Gas Inc.	COST CLAIM EB-2024-0200 : 1 : Maria Ciciretto	INTERVENOR NAME Ciciretto, Maria; +1 (416) 369-7335 maria.ciciretto@gowlingwlg.c om	PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS Submitted
FILING PARTICIPANT Mondrow, lan; +1 (416) 369-4670 ian.mondrow@gowlingwlg.com	NEW PARTICIPANT No	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME
SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE* Legal Counsel	YEAR CALLED TO BAR* 1991	COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF RELEVANT EXPERIENCE* 34	HOURLY RATE 330
HST RATE CHARGED* 13.00	CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST) CV Required	LAST CV DATE	OVERRIDE HOURLY RATE No
HST NUMBER	HEARINGS	CONSULTATIONS	DISBURSEMENTS

No

No

Yes

HEARINGS

89659 3323 RT0001

Неа	arings Hours 21.10	Hearings Subtotal (\$) 6,963.00		Hearings Total 905.19	Tax (\$)	Hea	rings Total (\$) 7,868.19
	Name	<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST</u> Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
DISC	OVERY						
	Read and Research Application a Evidence	nd 10.00	330	3,300.00	13.00	429.00	3,729.00
	Preparation of Interrogatories		330		13.00		
	Review Interrogatory Responses		330		13.00		
	Technical Conference Preparation	0.70	330	231.00	13.00	30.03	261.03
	Technical Conference Attendance	0.20	330	66.00	13.00	8.58	74.58
	Technical Conference Follow-up	1.50	330	495.00	13.00	64.35	559.35
	Subtotal of DISCOVERY	12.40	330	4,092.00		531.96	4,623.96
PROC	CEDURAL						
	Preparation of Issues List Submis	sion	330		13.00		
	Attendance at Issues List Conference	ence	330		13.00		
	Preparation for a Confidentiality R	equest	330		13.00		
	Prepare Submissions on Confider	ntiality	330		13.00		
	Preparation of Motion(s) Materials	s 1.60	330	528.00	13.00	68.64	596.64
	Prepare Submissions on the Moti	on(s)	330		13.00		
	Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)	330		13.00		
	Review Procedural Documents	2.00	330	660.00	13.00	85.80	745.80

CC_Participant_Combined.rpt - last Update 20230601

	Name	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly</u> <u>Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST</u> Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
	Subtotal of PROCEDURAL	3.60	330	1,188.00		154.44	1,342.44
INTE	RVENOR EVIDENCE Preparation of Intervenor Evidence		330		13.00		
	Interrogatory Responses		330		13.00		
	Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE	0.00	330 330	0.00	13.00	0.00	0.00
SETT							
0L11	Preparation for Settlement Conference		330		13.00		
	Attendance at Settlement Conference		330		13.00		
	Preparation of Settlement Proposal		330		13.00		
	Attendance at Presentation to Panel		330		13.00		
WDIT	Subtotal of SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE TEN ARGUMENT	0.00	330	0.00		0.00	0.00
VVINI	Written Submissions	3.90	330	1,287.00	13.00	167.31	1,454.31
	Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT	3.90	330	1,287.00		167.31	1,454.31
ORAI	L ARGUMENT Preparation for Oral Hearing		330		13.00		
	Attendance at Oral Hearing		330		13.00		
	Oral Submissions		330		13.00		
	Attendance at Oral Submissions		330		13.00		
	Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT	0.00	330	0.00		0.00	0.00
DECI						- / / 2	
	Review Decision	1.20	330	396.00	13.00	51.48	447.48
	Review Rate/Accounting Order		330		13.00		
	Prepare Submission on Rate Order		330		13.00		
	Subtotal of DECISION	1.20	330	396.00		51.48	447.48
OTHE	ER Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor Conferences)		330		13.00		
	Subtotal of OTHER	0.00	330	0.00		0.00	0.00
ΤΟΤΑ	L SERVICE PROVIDER FEES Total Service Provider Fees	21.10		6,963.00		905.19	7,868.19

Attachment	Document Type	Import Message
IGUA_EB-2024-0200_St Laurent_Mondrow_Time_Docket_04082025. odf	Time Docket	<u>import message</u>
OEB Cost Claim - Table of Revised Activities.pdf	Other	We are filing with this claim two additional documents; 1. A copy of the Board's Table of Revised Activities with the addition of the acronyms that we used to code the individual time entries supporting the claim.
Categories_EB-2024-0200_St Laurent.pdf	Other	We are filing with this claim two additional documents; . 2. An excel working spreadsheet summarizing, by invoice, the hours allocated to various activity categories and the totals input into the Board's cost claim template.
Attachments General Attachments		
<u>Attachment</u> OEB Cost Claim - Table of Revised Activities.pdf	<u>Document Type</u> Other	Import Message We are filing with this claim two additional documents; 1. A copy of the Board's Table of Revised Activities with the addition of the acronyms that we used to code the individual time entries supporting the claim.
Categories_EB-2024-0200_St Laurent.pdf	Other	We are filing with this claim two additional documents; 2. An excel working spreadsheet summarizing, by invoice, the hours allocated to various activity categories and the totals input into the Board's cost claim template.
IGUA EB-2024-0200 St	Time Docket	tompiato.

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

3 -, ,			
<u>Attachment</u> IGUA_EB-2024-0200_St Laurent_Mondrow_Time_Docket_04082025 .pdf	<u>Document Type</u> Time Docket	<u>Claim Type</u> Hearings	<u>Import Message</u>
OEB Cost Claim - Table of Revised Activities.pdf	Other	Hearings	We are filing with this claim two additional documents; 1. A copy of the Board's Table of Revised Activities with the addition of the acronyms that we used to code the individual time entries supporting the claim.
Categories_EB-2024-0200_St Laurent.pdf	Other	Hearings	We are filing with this claim two additional documents; . 2. An excel working spreadsheet summarizing, by invoice, the hours allocated to various activity categories and the totals input into the Board's cost claim template.



August 29, 2024 INVOICE: 20331948

Industrial Gas Users Association Our Matter: T1036623 2024 EGI St. Laurent LTC (EB-2024-0200) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-11)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
RAE	2024-07-22	0.20	lan Mondrow	Retrieve application materials, instruct file opening and diarize intervention date;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, Ian		0.20
	Total	0.20



September 30, 2024 INVOICE: 20351194

Industrial Gas Users Association Our Matter: T1036623 2024 EGI St. Laurent LTC (EB-2024-0200) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-11)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
RAE	2024-08-08	0.90	Ian Mondrow	Commence review of application materials;
PREP-MOT-MAT	2024-08-08	0.40	Ian Mondrow	Review draft intervention form and provide detailed instructions to finalize;
RAE	2024-08-08	0.60	Ian Mondrow	Initial briefing to IGUA on application scope and content and recommendation for intervention focus;
RAE	2024-08-17	1.50	Ian Mondrow	Continue review of prefiled materials;
RAE	2024-08-18	2.00	Ian Mondrow	Continue review of prefiled evidence;
RAE	2024-08-18	0.80	Ian Mondrow	Note to IGUA regarding initial views on application, including Energy Transition topic and related evidence;
RAE	2024-08-19	1.10	Ian Mondrow	Continue review of prefiled evidence; conference with IGUA regarding early record and interim positions;
RAE	2024-08-20	0.40	Ian Mondrow	Complete review of prefiled evidence;
RAE	2024-08-20	0.70	Ian Mondrow	Further briefing note on the application and IGUA's working position thereon for IGUA members;
RPD	2024-08-22	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Review PO No. 1; Review P. Probe letter regarding materials to be used;
PREP-MOT-MAT		0.40	lan Mondrow	Review P.O. No. 1 and instructions to M. Ciciretto for diarizing dates and drafting letter regarding (no) evidence filing;
PREP-MOT-MAT	2024-08-27	0.80	Ian Mondrow	Review and revise letter to OEB to advise that IGUA does not intend to file evidence;
RAE	2024-08-30	0.90	Ian Mondrow	Review evidence proposals from P. Probe and ED and breifing thereon to IGUA;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, Ian		10.60
	Total	10.60



October 31, 2024 INVOICE: 20369271

Industrial Gas Users Association Our Matter: T1036623 2024 EGI St. Laurent LTC (EB-2024-0200) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-11)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
RAE	2024-09-04	0.40	lan Mondrow	Review comments submitted on proposed (ED & P Probe) evidence;
RAE	2024-09-16	0.10	lan Mondrow	Review ED and EGI correspondence re proposed ED (Neme) evidence;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, Ian		0.50
	Total	0.50



November 30, 2024 INVOICE: 20391265

Industrial Gas Users Association Our Matter: T1036623 2024 EGI St. Laurent LTC (EB-2024-0200) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-11)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
RPD	2024-10-01	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Review PO 2 regarding findings on proposed expert evidence and next procedural steps;
ТСР	2024-10-19	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review correspondence regarding scope and EGI witnesses for Technical Conference and re confidentiality requests;
ТСР	2024-10-28	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Review corresondence filed by ED and EGI regarding Technical Conference attendance by EGI external experts;
TCP	2024-10-30	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review P. Probe filling of City of Ottawa council material regarding project;
RPD	2024-10-30	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Review PO #3 re external EGI experts at Technical Conference and related corresopndence;
TCA	2024-10-31	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Corresopndence regarding and retrievel of transcripts; review status of Technical Conference;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, Ian		1.50
	Total	1.50



December 30, 2024 INVOICE: 20408208

Industrial Gas Users Association Our Matter: T1036623 2024 EGI St. Laurent LTC (EB-2024-0200) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-11)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
RPD	2024-11-12	0.20	lan Mondrow	Review recent confidentiality decision and search for updated EGI evidence;
TC-FOL-UP	2024-11-16	0.10	lan Mondrow	Review recent correspondence regarding Technical Conference undertakings;
TC-FOL-UP	2024-11-19	0.10	lan Mondrow	Retrieve and review Technical Conference U/T response filing;
RPD	2024-11-22	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review CAFES letter regarding hearing process requested;
TC-FOL-UP	2024-11-30	0.40	Ian Mondrow	Review FRPO letter regarding further and better TC undertaking responses and note to intervenors regarding cost allocation issues raised;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, Ian		1.00
	Total	1.00



December 31, 2024 INVOICE: 20417983

Industrial Gas Users Association Our Matter: T1036623 2024 EGI St. Laurent LTC (EB-2024-0200) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-11)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	⊺imekeeper	Description
TC-FOL-UP	2024-12-05	0.30	lan Mondrow	Review correspondence regarding P. Probe supplementary undertaking response request; review procedural status;
TC-FOL-UP	2024-12-06	0.10	lan Mondrow	Review P. Probe letter regarding DNV draft report filing;
TC-FOL-UP	2024-12-08	0.30	lan Mondrow	Review EGI filing of additional U/T responses and explanations in response to FRPO requests;
TC-FOL-UP	2024-12-13	0.20	lan Mondrow	Review additional correspondence regarding undertaking responses requested;
RPD	2024-12-16	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review P.O. No. 5;
RPD	2024-12-22	0.30	lan Mondrow	Review recent EGI correspondence regarding status of record and proceeding to hearing; Review intervenor correspondence in response to OEB request for comments on form of hearing;
RAE	2024-12-23	0.40	lan Mondrow	Review EGI submission regarding oral hearing and project timing;
SUB	2024-12-23	0.20	lan Mondrow	Review previous notes on application and add initial notes for final submissions;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, Ian		2.00
	Total	2.00



February 13, 2025 INVOICE: 20440858

Industrial Gas Users Association Our Matter: T1036623 2024 EGI St. Laurent LTC (EB-2024-0200) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-11)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
RPD	2025-01-04	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Review P.O. No. 6 and diarize argument dates;
RPD	2025-01-22	0.10	lan Mondrow	Intervenor correspondence regarding approach to final submissions;
SUB	2025-01-23	1.70	lan Mondrow	Review draft arguments shared and review record and draft IGUA submission;
SUB	2025-01-24	0.40	Ian Mondrow	Additional intervenor correspondence regarding approach to final submissions; review and finalize IGUA submission and forward for filing;
SUB	2025-01-26	0.60	lan Mondrow	Quick review of positions in submissions of other parties and update note to IGUA;
SUB	2025-01-30	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review and comment on Gassentials update for members;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, lan		3.30
	Total	3.30



March 31, 2025 INVOICE: 20466207

Industrial Gas Users Association Our Matter: T1036623 2024 EGI St. Laurent LTC (EB-2024-0200) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-11)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
2025-02-	19 0.80	lan Mondrow	Review EGI Reply Argument;

Total Fees for Professional Services

SUMMARY OF FEES

SUB

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, lan		0.80
	Total	0.80

gowlinks

As of April-06-25 11:31:00 PM

Client Code	190123			
Client Name	Industrial Gas Users Association			
Nature of Client Business	Member Associations and Organizations			
Matter Code	T1036623			
Matter Name	2024 EGI St. Laurent LTC (EB-2024-0200) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-11)			
Client Reference Code				
Matter Area of Law	Not Available (NA)			
Matter Service Area	Advice, Opinion, Consulting, Strategy (ADV01)			
Status	Open Open and Active			
Open Date	Jul 23, 2024			
Close Date				
Billing Professional	Mondrow, Ian (1760)			
Nature of Work	Assisting client with intervention in EGI's St. Laurent LTC Application			
Tax Jurisdiction	Ontario HST (ONT)			
Rate Level	National Rates			
WIP Fees Detail All Timekeepe	ers V			

Date	Timekeeper	Remarks	Hours
Mar 24, 2025	Mondrow, lan 1760	Report to client on decision;	0.4
Mar 24, 2025	Mondrow, Ian 1760	Reviewing decision;	0.5
Mar 25, 2025	Mondrow, Ian 1760	Review IGUA reporting note for members and provide suggested revisions;	0.3
Total			1.2

https://gowlinks.gowlings.corp/site/rex/matterDesc/wipdetail.asp?matteruno=2481859 | Maria Ciciretto



August 29, 2024 INVOICE: 20331948

Industrial Gas Users Association Our Matter: T1036623 2024 EGI St. Laurent LTC (EB-2024-0200) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-11)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
RAE	2024-07-22	0.20	lan Mondrow	Retrieve application materials, instruct file opening and diarize intervention date;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, Ian		0.20
	Total	0.20



September 30, 2024 INVOICE: 20351194

Industrial Gas Users Association Our Matter: T1036623 2024 EGI St. Laurent LTC (EB-2024-0200) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-11)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
RAE	2024-08-08	0.90	Ian Mondrow	Commence review of application materials;
PREP-MOT-MAT	2024-08-08	0.40	Ian Mondrow	Review draft intervention form and provide detailed instructions to finalize;
RAE	2024-08-08	0.60	Ian Mondrow	Initial briefing to IGUA on application scope and content and recommendation for intervention focus;
RAE	2024-08-17	1.50	Ian Mondrow	Continue review of prefiled materials;
RAE	2024-08-18	2.00	Ian Mondrow	Continue review of prefiled evidence;
RAE	2024-08-18	0.80	Ian Mondrow	Note to IGUA regarding initial views on application, including Energy Transition topic and related evidence;
RAE	2024-08-19	1.10	Ian Mondrow	Continue review of prefiled evidence; conference with IGUA regarding early record and interim positions;
RAE	2024-08-20	0.40	Ian Mondrow	Complete review of prefiled evidence;
RAE	2024-08-20	0.70	Ian Mondrow	Further briefing note on the application and IGUA's working position thereon for IGUA members;
RPD	2024-08-22	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Review PO No. 1; Review P. Probe letter regarding materials to be used;
PREP-MOT-MAT		0.40	lan Mondrow	Review P.O. No. 1 and instructions to M. Ciciretto for diarizing dates and drafting letter regarding (no) evidence filing;
PREP-MOT-MAT	2024-08-27	0.80	Ian Mondrow	Review and revise letter to OEB to advise that IGUA does not intend to file evidence;
RAE	2024-08-30	0.90	Ian Mondrow	Review evidence proposals from P. Probe and ED and breifing thereon to IGUA;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, Ian		10.60
	Total	10.60



October 31, 2024 INVOICE: 20369271

Industrial Gas Users Association Our Matter: T1036623 2024 EGI St. Laurent LTC (EB-2024-0200) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-11)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
RAE	2024-09-04	0.40	lan Mondrow	Review comments submitted on proposed (ED & P Probe) evidence;
RAE	2024-09-16	0.10	lan Mondrow	Review ED and EGI correspondence re proposed ED (Neme) evidence;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, Ian		0.50
	Total	0.50



November 30, 2024 INVOICE: 20391265

Industrial Gas Users Association Our Matter: T1036623 2024 EGI St. Laurent LTC (EB-2024-0200) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-11)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
RPD	2024-10-01	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Review PO 2 regarding findings on proposed expert evidence and next procedural steps;
ТСР	2024-10-19	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review correspondence regarding scope and EGI witnesses for Technical Conference and re confidentiality requests;
ТСР	2024-10-28	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Review corresondence filed by ED and EGI regarding Technical Conference attendance by EGI external experts;
TCP	2024-10-30	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review P. Probe filling of City of Ottawa council material regarding project;
RPD	2024-10-30	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Review PO #3 re external EGI experts at Technical Conference and related corresopndence;
TCA	2024-10-31	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Corresopndence regarding and retrievel of transcripts; review status of Technical Conference;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, Ian		1.50
	Total	1.50



December 30, 2024 INVOICE: 20408208

Industrial Gas Users Association Our Matter: T1036623 2024 EGI St. Laurent LTC (EB-2024-0200) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-11)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
RPD	2024-11-12	0.20	lan Mondrow	Review recent confidentiality decision and search for updated EGI evidence;
TC-FOL-UP	2024-11-16	0.10	lan Mondrow	Review recent correspondence regarding Technical Conference undertakings;
TC-FOL-UP	2024-11-19	0.10	lan Mondrow	Retrieve and review Technical Conference U/T response filing;
RPD	2024-11-22	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review CAFES letter regarding hearing process requested;
TC-FOL-UP	2024-11-30	0.40	Ian Mondrow	Review FRPO letter regarding further and better TC undertaking responses and note to intervenors regarding cost allocation issues raised;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, Ian		1.00
	Total	1.00



December 31, 2024 INVOICE: 20417983

Industrial Gas Users Association Our Matter: T1036623 2024 EGI St. Laurent LTC (EB-2024-0200) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-11)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	⊺imekeeper	Description
TC-FOL-UP	2024-12-05	0.30	lan Mondrow	Review correspondence regarding P. Probe supplementary undertaking response request; review procedural status;
TC-FOL-UP	2024-12-06	0.10	lan Mondrow	Review P. Probe letter regarding DNV draft report filing;
TC-FOL-UP	2024-12-08	0.30	lan Mondrow	Review EGI filing of additional U/T responses and explanations in response to FRPO requests;
TC-FOL-UP	2024-12-13	0.20	lan Mondrow	Review additional correspondence regarding undertaking responses requested;
RPD	2024-12-16	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review P.O. No. 5;
RPD	2024-12-22	0.30	lan Mondrow	Review recent EGI correspondence regarding status of record and proceeding to hearing; Review intervenor correspondence in response to OEB request for comments on form of hearing;
RAE	2024-12-23	0.40	lan Mondrow	Review EGI submission regarding oral hearing and project timing;
SUB	2024-12-23	0.20	lan Mondrow	Review previous notes on application and add initial notes for final submissions;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, Ian		2.00
	Total	2.00



February 13, 2025 INVOICE: 20440858

Industrial Gas Users Association Our Matter: T1036623 2024 EGI St. Laurent LTC (EB-2024-0200) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-11)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
RPD	2025-01-04	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Review P.O. No. 6 and diarize argument dates;
RPD	2025-01-22	0.10	lan Mondrow	Intervenor correspondence regarding approach to final submissions;
SUB	2025-01-23	1.70	lan Mondrow	Review draft arguments shared and review record and draft IGUA submission;
SUB	2025-01-24	0.40	Ian Mondrow	Additional intervenor correspondence regarding approach to final submissions; review and finalize IGUA submission and forward for filing;
SUB	2025-01-26	0.60	lan Mondrow	Quick review of positions in submissions of other parties and update note to IGUA;
SUB	2025-01-30	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review and comment on Gassentials update for members;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, lan		3.30
	Total	3.30



March 31, 2025 INVOICE: 20466207

Industrial Gas Users Association Our Matter: T1036623 2024 EGI St. Laurent LTC (EB-2024-0200) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-11)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
2025-02-	-19 0.80	lan Mondrow	Review EGI Reply Argument;

Total Fees for Professional Services

SUMMARY OF FEES

SUB

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, lan		0.80
	Total	0.80

gowlinks

As of April-06-25 11:31:00 PM

Client Code	190123	
Client Name	Industrial Gas Users Association	
Nature of Client Business	Member Associations and Organizations	
Matter Code	T1036623	
Matter Name	2024 EGI St. Laurent LTC (EB-2024-0200) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-11)	
Client Reference Code		
Matter Area of Law	Not Available (NA)	
Matter Service Area	Advice, Opinion, Consulting, Strategy (ADV01)	
Status	Open Open and Active	
Open Date	Jul 23, 2024	
Close Date		
Billing Professional	Mondrow, Ian (1760)	
Nature of Work	Assisting client with intervention in EGI's St. Laurent LTC Application	
Tax Jurisdiction	Ontario HST (ONT)	
Rate Level	National Rates	
WIP Fees Detail All Timekeepe	ers V	

Date	Timekeeper	Remarks	Hours
Mar 24, 2025	Mondrow, lan 1760	Report to client on decision;	0.4
Mar 24, 2025	Mondrow, Ian 1760	Reviewing decision;	0.5
Mar 25, 2025	Mondrow, Ian 1760	Review IGUA reporting note for members and provide suggested revisions;	0.3
Total			1.2

https://gowlinks.gowlings.corp/site/rex/matterDesc/wipdetail.asp?matteruno=2481859 | Maria Ciciretto

Appendix A Table of Revised Activities

			[used acronyms in red when categoriz
Original Category	Original Activity	Revised Category	Revised Activity
Review Application and	Review Application	Discovery	Read and Research
Evidence	and Evidence		Application [RAE]
Discovery	Preparation of	Discovery	Preparation of Interrogatories
-	Interrogatories		[PREP-IR]
Discovery	Review Interrogatory	Discovery	Review Interrogatory
	Responses	,	Responses [REV-IRR]
Discovery	Technical Conference	Discovery	Technical Conference
	Preparation		Preparation [TCP]
Discovery	Technical Conference	Discovery	Technical Conference
Discovery	Attendance	Discovery	Attendance [TCA]
Discovery	Technical Conference	Discovery	Technical Conference Follow-
Discovery		Discovery	up [TC-FOL-UP]
	Follow Up	Due e e deme l	
Issues List	Preparation	Procedural	Preparation of Issues List
			Submission [IL-PREP]
Issues List	Attendance at Issues	Procedural	Attendance at Issues List
	Conference		Conference [ILC-ATT]
Confidentiality	Preparation of	Procedural	Preparation for a
	Application for		confidentiality request
	Confidentiality		[CONF-REQ]
Confidentiality	Prepare Submissions	Procedural	Prepare Submissions on
•	on Confidentiality		confidentiality [SUB-CONF]
Confidentiality	Attendance at Hearing		Activity removed
,	on Confidentiality		
Motions	Preparation of Motion	Procedural	Preparation of Motion(s)
	(s) Materials		materials [PREP-MOT-MAT]
Motions	Prepare Submissions	Procedural	Prepare submissions on the
Motions	on the Motion(s)	TIOCEUUIAI	Motion(s) [PREP-SUB-MOT]
Motions	Attendance at Hearing	Procedural	Attendance at hearing on
WOUDIS		FIOCEULIAI	C C
	on Motion(s)	Dreeselungt (March)	Motion(s) [ATT-HM]
		Procedural (New)	Review procedural documents
Intervenor Evidence	Preparation	Intervenor	Preparation of Intervenor
		Evidence	Evidence [PREP-IE]
Intervenor Evidence	Interrogatory	Intervenor	Interrogatory Responses
	Responses	Evidence	[IE-IRR]
Intervenor Evidence	Preparation of	Intervenor	Preparation of Witness(es) for
	Witness(es) for	Evidence	Attendance at Hearing
	Attendance at Hearing		[PREP-WIT-OH]
Settlement/ADR	Preparation	Settlement	Preparation for Settlement
Oettiement/ADIX		Oettiement	Conference [SCP]
Settlement/ADR	Attendance	Settlement	Attendance at Settlement
Settlement/ADK	Allenuarice	Settlement	
0 41 44 55			Conference [SCA]
Settlement/ADR	Preparation of	Settlement	Preparation of Settlement
	Settlement Proposal		Proposal [PSP]
Settlement/ADR	Attendance at	Settlement	Attendance at Presentation to
	Presentation to Panel		Panel [ATT-PP]

Original Category	Original Activity	Revised Category	Revised Activity	
Submissions	Written Submissions	Written Argument	Written Submissions [SUB]	1
Oral Hearing	Preparation	Oral Argument	Preparation for Oral Hearing	[OHF
Oral Hearing	Attendance at Oral Hearing	Oral Argument	Attendance at Oral Hearing [OHA]	
Submissions	Oral Submissions	Oral Argument	Oral Submissions [O-SUB]	1
Submissions	Attendance at Oral Submissions	Oral Argument	Attendance at Oral Submissions [ATT-O-SUB]	
Decision	Review	Decision	Review Decision [DEC]	1
Rate Order	Review	Decision	Review Rate/Accounting Order	[REV
Rate Order	Prepare Submission on Rate Order	Decision	Prepare Submission on Rate Order [PREP-SUB-RO]	RO]
Other Attendance	Other Attendance	Other	Other attendance (e.g., [OTH-AT Intervenor Conferences)	T]
Communication	With Other Parties		Activity removed	
Communication	With Client		Activity removed	



Ontario | Commission Energy | de l'énergie Board | de l'Ontario

Guidance for Online Cost Claim Submissions

Cost claims at the OEB are filed through a secure online portal. If you are a new intervenor, you must ensure you have your own log-on credentials, and your support staff who handles cost claims must have their own.

Information on registering for portal access, as well as contact information, training guides, and walkthrough videos are available on the Intervenor Information and Filing Systems pages of the OEB's website.

Please review the guide when you prepare your claim to ensure you allocate your costs to the appropriate activity.

Category	Activity	Guidance
Discovery	Read and Research Application and Evidence	The number of hours spent reading and researching the submitted application and evidence. If you develop interrogatories while reviewing the application and evidence, report such hours under the 'Preparation of Interrogatories' category.
	Preparation of Interrogatories	The number of hours spent reviewing the application and evidence to prepare interrogatories on the application and evidence as well as any evidentiary updates, supplemental rounds of discovery, and expert evidence.
	Review Interrogatory Responses	The number of hours spent reviewing responses to interrogatories for technical conferences, settlement conferences, or submissions. If you develop technical/settlement conference questions while reviewing interrogatory responses, you may divide the hours equally between the respective categories and identify that in your cover letter.
	Technical Conference Preparation	The number of hours spent preparing to attend the technical conference (e.g., drafting questions to ask). If you develop technical conference questions while reviewing interrogatory responses, you may divide the hours equally between the respective categories and identify that in your cover letter.
	Technical Conference Attendance	The number of hours spent in attendance at a technical conference.
	Technical Conference Follow-up	The number of hours spent reviewing undertakings or any other evidence filed in response to requests/discussions at the technical conference.

Category	Activity	Guidance
Procedural	Preparation of Issues List Submission	The number of hours spent preparing submissions on the issues list and any hours spent preparing a list of issues, not including those on the standard issues list. If issues are noted during the initial review of the application, apply some of those hours to this category. If applicable, include the number of hours spent preparing submissions on refusals and/or preparing to attend a refusals hearing (e.g., drafting verbal argument for why a response should not be refused).
	Attendance at Issues List Conference	The number of hours spent in attendance at an issues conference. If applicable, this can also include attendance at a refusals hearing.
	Preparation for a confidentiality request	The number of hours spent reviewing a confidentiality request. Or, if expert evidence requires confidential treatment when filing, report the number of hours required to prepare your confidentiality request in this category.
	Prepare submissions on confidentiality	The number of hours spent preparing submissions on a confidentiality request.
	Preparation of Motion(s) materials	The number of hours spent preparing materials for a motion(s) (e.g., drafting a motion). If applicable, this also includes the number of hours spent preparing materials for a hearing on motion(s).
	Prepare submissions on the Motion(s)	The number of hours spent preparing submissions on the motion (s) or preparing a reply submission on the motion(s).
	Attendance at hearing on Motion(s)	The number of hours spent in attendance at a hearing on motion(s).
	Review procedural documents	The number of hours spent reviewing other procedural documents where the OEB is soliciting comment, such as P.O. No. 1, letters of correspondence, OEB staff submission on settlement conference, confidentiality decisions, interlocutory motion decisions, blue page updates, and submissions on rate orders.
Intervenor Evidence	Preparation of Intervenor Evidence	The number of hours spent preparing/coordinating your expert evidence to be filed.
	Interrogatory Responses	The number of hours spent preparing interrogatory responses to questions on your expert evidence.
	Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing	The number of hours spent preparing your expert witness(es) for their attendance at an oral hearing.
Settlement Conference	Preparation for Settlement Conference	The number of hours spent preparing for the settlement conference (e.g., drafting of positions, seeking clarification of questions from the applicant). This includes any hours spent in communication with your client regarding positions to take in

Category	Activity	Guidance				
		settlement. If you develop settlement conference questions while reviewing interrogatory responses, you may divide the hours equally between the respective categories and identify that in your cover letter.				
	Attendance at Settlement Conference	The number of hours spent in attendance at the settlement conference.				
	Preparation of Settlement Proposal	The number of hours spent reviewing and providing edits and/or comments on the settlement proposal.				
	Attendance at Presentation to Panel	The number of hours spent in attendance at a settlement presentation to the Panel.				
Written Argument	Written Submissions	The number of hours spent preparing a final written argument for the proceeding.				
Oral Argument	Preparation for Oral Hearing	The number of hours spent preparing for the oral hearing (e.g., preparing cross-examination, compendium development).				
	Attendance at Oral Hearing	The number of hours spent in attendance at an oral hearing.				
	Oral Submissions	The number of hours spent preparing oral submissions.				
	Attendance at Oral Submissions	The number of hours spent attending or presenting oral submissions.				
Decision	Review Decision	The number of hours spent reviewing the final decision and order of the OEB. This may include time spent reporting back to the client about the decision.				
	Review Rate/Accounting Order	The number of hours spent reviewing the Draft Rate or Accounting Order.				
	Prepare Submission on Rate Order	The number of hours spent preparing a submission on the Draft Rate or Accounting Order.				
Other	Other attendance (e.g., Intervenor Conferences)	The number of hours spent attending any other OEB-related conferences regarding the proceeding that are not already identified in this form.				

T1036623 Invoices RAE PREP-IR REV-IRR	20331948 0.2	20351194 8.9	20369271 0.5	20391265	20408208	20417983 0.4	20440858	20466207 WIP		TOTALS 10
TCP TCA TC-FOL-UP IL-PREP ILC-ATT				0.7 0.2	0.6	0.9				0.7 0.2 1.5
CONF-REQ SUB-CONF PREP-MOT-MAT PREP-SUB-MOT		1.6								1.6
ATT-HM RPD PREP-IE		0.1		0.6	0.4	0.5	0.4			2
IE-IRR PREP-WIT-AH SCP SCA PSP ATT-PP										
SUB OHP OHA O-SUB						0.2	2.9	0.8		3.9
ATT-O-SUB DEC REV-OR PREP-SUB-RO OTH-ATT									1.2	1.2
TOTAL	0.2	10.6	0.5	1.5	1	2	3.3	0.8	1.2	21.1

Appendix A Table of Revised Activities

			[used acronyms in red when categoriz
Original Category	Original Activity	Revised Category	Revised Activity
Review Application and	Review Application	Discovery	Read and Research
Evidence	and Evidence		Application [RAE]
Discovery	Preparation of	Discovery	Preparation of Interrogatories
-	Interrogatories		[PREP-IR]
Discovery	Review Interrogatory	Discovery	Review Interrogatory
	Responses	,	Responses [REV-IRR]
Discovery	Technical Conference	Discovery	Technical Conference
	Preparation		Preparation [TCP]
Discovery	Technical Conference	Discovery	Technical Conference
Discovery	Attendance	Discovery	Attendance [TCA]
Discovery	Technical Conference	Discovery	Technical Conference Follow-
Discovery		Discovery	up [TC-FOL-UP]
	Follow Up	Due e e deme l	
Issues List	Preparation	Procedural	Preparation of Issues List
			Submission [IL-PREP]
Issues List	Attendance at Issues	Procedural	Attendance at Issues List
	Conference		Conference [ILC-ATT]
Confidentiality	Preparation of	Procedural	Preparation for a
	Application for		confidentiality request
	Confidentiality		[CONF-REQ]
Confidentiality	Prepare Submissions	Procedural	Prepare Submissions on
•	on Confidentiality		confidentiality [SUB-CONF]
Confidentiality	Attendance at Hearing		Activity removed
,	on Confidentiality		
Motions	Preparation of Motion	Procedural	Preparation of Motion(s)
	(s) Materials		materials [PREP-MOT-MAT]
Motions	Prepare Submissions	Procedural	Prepare submissions on the
Motions	on the Motion(s)	TIOCEUUIAI	Motion(s) [PREP-SUB-MOT]
Motions	Attendance at Hearing	Procedural	Attendance at hearing on
WOUDIS	U	FIOCEULIAI	C C
	on Motion(s)	Dreeselungt (March)	Motion(s) [ATT-HM]
		Procedural (New)	Review procedural documents
Intervenor Evidence	Preparation	Intervenor	Preparation of Intervenor
		Evidence	Evidence [PREP-IE]
Intervenor Evidence	Interrogatory	Intervenor	Interrogatory Responses
	Responses	Evidence	[IE-IRR]
Intervenor Evidence	Preparation of	Intervenor	Preparation of Witness(es) for
	Witness(es) for	Evidence	Attendance at Hearing
	Attendance at Hearing		[PREP-WIT-OH]
Settlement/ADR	Preparation	Settlement	Preparation for Settlement
octionicityADR	rieparation	Octioniciti	Conference [SCP]
Settlement/ADR	Attendance	Settlement	Attendance at Settlement
Settlement/ADK	Allenuarice	Settlement	
0 41 44 55			Conference [SCA]
Settlement/ADR	Preparation of	Settlement	Preparation of Settlement
	Settlement Proposal		Proposal [PSP]
Settlement/ADR	Attendance at	Settlement	Attendance at Presentation to
	Presentation to Panel		Panel [ATT-PP]

Original Category	Original Activity	Revised Category	Revised Activity	
Submissions	Written Submissions	Written Argument	Written Submissions [SUB]	1
Oral Hearing	Preparation	Oral Argument	Preparation for Oral Hearing	[OHF
Oral Hearing	Attendance at Oral Hearing	Oral Argument	Attendance at Oral Hearing [OHA]	
Submissions	Oral Submissions	Oral Argument	Oral Submissions [O-SUB]	1
Submissions	Attendance at Oral Submissions	Oral Argument	Attendance at Oral Submissions [ATT-O-SUB]	
Decision	Review	Decision	Review Decision [DEC]	1
Rate Order	Drder Review		Review Rate/Accounting Order	[REV
Rate Order	Prepare Submission on Rate Order	Decision	Prepare Submission on Rate Order [PREP-SUB-RO]	RO]
Other Attendance	Other Attendance	Other	Other attendance (e.g., [OTH-AT Intervenor Conferences)	T]
Communication	With Other Parties		Activity removed	
Communication	With Client		Activity removed	



Ontario | Commission Energy | de l'énergie Board | de l'Ontario

Guidance for Online Cost Claim Submissions

Cost claims at the OEB are filed through a secure online portal. If you are a new intervenor, you must ensure you have your own log-on credentials, and your support staff who handles cost claims must have their own.

Information on registering for portal access, as well as contact information, training guides, and walkthrough videos are available on the Intervenor Information and Filing Systems pages of the OEB's website.

Please review the guide when you prepare your claim to ensure you allocate your costs to the appropriate activity.

Category	Activity	Guidance
Discovery	Read and Research Application and Evidence	The number of hours spent reading and researching the submitted application and evidence. If you develop interrogatories while reviewing the application and evidence, report such hours under the 'Preparation of Interrogatories' category.
	Preparation of Interrogatories	The number of hours spent reviewing the application and evidence to prepare interrogatories on the application and evidence as well as any evidentiary updates, supplemental rounds of discovery, and expert evidence.
	Review Interrogatory Responses	The number of hours spent reviewing responses to interrogatories for technical conferences, settlement conferences, or submissions. If you develop technical/settlement conference questions while reviewing interrogatory responses, you may divide the hours equally between the respective categories and identify that in your cover letter.
	Technical Conference Preparation	The number of hours spent preparing to attend the technical conference (e.g., drafting questions to ask). If you develop technical conference questions while reviewing interrogatory responses, you may divide the hours equally between the respective categories and identify that in your cover letter.
	Technical Conference Attendance	The number of hours spent in attendance at a technical conference.
	Technical Conference Follow-up	The number of hours spent reviewing undertakings or any other evidence filed in response to requests/discussions at the technical conference.

Category	Activity	Guidance				
Procedural	Preparation of Issues List Submission	The number of hours spent preparing submissions on the issues list and any hours spent preparing a list of issues, not including those on the standard issues list. If issues are noted during the initial review of the application, apply some of those hours to this category. If applicable, include the number of hours spent preparing submissions on refusals and/or preparing to attend a refusals hearing (e.g., drafting verbal argument for why a response should not be refused).				
	Attendance at Issues List Conference	The number of hours spent in attendance at an issues conference. If applicable, this can also include attendance at a refusals hearing.				
	Preparation for a confidentiality request	The number of hours spent reviewing a confidentiality request. Or, if expert evidence requires confidential treatment when filing, report the number of hours required to prepare your confidentiality request in this category.				
	Prepare submissions on confidentiality	The number of hours spent preparing submissions on a confidentiality request.				
	Preparation of Motion(s) materials	The number of hours spent preparing materials for a motion(s) (e.g., drafting a motion). If applicable, this also includes the number of hours spent preparing materials for a hearing on motion(s).				
	Prepare submissions on the Motion(s)	The number of hours spent preparing submissions on the motion (s) or preparing a reply submission on the motion(s).				
	Attendance at hearing on Motion(s)	The number of hours spent in attendance at a hearing on motion(s).				
	Review procedural documents	The number of hours spent reviewing other procedural documents where the OEB is soliciting comment, such as P.O. No. 1, letters of correspondence, OEB staff submission on settlement conference, confidentiality decisions, interlocutory motion decisions, blue page updates, and submissions on rate orders.				
Intervenor Evidence	Preparation of Intervenor Evidence	The number of hours spent preparing/coordinating your expert evidence to be filed.				
	Interrogatory Responses	The number of hours spent preparing interrogatory responses questions on your expert evidence.				
	Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing	The number of hours spent preparing your expert witness(es) for their attendance at an oral hearing.				
Settlement Conference	Preparation for Settlement Conference	The number of hours spent preparing for the settlement conference (e.g., drafting of positions, seeking clarification of questions from the applicant). This includes any hours spent in communication with your client regarding positions to take in				

Category	Activity	Guidance				
		settlement. If you develop settlement conference questions while reviewing interrogatory responses, you may divide the hours equally between the respective categories and identify that in your cover letter.				
	Attendance at Settlement Conference	The number of hours spent in attendance at the settlement conference.				
	Preparation of Settlement Proposal	The number of hours spent reviewing and providing edits and/or comments on the settlement proposal.				
	Attendance at Presentation to Panel	The number of hours spent in attendance at a settlement presentation to the Panel.				
Written Argument	Written Submissions	The number of hours spent preparing a final written argument for the proceeding.				
Oral Argument	Preparation for Oral Hearing	The number of hours spent preparing for the oral hearing (e.g., preparing cross-examination, compendium development).				
	Attendance at Oral Hearing	The number of hours spent in attendance at an oral hearing.				
	Oral Submissions	The number of hours spent preparing oral submissions.				
	Attendance at Oral Submissions	The number of hours spent attending or presenting oral submissions.				
Decision	Review Decision	The number of hours spent reviewing the final decision and order of the OEB. This may include time spent reporting back to the client about the decision.				
	Review Rate/Accounting Order	The number of hours spent reviewing the Draft Rate or Accounting Order.				
	Prepare Submission on Rate Order	The number of hours spent preparing a submission on the Draft Rate or Accounting Order.				
Other	Other attendance (e.g., Intervenor Conferences)	The number of hours spent attending any other OEB-related conferences regarding the proceeding that are not already identified in this form.				

T1036623 Invoices RAE PREP-IR REV-IRR	20331948 0.2	20351194 8.9	20369271 0.5	20391265	20408208	20417983 0.4	20440858	20466207 WIP		TOTALS 10
TCP TCA TC-FOL-UP IL-PREP ILC-ATT				0.7 0.2	0.6	0.9				0.7 0.2 1.5
CONF-REQ SUB-CONF PREP-MOT-MAT PREP-SUB-MOT		1.6								1.6
ATT-HM RPD PREP-IE		0.1		0.6	0.4	0.5	0.4			2
IE-IRR PREP-WIT-AH SCP SCA PSP ATT-PP										
SUB OHP OHA O-SUB						0.2	2.9	0.8		3.9
ATT-O-SUB DEC REV-OR PREP-SUB-RO OTH-ATT									1.2	1.2
TOTAL	0.2	10.6	0.5	1.5	1	2	3.3	0.8	1.2	21.1