INVOICE #	OEBCOC63	Mark C Garner					
Date	April 2, 2025	April 2, 2025					
Client:	PIAC-VECC	PIAC-VECC					
File:	OEB COST OF CAPITAL EB-2024-0063	M4G 2S8					
Period covering:	March 13, 2024 Noven	March 13, 2024 November 13, 2023					
	-		1	T		T	
Billable Hours	96.00	@	Rate	\$330.00	HRs	\$31,680.00	
Disbursements Detail	N/A					n/a	
HST No.		@	Rate	13%	HST	\$4,118.40	
No. 87831 4327 RT001							
Tota	I					\$35,798.40	

TERM: Payable upon receipt of payment from the client net of service charges Please make amounts payable to Mark C. Garner.

Detailed Dockets OEB Cost of Capital Review EB-2024-0063

Phase	Date	Hrs	Code	Description
Discovery Phase	March 13, 2024	0.25	IRP	Notice and Review of Past OEB CoC material
	March 28, 2024	0.25	ICP	Review of PO 1 and Issues List - notes
	April 17, 2024	1.00	ICP	Discussion with BH on suggestions to issues list - notes
	April 18, 2024	3.00	ICA	Attendance at Issues Conference 9:30-4:30 50% with BH
	April 29, 204	0.75	ICP	Zoom meeting on intervenor evidence (1hr share with BH = .50) + review letter .25 and parties correspondence
	May 6, 2024	0.75	ICP	Review EGI submission on issues list (16pgs)
	July 30, 2024	4.75	IRP	Review evidence and notes for IRs
	July 31, 2024	5.25	IRP	Review evidence and notes for IRs
	August 1, 2024	6.00	IRP	Review evidence and notes for IRs integrate with BH IRs
	August 2, 2024	5.25	IRP	Review evidence, notes for IRs integrate with BH IRs - Finalize 3
	August 23, 2024	0.75	IRP	Finalize final IRs (Cleary) late filing
	August 30, 2024	0.25	PHP	Review Staff Confidentiality Objections
	September 5, 2024	1.75	HRA	Presentation Day 9:30-2:30 / 50% share with BH
Hearing Phase	September 22, 2024	4.50	HRP	Hearing Preparation
	September 23, 2024	5.75	HRP	Hearing Preparation
	September 24, 2024	6.25	HRP	Hearing Preparation
	September 25, 2024	6.00	HRA	Hearing Day 1 - sole attendee 9:30-4:30
	September 26, 2024	3.25	HRA	Hearing Day 2 9:30-5pm / 50% share with BH
	September 27, 2024	3.25	HRA	Hearing Day 3: 9:30-5pm 50% share with BH
	October 1, 2024	n/c	HRA	Hearing Day 4 - BH only
	October 2, 2024	3.25	HRA	Hearing Day 5 9:30-5pm 50% share with BH
	October 10, 2024	6.00	HRA	Hearing Day 6 - MG only
Argument Phase	October 4, 2024	2.75	ARG	Begin drafting review BH
	October 5, 2024	4.00	ARG	Draft Front Portions
	October 6, 2024	3.75	ARG	Draft Debt Portions
	October 7, 2024	7.25	ARG	Drafting Argument
	October 8, 2024	1.50	ARG	Finalize submissions with BH comments
Review Phase	November 25, 2024	3.00	OCP	Review Parties submissions
	November 26, 2024	0.25	OCP	Review Parties Submissions
	November 25, 2024	0.75	OCP	Review Parties submissions
	November 29, 2024	2.75	OCP	Review Reply Submissions
	March 27, 2025	1.75	OCP	Review Decisions
	TOTAL	96.00		

то:	VULNERABLE ENERGY CONSUMERS COALITION c/o Public Interest Advocacy Centre (PIAC)				Statement of Account Mark Garner 647 Broadway Ave. Toronto		
RE:	OEB COST OF CAPITAL REVIEW	EB-2024-	-0063				
					13.00%		
		Hours	Rate	Subtotal	нѕт	Total	
Confidentiality							
	Preparation	0.25		82.50	10.73	93.23	
Technical Conference				-	-	-	
	Preparation	-		-	-	-	
	Attendance	_		-	_	_	
Discovery -Interrogator							
	Preparation	22.25	330	7,342.50	954.53	8,297.03	
	Responses	-	330	-	-	-	
Issues List							
	Preparation	2.75	330	907.50	117.98	1,025.48	
	Attendance	3.00		990.00	128.70	1,118.70	
ADR-Settlement Confe	rence						
	Preparation			-	-	-	
	Attendance			-	-	-	
	Proposal Preparation			-	-	-	
Argument/Submissions	6						
	Preparation	19.25		6,352.50	825.83	7,178.33	
Oral Hearing							
	Preparation	16.50		5,445.00	707.85	6,152.85	
	Attendance	23.50		7,755.00	1,008.15	8,763.15	
Decion Review							
	Preparation	8.50		2,805.00	364.65	3,169.65	
	Attendance	-		-	-	-	
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES		96.00		\$31,680.00	\$4,118.40	\$35,798.40	