Colm Boyle T: 416-367-7273 cboyle@blg.com

John Vellone T: 416-367-6730 jvellone@blg.com Borden Ladner Gervais LLP Bay Adelaide Centre, East Tower 22 Adelaide Street West Toronto ON M5H 4E3 Canada T 416-367-6000 F 416-367-6749 blg.com



File No. 61604.56

April 24, 2025

VIA RESS registrar@oeb.ca

Ms. Nancy Marconi Ontario Energy Board 2300 Yonge Street, 27th Floor Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

Dear Ms. Marconi,

Re: Association of Power Producers of Ontario ("APPrO")

Generic Proceeding - Cost of Capital and Other Matters

EB-2024-0063

We are counsel to the Association of Power Producers of Ontario ("APPrO") in the above-noted proceeding. On March 27, 2024, the Ontario Energy Board ("OEB") issued a decision directing cost eligible intervenors to file their cost claims with the OEB. APPrO's cost claim has been prepared and filed through the OEB's online cost claim filing system in accordance with Section 10 of the OEB Practice Direction on Cost Awards. The claim was filed on April 4, 2025.

On April 23rd, 2025 OEB staff requested a revision to previously filed cost claims made on April 4, 2025. The OEB granted an extension for the revisions to be filed by April 24, 2025. The revision to the claim has been made with the supporting time docket attached hereto.

Accordingly, APPrO requests reimbursement of its costs.

Yours truly,

BORDEN LADNER GERVAIS LLP

Colm Boyle

Cole Byle

CB

CASE

EB-2024-0063: Rates:

Policy-Related: Ontario Energy

Board

COST CLAIM

EB-2024-0063 : 2 : Maira

Canales

INTERVENOR NAME

Canales, Maira; +1 (416)

367-7284

mcanales@blg.com

PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS

Submitted

FILING PARTICIPANT

Boyle, Colm; +1 (416) 367-7273

cboyle@blg.com

NEW

PARTICIPANT

Nο

NON-FILING

PARTICIPANT F. NAME

NON-FILING

PARTICIPANT L. NAME

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE*

Legal Counsel

YEAR CALLED TO BAR*

2015

COMPLETED YEARS

PRACTICING/YEARS OF RELEVANT EXPERIENCE*

9

HST RATE CHARGED*

13.00

CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST)

CV Required

LAST CV DATE

OVERRIDE

HOURLY RATE

230

HOURLY RATE Yes

HST NUMBER 125298802RT0001

HEARINGS

Yes

CONSULTATIONS

No

DISBURSEMENTS

No

HEARINGS

Hearings Hours

Hearings Subtotal (\$)

Hearings Total Tax (\$) 690.69

Hearings Total (\$)

	23.10	5,313.00		690.69			6,003.69
	<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	Sub Total	HST Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
DISC	OVERY Read and Research Application and Evidence Preparation of Interrogatories	0.50	230 230	115.00	13.00 13.00	14.95	129.95
	Review Interrogatory Responses		230		13.00		
	Technical Conference Preparation		230		13.00		
	Technical Conference Attendance		230		13.00		
	Technical Conference Follow-up		230		13.00		
	Subtotal of DISCOVERY	0.50		115.00		14.95	129.95
PROC	CEDURAL Preparation of Issues List Submission		230		12.00		
	· ·		230		13.00		
	Attendance at Issues List Conference		230		13.00		
	Attendance at Issues List Conference Preparation for a Confidentiality Reque	st					
			230		13.00		
	Preparation for a Confidentiality Reque		230 230		13.00 13.00		
	Preparation for a Confidentiality Reque Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality		230 230 230		13.00 13.00 13.00		
	Preparation for a Confidentiality Reque Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		230 230 230 230		13.00 13.00 13.00 13.00		
	Preparation for a Confidentiality Reque Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality Preparation of Motion(s) Materials Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		230 230 230 230 230 230	69.00	13.00 13.00 13.00 13.00 13.00	8.97	77.97

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	Sub Total	HST Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Subtotal of PROCEDURAL	0.30		69.00		8.97	77.97
INTERVENOR EVIDENCE Preparation of Intervenor Evidence		230		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		230		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE	0.00	230	0.00	13.00	0.00	0.00
SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE Preparation for Settlement Conference		230		13.00		
Attendance at Settlement Conference		230		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		230		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		230		13.00		
Subtotal of SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE WRITTEN ARGUMENT	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
Written Submissions	19.00	230	4,370.00	13.00	568.10	4,938.10
Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT	19.00		4,370.00		568.10	4,938.10
ORAL ARGUMENT Preparation for Oral Hearing	2.00	230	460.00	13.00	59.80	519.80
Attendance at Oral Hearing		230		13.00		
Oral Submissions		230		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		230		13.00		
Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT	2.00		460.00		59.80	519.80
DECISION Review Decision	1.30	230	299.00	13.00	38.87	337.87
Review Rate/Accounting Order		230		13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order		230		13.00		
Subtotal of DECISION	1.30		299.00		38.87	337.87
OTHER Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor Conferences)		230		13.00		
Subtotal of OTHER	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES Total Service Provider Fees	23.10		5,313.00		690.69	6,003.69

Attachments

<u>Attachment</u> Import Message **Document Type** Revision

APPrO_Time-Docket_Cost-Claim_20250424. Time Docket and Invoice pdf

APPrO_Ltr_Cost Claim Revision_20250424.pdf Cover Letter

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

Attachment APPrO_Time-Docket_Cost-Claim_2025042 4.pdf

APPrO_Ltr_Cost Claim Revision_20250424.pdf **Document Type**

Time Docket and Invoice

Cover Letter

Claim Type Hearings

Import Message

Revision

Hearings

EB-2024-0063

Date	TKPR Name	Billable time	Phase Desc	Task Desc	Narrative
9/10/2024	Boyle, Colm	0.4	Oral Hearing	Preparation for Oral	Attendance on conference call with J. Vellone and C. Anderson to discuss oral
				Hearing	hearing strategy.
9/11/2024	Boyle, Colm	1.6	Oral Hearing	Preparation for Oral	Prepare slides summarizing positions of parties; attendance on conference call to
				Hearing	discuss strategy at oral hearing.
10/15/2024	Boyle, Colm	0.3	Procedural	Review procedural	Review of procedural direction from the OEB on cost of capital matters and email
				documents	correspondence with client on instructions regarding same.
9/3/2024	Boyle, Colm	0.5	Review	Review Application and	Review of proceeding materials.
			Application and	Evidence	
			Evidence		
11/7/2024	Boyle, Colm	7.4	Submissions	Written Submissions	Attendance on researching and drafting the submission; filing of same.
11/28/2024	Boyle, Colm	6.2	Submissions	Written Submissions	Research and draft reply argument; email correspondence with C. Anderson;
					attendance on filing.
11/6/2024	Boyle, Colm	0.5	Submissions	Written Submissions	Attendance on drafting cost of capital submission.
11/27/2024	Boyle, Colm	4.6	Submissions	Written Submissions	Research, analysis and draft reply argument.
12/9/2024	Boyle, Colm	0.1	Decision	Review	Review OEB decision on confidentiality.
1/6/2025	Boyle, Colm	0.3	Submissions	Written Submissions	Review Three Fires Group written submission.
3/28/2025	Boyle, Colm	1.2	Decision	Review	Review decision and order.