EB-2024-0063 : 2 : Maria Ciciretto

COST CLAIM NUMBER SUBMISSION DEADLINE DATE **CLAIM STATUS** 2640 April 07, 2025 Submitted EB# OTHER EB#S PHASE #* EB-2024-0063: Rates: Policy-Related: Ontario **Energy Board INTERVENOR** INTERVENOR COMPANY* INTERVENOR TYPE Ciciretto, Maria; +1 (416) 369-7335 Association of Major Power Full Registrant maria.ciciretto@gowlingwlg.com Consumers in Ontario, Toronto: Institution HST RATE ONTARIO **EXCHANGE RATE COUNTRY** 13.00 Canada HST NUMBER LATE SUBMISSION ALLOWED EXTENSION DEADLINE DATE R137667424 Yes April 10, 2025

PART	ICIPANTS				Dantialmant
New	Non-Filing Participant First, Last Name	Filing Participant	Total (\$)	Total Hours	Participant Claim Status
No	,	Mondrow, lan; +1 (416) 369-4670 ian.mondrow@gowlingwlg.c om	32,654.87	87.57	Submitted
No	,	Grice, Shelley; +1 (647) 880-9942 shelley.grice@rogers.com	1,678.06	4.50	Submitted
No	,	Mondrow, lan; +1 (416) 369-4670 ian.mondrow@gowlingwlg.c om	0.00	0.00	Submitted

ATTACHMENTS

Attachment	Document Type	Import Message
IGUA_EB-2024-0063_OEB Cost Claim_Table of Revised Activities_20250410.pdf	Other	Copy of the Board`s Table of Revised Activities with the addition of acronyms that we used to code the individual time entries supporting the claim.

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT/OTHER FEES 30,383.10

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 0.00

TOTAL HST 3,949.83

TOTAL CLAIM 34,332.93

TOTAL AMOUNT AWARDED

TOTAL HOURS CLAIMED

92.07

TOTAL HOURS DISALLOWED

REASON FOR REASON FOR REASON FOR DISALLOWANCE - 2 DISALLOWANCE - 3

MAKE CHEQUE PAYABLE TO

Association of Major Power Consumers in Ontario

SEND PAYMENT TO ADDRESS 65 Queen Street West, Suite 1510 Toronto, ON M5H 2M5 ATTENTION
Mark Passi, Chair,
AMPCO Board of
Directors

SUBMIT SECTION

I am a representative of the Party. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim. The costs incurred and time spent are directly related to the Party's participation in the OEB Process referred to above.

This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in section 6.05 and 6.09 of the OEB's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

The information (fees and disbursements) filed in this cost claim is complete and accurate and in accordance with the OEB's Practice Direction for Cost Awards and Appendix A, the Cost Awards Tariff.

SUBMITTED BY

Ian Mondrow

DATE SUBMITTED

April 10, 2025

CASE

EB-2024-0063: Rates:

Policy-Related: Ontario Energy

Board

COST CLAIM

EB-2024-0063 : 2 : Maria

Ciciretto

INTERVENOR NAME
Ciciretto, Maria; +1 (416)

369-7335

maria.ciciretto@gowlingwlg.c

om

FILING PARTICIPANT

Mondrow, lan; +1 (416) 369-4670

ian.mondrow@gowlingwlg.com

NEW

PARTICIPANT No NON-FILING

PARTICIPANT F. NAME

NON-FILING

PARTICIPANT

Submitted

CLAIM STATUS

PARTICIPANT L. NAME

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE*

Legal Counsel

YEAR CALLED TO BAR*

1991

COMPLETED YEARS
PRACTICING/YEARS OF

RELEVANT EXPERIENCE*

34

HST RATE CHARGED*

13.00

CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST)

CV Required

LAST CV DATE

OVERRIDE HOURLY RATE

HOURLY RATE

330

No

HST NUMBER R137667424

HEARINGS

Yes

CONSULTATIONS

No

DISBURSEMENTS

No

HEARINGS

Hearings Hours 87.57 Hearings Subtotal (\$) 28,898.10

Hearings Total Tax (\$) 3,756.77

Hearings Total (\$) 32,654.87

HST Name Sub Total **HST** Total <u>Hours</u> **Hourly** Rate Rate **DISCOVERY** Read and Research Application and 330 13.00 Evidence Preparation of Interrogatories 330 13.00 **Review Interrogatory Responses** 330 13.00 **Technical Conference Preparation** 330 13.00 330 13.00 **Technical Conference Attendance** 13.00 Technical Conference Follow-up 330 Subtotal of DISCOVERY 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 **PROCEDURAL** Preparation of Issues List Submission 330 13.00 Attendance at Issues List Conference 330 13.00 Preparation for a Confidentiality Request 330 13.00 0.20 Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality 330 66.00 13.00 8.58 74.58 330 Preparation of Motion(s) Materials 13.00 Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s) 330 13.00 Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s) 330 13.00 **Review Procedural Documents** 330 13.00

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	Sub Total	HST Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Subtotal of PROCEDURAL	0.20		66.00		8.58	74.58
INTERVENOR EVIDENCE Preparation of Intervenor Evidence	0.65	330	214.50	13.00	27.89	242.39
Interrogatory Responses		330		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing	0.55	330	181.50	13.00	23.60	205.10
Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE	1.20		396.00		51.49	447.49
SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE Preparation for Settlement Conference		330		13.00		
Attendance at Settlement Conference		330		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		330		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		330		13.00		
Subtotal of SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
WRITTEN ARGUMENT Written Submissions	32.30	330	10,659.00	13.00	1,385.67	12,044.67
Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT	32.30		10,659.00		1,385.67	12,044.67
ORAL ARGUMENT Preparation for Oral Hearing	25.62	330	8,454.60	13.00	1,099.10	9,553.70
Attendance at Oral Hearing	20.50	330	6,765.00	13.00	879.45	7,644.45
Oral Submissions		330		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		330		13.00		
Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT	46.12		15,219.60		1,978.55	17,198.15
DECISION						
Review Decision	5.00	330	1,650.00	13.00	214.50	1,864.50
Review Rate/Accounting Order		330		13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order		330		13.00		
Subtotal of DECISION	5.00		1,650.00		214.50	1,864.50
OTHER Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor Conferences)	2.75	330	907.50	13.00	117.98	1,025.48
Subtotal of OTHER	2.75		907.50		117.98	1,025.48
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES Total Service Provider Fees	87.57		28,898.10		3,756.77	32,654.87

Attachments General Attachments

Attachment Ian Summary Page.pdf	<u>Document Type</u> Other	Import Message Ian`s Summary Page
IGUA_EB-2024-0063_TimeDockets_20250410.pdf	Time Docket	
IGUA_EB-2024-0063_WorkingSpreadsheet_IGUA_ AMPCO.pdf	Other	Working Spreadsheet



October 31, 2024 INVOICE: 20369265

Association of Major Power Consumers in Ontario

Our Matter: T1035335.2

(AMPCO) OEB Motion re Cost of Capital Review

(EB-2024-0063)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date

Hours

Timekeeper

Description

SUB

2024-09-15 0.20

lan Mondrow

Review draft AMPCO Board of Directors presentation and

comments to M. Passi;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name	, mark	ţ	Hours
Mondrow, lan			0.20
	Total		0.20



November 30, 2024 INVOICE: 20391269

Association of Major Power Consumers in Ontario

Our Matter: T1035335.2

(AMPCO) OEB Motion re Cost of Capital Review

(EB-2024-0063)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
2024-10-02	0.20	lan Mondrow	Update discussion to brief M. Passi;
2024-10-17	0.20	lan Mondrow	Supplemental note to M. Passi providing assessment of S. Cleary testimony and thoughts on approach to argument;
2024-10-28	0.30	lan Mondrow	Correspondence with S. Grice regarding approach to final submissions;

Total Fees for Professional Services

\$542.50

TK Name		Hours	
Mondrow, lan		0.70	
	Total	0.70	



October 31, 2024 INVOICE: 20369273

Association of Major Powers Consumers in Ontario

Our Matter: T1035335.1

(IGUA/AMPCO) OEB Motion re Cost of Capital Review (EB-2024-0063) (IGUA24-ON-OEB-4)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
PREP-WIT-OH	2024-09-03	1.00	lan Mondrow	Instructions regarding filing declaration and undertaking for S. Cleary; review SEC letter regarding OEA confidentiality claims; correspondence and discussion with S. Cleary regarding Presentation Day arrangements;
Previously Claime	^{ed} 2024-09-03	1.30	lan Mondrow	Review filed presentation day materials from experts;
PREP-WIT-OH	2024-09-04	0.10	lan Mondrow	Correspondence from OEB Staff regarding Presentation Day; retrieve LEI presentation materials and send copy to S. Cleary;
OHP	2024-09-05	0.50	Ian Mondrow	Review LEI presentation day materials;
ОНА	2024-09-05	5.00	Ian Mondrow	Attend presentation day;
ОНА	2024-09-05	0.50	Ian Mondrow	Debrief discussion with S. Cleary and update note regarding Presentation Day to clients;
SUB-CONF	2024-09-09	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Correspondence regarding obtaining access to confidential OEA IRR filings;
ОНР	2024-09-12	0.70	lan Mondrow	Discussion with M. Rubenstein and L. Gluck regarding division of responsibilities for cross-examinations and various approaches; consider and provide time estimates to OEB Staff; note to S. Grice regarding co-ordinating work for oral hearing;
SUB-CONF	2024-09-15	0.20	lan Mondrow	Review OEA letter regarding confidentiality claim;
1	2024-09-16	0.20	lan Mondrow	Correspondence with OEB Staff regarding hearing logistics;
	2024-09-19	0.30	lan Mondrow	Hearing preparation;
OHP	2024-09-20	0.70	Ian Mondrow	Intervenor discussion regarding time estimate reduction and further co-ordination;
	2024-09-21	1.70	lan Mondrow	Continue review of materials and hearing preparation;
	2024-09-22	2.10	lan Mondrow	Continue hearing preparation;
	2024-09-23	3.80	lan Mondrow	Continue hearing preparation;
	2024-09-24	7.20	lan Mondrow	Continue hearing preparation;
OHA	2024-09-25	3.60	lan Mondrow	Attend hearing;
1	2024-09-25	6.40	lan Mondrow	Continue hearing preparation;
OHP	2024-09-26	1.90	lan Mondrow	Continue hearing preparation;
	2024-09-26	2.50	Ian Mondrow	Hearing preparation;
	2024-09-26	5.50	Ian Mondrow	Attend oral hearing;



October 31, 2024

INVOICE: 20369273

OHA	2024-09-27	8.10	Ian Mondrow	Attend hearing;
	2024-09-28	0.50	Ian Mondrow	Hearing preparation;
OHP	2024-09-29	4.70	Ian Mondrow	Continue hearing preparation;
	2024-09-30	8.50	Ian Mondrow	Continue hearing preparation;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, lan		67.20
	Total	67.20



November 30, 2024

INVOICE: 20391266

SPLITTING OF RESPONSIBILITY FOR ACCOUNT

Due From	Fee %	Disb %
Industrial Gas Users Association	50.0	0.0
Association of Major Power Consumers	50.0	0.0



November 30, 2024 INVOICE: 20391266

Association of Major Powers Consumers in Our Matter: T1035335.1

(IGUA/AMPCO) OEB Motion re Cost of Capital Review (EB-2024-0063) (IGUA24-ON-OEB-4)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
OHA	2024-10-01	8.00	lan Mondrow	Attend hearing;
0.10	2024-10-01	0.80	Ian Mondrow	Hearing preparation;
OHP	2024-10-02	0.60	Ian Mondrow	Hearing preparation; review finalized UT response for filing;
OHA	2024-10-02	6.70	Ian Mondrow	Hearing attendance;
	2024-10-03	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Correspondence with S. Cleary and OEB Staff regarding scope of undertaking given; update note to clients;
PREP-IE	2024-10-05	0.40	lan Mondrow	Review notes from S. Cleary regarding U/T responses and provide instructions regarding response filing preparation; note to N. Daube with report requested for review prior to hearing resumption;
	2024-10-07	0.50	Ian Mondrow	Review interim cost decision and update to clients; review supplementary compendium from TFG/Minogi;
OHP	2024-10-08	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Retrieve undertaking responses; follow-up with S. Cleary regarding undertaking to update recommended parameters;
	2024-10-09	2.00	Ian Mondrow	Retrieve late filed compendia; correspondence with OEB Staff regarding U/T responses;
OHA	2024-10-10	8.10	Ian Mondrow	Attend hearing;
	2024-10-11	0.80	Ian Mondrow	Review outstanding undertakings; forward related information to S. Cleary for review and response; internal correspondence for production of responses for filing;
PREP-IE	2024-10-14	0.50	Ian Mondrow	Review draft undertaking responses from S. Cleary and instructions for formatting and finalizing for filing;
	2024-10-15	0.40	lan Mondrow	Review and approve U/T responses for filing;
SUB	2024-10-25	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Review questions from L. Gluck (CCC) and pass on to S. Cleary for for consideration;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, Ian		29.30
	Total	29.30



December 30, 2024

INVOICE: 20408211

SPLITTING OF RESPONSIBILITY FOR ACCOUNT

Due From	Fee %	Disb %	Hours
Industrial Gas Users Association	50.0	0.0	14.65
Association of Major Power Consumers	50.0	0.0	14.65



December 30, 2024 INVOICE: 20408211

Association of Major Powers Consumers in Our Matter: T1035335.1

(IGUA/AMPCO) OEB Motion re Cost of Capital Review (EB-2024-0063) (IGUA24-ON-OEB-4)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
2024-11-0	2 0.30	Ian Mondrow	Review recent correspondence from S. Cleary regarding points for argument;
2024-11-0	3 2.40	Ian Mondrow	Review historical material and work on argument;
2024-11-0	4 4.10	Ian Mondrow	Continue review of materials and drafting of argument; correspondence with various intervenors regarding issues and approach to argument and sharing of drafts;
2024-11-0	5 8.20	Ian Mondrow	Continue review of materials and drafting argument;
2024-11-0	6 7.80	Ian Mondrow	Continue drafting argument;
2024-11-0	7 2.90	Ian Mondrow	Finalizing argument and overseeing filing;
2024-11-0	7 1.80	Ian Mondrow	Finalizing argument; collecting other arguments filed for review;
2024-11-0	7 0.40	Ian Mondrow	Client update on filing of argument and upcoming work to assess reply;
2024-11-1	1 0.10	Ian Mondrow	Review round 1 submissions;
2024-11-1	3 0.30	Ian Mondrow	Correspondence with S. Cleary and send arguments for review; correspondence with L. Gluck (CCC) re topics for reply;
2024-11-1	3 0.10	Ian Mondrow	Review S. Cleary input;
2024-11-2	4 0.80	Ian Mondrow	Continue review of round 1 submissions and drafting reply;
2024-11-2	5 2.40	Ian Mondrow	Continue review of round 1 submissions and drafting reply;
2024-11-2	6 4.40	Ian Mondrow	Continue review of submisisons and drafting reply;
2024-11-2	7 7.50	Ian Mondrow	Continue review of round 1 submissions and drafting reply;
2024-11-2	8 12.10	Ian Mondrow	Continue drafting reply submissions;
2024-11-2	9 0.70	lan Mondrow	Update note to clients regarding reply completion and remaining steps; final filing instructions;

Total Fees for Professional Services

SUB



December 30, 2024

INVOICE: 20408211

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, lan		56.30
	Total	56.30



December 31, 2024

INVOICE: 20417984

SPLITTING OF RESPONSIBILITY FOR ACCOUNT

Due From	Fee %	Disb %	Hours
Industrial Gas Users Association	50.0	0.0	28.15
Association of Major Power Consumers	50.0	0.0	28.15



December 31, 2024 INVOICE: 20417984

Association of Major Powers Consumers in

Our Matter: T1035335.1

(IGUA/AMPCO) OEB Motion re Cost of Capital Review (EB-2024-0063) (IGUA24-ON-OEB-4)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
O. I.D.	2024-11-23	2.20	lan Mondrow	Review notes from S. Cleary commenting on round 1 submissions; review round one submissions from other parties and work on reply;
SUB	2024-12-02	2.90	Ian Mondrow	Review reply arguments;
	2024-12-03	1.20	Ian Mondrow	Conclude review of reply submissions;
	2024-12-05	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Review confidential version of OEA Reply Submission;
DEC	2024-12-11	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Review OEB decision on confidentiality;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, lan		6.50
	Total	6.50

CASE

EB-2024-0063: Rates:

Policy-Related: Ontario Energy

Board

COST CLAIM

EB-2024-0063: 2: Maria

Ciciretto

INTERVENOR NAME

Ciciretto, Maria; +1 (416)

369-7335

maria.ciciretto@gowlingwlg.c

FILING PARTICIPANT

Mondrow, lan; +1 (416) 369-4670

ian.mondrow@gowlingwlg.com

NEW

PARTICIPANT

NON-FILING

PARTICIPANT F. NAME

NON-FILING

PARTICIPANT

In Progress

CLAIM STATUS

PARTICIPANT L. NAME

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE*

Legal Counsel

YEAR CALLED TO BAR*

1991

COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF

RELEVANT EXPERIENCE*

34

HST RATE CHARGED*

13.00

CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST)

CV Required

LAST CV DATE

OVERRIDE HOURLY RATE

HOURLY RATE

330

No

HST NUMBER R137667424

HEARINGS

Yes

CONSULTATIONS

No

DISBURSEMENTS

No

HEARINGS

Hearings Hours 87.57

Hearings Subtotal (\$) 28,898.10

Hearings Total Tax (\$) 3,756.77

Hearings Total (\$) 32,654.87

<u>Name</u>		<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	Sub Total	HST Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
DISCOVERY Read and Research Application Evidence	cation and		330		13.00		
Preparation of Interrogato	ries		330		13.00		
Review Interrogatory Res	oonses		330		13.00		
Technical Conference Pre	paration		330		13.00		
Technical Conference Atte	endance		330		13.00		
Technical Conference Follows	ow-up		330		13.00		
Subtotal of DISCOVERY		0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
PROCEDURAL Preparation of Issues List	Submission		330		13.00		
Attendance at Issues List	Conference		330		13.00		
Preparation for a Confider	ntiality Request		330		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on 0	Confidentiality	0.20	330	66.00	13.00	8.58	74.58
Preparation of Motion(s) N	/laterials		330		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on t	he Motion(s)		330		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on	Motion(s)		330		13.00		
Review Procedural Docum	nents		330		13.00		

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	Sub Total	HST Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Subtotal of PROCEDURAL	0.20		66.00		8.58	74.58
INTERVENOR EVIDENCE Preparation of Intervenor Evidence	0.65	330	214.50	13.00	27.89	242.39
Interrogatory Responses		330		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing	0.55	330	181.50	13.00	23.60	205.10
Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE	1.20		396.00		51.49	447.49
SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE Preparation for Settlement Conference		330		13.00		
Attendance at Settlement Conference		330		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		330		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		330		13.00		
Subtotal of SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
WRITTEN ARGUMENT						
Written Submissions	32.30	330	10,659.00	13.00	1,385.67	12,044.67
Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT	32.30		10,659.00		1,385.67	12,044.67
ORAL ARGUMENT Preparation for Oral Hearing	25.62	330	8,454.60	13.00	1,099.10	9,553.70
Attendance at Oral Hearing	20.50	330	6,765.00	13.00	879.45	7,644.45
Oral Submissions		330		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		330		13.00		
Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT	46.12		15,219.60		1,978.55	17,198.15
DECISION Review Decision	5.00	330	1,650.00	13.00	214.50	1,864.50
Review Rate/Accounting Order		330		13.00		·
Prepare Submission on Rate Order		330		13.00		
Subtotal of DECISION	5.00		1,650.00		214.50	1,864.50
OTHER			,			,
Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor Conferences)	2.75	330	907.50	13.00	117.98	1,025.48
Subtotal of OTHER	2.75		907.50		117.98	1,025.48
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES Total Service Provider Fees	87.57		28,898.10		3,756.77	32,654.87

Attachments General Attachments

Attachment
IGUA_EB-2024-0063_Cost_Claim_Support_Letter_ Document Type Cover Letter **Import Message**

20250410.pdf $IGUA_EB-2024-0063_TimeDockets_20250410.pdf$

Time Docket

AMPCO, T1035335.2 RAE PREP-IR REV-IRR	20399265	20391269	20369273	split	20391266 <mark>split</mark>		20408211 <mark>spli</mark>	t	20417984 split		Shelley Grice's Time
TCP											
TCA TC-FOL-UP											
IL-PREP											
ILC-ATT CONF-REQ											
SUB-CONF			0.4	0.2							
PREP-MOT-MAT PREP-SUB-MOT											
ATT-HM											
RPD PREP-IE					1.3	0.65					
IE-IRR			4.4	0.55							
PREP-WIT-OH SCP			1.1	0.55							
SCA											
PSP ATT-PP											
SUB	0.2	0.7			0.1	0.05	56.3	28.15	6.4	3.2	
OHP OHA			47.2 17.2	23.6 8.6	4.1 23.8	2.05 11.9					
O-SUB			17.2	0.0	25.0	11.5					
ATT-O-SUB									0.5	0.05	4.75
DEC REV-OR									6.5	3.25	1.75
PREP-SUB-RO											0.75
OTH-ATT Total	0.2	0.7	65.9		29.3		56.3		12.9		2.75 4.5

CASE

EB-2024-0063: Rates:

Policy-Related: Ontario Energy

Board

COST CLAIM

EB-2024-0063: 2: Maria

Ciciretto

INTERVENOR NAME

Ciciretto, Maria; +1 (416)

369-7335

maria.ciciretto@gowlingwlg.c

FILING PARTICIPANT

Grice, Shelley; +1 (647) 880-9942

shelley.grice@rogers.com

NEW

PARTICIPANT

NON-FILING

PARTICIPANT F. NAME

NON-FILING

PARTICIPANT

Submitted

CLAIM STATUS

PARTICIPANT L. NAME

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE*

Consultant

YEAR CALLED TO BAR*

PRACTICING/YEARS OF **RELEVANT EXPERIENCE***

24

COMPLETED YEARS

HST RATE CHARGED*

13.00

CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST)

CV Provided within Previous

24 Months

LAST CV DATE

February 21, 2024

OVERRIDE HOURLY RATE

HOURLY RATE

330

No

HST NUMBER R137667424

HEARINGS

Yes

CONSULTATIONS

No

DISBURSEMENTS

No

HEARINGS

Hearings Hours 4.50

Hearings Subtotal (\$) 1,485.00

Hearings Total Tax (\$) 193.06

Hearings Total (\$) 1,678.06

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	Sub Total	HST Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
DISCOVERY Read and Research Application and Evidence		330		13.00		
Preparation of Interrogatories		330		13.00		
Review Interrogatory Responses		330		13.00		
Technical Conference Preparation		330		13.00		
Technical Conference Attendance		330		13.00		
Technical Conference Follow-up		330		13.00		
Subtotal of DISCOVERY	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
PROCEDURAL Preparation of Issues List Submission		330		13.00		
Attendance at Issues List Conference		330		13.00		
Preparation for a Confidentiality Request		330		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality		330		13.00		
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		330		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		330		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		330		13.00		
Review Procedural Documents		330		13.00		

<u>!</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	Sub Total	HST Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
;	Subtotal of PROCEDURAL	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
	VENOR EVIDENCE Preparation of Intervenor Evidence		330		13.00		
I	Interrogatory Responses		330		13.00		
á	Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE	0.00	330	0.00	13.00	0.00	0.00
	EMENT CONFERENCE Preparation for Settlement Conference		330		13.00		
,	Attendance at Settlement Conference		330		13.00		
ı	Preparation of Settlement Proposal		330		13.00		
,	Attendance at Presentation to Panel		330		13.00		
WRITT	Subtotal of SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE EN ARGUMENT Written Submissions	0.00	330	0.00	13.00	0.00	0.00
;	Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
_	ARGUMENT Preparation for Oral Hearing		330		13.00		
,	Attendance at Oral Hearing		330		13.00		
(Oral Submissions		330		13.00		
,	Attendance at Oral Submissions		330		13.00		
;	Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
DECISI	ON Review Decision	1.75	330	577.50	13.00	75.08	652.58
ſ	Review Rate/Accounting Order		330		13.00		
ı	Prepare Submission on Rate Order		330		13.00		
;	Subtotal of DECISION	1.75		577.50		75.08	652.58
(Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor Conferences)	2.75	330	907.50	13.00	117.98	1,025.48
	Subtotal of OTHER SERVICE PROVIDER FEES	2.75		907.50		117.98	1,025.48
	Total Service Provider Fees	4.50		1,485.00		193.06	1,678.06

Attachments General Attachments

<u>Attachment</u> EB-2024-0063_SGInvoice_Timesheet_20250410.pd <u>Document Type</u> Time Docket and **Import Message**

Invoice

CC_Participant_Combined.rpt - last Update 20230601

Shelley Grice, P. Eng.

46 Scarborough Road, Toronto ON M4E 3M5

INVOICE #A25-03

April 3, 2025

AMPCO PO Box 1008 First Canadian Place RPO First CAN Toronto, ON M5K 1P2

Attention: Mr. Brad Duguid, President

Re:OEB Cost of Capital Review

EB-2024-0063

Description	Charge Type	Hours	Rate	Amount
Professional Services of	Review Decision; Advise			
Shelley Grice	client	4.50	\$330.00	\$1,485.00
Sub-Total				\$1,485.00
HST on Services				\$193.05
Disbursements				
HST on Disbursements				
GST #817042757RT0001		4.50	TOTAL	\$1,678.05

Details are included in the attached time sheet. Please make cheque payable to Shelley Grice.

Sincerely,

Shelley Grice, P. Eng.

Name: Shelley Grice						
PROJECT TIME S	HEET	DATE	INVOICE			
EB-2024-0063		2025-03-31	#A25-03			
Cost Of Capital	Review		•			
PROJECT TIME SHEET						
DATE	TASK DESCRIPTION	CHARGE TYPE	Hours			
2024-10-27	Review evidence & prepare presentation materials on Cost of Capital parameters & proposals for AMPCO briefing; calls w/intervenors; emails	Other	2.75			
2025-03-29	Review Decision; Prepare notes for AMPCO Board Meeting	Review Decision	1.75			
TOTAL			4.50			

CASE

EB-2024-0063: Rates:

Policy-Related: Ontario Energy

Board

COST CLAIM

EB-2024-0063: 2: Maria

Ciciretto

INTERVENOR NAME

Ciciretto, Maria; +1 (416)

369-7335

maria.ciciretto@gowlingwlg.c

NON-FILING

PARTICIPANT

Submitted

CLAIM STATUS

PARTICIPANT L. NAME

FILING PARTICIPANT

Mondrow, lan; +1 (416) 369-4670 ian.mondrow@gowlingwlg.com

NEW

PARTICIPANT

NON-FILING

PARTICIPANT F. NAME

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE*

Legal Counsel

YEAR CALLED TO BAR*

1991

COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF

RELEVANT EXPERIENCE*

34

HST RATE CHARGED*

13.00

CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST)

CV Required

LAST CV DATE

OVERRIDE

HOURLY RATE

330

HOURLY RATE No

HST NUMBER R137667424

HEARINGS

No

CONSULTATIONS

No

DISBURSEMENTS

No