
EXTENSION DEADLINE DATE

EB-2024-0111 : 1 : Brianne Fisher

COST CLAIM NUMBER SUBMISSION DEADLINE DATE CLAIM STATUS

EB# PHASE #*

INTERVENOR COMPANY*INTERVENOR

HST RATE ONTARIO

INTERVENOR TYPE

EXCHANGE RATE COUNTRY

LATE SUBMISSION ALLOWED

2753 June 13, 2025 Approved by Finance

EB-2024-0111: Rates: Distribution: Enbridge Gas 

Inc.

1

Industrial Gas Users Association, 

Ottawa: Corporation

 13.00

Full Registrant

Canada

Yes June 24, 2025

Fisher, Brianne; +1 (416) 369-7111 

brianne.fisher@ca.gowlingwlg.com

OTHER EB#S

89659 3323 RT0001

HST NUMBER

New 

PARTICIPANTS

Total ($)
Participant 

Claim 

StatusFiling ParticipantNon-Filing Participant First, Last Name

Total 

Hours

No  81,785.75 SubmittedMondrow, Ian; +1 (416) 

369-4670 

ian.mondrow@gowlingwlg.c

om

,  201.10

Yes  5,145.53 SubmittedDustin , Madsen  14.85

ATTACHMENTS

Attachment

Document 

Type

Import Message

IGUA EB-2024-0111 Cost Claim 061220251419.pdf

IGUA EB-2024-0111 Cost Claim 062320251637.pdf

IGUA EB-2024-0111 Cost Claim 062320252018.pdf

EB-2024-0111_Coverletter_06232025.pdf Cover 

Letter

IGUA EB-2024-0111 Cost Claim 062420251156.pdf

Report Name: CC_Cost_Claim_Header.rpt Last Update 20230214 - Page 1 of 2



TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT/OTHER FEES TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS

 77,095.40  181.86

TOTAL HST

 9,654.02

TOTAL CLAIM

 86,931.28

TOTAL AMOUNT AWARDED

REASON FOR 

DISALLOWANCE

MAKE CHEQUE PAYABLE TO

SEND PAYMENT TO ADDRESS

851 Industrial Avenue

P.O. Box 30

Ottawa, ON    K1G 4L3

ATTENTION

Jacob Irving, President

REASON FOR 

DISALLOWANCE - 2

REASON FOR 

DISALLOWANCE - 3

Industrial Gas Users Association

TOTAL HOURS CLAIMED

 215.95

TOTAL HOURS DISALLOWED

SUBMIT SECTION

I am a representative of the Party. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim. The costs 

incurred and time spent are directly related to the Party's participation in the OEB Process referred to above.

This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the 

Party as described in section 6.05 and 6.09 of the OEB's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

The information (fees and disbursements) filed in this cost claim is complete and accurate and in accordance with the 

OEB's Practice Direction for Cost Awards and Appendix A, the Cost Awards Tariff.

DATE SUBMITTED

Ian Mondrow June 24, 2025

SUBMITTED BY

Report Name: CC_Cost_Claim_Header.rpt Last Update 20230214 - Page 2 of 2



DISBURSEMENTS

CASE COST CLAIM INTERVENOR NAME

Fisher, Brianne; +1 (416) 

369-7111 

brianne.fisher@ca.gowlingwlg

.com

PARTICIPANT 

CLAIM STATUSEB-2024-0111: Rates: 

Distribution: Enbridge Gas Inc.

FILING PARTICIPANT NEW 

PARTICIPANT

NON-FILING 

PARTICIPANT F. NAME

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE* YEAR CALLED TO BAR* COMPLETED YEARS 

PRACTICING/YEARS OF 

RELEVANT EXPERIENCE*

HOURLY RATE

CV STATUS (FOR 

CONSULTANT/ANALYST)

LAST CV DATE

HEARINGS CONSULTATIONS

Mondrow, Ian; +1 (416) 369-4670 

ian.mondrow@gowlingwlg.com No

Legal Counsel 1991

 34

 359

CV Required

No Yes

Ian Mondrow

Yes

July 17, 2025

EB-2024-0111 : 1 : Brianne 

Fisher

NON-FILING 

PARTICIPANT L. NAME

Submitted

HST NUMBER

 13.00

HST RATE CHARGED*

89659 3323 RT0001

Yes

OVERRIDE 

HOURLY RATE

HEARINGS

Hearings Hours

 201.10

Hearings Subtotal ($)

 72,194.90

Hearings Total Tax ($)

 9,385.35  81,580.25

Hearings Total ($)

Name Hours Hourly 

Rate

Sub Total HST 

Rate

HST Total

DISCOVERY
Read and Research Application and 

Evidence

 37.80  359  13,570.20  13.00  1,764.13  15,334.33

Preparation of Interrogatories  359  13.00

Review Interrogatory Responses  359  13.00

Technical Conference Preparation  6.50  359  2,333.50  13.00  303.36  2,636.86

Technical Conference Attendance  6.60  359  2,369.40  13.00  308.02  2,677.42

Technical Conference Follow-up  359  13.00

Subtotal of DISCOVERY  50.90  18,273.10  2,375.51  20,648.61

PROCEDURAL
Preparation of Issues List Submission  4.30  359  1,543.70  13.00  200.68  1,744.38

Attendance at Issues List Conference  359  13.00

Preparation for a Confidentiality Request  359  13.00

Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality  359  13.00

Preparation of Motion(s) Materials  359  13.00

Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)  4.80  359  1,723.20  13.00  224.02  1,947.22

Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)  1.60  359  574.40  13.00  74.67  649.07

Review Procedural Documents  9.20  359  3,302.80  13.00  429.36  3,732.16

CC_Participant_Combined.rpt - last Update 20230601
Page 1 of 3



Name Hours Hourly 

Rate

Sub Total HST 

Rate

HST Total

Subtotal of PROCEDURAL  19.90  7,144.10  928.73  8,072.83

INTERVENOR EVIDENCE
Preparation of Intervenor Evidence  359  13.00

Interrogatory Responses  359  13.00

Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance 

at Hearing

 359  13.00

Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE  0.00  0.00  0.00  0.00

SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE
Preparation for Settlement Conference  15.80  359  5,672.20  13.00  737.39  6,409.59

Attendance at Settlement Conference  50.20  359  18,021.80  13.00  2,342.83  20,364.63

Preparation of Settlement Proposal  6.70  359  2,405.30  13.00  312.69  2,717.99

Attendance at Presentation to Panel  3.40  359  1,220.60  13.00  158.68  1,379.28

Subtotal of SETTLEMENT 

CONFERENCE

 76.10  27,319.90  3,551.59  30,871.49

WRITTEN ARGUMENT
Written Submissions  20.30  359  7,287.70  13.00  947.40  8,235.10

Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT  20.30  7,287.70  947.40  8,235.10

ORAL ARGUMENT
Preparation for Oral Hearing  9.70  359  3,482.30  13.00  452.70  3,935.00

Attendance at Oral Hearing  21.40  359  7,682.60  13.00  998.74  8,681.34

Oral Submissions  359  13.00

Attendance at Oral Submissions  359  13.00

Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT  31.10  11,164.90  1,451.44  12,616.34

DECISION
Review Decision  2.80  359  1,005.20  13.00  130.68  1,135.88

Review Rate/Accounting Order  359  13.00

Prepare Submission on Rate Order  359  13.00

Subtotal of DECISION  2.80  1,005.20  130.68  1,135.88

OTHER
Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor 

Conferences)

 359  13.00

Subtotal of OTHER  0.00  0.00  0.00  0.00

TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES

Total Service Provider Fees  201.10  72,194.90  9,385.35  81,580.25

Import MessageDocument TypeAttachment

Attachments

EB-2024-0111_Coverletter_06232025.pdf Cover Letter

OEB Cost Claim - Table of Revised 

Activities.pdf

Other

EB-2024-0111_Invoices_06232025.pdf Time Docket

EB-2024-0111_Spreadsheet_ 06232025.pdf Other Excel spreadsheet

EB-2024-0111_IMondrow_Summary_Page_ 

06232025.pdf

Other Summary page

CC_Participant_Combined.rpt - last Update 20230601
Page 2 of 3



DISBURSEMENTS

Disbursement 

Subtotal($)

Disbursement 

Total Tax($)

Other Taxes/Tips 

Total($)

Disbursement 

Total($)

 205.50 23.64 181.86  0.00

ATT.

PROV
Name

Total

Other 

Taxes/TipHST

HST 

Rate

Net 

Cost

$/ 

Unit

Qty Rationale/

Comment

ATT.

REQ'D

Scanning/Photocopy 

(Internal)

 13.00

Scanning/Photocopy 

(External)

 13.00

Printing (Internal)  13.00

Printing (External)  13.00

Courier  13.00

Teleconference  13.00

Travel:  Air  13.00

Travel:  Car Rental  13.00

Travel:  Gas  13.00

Travel:  Car Mileage – 

Southern Ontario

 0.40

Travel:  Car Mileage – 

Northern Ontario

 0.41

Travel:  Rail  13.00

Travel (Other)  13.00

Parking YesYes  1.00  181.86  181.86  13.00  23.64  205.50

Taxi  13.00

Accommodation  13.00

Other  13.00

Total Disbursements:  181.86  23.64  0.00  205.50

Attachments
Attachment Import Message

EB-2024-0111_Disbursements_06232025.pdf

Attachment Document Type Claim Type Import Message

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

EB-2024-0111_Coverletter_06232025.pdf Cover Letter Hearings

OEB Cost Claim - Table of Revised 

Activities.pdf

Other Hearings

EB-2024-0111_Invoices_06232025.pdf Time Docket Hearings

EB-2024-0111_Spreadsheet_ 06232025.pdf Excel spreadsheetOther Hearings

EB-2024-0111_Disbursements_06232025.p

df

Parking Disbursements

EB-2024-0111_IMondrow_Summary_Page_ 

06232025.pdf

Summary pageOther Hearings

CC_Participant_Combined.rpt - last Update 20230601
Page 3 of 3



April 19, 2024
INVOICE: 20255605

Terms: payment due within 30 days of invoice date
Interest at the rate of 5.3% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within 30 days of invoice date

Errors and omissions excluded
page 2 of 3

Industrial Gas Users Association
Our Matter:  T1035636
EGI 2024 Rebasing and IRM Application - Phase 
2 (EB-2024-0111) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-9)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date Hours Timekeeper Description
2024-03-13 1.60 Ian Mondrow Commence review and organization of Phase 2 related 

materials;
2024-03-14 0.80 Ian Mondrow Continue review of materials regarding Phase 2 and 3 

issues;
2024-03-16 2.40 Ian Mondrow Continue review of Phase 1 Settlement and Decision to 

identify scope of Phase 2 (and 3) issues;
2024-03-18 0.10 Ian Mondrow Continue review of materials regarding organization of 

issues for Phases 2 and 3;

Total Fees for Professional Services $3,797.50

SUMMARY OF FEES

TK Name Billed Rate Hours Amount
Mondrow, Ian 775.00 4.90 3,797.50

Total 4.90 $3,797.50

FisherBr
Text Box

FisherBr
Text Box

FisherBr
Text Box



iPad Pro 12.9" 5
RAE

iPad Pro 12.9" 5



May 24, 2024
INVOICE: 20275573

Terms: payment due within 30 days of invoice date
Interest at the rate of 5.3% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within 30 days of invoice date

Errors and omissions excluded
page 2 of 3

Industrial Gas Users Association
Our Matter:  T1035636
Phase 2 - EGI 2024 Rebasing and IRM 
Application (EB-2024-0111) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-9)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date Hours Timekeeper Description
2024-04-04 0.30 Ian Mondrow Review OEB letter regarding timing and update to IGUA;
2024-04-16 1.00 Ian Mondrow IGUA Caucus update and discussion of pending issues;
2024-04-23 0.20 Ian Mondrow Review ED lettter regarding Extended Length Charge non-

compliance;
2024-04-29 0.20 Ian Mondrow Review additional ED correspondence regarding alleged 

Extended Length Charge avoidance by EGI;
2024-04-29 0.40 Ian Mondrow Review P.O. No. 1; review OEB communication on 

continued stay of revenue horizon findings and associated 
abeyance of EGI motion for review;

2024-04-29 0.20 Ian Mondrow Review EGI Phase 2 transmittal letter and retrieve Phase 2 
evidence for review;

2024-04-30 0.80 Ian Mondrow Continue review of Phase 1 decision regarding Phase 2 
issues and compilation of working list of issues;

Total Fees for Professional Services $2,402.50

SUMMARY OF FEES

TK Name Billed Rate Hours Amount
Mondrow, Ian 775.00 3.10 2,402.50

Total 3.10 $2,402.50

FisherBr
Text Box

FisherBr
Text Box

FisherBr
Text Box

FisherBr
Text Box



iPad Pro 12.9" 5

iPad Pro 12.9" 5
RPD

iPad Pro 12.9" 5

iPad Pro 12.9" 5
RAE



June 28, 2024
INVOICE: 20295893

Terms: payment due within 30 days of invoice date
Interest at the rate of 5.3% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within 30 days of invoice date

Errors and omissions excluded
page 2 of 3

Industrial Gas Users Association
Our Matter:  T1035636
Phase 2 - EGI 2024 Rebasing and IRM 
Application (EB-2024-0111) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-9)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date Hours Timekeeper Description
2024-05-01 0.20 Ian Mondrow Review OEB letter regarding Phase 2 Hearing Panel 

expansion and note to IGUA;
2024-05-01 0.20 Ian Mondrow Update to client on EGI filing and procedural directions;
2024-05-06 0.40 Ian Mondrow Correspondence with K. Elson regarding potential rate plan 

options topic and with A Hopkins (Synapse); review recent 
ED GEC letter to the OEB;

2024-05-08 0.30 Ian Mondrow Review EGI issues list submission;
2024-05-10 0.80 Ian Mondrow Review and consider HRAI e-mail and related historical 

corresopndence re Enbridge Sustain and Phase 2 issues 
list;

2024-05-13 2.20 Ian Mondrow Conclude review and consideration of EGI issues list 
submission; review submissions filed by other parties; 
consider submission by IGUA;

2024-05-14 0.50 Ian Mondrow Complete review of issues submisisons filed by others;
2024-05-17 0.50 Ian Mondrow Review EGI's detailed issues list reply;
2024-05-27 0.20 Ian Mondrow Review recent correspondence regarding Enbridge Sustain 

status change (to affiliate) and Minogi intervention and 
check procedural status of the case;

Total Fees for Professional Services $4,107.50

SUMMARY OF FEES

TK Name Billed Rate Hours Amount
Mondrow, Ian 775.00 5.30 4,107.50

Total 5.30 $4,107.50

FisherBr
Text Box

FisherBr
Text Box

FisherBr
Text Box



iPad Pro 12.9" 5

iPad Pro 12.9" 5
RPD

iPad Pro 12.9" 5

iPad Pro 12.9" 5
IL-PREP

iPad Pro 12.9" 5
RAE



July 22, 2024
INVOICE: 20310665

Terms: payment due within 30 days of invoice date
Interest at the rate of 5.3% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within 30 days of invoice date

Errors and omissions excluded
page 2 of 5

Industrial Gas Users Association
Our Matter:  T1035636
Phase 2 - EGI 2024 Rebasing and IRM 
Application (EB-2024-0111) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-9)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date Hours Timekeeper Description
2024-06-03 0.70 Ian Mondrow Review P.O. No. 2 (issues list and late intervention findings 

and schedule through settlement process); organize Phase 
1/Phase 2 documents;

2024-06-04 2.10 Ian Mondrow Detailed review of Phase 2 filing and assess/draft IRs;
2024-06-11 0.90 Ian Mondrow Review OEB Staff letter regarding intended expert evidence;
2024-06-12 0.80 Ian Mondrow Discussion with S. Rahbar regarding evidence proposals 

filed and issues for IGUA to pursue; update note for IGUA 
membership;

2024-06-12 0.40 Ian Mondrow Drafting letter of support for ED/GEC evidence proposals;
2024-06-13 0.10 Ian Mondrow Review HRAI letter regarding IR schedule and evidence 

scope;
2024-06-14 1.10 Ian Mondrow Continue review of EGI evidence;
2024-06-17 0.10 Ian Mondrow Correspondence regarding deferred Phase 1 IRs; review 

notes from D. Quinn relating to Phase 2 storage issues for 
discussion;

2024-06-17 0.10 Ian Mondrow Review OEB determination regarding intervenor evidence;
2024-06-17 0.50 Ian Mondrow Continue review of pre-filed evidence;
2024-06-18 5.30 Ian Mondrow Continue review of pre-filed evidence and consideration of 

IRs;
2024-06-19 1.70 Ian Mondrow Continue review of pre-filed materials and consideration of 

IRs;
2024-06-20 0.30 Ian Mondrow Continue review of pre-filed evidence and compilation of 

expected issues;
2024-06-20 0.30 Ian Mondrow Update to IGUA Ontario Caucus;
2024-06-21 0.30 Ian Mondrow Continue review of Phase 2 pre-filing;
2024-06-24 2.20 Ian Mondrow Continue review of pre-filed materials and filed IRs thereon;
2024-06-25 1.20 Ian Mondrow Continue review of pre-filed material and issues definition;
2024-06-25 0.80 Ian Mondrow Note to IGUA regarding instructions on net salvage advice 

retainer; client correspondence relating to position on 
RNG/Hydrogen initiatives and large industrial alternative fuel 
aspirations; member reporting;

2024-06-25 1.30 Ian Mondrow Note to D. Madsen for assistance with net salvage topic and 
confirmation to IGUA of D. Madsen retainer;

2024-06-25 1.60 Ian Mondrow Review balance of intervenor IRs filed and consider issues 

iPad Pro 12.9" 5
RPD

iPad Pro 12.9" 5
RAE

iPad Pro 12.9" 5

iPad Pro 12.9" 5
PREP-SUB-MOT

iPad Pro 12.9" 5

iPad Pro 12.9" 5
RAE

iPad Pro 12.9" 5
RPD

iPad Pro 12.9" 5

iPad Pro 12.9" 5
RAE



July 22, 2024
INVOICE: 20310665

Terms: payment due within 30 days of invoice date
Interest at the rate of 5.3% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within 30 days of invoice date

Errors and omissions excluded
page 3 of 5

raised;
2024-06-26 0.10 Ian Mondrow Continue review of pre-filed material and issues matrix 

development;
2024-06-26 0.20 Ian Mondrow Further correspondence with client representatives 

regarding various issues/directions for further consideration;

Total Fees for Professional Services $17,127.50

SUMMARY OF FEES

TK Name Billed Rate Hours Amount
Mondrow, Ian 775.00 22.10 17,127.50

Total 22.10 $17,127.50

FisherBr
Text Box

FisherBr
Text Box

FisherBr
Text Box

FisherBr
Text Box



iPad Pro 12.9" 5

iPad Pro 12.9" 5
RAE



August 29, 2024
INVOICE: 20331946

Terms: payment due within 30 days of invoice date
Interest at the rate of 5.3% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within 30 days of invoice date

Errors and omissions excluded
page 2 of 4

Industrial Gas Users Association
Our Matter:  T1035636
Phase 2 - EGI 2024 Rebasing and IRM 
Application (EB-2024-0111) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-9)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date Hours Timekeeper Description
2024-07-02 1.60 Ian Mondrow Review D. Madsen notes on net salvage calculations and 

EGi's evidence and conference with D. Madsen to discuss;
2024-07-10 0.10 Ian Mondrow Update to client for member circulation;
2024-07-12 0.30 Ian Mondrow Reviewing recent correspondence/filings regarding IRRs, 

evidence update and Technical Conference;
2024-07-16 0.70 Ian Mondrow Complete review of prefiled evidence;
2024-07-16 0.50 Ian Mondrow Review correspondence with IGUA regarding low carbon 

fuel initiatives and further notes regarding potential large 
industrial interest/IGUA positions on the topic;

2024-07-17 2.60 Ian Mondrow Continue review of prefiled materials;
2024-07-17 0.60 Ian Mondrow Review corresopndence regarding Technical Conference 

and provide IGUA time estimates;
2024-07-17 0.80 Ian Mondrow Correspondence & discussions with IGUA regarding views 

on ETTF proposal;
2024-07-17 0.20 Ian Mondrow Note to M. Rubenstein with thoughts on potential positions 

for ETTF proposal;
2024-07-18 0.90 Ian Mondrow Continue review of materials and correspondence with D. 

Madsen regarding net-salvage issues and preparation for 
Technical Conference;

2024-07-19 0.60 Ian Mondrow Continue review of materials and preparation for Technical 
Conference;

2024-07-21 3.00 Ian Mondrow Continue reivew of materials, including notes from D. 
Madsen, and preparation for Technical Conference on 
SRCs;

2024-07-22 1.00 Ian Mondrow Continue preparation for Technical Conference;
2024-07-22 0.80 Ian Mondrow Review Technical Conference transcripts in lieu of 

attendance;
2024-07-23 3.70 Ian Mondrow Attend Technical Conference; review transcripts in lieu of 

attendance at Technical Conference;
2024-07-23 0.20 Ian Mondrow Report to IGUA and members on Technical Conference 

proceedings;
2024-07-24 0.50 Ian Mondrow Review transcripts in lieu of attendance;
2024-07-24 0.30 Ian Mondrow Review recent EGI update filings;
2024-07-25 0.40 Ian Mondrow Review Technical Conference transcripts in lieu of 

attendance;

iPad Pro 12.9" 5

iPad Pro 12.9" 5
RAE

iPad Pro 12.9" 5
RPD

iPad Pro 12.9" 5

iPad Pro 12.9" 5
TCP

iPad Pro 12.9" 5

iPad Pro 12.9" 5
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iPad Pro 12.9" 5
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iPad Pro 12.9" 5
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August 29, 2024
INVOICE: 20331946

Terms: payment due within 30 days of invoice date
Interest at the rate of 5.3% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within 30 days of invoice date

Errors and omissions excluded
page 3 of 4

2024-07-25 0.20 Ian Mondrow Review EGI response to P. Probe letter regarding 
confidentiality claimed in respect of hydrogen study IRR;

2024-07-25 0.20 Ian Mondrow Review and consider ED letter regarding review of Hydrogen 
Blending Study in Phase 2 and note to K. Elson requesting 
clarification;

2024-07-30 0.30 Ian Mondrow Review EGI correspondence regarding Phase 2 scope for 
Hydrogen Study; review FRPO correspondence regarding 
storage cost (utlity/non-utility) allocation alternative 
calculation approach;

Total Fees for Professional Services $15,112.50

SUMMARY OF FEES

TK Name Billed Rate Hours Amount
Mondrow, Ian 775.00 19.50 15,112.50

Total 19.50 $15,112.50

DISBURSEMENTS

Taxable Costs
2024-07-24 Travel Expenses: Parking & Tolls (Out-of-Town)

VENDOR: Mondrow, Ian INVOICE#: 6827545507262101 DATE: 
07/26/2024   Mondrow, Ian, Parking at Ontario Energy Board for 
attendance at Technical Conference. 07/24/24 

$21.24

Total Taxable Disbursements $21.24

FisherBr
Text Box

FisherBr
Text Box

FisherBr
Text Box

iPad Pro 12.9" 5



September 30, 2024
INVOICE: 20351192

Terms: payment due within 30 days of invoice date
Interest at the rate of 5.3% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within 30 days of invoice date

Errors and omissions excluded
page 2 of 4

Industrial Gas Users Association
Our Matter:  T1035636
Phase 2 - EGI 2024 Rebasing and IRM 
Application (EB-2024-0111) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-9)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date Hours Timekeeper Description
2024-08-05 0.70 Ian Mondrow Initial review of materials recently filed (Transcript 

Undertaking responses and updated evidence); collect and 
send D. Madsen Transcript regarding net salvage value 
calculations;

2024-08-07 0.60 Ian Mondrow Review HRAI motion materials and related correspondence 
regarding procedural proposals;

2024-08-09 0.30 Ian Mondrow Review confidentiality and Hydrogen Blending Study issue 
scoping decision; review PO No. 3 regarding HRAI motion 
process;

2024-08-12 0.30 Ian Mondrow Review and consider correspondence regarding HRAI 
Enbridge Sustain motion and summary note to IGUA to 
confirm instructions; review OEB Staff letter regarding late 
filing of evidence;

2024-08-14 0.10 Ian Mondrow Retrieve OEB Staff evidence for review; quick review of 
submissions regarding HRAI motion;

2024-08-14 0.10 Ian Mondrow Review SEC submission on HRAI IRR motion;
2024-08-16 0.10 Ian Mondrow Review additional submissions on HRAI motion;
2024-08-19 0.20 Ian Mondrow Discussion with D. Francis regarding LVC position on 

proposed RNG program;
2024-08-19 0.10 Ian Mondrow Review correspondence from OEB Staff regarding parties' 

evidence numbering and check copies of evidence for 
correct Exhibit numbers;

2024-08-21 0.30 Ian Mondrow Review Technical Conference. transcripts in lieu of 
attendance;

2024-08-21 0.30 Ian Mondrow Review correspondence from EGI regarding intention to file 
reply and impact on proceeding; review correspondence 
from OEB Staff regarding settlement conference format;

2024-08-21 0.10 Ian Mondrow Correspondence with parties regarding Settlement 
Conference logistics;

2024-08-22 0.20 Ian Mondrow Review case status and parties evidence filings for further 
consideration;

2024-08-27 0.50 Ian Mondrow Review HRAI motion decision and related 
filings/correspondence;

2024-08-30 0.40 Ian Mondrow Review ED evidence;
2024-08-30 1.20 Ian Mondrow Review correspondence and P.O. related to HRAI motion 

and EGI disclosure;
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September 30, 2024
INVOICE: 20351192

Terms: payment due within 30 days of invoice date
Interest at the rate of 5.3% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within 30 days of invoice date

Errors and omissions excluded
page 3 of 4

Total Fees for Professional Services $4,262.50

SUMMARY OF FEES

TK Name Billed Rate Hours Amount
Mondrow, Ian 775.00 5.50 4,262.50

Total 5.50 $4,262.50
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October 31, 2024
INVOICE: 20369270

Terms: payment due within 30 days of invoice date
Interest at the rate of 4.8% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within 30 days of invoice date

Errors and omissions excluded
page 2 of 6

Industrial Gas Users Association
Our Matter:  T1035636
Phase 2 - EGI 2024 Rebasing and IRM 
Application (EB-2024-0111) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-9)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date Hours Timekeeper Description
2024-09-03 0.20 Ian Mondrow Correspondence with parties in preparation for settlement 

conference;
2024-09-06 0.90 Ian Mondrow Review intervenor pre-settlement conference questions 

circulated; meeting with some parties to discuss upcoming 
settlement process;

2024-09-06 0.30 Ian Mondrow Review further submisisons regarding HRAI requested 
disclosures;

2024-09-06 0.20 Ian Mondrow Initial review of filings of IRRs on intervenor and OEB Staff 
evidence;

2024-09-07 0.10 Ian Mondrow Review additional Settlement Conference questions 
circulated;

2024-09-08 1.10 Ian Mondrow Review materials in preparation for Settlement Conference;
2024-09-08 0.40 Ian Mondrow Review intervenor evidence;
2024-09-09 3.00 Ian Mondrow Continue review of intervenor evidence;
2024-09-09 0.50 Ian Mondrow Discussion with M. Rubenstein regarding approach to 

settlement conference issues and discussions;
2024-09-09 0.10 Ian Mondrow Review additional materials in preparation for Settlement 

Conference;
2024-09-09 0.80 Ian Mondrow Continue review of materials in preparation for settlement 

conference;
2024-09-10 8.00 Ian Mondrow Attend settlement conference;
2024-09-10 0.80 Ian Mondrow Discuss storage settlement proposal with D. Quinn; review 

material in preparation for continuation of settlement 
discussions;

2024-09-11 8.10 Ian Mondrow Attend settlement conference;
2024-09-12 6.00 Ian Mondrow Attend settlement conference and related discussions;
2024-09-12 0.20 Ian Mondrow Review e-mails regarding ongoing settlement discussions;
2024-09-13 6.70 Ian Mondrow Attend settlement conference;
2024-09-14 0.40 Ian Mondrow Review settlement conference correspondence; note to 

IGUA members for feedback on competitiveness of Ontario 
based storage;

2024-09-15 0.90 Ian Mondrow Review settlement conference correspondence and 
materials recently circulated;

2024-09-15 0.10 Ian Mondrow Review OEB Staff confidentiality filing letter;
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October 31, 2024
INVOICE: 20369270

Terms: payment due within 30 days of invoice date
Interest at the rate of 4.8% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within 30 days of invoice date

Errors and omissions excluded
page 3 of 6

2024-09-16 0.80 Ian Mondrow Discussions/correspondence with various parties regarding 
settlement issues;

2024-09-16 0.20 Ian Mondrow Update S. Rahbar on status of settlement discussions;
2024-09-17 2.10 Ian Mondrow Catch-up review of settlement conference materials and 

preparation for conference reconvening; participate in brief 
settlement conference discussion regarding next steps;

2024-09-18 6.70 Ian Mondrow Participate in resumption of settlement conference;
2024-09-19 5.50 Ian Mondrow Participate in reconvened settlement discussions;
2024-09-20 3.70 Ian Mondrow Continued correspondence regarding, and participation in, 

settlement discussions;
2024-09-21 0.40 Ian Mondrow Review balance of intervenor e-mail exchanges from 

settlement discussions and note substantive points raised 
for consideration upon re-engagement in discussions;

2024-09-23 0.10 Ian Mondrow Review draft letter from D. Stevens; insert comments; 
circulate to intervenors with covering note for review and 
comment;

2024-09-24 0.20 Ian Mondrow IGUA Ontario Caucus update;
2024-09-28 0.20 Ian Mondrow Review P.O. regarding settlement extension and hearing 

scheduling and diarize dates;

Total Fees for Professional Services $45,492.50

SUMMARY OF FEES

TK Name Billed Rate Hours Amount
Mondrow, Ian 775.00 58.70 45,492.50

Total 58.70 $45,492.50

FisherBr
Text Box

FisherBr
Text Box

FisherBr
Text Box

FisherBr
Text Box



iPad Pro 12.9" 5

iPad Pro 12.9" 5
SCP

iPad Pro 12.9" 5

iPad Pro 12.9" 5
SCA

iPad Pro 12.9" 5

iPad Pro 12.9" 5
SCP

iPad Pro 12.9" 5
RPD



October 31, 2024
INVOICE: 20369270

Terms: payment due within 30 days of invoice date
Interest at the rate of 4.8% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within 30 days of invoice date

Errors and omissions excluded
page 4 of 6

DISBURSEMENTS

Taxable Costs
2024-08-15 Parking & Tolls - Local Travel

VENDOR: Mondrow, Ian INVOICE#: 6880476108232105 DATE: 
08/23/2024   Mondrow, Ian, attendance to meeting consultation 
at EGI 08/15/24 

$21.24

2024-09-10 Parking & Tolls - Local Travel
VENDOR: Mondrow, Ian INVOICE#: 6931958209192106 DATE: 
09/19/2024   Mondrow, Ian, Attendance to EGI Phase II - 
Settlement Conference, EB-2024-0111 09/10/24 

$21.24

2024-09-11 Parking & Tolls - Local Travel
VENDOR: Mondrow, Ian INVOICE#: 6931958209192106 DATE: 
09/19/2024   Mondrow, Ian, Attendance to EGI Phase II - 
Settlement Conference, EB-2024-0111 09/11/24 

$21.24

2024-09-12 Parking & Tolls - Local Travel
VENDOR: Mondrow, Ian INVOICE#: 6931958209192106 DATE: 
09/19/2024   Mondrow, Ian, Attendance to EGI Phase II - 
Settlement Conference, EB-2024-0111 09/12/24 

$21.24

2024-09-13 Parking & Tolls - Local Travel
VENDOR: Mondrow, Ian INVOICE#: 6931958209192106 DATE: 
09/19/2024   Mondrow, Ian, Attendance to EGI Phase II - 
Settlement Conference, EB-2024-0111 09/13/24 

$21.24

Total Taxable Disbursements $106.20



November 30, 2024
INVOICE: 20391263

Terms: payment due within 30 days of invoice date
Interest at the rate of 4.8% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within 30 days of invoice date

Errors and omissions excluded
page 2 of 5

Industrial Gas Users Association
Our Matter:  T1035636
Phase 2 - EGI 2024 Rebasing and IRM 
Application (EB-2024-0111) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-9)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date Hours Timekeeper Description
2024-10-05 0.20 Ian Mondrow E-mail to K. Elson regarding potential approach to RNG 

program topic for resumption of settlement discussions; 
correspondence with M. Rubenstein regarding approach to 
resumption of settlement discussions;

2024-10-06 0.30 Ian Mondrow Review intervenor correspondence regarding resumption of 
settlement discussions;

2024-10-07 3.10 Ian Mondrow Participate in resumed settlement discussions;
2024-10-07 0.80 Ian Mondrow Preparation for continuation of settlement discussions;
2024-10-08 0.40 Ian Mondrow Intervenor correspondence in preparation for resumption of 

settlement discussions;
2024-10-08 4.00 Ian Mondrow Participate in continued settlement discussions;
2024-10-09 1.80 Ian Mondrow Attend settlement conference continuation;
2024-10-15 0.10 Ian Mondrow Interim report to IGUA members on status of settlement 

discussions;
2024-10-20 2.00 Ian Mondrow Review and comment on draft settlement agreement;
2024-10-21 0.10 Ian Mondrow Review comments circulated on draft Settlement 

Agreement;
2024-10-26 1.00 Ian Mondrow Review intervenor comments on draft settlement agreement;
2024-10-28 0.10 Ian Mondrow Update to S. Rahbar re settlement process status;
2024-10-30 0.60 Ian Mondrow Review revised draft settlement agreement and comments 

thereon and provide IGUA sign-off;
2024-10-30 0.50 Ian Mondrow Update to IGUA membership on outcome of settlement 

discussions;
2024-10-31 0.30 Ian Mondrow Supplemental report for IGUA members on settlement 

outcome;
2024-10-31 0.10 Ian Mondrow Review further correspondence and information for finalizing 

Phase 2 settlement.

Total Fees for Professional Services $11,935.00
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November 30, 2024
INVOICE: 20391263

Terms: payment due within 30 days of invoice date
Interest at the rate of 4.8% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within 30 days of invoice date

Errors and omissions excluded
page 3 of 5

SUMMARY OF FEES

TK Name Billed Rate Hours Amount
Mondrow, Ian 775.00 15.40 11,935.00

Total 15.40 $11,935.00
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December 31, 2024
INVOICE: 20408716

Terms: payment due within 30 days of invoice date
Interest at the rate of 4.8% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within 30 days of invoice date

Errors and omissions excluded
page 2 of 5

Industrial Gas Users Association
Our Matter:  T1035636
Phase 2 - EGI 2024 Rebasing and IRM 
Application (EB-2024-0111) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-9)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date Hours Timekeeper Description
2024-11-01 0.40 Ian Mondrow Review corresondence regarding draft settlement 

agreement comments and finalization;
2024-11-02 0.50 Ian Mondrow Review DRO;
2024-11-04 0.20 Ian Mondrow Review ED motion letter regarding further decoupling 

information from EGI;
2024-11-04 0.20 Ian Mondrow Review EGI submissions regarding settlement outcomes 

(including DRO and steps towards hearing of remaining 
issues);

2024-11-08 0.90 Ian Mondrow Review EGI response to ED motion materials regarding 
revenue decoupling information requests, including 
associated evidentiary references;

2024-11-08 0.40 Ian Mondrow Review procedural status, including P.O. 8, and diarize 
dates;

2024-11-11 0.20 Ian Mondrow Review revised P.O. and check calendar dates;
2024-11-12 0.10 Ian Mondrow Review corresondence regarding EGI evidence updates;
2024-11-16 0.10 Ian Mondrow Review hearing schedule and recent correspondence;
2024-11-18 0.80 Ian Mondrow Review settlement proposal presentation from EGI and Staff 

submission;
2024-11-18 2.60 Ian Mondrow Attend settlement proposal presentation hearing;
2024-11-18 1.00 Ian Mondrow Review written submissions on ED motion for revenue 

decoupling options information; including EGI responses to 
ED supplemental IRs; and update note to IGUA regarding 
issues raised, positions taken and evidence provided by 
EGI;

2024-11-18 0.20 Ian Mondrow Review updated evidence/IRR filings;
2024-11-18 1.60 Ian Mondrow Attend hearing of ED motion;
2024-11-19 0.20 Ian Mondrow Review EGI letter regarding OEB Staff comments on DRO; 

download and check motion/settlement presentation day 
transcripts;

2024-11-20 0.50 Ian Mondrow Review and consider EGI draft settlement presentation 
undertaking response and provide comments on 
characterization of the requested Phase 3 issues list;

2024-11-21 0.20 Ian Mondrow Review undertaking filed by EGI regarding Phase 3 issues 
and related intervenor correspondence;

2024-11-27 0.20 Ian Mondrow Review correspondence from ED regarding additional 
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December 31, 2024
INVOICE: 20408716

Terms: payment due within 30 days of invoice date
Interest at the rate of 4.8% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within 30 days of invoice date

Errors and omissions excluded
page 3 of 5

hearing time and EGI information campaign; check 
procedural status/schedule;

2024-11-29 0.30 Ian Mondrow Review decision on settlement proposal;
2024-11-30 0.30 Ian Mondrow Complete review of decision on settlement proposal and 

DRO; review EGI response to ED letter regarding interim 
marketing acitivities;

2024-11-30 0.90 Ian Mondrow Report to client on Phase 2 settlement decision and 
remaining steps/issues in the process and review S. Cleary 
invoice and retainer agreement regarding payment timing 
and hours approvals;

Total Fees for Professional Services

SUMMARY OF FEES

TK Name Billed Rate Hours
Mondrow, Ian 775.00 11.80

Total 11.80

Hours  
11.8  
11.8 
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January 23, 2025
INVOICE: 20433972

Terms: payment due within 30 days of invoice date
Interest at the rate of 4.0% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within 30 days of invoice date

Errors and omissions excluded
page 2 of 5

Industrial Gas Users Association
Our Matter:  T1035636
Phase 2 - EGI 2024 Rebasing and IRM 
Application (EB-2024-0111) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-9)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

THIS REPLACES THE FOLLOWING INVOICES:
20417982 DATED DECEMBER 31, 2024
20417985 DATED DECE,BER 31. 2024

Date Hours Timekeeper Description
2024-12-02 0.60 Ian Mondrow Review correspondence regarding hearing panels and time 

estimates and submit time estimates;
2024-12-05 0.80 Ian Mondrow Commence review of materials and preparation for hearing;
2024-12-05 0.40 Ian Mondrow Review and consider EGI and ED correspondence regarding 

conduct of hearing and ED evidence presentation;
2024-12-06 0.20 Ian Mondrow Review EGI letter responding to ED proposal to lead 

additional EFG evidence;
2024-12-08 0.20 Ian Mondrow Review P.O. 9 regarding hearing and additional filings 

directed;
2024-12-10 0.40 Ian Mondrow Review EGI letter to OEB regarding "clarification" of 

settlement proposal decision and P. Probe response, and 
provide further comment to parties in further response;

2024-12-11 0.40 Ian Mondrow Update for IGUA members;
2024-12-11 0.60 Ian Mondrow Review filings by EGI and ED regarding rate decoupling 

topic;
2024-12-12 0.60 Ian Mondrow Continue review of materials and hearing preparation;
2024-12-12 0.20 Ian Mondrow Review EGI filed correspondence regarding settlement 

agreement decision "clarification";
2024-12-12 0.10 Ian Mondrow Continue review of material and preparation for hearing;
2024-12-13 0.30 Ian Mondrow Review parties correspondence regarding CEG & EFG 

witneseses (cross-examinations and qualifications);
2024-12-15 2.70 Ian Mondrow Continue review of materials and preparation for hearing;
2024-12-16 1.90 Ian Mondrow Continue review of materials and hearing preparation;
2024-12-16 0.30 Ian Mondrow Continue review of material and hearing preparation;
2024-12-17 7.90 Ian Mondrow Attend hearing;
2024-12-18 7.80 Ian Mondrow Attend hearing;
2024-12-19 5.70 Ian Mondrow Attend hearing;
2024-12-22 0.30 Ian Mondrow Review P.O. 10 and diarize dates; review recent 

correspondence from parties;
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January 23, 2025
INVOICE: 20433972

Terms: payment due within 30 days of invoice date
Interest at the rate of 4.0% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within 30 days of invoice date

Errors and omissions excluded
page 3 of 5

Total Fees for Professional Services

SUMMARY OF FEES

TK Name Hours
Mondrow, Ian 31.40

Total 31.40

DISBURSEMENTS

Taxable Costs
2024-12-17 Parking & Tolls - Local Travel

VENDOR: Mondrow, Ian INVOICE#: 7147503912301706 DATE: 
12/30/2024   Mondrow, Ian, Attendance to EGI Phase 2 Hearing 
12/17/24 

$25.22

2024-12-18 Parking & Tolls - Local Travel
VENDOR: Mondrow, Ian INVOICE#: 7147503912301706 DATE: 
12/30/2024   Mondrow, Ian, Attendance to EGI Phase 2 Hearing 
12/18/24 

$25.22

2024-12-19 Parking & Tolls - Local Travel
VENDOR: Mondrow, Ian INVOICE#: 7147503912301706 DATE: 
12/30/2024   Mondrow, Ian, Attendance to EGI Phase 2 Hearing 
12/19/24 

$21.24

Total Taxable Disbursements $71.68



February 13, 2025
INVOICE: 20440861

Terms: payment due within 30 days of invoice date
Interest at the rate of 4.0% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within 30 days of invoice date

Errors and omissions excluded
page 2 of 3

Industrial Gas Users Association
Our Matter:  T1035636
Phase 2 - EGI 2024 Rebasing and IRM 
Application (EB-2024-0111) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-9)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date Hours Timekeeper Description
2025-01-13 0.10 Ian Mondrow Review revised P.O. No. 10 and confirm filing dates;
2025-01-21 0.60 Ian Mondrow Review ED and EGI undertaking responses;
2025-01-22 0.50 Ian Mondrow Complete review of EGI undertaking responses;

Total Fees for Professional Services $930.00

SUMMARY OF FEES

TK Name Billed Rate Hours Amount
Mondrow, Ian 775.00 1.20 930.00

Total 1.20 $930.00
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March 31, 2025
INVOICE: 20466205

Terms: payment due within 30 days of invoice date
Interest at the rate of 4.0% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within 30 days of invoice date

Errors and omissions excluded
page 2 of 3

Industrial Gas Users Association
Our Matter:  T1035636
Phase 2 - EGI 2024 Rebasing and IRM 
Application (EB-2024-0111) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-9)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date Hours Timekeeper Description
2025-01-04 0.20 Ian Mondrow Review decision on indigenous request for sur-reply;
2025-01-07 0.50 Ian Mondrow Review Three Fires/Minogi sur-reply submissions;
2025-02-10 2.20 Ian Mondrow Review ED/GEC AIC;
2025-02-11 1.10 Ian Mondrow Review EGI AIC;
2025-02-12 0.90 Ian Mondrow Complete review of EGI AIC;
2025-02-13 0.40 Ian Mondrow Review intervenor correspondence regarding 

thoughts/positions on final argument and add IGUA 
prespective;

2025-02-17 1.50 Ian Mondrow Reviewing materials and intervenor correspondence and 
considering IGUA position/submission; drafting submission;

2025-02-18 3.40 Ian Mondrow Continue drafting IGUA submissions and forward for 
finalization and filing; reviewing other arguments filed;

2025-02-18 0.70 Ian Mondrow Review EGI DRO package and respond to IGUA inquiry 
regarding observed rate changes and main drivers;

2025-02-19 1.00 Ian Mondrow Continue review of arguments filed;
2025-02-24 4.40 Ian Mondrow Continue review of submissions filed;
2025-02-25 2.00 Ian Mondrow Conclude review of submsisions;
2025-02-25 0.50 Ian Mondrow Reporting to IGUA members on Phase 2 submissions/issues 

of interest to IGUA;
2025-02-26 0.90 Ian Mondrow Review report for IGUA members on EGI rate changes and 

status of Phase 2 proceeding and provide suggested 
revisions;

Total Fees for Professional Services $15,267.50

SUMMARY OF FEES

TK Name Billed Rate Hours Amount
Mondrow, Ian 775.00 19.70 15,267.50

Total 19.70 $15,267.50
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April 24, 2025
INVOICE: 20481138

Terms: payment due within 30 days of invoice date
Interest at the rate of 3.3% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within 30 days of invoice date

Errors and omissions excluded
page 2 of 3

Industrial Gas Users Association
Our Matter:  T1035636
Phase 2 - EGI 2024 Rebasing and IRM 
Application (EB-2024-0111) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-9)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date Hours Timekeeper Description
2025-03-04 0.20 Ian Mondrow Review OEB correspondence regarding recusal and PO 

providing opportunity for submissions on remaining panel 
members;

2025-03-07 0.20 Ian Mondrow Review EGI letter regarding A. Zlahtic recusal;
2025-03-25 0.30 Ian Mondrow Review EGI reply submission;
2025-03-26 0.50 Ian Mondrow Complete review of EGI reply;

Total Fees for Professional Services $930.00

SUMMARY OF FEES

TK Name Billed Rate Hours Amount
Mondrow, Ian 775.00 1.20 930.00

Total 1.20 $930.00
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June-04-25 7:45:02 PM  

As of June-03-25 11:38:00 PM

Client Code 190123
Client Name Industrial Gas Users Association
Nature of Client Business Member Associations and Organizations
 
Matter Code T1035636
Matter Name Phase 2 - EGI 2024 Rebasing and IRM Application (EB-2024-0111) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-9)
Client Reference Code
Matter Area of Law Not Available (NA)
Matter Service Area Advice, Opinion, Consulting, Strategy (ADV01)         
Status Open     Open and Active
Open Date Apr 5, 2024
Close Date
Billing Professional Mondrow, Ian (1760)
Nature of Work Participation on behalf of IGUA in Phase 2 of Enbridge Gas Inc.'s 2024 Rebasing and Incentive Rate-Making

Mechanism (IRM) Application.
Tax Jurisdiction Ontario HST (ONT)
Rate Level National Rates

WIP Fees Detail     All Timekeepers

Date Timekeeper Remarks Hours Amount
May 30, 2025 Mondrow, Ian 1760 Reviewing Phase 2 decision; 0.4 $310.00
Jun 3, 2025 Mondrow, Ian 1760 Complete review of decision; reporting note to client; not to B.

Fisher re preparation of cost claim;
1.4 $1,085.00

Total 1.8 $1,395.00

https://gowlinks.gowlings.corp/site/rex/matterDesc/wipdetail.asp?matteruno=2451690 | Maria Ciciretto

6/4/25, 7:45 PM GOWLinks - WIP Fees Detail

https://gowlinks.gowlings.corp/pf.asp 1/1

https://gowlinks.gowlings.corp/site/rex/clientDesc/contents.asp?clientuno=207973
https://gowlinks.gowlings.corp/site/rex/matterDesc/contents.asp?matteruno=2451690
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Appendix A  Page 1 

Appendix A 
Table of Revised Activities 

 
Original Category Original Activity Revised Category Revised Activity 
Review Application and 
Evidence 

Review Application 
and Evidence 

Discovery Read and Research 
Application 

Discovery Preparation of 
Interrogatories 

Discovery Preparation of Interrogatories 

Discovery Review Interrogatory 
Responses 

Discovery Review Interrogatory 
Responses 

Discovery Technical Conference 
Preparation 

Discovery Technical Conference 
Preparation 

Discovery Technical Conference 
Attendance 

Discovery Technical Conference 
Attendance 

Discovery Technical Conference 
Follow Up 

Discovery Technical Conference Follow-
up 

Issues List Preparation Procedural Preparation of Issues List 
Submission 

Issues List Attendance at Issues 
Conference 

Procedural Attendance at Issues List 
Conference 

Confidentiality Preparation of 
Application for 
Confidentiality 

Procedural Preparation for a 
confidentiality request 

Confidentiality Prepare Submissions 
on Confidentiality 

Procedural Prepare Submissions on 
confidentiality 

Confidentiality Attendance at Hearing 
on Confidentiality 

 Activity removed 

Motions Preparation of 
Motion(s) Materials 

Procedural Preparation of Motion(s) 
materials 

Motions Prepare Submissions 
on the Motion(s) 

Procedural Prepare submissions on the 
Motion(s) 

Motions Attendance at Hearing 
on Motion(s) 

Procedural Attendance at hearing on 
Motion(s) 

  Procedural (New) Review procedural documents 
Intervenor Evidence Preparation Intervenor 

Evidence 
Preparation of Intervenor 
Evidence 

Intervenor Evidence Interrogatory 
Responses 

Intervenor 
Evidence 

Interrogatory Responses 

Intervenor Evidence Preparation of 
Witness(es) for 
Attendance at Hearing 

Intervenor 
Evidence 

Preparation of Witness(es) for 
Attendance at Hearing 

Settlement/ADR Preparation Settlement Preparation for Settlement 
Conference 

Settlement/ADR Attendance Settlement Attendance at Settlement 
Conference 

Settlement/ADR Preparation of 
Settlement Proposal 

Settlement Preparation of Settlement 
Proposal 

Settlement/ADR Attendance at 
Presentation to Panel 

Settlement Attendance at Presentation to 
Panel 

[RAE]

[use acronym in red when categorizing]

[PREP-IR]

[REV-IRR]

[TCP]

[TCA]

[TC-FOL-UP]

[IL-PREP]

[ILC-ATT]

[CONF-REQ]

[SUB-CONF]

[PREP-MOT-MAT]

[PREP-SUB-MOT]

[ATT-HM]
[RPD]

[PREP-IE]

[IE-IRR]

[PREP-WIT-OH]

[SCP]

[SCA]

[PSP]

[ATT-PP]



Ontario Energy Board 

Appendix A  Page 2 

Original Category Original Activity Revised Category Revised Activity 
Submissions Written Submissions Written Argument Written Submissions 
Oral Hearing Preparation Oral Argument Preparation for Oral Hearing 
Oral Hearing Attendance at Oral 

Hearing 
Oral Argument Attendance at Oral Hearing 

Submissions Oral Submissions Oral Argument Oral Submissions 
Submissions Attendance at Oral 

Submissions 
Oral Argument Attendance at Oral 

Submissions 
Decision  Review Decision Review Decision 
Rate Order Review Decision Review Rate/Accounting Order 
Rate Order Prepare Submission 

on Rate Order 
Decision Prepare Submission on Rate 

Order 
Other Attendance Other Attendance Other Other attendance (e.g., 

Intervenor Conferences) 
Communication With Other Parties  Activity removed 
Communication With Client  Activity removed 

[SUB]

[OHP]

[OHA]
[O-SUB]

[ATT-O-SUB]
[DEC]

[REV-
RO]

[PREP-SUB-RO]
[OTH-ATT]



20433972 20440861 20466205 20481138 WIP Subtotal 2024 TOTAL

RAE 1.1 1.1 36.7 37.8

PREP-IR

REV-IRR

TCP 6.5 6.5

TCA 6.6 6.6

TC-FOL-UP

IL-PREP 4.3 4.3

ILC-ATT

CONF-REQ

SUB-CONF

PREP-MOT-MAT

PREP-SUB-MOT 4.8 4.8

ATT-HM 1.6 1.6

RPD 0.5 0.1 0.2 0.4 1.2 8 9.2

PREP-IE

IE-IRR

PREP-WIT-OH

SCP 15.8 15.8

SCA 50.2 50.2

PSP 6.7 6.7

ATT-PP 3.4 3.4

SUB 19.5 0.8 20.3 0 20.3

OHP 9.5 9.5 0.2 9.7

OHA 21.4 21.4 0 21.4

O-SUB

ATT-O-SUB

DEC 1.8 1.8 1 2.8

REV-OR

PREP-SUB-RO

OTH-ATT

Total 31.4 1.2 19.7 1.2 1.8 55.3 145.8 201.1

IGUA: EB-2024-0111



20255605 20275573 20295893 20310665 20331946 20351192 20369270 20391263 20408716 Subtotal 2025 TOTAL

RAE 4.9 1 0.2 19.2 6.1 1.4 3.6 0.3 36.7 1.1 37.8

PREP-IR

REV-IRR

TCP 6.5 6.5 0 6.5

TCA 6.3 0.3 6.6 0 6.6

TC-FOL-UP

IL-PREP 4.3 4.3 0 4.3

ILC-ATT

CONF-REQ

SUB-CONF

PREP-MOT-MAT

PREP-SUB-MOT 2.1 0.6 2.1 4.8 0 4.8

ATT-HM 1.6 1.6 0 1.6

RPD 2.1 0.8 0.8 0.6 2.8 0.2 0.7 8 1.2 9.2

PREP-IE

IE-IRR

PREP-WIT-OH

SCP 0.4 13.7 1.7 15.8 0 15.8

SCA 41.2 9 50.2 0 50.2

PSP 4.7 2 6.7 0 6.7

ATT-PP 3.4 3.4 3.4

SUB 20.3 20.3

OHP 0.2 0.2 9.5 9.7

OHA 21.4 21.4

O-SUB

ATT-O-SUB

DEC 1 1 1.8 2.8

REV-OR

PREP-SUB-RO

OTH-ATT

Total 3.1 5.3 22.1 19.5 5.5 58.7 15.4 11.3 145.8 55.3 201.1

IGUA: EB-2024-0111



Ian Mondrow
Gowling WLG

Expenses 

Drafts Returned Submitted





Gift wrapping for client gift.
010069329044

09/19/2024 10.83
CAD

PAID

PDay - Cost of Capital, EB…
010069321302

09/19/2024 24.00
CAD

PAID

EGI Phase 2 Rebasing Set…
010069319582

09/19/2024 96.00
CAD

PAID

EGI DSM Consultation
010068804761

08/22/2024 24.00
CAD

PAID

Parking for Technical Con…
010068275455

07/26/2024 24.00
CAD

PAID

OEB Staff Pre-Filing Cons…
010067833726

07/03/2024 34.00
CAD

PAID

Prague-Limo home from P…
010067455184

06/17/2024 97.00
CAD

PAID

CAMPUT 2024/Canadian E…
010066654098

05/13/2024 2,759…
CAD

PAID

Parking-OEB Cost of Capi…
010066383712

04/29/2024 24.00
CAD

PAID

Open Tracking PDF 





 

 AMOUNT (CAD) APPROVED
(CAD)

Parking 24.00 24.00

Total 24.00 24.00

Account Summary

 AMOUNT (CAD)
APPROVED

(CAD)

190123.T1… Industrial
Gas Users
Association
Phase 2 - EGI
2024 Rebasing
and IRM
Application
(EB-2024-
0111) (IGUA24-
ON-EGI-9)

24.00 24.00

Totals 24.00 24.00

Comments  (0)

Attachments  (1)

Drag image here to upload

Add Comment Post

Add Attachments



   



Parking 07/24/2024
Amount: 24.00 CAD Pay Me: 24.00 CAD 

6/23/25, 2:56 PM Emburse Enterprise

https://app.chromeriver.com/index#expenses/submitted/4072e3a3885c1b9e9ceac6de9722a283c5882a808304a9e43a27b27fc06ce58905b28db79542… 1/1



Ian Mondrow
Gowling WLG

Expense Report

010069319582

Total Pay Me A…

96.00 CAD


Expenses For
Ian Mondrow 

EGI Phase 2 Rebasing Settlement C…
 0 Comments  4 Attachments 

DATE EXPENSE SPENT PAY ME   





Tue
09/10/2024

Loc… 24.00
CAD 24.00  

Wed
09/11/2024

Loc… 24.00
CAD 24.00  

Thu
09/12/2024

Loc… 24.00
CAD 24.00  

Fri
09/13/2024

Loc… 24.00
CAD 24.00  

Images PDF 





 

Expenses For Ian Mond…

Comments  (0)

Attachments  (4)

Drag image here to upload

Report Name EGI Phase 2 Rebasing Settle…

Pay Me In CAD - Canada Dollars

Add Comment Post

Add Attachments

   

   



Local Parking 09/12/2024
Amount: 24.00 CAD Pay Me: 24.00 CAD 



6/23/25, 2:53 PM Emburse Enterprise

https://app.chromeriver.com/index#expense/submitted/83a7870cdc47414ffad5f6e46fb36dc4433adb7106a4e1b6f6476a39bd56bc9c6f4bc4052b49a69… 1/1





DISBURSEMENTS

CASE COST CLAIM INTERVENOR NAME

Fisher, Brianne; +1 (416) 

369-7111 

brianne.fisher@ca.gowlingwlg

.com

PARTICIPANT 

CLAIM STATUSEB-2024-0111: Rates: 

Distribution: Enbridge Gas Inc.

FILING PARTICIPANT NEW 

PARTICIPANT

NON-FILING 

PARTICIPANT F. NAME

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE* YEAR CALLED TO BAR* COMPLETED YEARS 

PRACTICING/YEARS OF 

RELEVANT EXPERIENCE*

HOURLY RATE

CV STATUS (FOR 

CONSULTANT/ANALYST)

LAST CV DATE

HEARINGS CONSULTATIONS

Mondrow, Ian; +1 (416) 369-4670 

ian.mondrow@gowlingwlg.com No

Legal Counsel 1991

 34

 359

CV Required

No Yes

Ian Mondrow

Yes

June 23, 2025

EB-2024-0111 : 1 : Brianne 

Fisher

NON-FILING 

PARTICIPANT L. NAME

In Progress

HST NUMBER

 13.00

HST RATE CHARGED*

89659 3323 RT0001

Yes

OVERRIDE 

HOURLY RATE

HEARINGS

Hearings Hours

 201.10

Hearings Subtotal ($)

 72,194.90

Hearings Total Tax ($)

 9,385.35  81,580.25

Hearings Total ($)

Name Hours Hourly 

Rate

Sub Total HST 

Rate

HST Total

DISCOVERY
Read and Research Application and 

Evidence

 37.80  359  13,570.20  13.00  1,764.13  15,334.33

Preparation of Interrogatories  359  13.00

Review Interrogatory Responses  359  13.00

Technical Conference Preparation  6.50  359  2,333.50  13.00  303.36  2,636.86

Technical Conference Attendance  6.60  359  2,369.40  13.00  308.02  2,677.42

Technical Conference Follow-up  359  13.00

Subtotal of DISCOVERY  50.90  18,273.10  2,375.51  20,648.61

PROCEDURAL
Preparation of Issues List Submission  4.30  359  1,543.70  13.00  200.68  1,744.38

Attendance at Issues List Conference  359  13.00

Preparation for a Confidentiality Request  359  13.00

Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality  359  13.00

Preparation of Motion(s) Materials  359  13.00

Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)  4.80  359  1,723.20  13.00  224.02  1,947.22

Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)  1.60  359  574.40  13.00  74.67  649.07

Review Procedural Documents  9.20  359  3,302.80  13.00  429.36  3,732.16

CC_Participant_Combined.rpt - last Update 20230601
Page 1 of 3



Name Hours Hourly 

Rate

Sub Total HST 

Rate

HST Total

Subtotal of PROCEDURAL  19.90  7,144.10  928.73  8,072.83

INTERVENOR EVIDENCE
Preparation of Intervenor Evidence  359  13.00

Interrogatory Responses  359  13.00

Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance 

at Hearing

 359  13.00

Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE  0.00  0.00  0.00  0.00

SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE
Preparation for Settlement Conference  15.80  359  5,672.20  13.00  737.39  6,409.59

Attendance at Settlement Conference  50.20  359  18,021.80  13.00  2,342.83  20,364.63

Preparation of Settlement Proposal  6.70  359  2,405.30  13.00  312.69  2,717.99

Attendance at Presentation to Panel  3.40  359  1,220.60  13.00  158.68  1,379.28

Subtotal of SETTLEMENT 

CONFERENCE

 76.10  27,319.90  3,551.59  30,871.49

WRITTEN ARGUMENT
Written Submissions  20.30  359  7,287.70  13.00  947.40  8,235.10

Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT  20.30  7,287.70  947.40  8,235.10

ORAL ARGUMENT
Preparation for Oral Hearing  9.70  359  3,482.30  13.00  452.70  3,935.00

Attendance at Oral Hearing  21.40  359  7,682.60  13.00  998.74  8,681.34

Oral Submissions  359  13.00

Attendance at Oral Submissions  359  13.00

Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT  31.10  11,164.90  1,451.44  12,616.34

DECISION
Review Decision  2.80  359  1,005.20  13.00  130.68  1,135.88

Review Rate/Accounting Order  359  13.00

Prepare Submission on Rate Order  359  13.00

Subtotal of DECISION  2.80  1,005.20  130.68  1,135.88

OTHER
Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor 

Conferences)

 359  13.00

Subtotal of OTHER  0.00  0.00  0.00  0.00

TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES

Total Service Provider Fees  201.10  72,194.90  9,385.35  81,580.25

Import MessageDocument TypeAttachment

Attachments

EB-2024-0111_Transmittal_Letter_06232025.

pdf

Cover Letter

OEB Cost Claim - Table of Revised 

Activities.pdf

Other

EB-2024-0111_Invoices_06232025.pdf Time Docket

EB-2024-0111_Spreadsheet_ 06232025.pdf Other Excel spreadsheet

CC_Participant_Combined.rpt - last Update 20230601
Page 2 of 3



DISBURSEMENTS

Disbursement 

Subtotal($)

Disbursement 

Total Tax($)

Other Taxes/Tips 

Total($)

Disbursement 

Total($)

 205.50 23.64 181.86  0.00

ATT.

PROV
Name

Total

Other 

Taxes/TipHST

HST 

Rate

Net 

Cost

$/ 

Unit

Qty Rationale/

Comment

ATT.

REQ'D

Scanning/Photocopy 

(Internal)

 13.00

Scanning/Photocopy 

(External)

 13.00

Printing (Internal)  13.00

Printing (External)  13.00

Courier  13.00

Teleconference  13.00

Travel:  Air  13.00

Travel:  Car Rental  13.00

Travel:  Gas  13.00

Travel:  Car Mileage – 

Southern Ontario

 0.40

Travel:  Car Mileage – 

Northern Ontario

 0.41

Travel:  Rail  13.00

Travel (Other)  13.00

Parking YesYes  1.00  181.86  181.86  13.00  23.64  205.50

Taxi  13.00

Accommodation  13.00

Other  13.00

Total Disbursements:  181.86  23.64  0.00  205.50

Attachments
Attachment Import Message

EB-2024-0111_Disbursements_06232025.pdf

Attachment Document Type Claim Type Import Message

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

EB-2024-0111_Transmittal_Letter_0623202

5.pdf

Cover Letter Hearings

OEB Cost Claim - Table of Revised 

Activities.pdf

Other Hearings

EB-2024-0111_Invoices_06232025.pdf Time Docket Hearings

EB-2024-0111_Spreadsheet_ 06232025.pdf Excel spreadsheetOther Hearings

EB-2024-0111_Disbursements_06232025.p

df

Parking Disbursements

CC_Participant_Combined.rpt - last Update 20230601
Page 3 of 3



DISBURSEMENTS

CASE COST CLAIM INTERVENOR NAME

Fisher, Brianne; +1 (416) 

369-7111 

brianne.fisher@ca.gowlingwlg

.com

PARTICIPANT 

CLAIM STATUSEB-2024-0111: Rates: 

Distribution: Enbridge Gas Inc.

FILING PARTICIPANT NEW 

PARTICIPANT

NON-FILING 

PARTICIPANT F. NAME

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE* YEAR CALLED TO BAR* COMPLETED YEARS 

PRACTICING/YEARS OF 

RELEVANT EXPERIENCE*

HOURLY RATE

CV STATUS (FOR 

CONSULTANT/ANALYST)

LAST CV DATE

HEARINGS CONSULTATIONS

Yes

Consultant

 23

 330

CV Attached

June 23, 2025

No NoYes

July 17, 2025

EB-2024-0111 : 1 : Brianne 

Fisher

NON-FILING 

PARTICIPANT L. NAME

Dustin Madsen

Submitted

HST NUMBER

 5.00

HST RATE CHARGED*

89659 3323 RT0001

Yes

OVERRIDE 

HOURLY RATE

HEARINGS

Hearings Hours

 14.85

Hearings Subtotal ($)

 4,900.50

Hearings Total Tax ($)

 245.03  5,145.53

Hearings Total ($)

Name Hours Hourly 

Rate

Sub Total HST 

Rate

HST Total

DISCOVERY
Read and Research Application and 

Evidence

 6.05  330  1,996.50  5.00  99.83  2,096.33

Preparation of Interrogatories  330  5.00

Review Interrogatory Responses  330  5.00

Technical Conference Preparation  8.80  330  2,904.00  5.00  145.20  3,049.20

Technical Conference Attendance  330  5.00

Technical Conference Follow-up  330  5.00

Subtotal of DISCOVERY  14.85  4,900.50  5.00  245.03  5,145.53

PROCEDURAL
Preparation of Issues List Submission  330  5.00

Attendance at Issues List Conference  330  5.00

Preparation for a Confidentiality Request  330  5.00

Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality  330  5.00

Preparation of Motion(s) Materials  330  5.00

Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)  330  5.00

Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)  330  5.00

Review Procedural Documents  330  5.00

Dustin Madsen

CC_Participant_Combined.rpt - last Update 20230601
Page 1 of 3



Name Hours Hourly 

Rate

Sub Total HST 

Rate

HST Total

Subtotal of PROCEDURAL  0.00  0.00  5.00  0.00  0.00

INTERVENOR EVIDENCE
Preparation of Intervenor Evidence  330  5.00

Interrogatory Responses  330  5.00

Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance 

at Hearing

 330  5.00

Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE  0.00  0.00  5.00  0.00  0.00

SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE
Preparation for Settlement Conference  330  5.00

Attendance at Settlement Conference  330  5.00

Preparation of Settlement Proposal  330  5.00

Attendance at Presentation to Panel  330  5.00

Subtotal of SETTLEMENT 

CONFERENCE

 0.00  0.00  5.00  0.00  0.00

WRITTEN ARGUMENT
Written Submissions  330  5.00

Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT  0.00  0.00  5.00  0.00  0.00

ORAL ARGUMENT
Preparation for Oral Hearing  330  5.00

Attendance at Oral Hearing  330  5.00

Oral Submissions  330  5.00

Attendance at Oral Submissions  330  5.00

Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT  0.00  0.00  5.00  0.00  0.00

DECISION
Review Decision  330  5.00

Review Rate/Accounting Order  330  5.00

Prepare Submission on Rate Order  330  5.00

Subtotal of DECISION  0.00  0.00  5.00  0.00  0.00

OTHER
Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor 

Conferences)

 330  5.00

Subtotal of OTHER  0.00  0.00  5.00  0.00  0.00

TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES

Total Service Provider Fees  14.85  4,900.50  245.03  5,145.53

Import MessageDocument TypeAttachment

Attachments

EB-2024-0111_Emrydia_Invoice_06232025.p

df

Time Docket and Invoice

EB-2024-0111_DMarsden_Spreadsheet_ 

06232025.pdf

Other Excel spreadsheet

D Madsen CV (002).pdf CV

CC_Participant_Combined.rpt - last Update 20230601
Page 2 of 3



Attachment Document Type Claim Type Import Message

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

EB-2024-0111_Emrydia_Invoice_06232025.

pdf

Time Docket and Invoice Hearings

EB-2024-0111_DMarsden_Spreadsheet_ 

06232025.pdf

Excel spreadsheetOther Hearings

D Madsen CV (002).pdf CV Hearings

CC_Participant_Combined.rpt - last Update 20230601
Page 3 of 3



Emrydia Consulting Corporation 
 

89 Auburn Springs Blvd SE 
Calgary, AB T3M 0Z4 
Phone: 403-869-9294 

INVOICE 

INVOICE #IGUA-2024-1 
DATE: AUGUST 2, 2024 
GST 720920115-RT0001 

TO: 
Attn: Shahrzad Rahbar 
Industrial Gas Users Association (IGUA) 
851 Industrial Ave 
Ottawa, ON K1G 4L3 

FOR: 
Invoice for time and charges of Dustin Madsen in 
the Enbridge 2024 Phase 2 rebasing application 
 

DESCRIPTION HOURS RATE AMOUNT 
Dustin Madsen hours (see detailed breakdown 
attached) 

14.85 $330.00 $4,900.50 

    
    
    
    
    
    
HST on services   245.03 

TOTAL $5,145.53 
Make all checks payable to Emrydia Consulting Corporation 
 

Thank you for your business! 



Time and Charges of Dustin Madsen

Project:

Date Time Description of Activity

28-06-2024 2.45             Review email from I. Mondrow. Review information provided and prepare notes re: the same.

02-07-2024 3.60             
Send list of issues and notes to I. Mondrow re: Enbridge Phase 2. Prepare for and attend call 
with I. Mondrow re: phase 2 salvage issues.

17-07-2024 3.85             
Email and respond to emails from I. Mondrow re: case. Begin preparing comments and notes 
on issues for technical conference.

18-07-2024 4.85             Finalize notes on technical conference issues to explore. Send to I. Mondrow.
21-07-2024 0.10             Review draft technical conf questions from I. Mondrow. Provide feedback re: the same.

Total 14.85           
Hourly Rate 330.00$       
Total Charges 4,900.50$    
HST 245.03$       
Total Charges (incl. HST) 5,145.53$    

Total 5,145.53$    

Disbursements (before GST)

Total 5,145.53$    
Previous charges
Total charges 5,145.53$    

Enbridge rebasing 2024-2028

iPad Pro 12.9" 5
RAE

iPad Pro 12.9" 5
RAE

iPad Pro 12.9" 5
TCP

iPad Pro 12.9" 5
TCP

iPad Pro 12.9" 5
TCP



EB-2024-0111

Dustin Madsen's 

Invoice Hourly Rate HST TOTAL
RAE 6.05 $330
PREP-IR

REV-IRR

TCP 8.8
TCA

TC-FOL-UP

IL-PREP

ILC-ATT

CONF-REQ

SUB-CONF

PREP-MOT-MAT

PREP-SUB-MOT

ATT-HM

RPD

PREP-IE

IE-IRR

PREP-WIT-OH

SCP

SCA

PSP

ATT-PP

SUB

OHP

OHA

O-SUB

ATT-O-SUB

DEC

REV-OR

PREP-SUB-RO

OTH-ATT

Total 14.85 $4,900 $637.07 5,537.57



DUSTIN MADSEN CA, CPA, CPA (IL, USA), CDP, CRRA 
Tel:  403-869-9294 / 725-500-0255 / E-mail:  dustin@emrydia.com 

 

1 | P a g e  
 

WORK EXPERIENCE 
 

Accounting, Finance, Tax and Regulatory Consultant                        January 2016 – Present  
Emrydia Consulting Corporation (owner)       
 Preparation of evidence and expert testimony both written and oral on a variety of 

areas, including cost-of-service, revenue requirement, income tax, valuation, 
depreciation, and cost of capital. Some examples of oral testimony include: 

 Preparation of comprehensive cost-of-service studies. 
 Preparation of business and succession plans. 
 Completion of business valuations, including the determination of both fair market 

value and replacement cost new less depreciation, as well as other valuations for 
utilities. 

 Provided advice on numerous matters including cost-of-service rate design, business 
issues, hedging, and other specific matters. 

 
Business Valuation and Accounting/Regulatory Risk Consultant      Nov 2015 – January 2016 
Berkshire Hathaway Energy Canada                  

 Advise senior management at Berkshire Hathaway Energy Canada on potential 
acquisition risks and rewards. 

 Evaluate all financial, treasury, regulatory, operational, and legal elements of potential 
acquisitions and coordinate with other senior team members to develop a go/no-go 
proposal for each potential acquisition. 

 Construct and maintain a business valuation model to support calculations of the 
enterprise value, including development of assumptions around levered/unlevered 
discount rates, cash flows, terminal values and certain tax assumptions depending upon 
the ultimate structure of the transaction. 

 
Regulatory Specialist (Consultant)          November 2012 – July 2015 
AltaLink L.P.                     

 Drafted or coordinated the drafting of AltaLink’s 2012/2013 Deferral Account 
Application and 2015/2016 GTA, including responses to information requests, updates to 
the applications and other matters as required.  

 Assisted AltaLink, working in conjunction with other Alberta utilities, in the drafting of 
the 2013 GCOC R&V application and the Utility Asset Disposition (UAD) Appeal. This 
work included detailed research and analysis into GCOC and UAD matters. 

 Actively engaged in the AUC proceeding to assess the AltaLink sale, including responses 
to information requests and responding to due diligence questions from the sale itself. 

 Prepared AltaLink’s 2011, 2012, 2013 and 2014 Reports on Operations and Finances in 
compliance with AUC Rule 005. 

 Assisted in the coordination of the 2013/2014 GTA oral hearing, including undertakings, 
preparation of cross-examination questions and monitoring of oral testimony. 

 Prepared the public and confidential rebuttal evidence, responses to additional 
information requests, and argument/reply argument for the 2013/2014 GTA. 

 Acted as AltaLink’s lead representative on a variety of key applications filed by other 
Alberta Utilities, including PBR applications, GCOC, capital tracker applications, GTAs, 
Deferral Account Applications, and also the AESO’s Tariff Application. 

 Automated the majority of the Report on Operations model and improved the 
documentation related to the process, thereby reducing the time required to update the 
Report on Operations to a matter of a couple weeks rather than a couple months. 



DUSTIN MADSEN CA, CPA, CPA (IL, USA), CDP, CRRA 
Tel:  403-869-9294 / 725-500-0255 / E-mail:  dustin@emrydia.com 

 

2 | P a g e  
 

 Automated and refined the Hearing Cost and Legal Cost process, including filing of costs 
with the AUC, reconciliation of costs for accounting purposes, and installation of an 
improved internal information system for gathering and reporting. 

 Continued monitoring of other proceedings and performed all other duties as required by 
the Vice President, Regulatory Rates and Tariffs. 

 
Manager, Financial Reporting (Contract)            April 2012 – October 2012 
AltaLink L.P.                     

 Managed the Financial Reporting group, and performed all duties as required of the 
Manager, Financial Reporting and any other duties as required. 

 Coordinated the implementation of BPC to assist with the consolidation of financial 
results in SAP. 

 Provided technical IFRS input for a variety of projects and Canadian Electricity 
Association matters. 

 
Consultant, Corporate Finance and Tax          February 2012 – April 2012 
Enerflex Ltd.                     

 Assisted with pre-implementation planning for IFRS 9 through 13. 
 Reviewed the hedging policy in place at Enerflex to assess ongoing effectiveness and 

provided feedback on a new treasury management system. 
 Reviewed annual financial statements, Management’s Discussion and Analysis and the 

AIF, and provided feedback for changes and improvements to the first quarter financial 
statements. 

 Performed a review of existing accounting policies including embedded derivative review 
of major contracts, lessee and lessor accounting, segmented reporting, borrowing costs, 
stock options and more. 

 
Manager, Forecasts and Budgets        January 2010 – November 2011 
IFRS Project Manager/Sponsor               February 2007 – December 2010 
Senior Financial Accountant, Financial Reporting       February 2007 – March 2010 
FortisAlberta Inc.                     

 Prepared/reviewed monthly, quarterly and annual forecasts and all associated financial 
analysis for the CFO in comparison to actuals. 

 Review of regulatory filings and annual regulatory financial statements submitted to the 
Alberta Utilities Commission. 

 Preparation/review of annual Business Plan for approval by Board of Directors. 
 Improvement of monthly and daily treasury forecasts and involvement in debt issuances 

and responses to due diligence requests. 
 Management and review of the monthly tax calculation and development of various tax 

planning strategies from both a regulatory and financial reporting perspective.  
 Assisted in the review of all corporate tax processes and calculation of tax provisions, as 

well as, design of complex tax planning strategies. 
 Responsible for the planning and oversight of the conversion to International Financial 

Reporting Standards including the review of all policy papers, issues lists, system 
conversion issues etc. 

 Responsible for financial reporting, including the preparation and review of financial 
statements in accordance with Canadian generally accepted accounting principles, the 
preparation and review of the MD&A, preparation of the monthly management report, 
and preparation and review of accounting research and policies. 
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 Involved in the design, implementation and ongoing improvements of various accounting 
processes and internal controls within financial reporting, accounts payable, capital 
assets, inventory, general accounting, treasury, taxation and payroll. 

 Provided IFRS transition course for all Finance staff at FortisAlberta. 
 Demonstrated effective time management, organization, supervisory and problem 

solving/analytical skills. 
 
Vice Chair, CEA`s Finance and Accounting Subcommittee        May 2011 – December 2011 
Member             May 2007 – December 2011 
Canadian Electrical Association        

 Attended all bi-annual meetings as an active participant involved in presentations at the 
meetings, organized special purpose conference calls, prepared response letters to both 
the IASB and AcSB on a variety of topics, and assisted in the special subcommittee on 
Rate Regulated Accounting. 

 Assisted the Chair in the preparation of meeting content, arranging speakers and guest 
attendees, and other duties as requested. 

 
IFRS Classroom Facilitator                       June 2009 – November 2011 
IASeminars                            

 Classroom facilitator for IASeminars focusing on IFRS accounting within the Utilities 
and Energy industries. 

 
Experienced Module Facilitator                January 2006 – September 2009 
CA School of Business                             

 Facilitated Modules 1 to 5 multiple times with class sizes between 8 and 20 students. 
 
Senior Auditor                              September 2003 – February 2007 
Deloitte and Touche LLP            

 Performed review, audit, SOX 404 and CSOX work for a variety of large multi-national 
clients including Petro Canada, Potash Corporation, and Superior Propane, as well as 
review and audit work for smaller to mid-sized for profit and not-for-profit organizations. 

 Completed personal tax returns and assisted in the audit of corporate tax provisions. 
 Provided audit and oil and gas accounting training to new and existing staff at Deloitte. 

 
EDUCATION                     
 
Certified Rate of Return Analyst 
Society of Utility and Regulatory Financial Analysts 
 
Certified Depreciation Professional 
Society of Depreciation Professionals 
Serving as Vice President beginning January 1, 2025 
 
Certified Public Accountant 
Illinois Board of Accountancy 
 
Chartered Professional Accountant 
Chartered Professional Accountants of Alberta 
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Chartered Accountant 
Institute of Chartered Accountants of Alberta 
 
Bachelor of Commerce, Major in Accounting, with Great Distinction 
University of Saskatchewan 
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LIST OF MAJOR REGULATORY PROCEEDINGS BY REGULATOR  
(Includes proceedings where evidence was filed, or material submissions were prepared) 
 

1. New York State Public Service Commission 
a. Consolidated Edison Company of New York, Inc. – Electric rate applications – 

25-E-0072 – Cost of service, revenue requirement, and financial matters. 
b. Consolidated Edison Company of New York, Inc. – Gas rate applications – 25-E-

0072 – Cost of service, revenue requirement, and financial matters. 
c. Central Hudson Gas & Electric Corporation – Electric rate applications – 24-E-

0461 – Cost of services, revenue requirement, and other matters. 
d. Central Hudson Gas & Electric Corporation – Gas rate application – 24-G-0462 – 

Cost of services, revenue requirement, and other matters. 
e. Niagara Mohawk Power Corporation d/b/a National Grid – Electric rate cases – 

24-E-0322 – Revenue requirement and cost of capital matters. 
f. Niagara Mohawk Power Corporation d/b/a National Grid –Gas rate cases – 24-G-

0323 – Revenue requirement and cost of capital matters. 
2. Mississippi Public Utilities Commission 

a. Mississippi Power Company – 2025 Cost of Service Study – 2025-UN-41 – 
Cost-of-service matters. 

b. Entergy Mississippi, LLC – December 31, 2022 Unit Cost of Service Study – 
2023-UN-142 – Cost-of-service matters. 

c. Mississippi Power Company – 2024 Cost of Service Study – 2024-UN-21 – 
Cost-of-service matters. 

3. Public Utilities Commission of Ohio 
a. First Energy Ohio – 2025 Request for Increase in rate – 24-0468-EL-AIR – 

Revenue requirement matters. 
b. Dominion Energy Ohio – 2024 Alternative Rate Plan – 23-894-GA-AIR – 

Revenue requirement matters. 
4. Arizona Corporation Commission 

a. UNS Gas, Inc. – Application for Establishment of Just and Reasonable Rates and 
Charges for Utility Service Designed to Realize a Reasonable Rate of Return on 
the Fair Value of its Property and for Certain Related Approvals – G-04204A-24-
0237 – Formula-based rates issues. 

b. Global Water-Palo Verde Utilities Company – Application for Establishment of 
Just and Reasonable Rates and Charges for Utility Service Designed to Realize a 
Reasonable Rate of Return on the Fair Value of its Property and for Certain 
Related Approvals – SW-20445A-25-0023 – Formula-based rates. 

c. Sulphur Springs Valley Electric Cooperative – Rate Case Application – E-
01575A-24-0246 – Cost-of-service and rate design matters. 

d. Trico Electric Cooperative rate cases – E-01461A-24-0244 – Cost-of-service and 
rate design matters. 

5. New Brunswick Energy and Utilities Board  
a. Liberty Utilities LP – Gas Cost Review and Review of Unaccounted for Gas – 

Matter 572/588 – Cost allocation and unaccounted for gas matters. 
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b. Liberty Utilities LP – 2024 General Rate Application – Matter 551 – Revenue 
requirement matters. 

c. New Brunswick Power – 2023-2024 Class Cost Allocation Study – Matter 554 – 
Cost-of-service matters. 

d. New Brunswick Power – 2024/25 and 2025/26 General Rate Application – 
Matter 552 – Revenue requirement, cost-of-capital, depreciation matters, deferral 
account, and information technology matters. 

e. New Brunswick Power –2023/24 General Rate Application – Matter 541 – 
Revenue requirement, depreciation matters, and deferral account matters. 

f. New Brunswick Power –2020/21 General Rate Application – Matter 458 – 
Revenue requirement, cost-of-capital, depreciation matters, and deferral account 
matters. 

6. Ontario Energy Board 
a. Enbridge Inc. – 2024 Rebasing Application Phase Two – EB-2025-0064 – Cost-

of-service matters. 
b. Enbridge Inc. – 2024 Rebasing Application Phase Two – EB-2024-0111 – 

Depreciation matters. 
c. Enbridge Inc. – 2024 Rebasing Application – EB-2022-0200 – Depreciation 

matters. 
7. Manitoba Public Utilities Board 

a. Manitoba Hydro – 2023-2025 General Rate Application – Revenue requirement, 
depreciation, information technology, and cost-of-service matters. 

8. Northwest Territories Public Utilities Board 
a. Naka Power (NWT) Ltd. – 2025 General Rate Application – Revenue 

requirement, cost-of-capital, depreciation, and cost-of-service. 
b. Northwest Territories Power Corporation – 2024-26 General Rate Application – 

Revenue requirement, depreciation, rate of return, and cost-of-service matters. 
c. Northwest Territories Power Corporation – 2024-25 Interim Rate Application – 

Revenue requirement and cost sharing matters. 
d. Northland Utilities (NWT) Ltd. – 2023 General Rate Application – Revenue 

requirement, cost-of-capital, and cost-of-service. 
e. Northland Utilities (NWT) Ltd. – Sale of Hay River Assets – Business valuation 

and cost-of-service. 
f. Northwest Territories Power Corporation – 2022-23 General Rate Application – 

Revenue requirement, cost-of-capital, depreciation matters, and deferral account 
matters. 

9.  Alberta Utilities Commission 
a. Reconsideration of DFO payments under the ISO tariff customer contribution 

policy – Proceeding 29006 – Investment and cost recovery issues. 
b. FortisAlberta 2025 Annual Rates Application – Proceeding 29297 – Replacement 

cost new less depreciation and valuation methodologies. 
c. PBR3 Reopener Proceedings Stages 1 and 2 – Proceeding 28300 – Alternative 

rate plans, reopener mechanisms, cost sharing, and prudence assessments. 
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d. Generic proceeding – Parameters of Third Generation Performance Based 
Regulation Plans – Proceeding 27388 – Alternative rate plans, capital-incentive 
mechanisms, Totex, and sharing mechanisms. 

e. Generic proceeding – 2023 Generic Cost of Capital – Proceeding 27084 – Cost-
of-capital. 

f. Generic proceeding – Examination of distribution facility owner payments under 
the Independent System Operator tariff customer contribution policy – 
Proceeding 26061 – Cost-of-service. 

g. Generic proceeding – 2018 Generic Cost of Capital and Generic Tax Proceeding 
– Proceeding 22570 – Cost-of-capital and income taxes. 

h. Generic proceeding – Distributed Generation Review – Proceeding 22534 – 
Cost-of-service. 

i. Independent System Operator – Bulk and Regional Rate Design and Modernized 
DOS Rate Design Application – Proceeding 26911 – Revenue requirement and 
cost-of-service. 

j. Independent System Operator –2018 ISO Tariff Application – Proceeding 22942 
– Revenue requirement and cost-of-service. 

k. ATCO Electric Transmission – 2023-2025 General Tariff Application – 
Proceeding 27062 – Revenue requirement, deferral accounts, capital 
expenditures, information technology, and income taxes. 

l. ATCO Electric Transmission – 2020-2022 General Tariff Application – 
Proceeding 24964 – Revenue requirement, deferral accounts, capital 
expenditures, information technology, and income taxes. 

m. ATCO Electric Transmission – 2018-2019 General Tariff Application – 
Proceeding 22742 – Revenue requirement, deferral accounts, capital 
expenditures, information technology, and income taxes. 

n. ATCO Electric Transmission – 2015-2017 General Tariff Application – 
Proceeding 20272 – Revenue requirement, deferral accounts, capital 
expenditures, information technology, and income taxes. 

o. ATCO Electric Transmission – Disposal of 2015-2017 Transmission Deferral 
Accounts – Proceeding 24375 – Deferral accounts, prudence assessment, and 
cost and performance audits. 

p. ATCO Electric Transmission – Hanna Project Audit and Deferral Account 
Application – Proceeding 22393 – Deferral accounts, prudence assessment, and 
cost and performance audits. 

q. ATCO Electric Transmission – 2013 and 2014 Transmission Deferral Account 
Application – Proceeding 21206 – Deferral accounts and prudence assessment. 

r. ATCO Electric Distribution and FortisAlberta Inc. – 2023 Cost-of-Service 
Review – Proceeding 26615 – Revenue requirement and alternative rate plans. 

s. AltaLink – 2024-2025 General Tariff Application – Proceeding 28174 – Revenue 
requirement, deferral accounts, capital expenditures, information technology, and 
income taxes. 
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t. AltaLink – 2022-2023 General Tariff Application – Proceeding 26509 – Revenue 
requirement, deferral accounts, depreciation, capital expenditures, information 
technology, and income taxes. 

u. AltaLink – 2019-2021 General Tariff Application – Proceeding 23848 – Revenue 
requirement, deferral accounts, depreciation, capital expenditures, information 
technology, and income taxes. 

v. AltaLink – 2017-2018 General Tariff Application – Proceeding 21341 – Revenue 
requirement, deferral accounts, capital expenditures, information technology, and 
income taxes. 

w. ENMAX – 2014-2015 Transmission Deferral Account and 2015 Distribution 
Deferral Account – Proceeding 22089 – Deferral accounts and revenue 
requirement. 

x. Epcor Distribution and Transmission Inc. - Application to Fix Purchase Price BR 
REA Annexation – Proceeding 26318 – Business valuation. 

y. FortisAlberta – Town of Fort Macleod RCN-D Valuation Application – 
Proceeding 23972 – Business valuation. 

 
 


