

BY RESS

June 13, 2025

Mr. Ritchie Murray Registrar Ontario Energy Board 2300 Yonge Street, 27th Floor Toronto, Ontario M4P 1E4

Dear Mr. Murray:

Re: Enbridge Gas Inc. 2024 Rebasing Phase 2 (EB-2024-0111) and Phase 1 (EB-2022-0200) Building Owners and Managers Association Toronto (BOMA Toronto) Cost Claim

Phase 2 Cost Claim

Please find attached BOMA Toronto's cost claim for the Enbridge Gas Inc. Rebasing Phase 2 proceeding. The invoice amount is \$63,893.06.

Phase 1 Cost Award True-up

As per our discussion with Ontario Energy Board (OEB) staff, the true-up of BOMA Toronto's Phase 1 outstanding balance will be addressed in the OEB's Phase 2 cost award decision.

BOMA Toronto's outstanding balance from Phase 1 of this proceeding is calculated as:

- 1. BOMA Toronto submitted an invoice for Enerlife Consulting, with an amount of \$47,021.22¹ as part of its April 30, 2024 Cost Claim. In addition, the Cost Claim includes an invoice for BOMA Toronto's counsel (Fogler) with an amount of \$1,998.30².
- 2. In its Phase 1 Cost Awards Decision and Order, the OEB deducted 7.75 hours for the work done by BOMA's counsel, reducing BOMA Toronto's cost claim by

¹ EB-2022-0200 BOMA Toronto Cost Claim submitted on April 30, 2024, pdf page 10.

² EB-2022-0200 BOMA Toronto Cost Claim submitted on April 30, 2024, pdf page 37.



- \$1,998.30. The OEB did not object to Enerlife Consulting's invoice (\$47,021.22) and it ordered Enbridge Gas Inc. to pay \$23,642.42 to BOMA Toronto.³
- 3. The OEB approved \$47,021.22. Enerlife Consulting received \$23,642.42. Therefore the outstanding balance is \$47,021.22 \$23,642.42 = \$23,378.80.

Sincerely,

Clement Li

Director, Policy & Regulatory Development

Enerlife Consulting Inc.

Centli

cli@enerlife.com

-

³ EB-2022-0200 EGI 2024 Rates Phase 1 - The OEB's June 14, 2024 Decision and Order on Cost Awards, pages 7-8.

EB-2024-0111:1: Clement Li

COST CLAIM NUMBER SUBMISSION DEADLINE DATE **CLAIM STATUS**

2778 June 13, 2025 Approved by Finance

EB# OTHER EB#S PHASE #*

EB-2024-0111: Rates: Distribution: Enbridge Gas

Inc.

13.00

HST RATE ONTARIO

INTERVENOR INTERVENOR COMPANY* INTERVENOR TYPE Full Registrant

Li, Clement; +1 (416) 915-1530 cli@enerlife.com **Building Owners and Managers** Association, Greater Toronto,

Toronto: Corporation

EXCHANGE RATE COUNTRY

Canada

HST NUMBER LATE SUBMISSION ALLOWED EXTENSION DEADLINE DATE

R119420859 No

<u>PART</u>	ICIPANTS		Total (\$)	Total	Participant Claim
New	Non-Filing Participant First, Last Name	Filing Participant	(17	Hours	Status
No	,	Jarvis, lan; +1 (416) 915-1530 x.203 ijarvis@enerlife.com	3,448.21	8.50	Submitted
No	,	Henderson, Gillian; +1 (416) 915-1530 Ghenderson@enerlife.com	10,040.33	24.75	Submitted
No	,	Li, Clement ; +1 (416) 915-1530 cli@enerlife.com	50,404.52	124.25	Submitted

ATTACHMENTS

	Document	Import Message
Attachment	Туре	
EB-2024-0111 BOMA Toronto cost claim cover letter Jun 13	Cover	
2025.pdf	Letter	
BOMA EB-2024-0111 Cost Claim 061320251603.pdf		

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT/OTHER FEES 56,542.50

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 0.00

TOTAL HST 7,350.56

TOTAL CLAIM 63,893.06

TOTAL AMOUNT AWARDED

TOTAL HOURS CLAIMED

157.50

TOTAL HOURS DISALLOWED

REASON FOR REASON FOR REASON FOR DISALLOWANCE - 2 DISALLOWANCE - 3

MAKE CHEQUE PAYABLE TO Enerlife Consulting

SEND PAYMENT TO ADDRESS 90 Eglinton Avenue East, Suite 412 Toronto, ON M4P 2Y3 **ATTENTION**

SUBMIT SECTION

I am a representative of the Party. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim. The costs incurred and time spent are directly related to the Party's participation in the OEB Process referred to above.

This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in section 6.05 and 6.09 of the OEB's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

The information (fees and disbursements) filed in this cost claim is complete and accurate and in accordance with the OEB's Practice Direction for Cost Awards and Appendix A, the Cost Awards Tariff.

SUBMITTED BY

Clement Li

DATE SUBMITTED

June 13, 2025

CASE EB-2024-0111: Rates: Distribution: Enbridge Gas Inc. **COST CLAIM** EB-2024-0111:1: Clement Li

INTERVENOR NAME Li, Clement; +1 (416) 915-1530 cli@enerlife.com

PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS Submitted

FILING PARTICIPANT Jarvis, lan; +1 (416) 915-1530 x.203 ijarvis@enerlife.com

NEW **PARTICIPANT** **NON-FILING** PARTICIPANT F. NAME **NON-FILING** PARTICIPANT L. NAME

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE*

Consultant

YEAR CALLED TO BAR*

COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF **RELEVANT EXPERIENCE*** **HOURLY RATE** 359

30

HST RATE CHARGED*

13.00

CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST)

CV Provided within Previous

24 Months

LAST CV DATE

April 10, 2025

OVERRIDE HOURLY RATE

No

HST NUMBER R119420859

HEARINGS

Yes

CONSULTATIONS

No

DISBURSEMENTS

No

HEARINGS

Hearings Hours 8.50	Hearings Su 3,051.5	. ,		Hearings Total 396.71	Tax (\$)	Hea	rings Total (\$) 3,448.21
<u>Name</u>		<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	Sub Total	HST Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
DISCOVERY							
Read and Research <i>I</i> Evidence	Application and	2.25	359	807.75	13.00	105.01	912.76
Preparation of Interro	gatories	1.75	359	628.25	13.00	81.67	709.92
Review Interrogatory	Responses		359		13.00		
Technical Conference	e Preparation	2.50	359	897.50	13.00	116.68	1,014.18
Technical Conference	e Attendance		359		13.00		
Technical Conference	e Follow-up	0.50	359	179.50	13.00	23.34	202.84
Subtotal of DISCOVE	≣RY	7.00		2,513.00		326.70	2,839.70
PROCEDURAL							
Preparation of Issues	List Submission		359		13.00		
Attendance at Issues	List Conference		359		13.00		
Preparation for a Cor	fidentiality Request		359		13.00		
Prepare Submissions	on Confidentiality		359		13.00		
Preparation of Motion	n(s) Materials		359		13.00		
Prepare Submissions	on the Motion(s)		359		13.00		
Attendance at Hearin	g on Motion(s)		359		13.00		
Review Procedural D	ocuments		359		13.00		

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	Sub Total	HST Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Subtotal of PROCEDURAL	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
INTERVENOR EVIDENCE Preparation of Intervenor Evidence		359		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		359		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE	0.00	359	0.00	13.00	0.00	0.00
SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE Preparation for Settlement Conference	1.00	359	359.00	13.00	46.67	405.67
Attendance at Settlement Conference		359		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		359		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		359		13.00		
Subtotal of SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE WRITTEN ARGUMENT	1.00		359.00		46.67	405.67
Written Submissions	0.50	359	179.50	13.00	23.34	202.84
Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT	0.50		179.50		23.34	202.84
ORAL ARGUMENT Preparation for Oral Hearing		359		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		359		13.00		
Oral Submissions		359		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		359		13.00		
Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
DECISION Paginian		250		42.00		
Review Decision		359		13.00		
Review Rate/Accounting Order		359 359		13.00 13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order Subtotal of DECISION	0.00	339	0.00	13.00	0.00	0.00
OTHER	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor Conferences)		359		13.00		
Subtotal of OTHER	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES Total Service Provider Fees	8.50		3,051.50		396.71	3,448.21

Attachments

<u>Attachment Document Type</u> <u>Import Message</u>

BOMA lan Jarvis Time Docket.pdf BOMA Invoice 4428 EB-2024-0111.pdf Time Docket Invoice

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

<u>Attachment</u> <u>Document Type</u> <u>Claim Type</u> <u>Import Message</u>

BOMA Ian Jarvis Time Docket.pdf Time Docket Hearings

BOMA Invoice 4428 EB-2024-0111.pdf Invoice Hearings

Time Docket

Date	Hours	Analyst/Consultant/	Description	Total
April 26, 2024	0.50	lan Jarvis	Read and Research Application and Evidence	\$179.50
May 6, 2024	0.25	lan Jarvis	Read and Research Application and Evidence	\$89.75
May 30, 2024	0.50	lan Jarvis	Read and Research Application and Evidence	\$179.50
June 8, 2024	0.50	lan Jarvis	Read and Research Application and Evidence	\$179.50
June 10, 2024	0.50	lan Jarvis	Read and Research Application and Evidence	\$179.50
June 17, 2024	0.75	lan Jarvis	Preparation of Interrogatories	\$269.25
June 19, 2024	1.00	lan Jarvis	Preparation of Interrogatories	\$359.00
July 17, 2024	0.50	lan Jarvis	Technical Conference Preparation	\$179.50
July 19, 2024	1.00	lan Jarvis	Technical Conference Preparation	\$359.00
July 20, 2024	1.00	lan Jarvis	Technical Conference Preparation	\$359.00
August 21, 2024	0.50	lan Jarvis	Technical Conference Follow-up	\$179.50
August 23, 2024	0.50	lan Jarvis	Preparation for Settlement Conference	\$179.50
September 9, 2024	0.50	lan Jarvis	Preparation for Settlement Conference	\$179.50
February 7, 2025	0.50	lan Jarvis	Written Submissions	\$179.50



To: BOMA Toronto

90 Eglinton Ave. East, Suite 412 Toronto, ON M4P 2Y3 Canada Tel: 416.915.1530 Fax: 416.915.1534

EB-2024-0111 Enbridge Gas Inc. Application for 2024 Rates - Phase 2

Date: June 13, 2025

Invoice: 4428 Date Hours Analyst/Consultant/ Description Rate Total April 26, 2024 May 6, 2024 May 30, 2024 May 10, 2024 May 15, 2024 May 22, 2024 lan Jarvis lan Jarvis lan Jarvis Clement Li 0.50 0.25 0.50 Read and Research Application and Evidence \$359 \$359 \$359 \$179.50 \$89.75 \$179.50 \$1,077.00 3.00 \$359 2.50 Read and Research Application and Evidence \$359 \$897.50 Clement Li Clement Li 3.00 1.00 Read and Research Application and Evidence \$359 \$1,077.00 June 7, 2024 June 8, 2024 June 10, 2024 June 10, 2024 June 10, 2024 June 10, 2024 Preparation of Interrogatories \$359 \$359.00 0.50 0.50 0.50 lan Jarvis lan Jarvis Gillian Henderson Gillian Henderson Read and Research Application and Evidence \$359 \$359 \$359 \$179.50 \$179.50 \$179.50 \$179.50 0.50 \$359 1.50 Clement Li Preparation of Interrogatories Preparation of Interrogatories \$359 \$538.50 June 11, 2024 1.00 Clement Li \$359 \$359.00 Preparation of Interrogatories
Read and Research Application and Evidence
Preparation of Interrogatories
Preparation of Interrogatories \$359.00 \$179.50 \$179.50 \$897.50 \$1,256.50 \$269.25 June 11, 2024 0.50 Clement Li \$359 Clement Li Clement Li Clement Li Clement Li Ian Jarvis Clement Li 0.50 2.50 3.50 0.75 1.00 \$359 \$359 \$359 \$359 June 12, 2024 June 12, 2024 June 14, 2024 June 17, 2024 June 17, 2024 June 19, 2024 June 19, 2024 \$359 \$359.00 1.00 Ian Jarvis Preparation of Interrogatories \$359 \$359.00 Ian Jarvis
Clement Li
Clement Li
Clement Li
Clement Li
Ian Jarvis
Gillian Henderson
Clement Li July 8, 2024 July 15, 2024 July 16, 2024 July 17, 2024 July 17, 2024 July 18, 2024 July 19, 2024 July 19, 2024 July 19, 2024 July 20, 2024 July 20, 2024 July 22, 2024 July 22, 2024 July 22, 2024 July 8, 2024 2.50 5.00 Review Interrogatory Responses \$359 \$897.50 Review Interrogatory Responses Review Interrogatory Responses Technical Conference Preparation \$350 \$1.795.00 0.50 1.00 0.50 0.50 \$359 \$359 \$359 \$359 \$179.50 \$179.50 \$359.00 \$179.50 \$179.50 \$359 0.50 \$359 \$179.50 1.00 Ian Jarvis \$359 \$359.00 lan Jarvis
Gillian Henderson
Clement Li
Gillian Henderson
lan Jarvis
Gillian Henderson Technical Conference Preparation Technical Conference Attendance 0.50 \$359 \$179.50 \$179.50 0.50 0.75 1.00 1.00 \$359 \$359 \$359 \$269.25 \$359.00 \$359.00 \$359 3.00 Gillian Henderson \$359 \$1,077.00 July 22, 2024 4.00 Gillian Hendersor Technical Conference Attendance \$359 \$1,436,00 Gillian Henderson Gillian Henderson Gillian Henderson Gillian Henderson Gillian Henderson \$1,436.00 \$269.25 \$987.25 \$1,256.50 \$718.00 \$1,346.25 0.75 2.75 3.50 2.00 3.75 July 23, 2024 Technical Conference Preparation \$359 July 23, 2024 July 23, 2024 July 23, 2024 July 24, 2024 July 24, 2024 July 25, 2024 July 25, 2024 Technical Conference Preparation Technical Conference Attendance Technical Conference Attendance Technical Conference Attendance Technical Conference Attendance Technical Conference Preparation Technical Conference Follow-up Technical Conference Follow-up \$359 \$359 \$359 \$359 \$359 Gillian Henderson 0.50 \$359 \$179.50 0.25 Gillian Henderson \$359 \$89.75 July 29, 2024 0.50 Gillian Hendersor \$359 \$179.50 July 29, 2024 August 16, 2024 August 16, 2024 August 20, 2024 August 20, 2024 August 21, 2024 August 23, 2024 August 23, 2024 Technical Conference Follow-up
Review procedural documents
Technical Conference Follow-up
Technical Conference Follow-up
Read and Research Application and Evidence
Technical Conference Follow-up
Read and Research Application and Evidence Clement Li Clement Li Clement Li Clement Li \$359 \$359 \$359 \$359 1.00 \$359.00 2.00 1.00 3.00 0.50 2.00 \$718.00 \$359.00 \$1,077.00 \$179.50 Ian Jarvis \$359 Clement Li \$359 \$718.00 Preparation for Settlement Conference Preparation for Settlement Conference August 23, 2024 0.50 Ian Jarvis \$359 \$179.50 September 3, 2024 2.00 Clement Li \$359 \$718.00 September 9, 2024 Preparation for Settlement Conference \$179.50 0.50 Ian Jarvis \$359 September 10, 2024 6.50 Clement Li Attendance at Settlement Conference \$359 \$2,333,50 Clement Li Clement Li Clement Li Clement Li Clement Li Clement Li Attendance at Settlement Conference
Attendance at Settlement Conference \$359 \$359 \$359 \$359 \$359 September 11, 2024 6.00 5.00 3.75 0.50 6.00 2.00 3.25 \$2.154.00 September 11, 2024 September 12, 2024 September 13, 2024 September 17, 2024 September 18, 2024 \$1,795.00 \$1,346.25 \$179.50 \$2,154.00 \$359 Attendance at Settlement Conference September 19, 2024 \$359 \$718.00 September 20, 2024 Clement Li Attendance at Settlement Conference \$359 \$1.166.75 Clement Li October 7, 2024 5.50 5.50 5.00 0.50 0.50 0.50 Attendance at Settlement Conference \$359 \$1,974.50 October 7, 2024 October 8, 2024 October 9, 2024 October 21, 2024 October 22, 2024 October 24, 2024 Attendance at Settlement Conference Attendance at Settlement Conference Attendance at Settlement Conference Preparation of Settlement Proposal \$359 \$359 \$359 \$359 \$359 \$1,974.50 \$1,795.00 \$1,795.00 \$179.50 \$179.50 \$179.50 \$359 October 28, 2024 0.50 \$359 \$179.50 October 29, 2024 0.50 \$359 \$179.50 Clement Li Preparation of Settlement Proposal Preparation of Settlement Proposal Preparation of Settlement Proposal Review procedural documents Review procedural documents Preparation of Settlement Proposal Attendance at Presentation to Panel \$179.50 \$179.50 \$179.50 \$359.00 \$179.50 \$1,077.00 \$359 \$359 \$359 \$359 \$359 October 30, 2024 0.50 0.50 1.00 0.50 0.50 3.00 November 4, 2024 November 6, 2024 November 11, 2024 November 15, 2024 November 18, 2024 \$359 \$359 November 18, 2024 3.00 1.00 Clement Li Attendance at hearing on Motion (s) \$359 \$1,077.00 December 2, 2024 Clement Li Preparation for Oral Hearing \$359 \$359.00 0.50 1.00 7.75 4.00 Clement Li Clement Li Clement Li Clement Li December 6, 2024 Preparation for Oral Hearing \$359 \$179.50 \$359.00 December 16, 2024 December 16, 2024 December 17, 2024 December 19, 2024 February 5, 2025 Preparation for Oral Hearing
Attendance at Oral Hearing \$359 \$2,782.25 \$1,436.00 Attendance at Oral Hearing \$359 1.50 Clement Li Written Submissions \$359 \$538.50 February 7, 2025 1.00 Clement Li Written Submissions \$359 \$359.00 0.50 1.00 2.50 2.00 0.50 **157.50** February 7, 2025 Ian Jarvis Written Submissions \$359 \$179.50 \$179.50 \$359.00 \$897.50 \$718.00 \$179.50 \$56,542.50 Clement Li Clement Li Clement Li Clement Li \$359 \$359 \$359 \$359 February 11, 2025 Written Submissions February 14, 2025 February 18, 2025 May 30, 2025 Written Submissions Written Submissions Written Submissions Review Decision

HST	\$7,350.53
Tatal Americal	662 002 02

Gillian Henderson

EB-2024-0111: Rates:

CASE

Distribution: Enbridge Gas Inc.

COST CLAIM

EB-2024-0111:1: Clement

Li

INTERVENOR NAME

Li, Clement; +1 (416) 915-1530 cli@enerlife.com **PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS** Submitted

FILING PARTICIPANT

Henderson, Gillian; +1 (416) 915-1530

Ghenderson@enerlife.com

NEW

PARTICIPANT

No

NON-FILING

PARTICIPANT F. NAME

NON-FILING

PARTICIPANT L. NAME

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE*

Consultant

YEAR CALLED TO BAR*

COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF **RELEVANT EXPERIENCE***

25

HST RATE CHARGED*

13.00

CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST)

CV Attached

LAST CV DATE

June 13, 2025

OVERRIDE

HOURLY RATE

HOURLY RATE

359

No

HST NUMBER R119420859

HEARINGS

Yes

CONSULTATIONS

No

DISBURSEMENTS

No

HEARINGS

Hearings Hours Hearings Subtotal (\$) **Hearings Total Tax (\$)** Hearings Total (\$) 24.75 8,885.25 1,155.08 10,040.33 **HST** Name **Hourly** Sub Total **HST** Total Hours

Rate Rate **DISCOVERY** Read and Research Application and 1.00 359 359.00 13.00 46.67 405.67 Evidence Preparation of Interrogatories 359 13.00 **Review Interrogatory Responses** 359 13.00 **Technical Conference Preparation** 7.00 359 2,513.00 13.00 326.69 2,839.69 13.00 16.00 359 746.72 6,490.72 **Technical Conference Attendance** 5,744.00 13.00 304.25 Technical Conference Follow-up 0.75 359 269.25 35.00 Subtotal of DISCOVERY 24.75 8,885.25 10,040.33 1.155.08

PROCEDURAL

Preparation of Issues List Submission 359 13.00 Attendance at Issues List Conference 359 13.00 Preparation for a Confidentiality Request 359 13.00 Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality 359 13.00 13.00 Preparation of Motion(s) Materials 359 Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s) 359 13.00 Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s) 359 13.00 **Review Procedural Documents** 359 13.00

<u>Nam</u>	<u>1e</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	Sub Total	HST Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Sub	total of PROCEDURAL	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
	OR EVIDENCE paration of Intervenor Evidence		359		13.00		
Inter	rrogatory Responses		359		13.00		
at H	paration of Witness(es) for Attendance earing total of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE	0.00	359	0.00	13.00	0.00	0.00
_	ENT CONFERENCE paration for Settlement Conference		359		13.00		
Atte	ndance at Settlement Conference		359		13.00		
Prep	paration of Settlement Proposal		359		13.00		
Atte	ndance at Presentation to Panel		359		13.00		
CON	total of SETTLEMENT NFERENCE ARGUMENT	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
Writ	ten Submissions		359		13.00		
Sub	total of WRITTEN ARGUMENT	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
ORAL ARG Prep	GUMENT paration for Oral Hearing		359		13.00		
Atte	ndance at Oral Hearing		359		13.00		
Oral	Submissions		359		13.00		
Atte	ndance at Oral Submissions		359		13.00		
Sub	total of ORAL ARGUMENT	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
DECISION	iew Decision		359		13.00		
	iew Rate/Accounting Order		359		13.00		
	pare Submission on Rate Order		359		13.00		
	total of DECISION	0.00	339	0.00	13.00	0.00	0.00
OTHER	total of Beololon	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
Othe Con	er Attendance (e.g., Intervenor ferences)		359		13.00		
	total of OTHER	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
	RVICE PROVIDER FEES al Service Provider Fees	24.75		8,885.25		1,155.08	10,040.33

Attachments

<u>Attachment</u> <u>Document Type</u>

BOMA Gillian Henderson Time Docket.pdf BOMA Invoice 4428 EB-2024-0111.pdf Enerlife CV Gillian Henderson 2024.pdf Time Docket Invoice CV Import Message

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

Attachment BOMA Gillian Henderson Time Docket.pdf	<u>Document Type</u> Time Docket	Claim Type Hearings	Import Message
BOMA Invoice 4428 EB-2024-0111.pdf	Invoice	Hearings	
Enerlife CV Gillian Henderson 2024.pdf	CV	Hearings	

Time Docket

Date	Hours	Analyst/Consultant/	Description	Total
June 10, 2024	0.50	Gillian Henderson	Read and Research Application and Evidence	\$179.50
June 10, 2024	0.50	Gillian Henderson	Read and Research Application and Evidence	\$179.50
July 18, 2024	0.50	Gillian Henderson	Technical Conference Preparation	\$179.50
July 19, 2024	0.50	Gillian Henderson	Technical Conference Preparation	\$179.50
July 19, 2024	0.75	Gillian Henderson	Technical Conference Preparation	\$269.25
July 22, 2024	1.00	Gillian Henderson	Technical Conference Preparation	\$359.00
July 22, 2024	3.00	Gillian Henderson	Technical Conference Attendance	\$1,077.00
July 22, 2024	4.00	Gillian Henderson	Technical Conference Attendance	\$1,436.00
July 23, 2024	0.75	Gillian Henderson	Technical Conference Preparation	\$269.25
July 23, 2024	2.75	Gillian Henderson	Technical Conference Attendance	\$987.25
July 23, 2024	3.50	Gillian Henderson	Technical Conference Attendance	\$1,256.50
July 24, 2024	2.00	Gillian Henderson	Technical Conference Attendance	\$718.00
July 24, 2024	3.75	Gillian Henderson	Technical Conference Attendance	\$1,346.25
July 25, 2024	0.50	Gillian Henderson	Technical Conference Preparation	\$179.50
July 25, 2024	0.25	Gillian Henderson	Technical Conference Follow-up	\$89.75
July 29, 2024	0.50	Gillian Henderson	Technical Conference Follow-up	\$179.50



To: BOMA Toronto

90 Eglinton Ave. East, Suite 412 Toronto, ON M4P 2Y3 Canada Tel: 416.915.1530 Fax: 416.915.1534

EB-2024-0111 Enbridge Gas Inc. Application for 2024 Rates - Phase 2

Date: June 13, 2025

Invoice: 4428 Date Hours Analyst/Consultant/ Description Rate Total April 26, 2024 May 6, 2024 May 30, 2024 May 10, 2024 May 15, 2024 May 22, 2024 lan Jarvis lan Jarvis lan Jarvis Clement Li 0.50 0.25 0.50 Read and Research Application and Evidence \$359 \$359 \$359 \$179.50 \$89.75 \$179.50 \$1,077.00 3.00 \$359 2.50 Read and Research Application and Evidence \$359 \$897.50 Clement Li Clement Li 3.00 1.00 Read and Research Application and Evidence \$359 \$1,077.00 June 7, 2024 June 8, 2024 June 10, 2024 June 10, 2024 June 10, 2024 June 10, 2024 Preparation of Interrogatories \$359 \$359.00 0.50 0.50 0.50 lan Jarvis lan Jarvis Gillian Henderson Gillian Henderson Read and Research Application and Evidence \$359 \$359 \$359 \$179.50 \$179.50 \$179.50 \$179.50 0.50 \$359 1.50 Clement Li Preparation of Interrogatories Preparation of Interrogatories \$359 \$538.50 June 11, 2024 1.00 Clement Li \$359 \$359.00 Preparation of Interrogatories
Read and Research Application and Evidence
Preparation of Interrogatories
Preparation of Interrogatories \$359.00 \$179.50 \$179.50 \$897.50 \$1,256.50 \$269.25 June 11, 2024 0.50 Clement Li \$359 Clement Li Clement Li Clement Li Clement Li Ian Jarvis Clement Li 0.50 2.50 3.50 0.75 1.00 \$359 \$359 \$359 \$359 June 12, 2024 June 12, 2024 June 14, 2024 June 17, 2024 June 17, 2024 June 19, 2024 June 19, 2024 \$359 \$359.00 1.00 Ian Jarvis Preparation of Interrogatories \$359 \$359.00 Ian Jarvis
Clement Li
Clement Li
Clement Li
Clement Li
Ian Jarvis
Gillian Henderson
Clement Li July 8, 2024 July 15, 2024 July 16, 2024 July 17, 2024 July 17, 2024 July 18, 2024 July 19, 2024 July 19, 2024 July 19, 2024 July 20, 2024 July 20, 2024 July 22, 2024 July 22, 2024 July 22, 2024 July 8, 2024 2.50 5.00 Review Interrogatory Responses \$359 \$897.50 Review Interrogatory Responses Review Interrogatory Responses Technical Conference Preparation \$350 \$1.795.00 0.50 1.00 0.50 0.50 \$359 \$359 \$359 \$359 \$179.50 \$179.50 \$359.00 \$179.50 \$179.50 \$359 0.50 \$359 \$179.50 1.00 Ian Jarvis \$359 \$359.00 lan Jarvis
Gillian Henderson
Clement Li
Gillian Henderson
lan Jarvis
Gillian Henderson Technical Conference Preparation Technical Conference Attendance 0.50 \$359 \$179.50 \$179.50 0.50 0.75 1.00 1.00 \$359 \$359 \$359 \$269.25 \$359.00 \$359.00 \$359 3.00 Gillian Henderson \$359 \$1,077.00 July 22, 2024 4.00 Gillian Hendersor Technical Conference Attendance \$359 \$1,436,00 Gillian Henderson Gillian Henderson Gillian Henderson Gillian Henderson Gillian Henderson \$1,436.00 \$269.25 \$987.25 \$1,256.50 \$718.00 \$1,346.25 0.75 2.75 3.50 2.00 3.75 July 23, 2024 Technical Conference Preparation \$359 July 23, 2024 July 23, 2024 July 23, 2024 July 24, 2024 July 24, 2024 July 25, 2024 July 25, 2024 Technical Conference Preparation Technical Conference Attendance Technical Conference Attendance Technical Conference Attendance Technical Conference Attendance Technical Conference Preparation Technical Conference Follow-up Technical Conference Follow-up \$359 \$359 \$359 \$359 \$359 Gillian Henderson 0.50 \$359 \$179.50 0.25 Gillian Henderson \$359 \$89.75 July 29, 2024 0.50 Gillian Hendersor \$359 \$179.50 July 29, 2024 August 16, 2024 August 16, 2024 August 20, 2024 August 20, 2024 August 21, 2024 August 23, 2024 August 23, 2024 Technical Conference Follow-up
Review procedural documents
Technical Conference Follow-up
Technical Conference Follow-up
Read and Research Application and Evidence
Technical Conference Follow-up
Read and Research Application and Evidence Clement Li Clement Li Clement Li Clement Li \$359 \$359 \$359 \$359 1.00 \$359.00 2.00 1.00 3.00 0.50 2.00 \$718.00 \$359.00 \$1,077.00 \$179.50 Ian Jarvis \$359 Clement Li \$359 \$718.00 Preparation for Settlement Conference Preparation for Settlement Conference August 23, 2024 0.50 Ian Jarvis \$359 \$179.50 September 3, 2024 2.00 Clement Li \$359 \$718.00 September 9, 2024 Preparation for Settlement Conference \$179.50 0.50 Ian Jarvis \$359 September 10, 2024 6.50 Clement Li Attendance at Settlement Conference \$359 \$2,333,50 Clement Li Clement Li Clement Li Clement Li Clement Li Clement Li Attendance at Settlement Conference
Attendance at Settlement Conference \$359 \$359 \$359 \$359 \$359 September 11, 2024 6.00 5.00 3.75 0.50 6.00 2.00 3.25 \$2.154.00 September 11, 2024 September 12, 2024 September 13, 2024 September 17, 2024 September 18, 2024 \$1,795.00 \$1,346.25 \$179.50 \$2,154.00 \$359 Attendance at Settlement Conference September 19, 2024 \$359 \$718.00 September 20, 2024 Clement Li Attendance at Settlement Conference \$359 \$1.166.75 Clement Li October 7, 2024 5.50 5.50 5.00 0.50 0.50 0.50 Attendance at Settlement Conference \$359 \$1,974.50 October 7, 2024 October 8, 2024 October 9, 2024 October 21, 2024 October 22, 2024 October 24, 2024 Attendance at Settlement Conference Attendance at Settlement Conference Attendance at Settlement Conference Preparation of Settlement Proposal \$359 \$359 \$359 \$359 \$359 \$1,974.50 \$1,795.00 \$1,795.00 \$179.50 \$179.50 \$179.50 \$359 October 28, 2024 0.50 \$359 \$179.50 October 29, 2024 0.50 \$359 \$179.50 Clement Li Preparation of Settlement Proposal Preparation of Settlement Proposal Preparation of Settlement Proposal Review procedural documents Review procedural documents Preparation of Settlement Proposal Attendance at Presentation to Panel \$179.50 \$179.50 \$179.50 \$359.00 \$179.50 \$1,077.00 \$359 \$359 \$359 \$359 \$359 October 30, 2024 0.50 0.50 1.00 0.50 0.50 3.00 November 4, 2024 November 6, 2024 November 11, 2024 November 15, 2024 November 18, 2024 \$359 \$359 November 18, 2024 3.00 1.00 Clement Li Attendance at hearing on Motion (s) \$359 \$1,077.00 December 2, 2024 Clement Li Preparation for Oral Hearing \$359 \$359.00 0.50 1.00 7.75 4.00 Clement Li Clement Li Clement Li Clement Li December 6, 2024 Preparation for Oral Hearing \$359 \$179.50 \$359.00 December 16, 2024 December 16, 2024 December 17, 2024 December 19, 2024 February 5, 2025 Preparation for Oral Hearing
Attendance at Oral Hearing \$359 \$2,782.25 \$1,436.00 Attendance at Oral Hearing \$359 1.50 Clement Li Written Submissions \$359 \$538.50 February 7, 2025 1.00 Clement Li Written Submissions \$359 \$359.00 0.50 1.00 2.50 2.00 0.50 **157.50** February 7, 2025 Ian Jarvis Written Submissions \$359 \$179.50 \$179.50 \$359.00 \$897.50 \$718.00 \$179.50 \$56,542.50 Clement Li Clement Li Clement Li Clement Li \$359 \$359 \$359 \$359 February 11, 2025 Written Submissions February 14, 2025 February 18, 2025 May 30, 2025 Written Submissions Written Submissions Written Submissions Review Decision

HST	\$7,350.53
Tatal Americal	662 002 02

GILLIAN HENDERSON BA (Hon), MBA, LEED AP

Vice President-Operations, Enerlife Consulting Inc., 2002 to present gillian.henderson@enerlife.com 416-915-1530 ext. 208

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL EXPERIENCE

Gillian leads the company's work in management consulting, strategic programs and project management, and social marketing. With over 20 years of experience in change management, energy efficiency and sustainability, she has executive responsibility for projects and programs in the commercial office, municipal, retail, post -secondary and multi-residential sectors. She has extensive experience with development of public and private sector strategic plans to achieve low-carbon goals, stakeholder engagement, effective program design, and implementation. She developed market research, best practice guides and documentation to support performance-based conservation and sustainability initiatives, with measurable results. Gillian has also conducted research and analysis in benchmarking and energy efficiency and developed and implemented engagement and communication programs aimed at realizing sustainability goals.

Gillian chaired the Collaboration Committee for Civic Action's Race to Reduce, a large-scale, collaborative program among landlords and tenants aiming to substantially improve the energy and environmental performance of office buildings.

RELEVANT PROJECTS

Cadillac Fairview

Gillian has been the Senior Project Manager responsible for the Integrated Building Performance Process at several Cadillac Fairview's commercial office buildings (Yonge Corporate Centre, Simcoe Place, and RBC Centre). This includes budget control and planning for a comprehensive evidence-based renewal of Cadillac Fairview's Yonge Corporate Centre heating, cooling, ventilation and lighting systems. Gillian facilitates the successful Tenant Green Committee and developed the occupant engagement program at YCC. Gillian has led the implementation and documentation of energy-related credits for LEED Operations + Maintenance certification at Yonge Corporate Centre and Simcoe Place. She supported BOMA BEST and Race to Reduce documentation for other Cadillac Fairview commercial office buildings.

Mayors' Megawatt Challenge, Greening Health Care, and Sustainable Schools programs

Gillian provides strategic and executive leadership for the Climate Challenge Network's Mayors' Megawatt Challenge program and actively contributes to the strategic evolution of the Greening Health Care and Sustainable Schools programs. She led the pilot project developing the roadmap to net-zero ice rinks, which won the Federation of Canadian Municipality's Sustainable Communities Award in 2023. She facilitated the development of the original strategy, concept and vision for the three programs (together formerly known as the Living City initiative) with over 20 stakeholders on behalf of the Toronto and Region Conservation Authority (TRCA).



HIGHLIGHTS OF EXPERIENCE

- Leads Enerlife's market analysis and best practice research
- Senior project management of projects and programs in multiple building sectors
- Over 20 years of experience in energy efficiency and sustainability

AREAS OF SPECIALIZATION

- Skilled project and program manager
- Engagement and communications expertise
- LEED O + M implementation
- Sector consulting and organizational effectiveness

PROFESSIONAL AFFILIATIONS

- LEED Accredited Professional
- Collaboration (Engagement)
 Committee Chair, Race to
 Reduce
- CaGBC LEED O+M Faculty Selection Committee

ACADEMIC QUALIFICATIONS

- Master of Business
 Administration (1st Class
 Honours), University College
 Dublin
- Adult Training & Development Program, Ontario Institute for Studies in Education (OISE)
- Project Management Certificate, Project Management Institute, University of Toronto
- Bachelor of Arts (Honors),
 Queens University



Federation of Canadian Municipalities

Supporting the goals of Green Municipal Fund's Capacity Development Collaborators initiative, our team provides one-on-one expert, specialist technical, organizational, communication and other support to municipalities across Canada, helping them establish and implement their GHG reduction/low-carbon pathways. Gillian leads this project, including the development of knowledge products, such as a guide on high-impact measures for net zero pools (operational and retrofit), case studies, and an energy management decision aid. She was responsible for development and delivery of live training sessions on topics of interest to Canadian municipalities.

Georgian College

As part of Enerlife's work as the College's Decarbonization Visualization Consultant, Gillian provides strategic leadership for this project, working with various stakeholders to develop the strategy and vision for the College's decarbonization journey. Enerlife's team is developing a decision-making tool to guide the College's future planning, construction, renovation, and replacement projects as they relate to energy priorities, and will serve to ensure that budgets, technologies, and organizational values are aligned.

Codes Acceleration Fund (for Natural Resources Canada)

Gillian provides strategic direction on a multi-year project to evaluate the energy use of new buildings of various types relative to the National Energy Code of Canada for Buildings (NECB) tiers. This project includes market research, benchmarking and analysis, development of guidance documents and case studies, support for buildings under development, and delivery of charrettes and webinars. All activities will support the project in promoting energy efficiency objectives, addressing Canada's clean energy and climate change goals, and increasing awareness of the benefits of adopting high-performance energy codes for buildings.

City of Toronto Green Will Initiative Strategic Energy Management Program

Gillian led the stakeholder engagement and development and delivery of a series of Strategic Energy Management workshops, working with Green Will Initiative participants in commercial, institutional, and MURB sectors to develop their Pathways to Net Zero plans.

Town of Halton Hills Corporate Energy Plan

Gillian was responsible for successful delivery of the Town of Halton Hills Corporate Energy Plan 2019-2024 update, led the stakeholder engagement, and oversaw building performance evaluation and analysis to recommend strategic actions to achieve the Town's overall goals as well as building-specific low-carbon targets based on in-depth review of the municipality's facilities, including the Town Hall.

Town of Caledon GHG Reduction Plan

Senior Project Manager leading the development of the Town of Caledon's Conservation Demand Management plan and Corporate GHG Reduction Framework. Gillian worked closely with the Project Manager to determine best practices and performance-based targets for municipalities in energy efficiency, waste, water and fleet practices, conduct workshops with stakeholders, and determine financial and organizational implications of adopting the targets and practices.

Oxford Properties

Managed the development of an evidence-based energy target model for retail, office, multi-residential and hotel properties to support the strategic objectives and make the business case for Oxford Properties' corporate GHG reduction target that is both achievable and meets the Science-Based Targets criteria. The model considered carbon reductions from building energy reductions, onsite renewables, and offsite renewables.

Produced the ground-breaking 'Sustainable Intelligence' operational excellence guides for commercial office and retail asset classes for Oxford Properties, focusing on identifying organizational and sector best practices and case studies. This required a survey of all General Managers and significant consultation with key subject matter experts across the country. Determining sector-wide best practices, and how best to initiate them internally was a key component for each iteration of the guide. Gillian also developed the second update of the guides, with the addition of Oxford's multi-residential, hotel and industrial asset classes.



Ontario Realty Corporation (Infrastructure Ontario)

From internal and industry best practices, Gillian developed a sustainable building operation guide for over 1000 Infrastructure Ontario buildings. This required facilitating stakeholder teams and providing technical review and input. Another project required testing and documentation of the results and process of a performance-based conservation pilot with IO buildings, as an easy-to-use energy performance operating guide for all operators and building managers of medium-sized buildings within Infrastructure Ontario. These include courthouses, offices, emergency response centres, and service retail stores.

Region of Peel GHG Emission Reduction Prioritization Methodology and Implementation Plan

Senior Project Manager for the development of the Region of Peel Greenhouse Gas Emission Reduction Prioritization Methodology and Implementation Plan. Enerlife was engaged to provide the Region with performance-based energy and carbon reduction targets for their whole portfolio, as well as estimated costs for engineering studies, testing, and operational and capital improvements.

City of Toronto Energy Conservation and Demand Management Plan

Senior Project Manager for the strategic development and proposed implementation of City of Toronto Energy Conservation and Demand Management Plan 2014-2019, applying an evidence-based approach to establishing savings potential across all City of Toronto buildings.

Performance-Based Conservation Pilot Project

Led the Performance-Based Conservation pilot with Ontario's Independent Electricity System Operator in the service area for Alectra, Milton Hydro and Halton Hills Hydro, which included over 200 municipal, school and commercial office buildings.

Mount Royal University Greenhouse Gas Inventory and AASHE STARS certification

Developed air and climate, building operations and maintenance and building energy consumption calculations and summaries for the initial AASHE STARS certification for the university. This included producing a Greenhouse Gas Inventory for the university.

Office of Energy Efficiency, Natural Resources Canada

Supervised research team and wrote research paper for Natural Resources Canada on the challenges faced by schools and hospitals in using benchmarking to improve energy performance. The paper took a deeper look into the benchmarked energy performance of hospitals and schools to identify common characteristics of high-scoring buildings. The research included both qualitative and quantitative analysis with both an emailed survey and phone interviews. Prior to that, wrote an energy benchmarking primer for the Office of Energy Efficiency to build the business case for energy management benchmarking.

City of Oshawa

Produced a consulting report providing recommendations for strategy, process and organizational structure improvements for the Office of Energy Management of the City of Oshawa. This involved in-person interviews with over 40 staff members, and the development of energy savings opportunity model supporting the business case for investing in energy efficiency measures.

GREEN UP Pilot Projects (for CaGBC)

Senior Project Manager/Principal for GREEN UP pilot projects and the programs developed from the LEED pilots for the Canada Green Building Council (CaGBC) in the commercial office, government and administration, schools, and retail (bank and credit union) sectors. Directly developed and managed the pilots and programs for the commercial office and retail sectors, while managing the overall budgetary and overseeing the project management of other sectors.

Toronto Central Local Health Implementation Network (LHIN)

Wrote the Toronto Central Local Health Implementation Network (LHIN) Energy Plan, which identified the energy savings potential across the LHIN. It also provided recommendations for implementation and energy savings measures to undertake.



Social Housing Services Corporation (SHSC)

Wrote, piloted and implemented an on-line survey of members to understand opportunity to provide energy efficiency services and inform energy efficiency pilot for Social Housing Services Corporation for 46 housing providers (148 buildings) across Ontario.

CASE EB-2024-0111: Rates:

Distribution: Enbridge Gas Inc.

COST CLAIM

PARTICIPANT

EB-2024-0111:1: Clement

Li

INTERVENOR NAME

Li, Clement; +1 (416) 915-1530 cli@enerlife.com

PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS Submitted

FILING PARTICIPANT

Li, Clement; +1 (416) 915-1530 cli@enerlife.com

NEW

NON-FILING

PARTICIPANT F. NAME

NON-FILING

PARTICIPANT L. NAME

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE*

Consultant

YEAR CALLED TO BAR*

COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF **RELEVANT EXPERIENCE*** 30

HOURLY RATE

359

HST RATE CHARGED*

13.00

CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST)

CV Provided within Previous

24 Months

LAST CV DATE

April 24, 2024

OVERRIDE HOURLY RATE

No

HST NUMBER R119420859

HEARINGS

Yes

CONSULTATIONS

No

DISBURSEMENTS

No

HEARINGS

Hearings Hours Hearings Subtotal (\$) **Hearings Total Tax (\$)** Hearings Total (\$) 124.25 44,605.75 5,798.77 50,404.52

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	Sub Total	HST Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
DISCOVERY Read and Research Application and Evidence	14.00	359	5,026.00	13.00	653.38	5,679.38
Preparation of Interrogatories	11.00	359	3,949.00	13.00	513.37	4,462.37
Review Interrogatory Responses	7.50	359	2,692.50	13.00	350.03	3,042.53
Technical Conference Preparation	2.50	359	897.50	13.00	116.68	1,014.18
Technical Conference Attendance		359		13.00		
Technical Conference Follow-up	3.00	359	1,077.00	13.00	140.01	1,217.01
Subtotal of DISCOVERY	38.00		13,642.00		1,773.47	15,415.47
PROCEDURAL Preparation of Issues List Submission		359		13.00		
Attendance at Issues List Conference		359		13.00		
Preparation for a Confidentiality Request		359		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality		359		13.00		
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		359		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		359		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)	3.00	359	1,077.00	13.00	140.01	1,217.01
Review Procedural Documents	2.50	359	897.50	13.00	116.68	1,014.18

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	Sub Total	HST Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Subtotal of PROCEDURAL	5.50		1,974.50		256.69	2,231.19
INTERVENOR EVIDENCE Preparation of Intervenor Evidence		359		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		359		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE	0.00	359	0.00	13.00	0.00	0.00
SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE						
Preparation for Settlement Conference	2.00	359	718.00	13.00	93.34	811.34
Attendance at Settlement Conference	49.00	359	17,591.00	13.00	2,286.83	19,877.83
Preparation of Settlement Proposal	4.00	359	1,436.00	13.00	186.68	1,622.68
Attendance at Presentation to Panel	3.00	359	1,077.00	13.00	140.01	1,217.01
Subtotal of SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE WRITTEN ARGUMENT	58.00		20,822.00		2,706.86	23,528.86
Written Submissions	8.00	359	2,872.00	13.00	373.36	3,245.36
Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT	8.00		2,872.00		373.36	3,245.36
ORAL ARGUMENT Preparation for Oral Hearing	2.50	359	897.50	13.00	116.68	1,014.18
Attendance at Oral Hearing	11.75	359	4,218.25	13.00	548.37	4,766.62
Oral Submissions		359		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		359		13.00		
Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT	14.25		5,115.75		665.05	5,780.80
DECISION Review Decision	0.50	359	179.50	13.00	23.34	202.84
Review Rate/Accounting Order		359		13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order		359		13.00		
Subtotal of DECISION	0.50		179.50		23.34	202.84
OTHER Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor Conferences)		359		13.00		
Subtotal of OTHER	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES Total Service Provider Fees	124.25		44,605.75		5,798.77	50,404.52

Attachments

<u>Attachment Document Type</u> <u>Import Message</u>

BOMA Clement Time Docket.pdf BOMA Invoice 4428 EB-2024-0111.pdf Time Docket Invoice

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

<u>Attachment</u> <u>Document Type</u> <u>Claim Type</u> <u>Import Message</u>

BOMA Clement Time Docket.pdf Time Docket Hearings

BOMA Invoice 4428 EB-2024-0111.pdf Invoice Hearings

Date	Hours	Analyst/Consultant/	Description	Total
May 10, 2024	3.00	Clement Li	Read and Research Application and Evidence	\$1,077.00
May 15, 2024	2.50	Clement Li	Read and Research Application and Evidence	\$897.50
May 22, 2024	3.00	Clement Li	Read and Research Application and Evidence	\$1,077.00
June 7, 2024	1.00	Clement Li	Preparation of Interrogatories	\$359.00
June 10, 2024	1.50	Clement Li	Preparation of Interrogatories	\$538.50
June 11, 2024	1.00	Clement Li	Preparation of Interrogatories	\$359.00
June 11, 2024	0.50	Clement Li	Read and Research Application and Evidence	\$179.50
June 12, 2024	0.50	Clement Li	Preparation of Interrogatories	\$179.50
June 14, 2024	2.50	Clement Li	Preparation of Interrogatories	\$897.50
June 17, 2024	3.50	Clement Li	Preparation of Interrogatories	\$1,256.50
June 19, 2024	1.00	Clement Li	Preparation of Interrogatories	\$359.00
July 8, 2024	2.50	Clement Li	Review Interrogatory Responses	\$897.50
July 15, 2024	5.00	Clement Li	Review Interrogatory Responses	\$1,795.00
July 16, 2024	0.50	Clement Li	Technical Conference Preparation	\$179.50
July 17, 2024	1.00	Clement Li	Technical Conference Preparation	\$359.00
July 19, 2024	0.50	Clement Li	Technical Conference Preparation	\$179.50
July 19, 2024	0.50	Clement Li	Technical Conference Preparation	\$179.50
August 16, 2024	1.00	Clement Li	Review procedural documents	\$359.00
August 16, 2024	2.00	Clement Li	Technical Conference Follow-up	\$718.00
August 20, 2024	1.00	Clement Li	Technical Conference Follow-up	\$359.00
August 20, 2024	3.00	Clement Li	Read and Research Application and Evidence	\$1,077.00
August 23, 2024	2.00	Clement Li	Read and Research Application and Evidence	\$718.00
September 3, 2024	2.00	Clement Li	Preparation for Settlement Conference	\$718.00
September 10, 2024	6.50	Clement Li	Attendance at Settlement Conference	\$2,333.50
September 11, 2024	6.00	Clement Li	Attendance at Settlement Conference	\$2,154.00
September 12, 2024	5.00	Clement Li	Attendance at Settlement Conference	\$1,795.00
September 13, 2024	3.75	Clement Li	Attendance at Settlement Conference	\$1,346.25
September 17, 2024	0.50	Clement Li	Attendance at Settlement Conference	\$179.50
September 18, 2024	6.00	Clement Li	Attendance at Settlement Conference	\$2,154.00
September 19, 2024	2.00	Clement Li	Attendance at Settlement Conference	\$718.00
September 20, 2024	3.25	Clement Li	Attendance at Settlement Conference	\$1,166.75
October 7, 2024	5.50	Clement Li	Attendance at Settlement Conference	\$1,974.50
October 8, 2024	5.50	Clement Li	Attendance at Settlement Conference	\$1,974.50
October 9, 2024	5.00	Clement Li	Attendance at Settlement Conference	\$1,795.00
October 21, 2024	0.50	Clement Li	Preparation of Settlement Proposal	\$179.50
October 22, 2024	0.50	Clement Li	Preparation of Settlement Proposal	\$179.50
October 24, 2024	0.50	Clement Li	Preparation of Settlement Proposal	\$179.50
October 28, 2024	0.50	Clement Li	Preparation of Settlement Proposal	\$179.50
October 29, 2024	0.50	Clement Li	Preparation of Settlement Proposal	\$179.50
October 30, 2024	0.50	Clement Li	Preparation of Settlement Proposal	\$179.50
November 4, 2024 November 6, 2024	0.50	Clement Li	Preparation of Settlement Proposal	\$179.50
November 11, 2024	1.00 0.50	Clement Li Clement Li	Review procedural documents	\$359.00 \$179.50
November 15, 2024	0.50	Clement Li	Review procedural documents Preparation of Settlement Proposal	\$179.50 \$179.50
November 18, 2024	3.00	Clement Li	Attendance at Presentation to Panel	\$1,077.00
November 18, 2024	3.00	Clement Li	Attendance at Presentation to Panel Attendance at hearing on Motion (s)	\$1,077.00
December 2, 2024	1.00	Clement Li	Preparation for Oral Hearing	\$359.00
December 6, 2024	0.50	Clement Li	Preparation for Oral Hearing	\$179.50
December 16, 2024	1.00	Clement Li	Preparation for Oral Hearing	\$359.00
December 17, 2024	7.75	Clement Li	Attendance at Oral Hearing	\$2,782.25
December 19, 2024	4.00	Clement Li	Attendance at Oral Hearing	\$1,436.00
February 5, 2025	1.50	Clement Li	Written Submissions	\$538.50
February 7, 2025	1.00	Clement Li	Written Submissions	\$359.00
February 11, 2025	1.00	Clement Li	Written Submissions	\$359.00
February 14, 2025	2.50	Clement Li	Written Submissions	\$897.50
February 18, 2025	2.00	Clement Li	Written Submissions	\$718.00
May 30, 2025	0.50	Clement Li	Review Decision	\$179.50



To: BOMA Toronto

90 Eglinton Ave. East, Suite 412 Toronto, ON M4P 2Y3 Canada Tel: 416.915.1530 Fax: 416.915.1534

EB-2024-0111 Enbridge Gas Inc. Application for 2024 Rates - Phase 2

Date: June 13, 2025

Invoice: 4428 Date Hours Analyst/Consultant/ Description Rate Total April 26, 2024 May 6, 2024 May 30, 2024 May 10, 2024 May 15, 2024 May 22, 2024 lan Jarvis lan Jarvis lan Jarvis Clement Li 0.50 0.25 0.50 Read and Research Application and Evidence \$359 \$359 \$359 \$179.50 \$89.75 \$179.50 \$1,077.00 3.00 \$359 2.50 Read and Research Application and Evidence \$359 \$897.50 Clement Li Clement Li 3.00 1.00 Read and Research Application and Evidence \$359 \$1,077.00 June 7, 2024 June 8, 2024 June 10, 2024 June 10, 2024 June 10, 2024 June 10, 2024 Preparation of Interrogatories \$359 \$359.00 0.50 0.50 0.50 lan Jarvis lan Jarvis Gillian Henderson Gillian Henderson Read and Research Application and Evidence \$359 \$359 \$359 \$179.50 \$179.50 \$179.50 \$179.50 0.50 \$359 1.50 Clement Li Preparation of Interrogatories Preparation of Interrogatories \$359 \$538.50 June 11, 2024 1.00 Clement Li \$359 \$359.00 Preparation of Interrogatories
Read and Research Application and Evidence
Preparation of Interrogatories
Preparation of Interrogatories \$359.00 \$179.50 \$179.50 \$897.50 \$1,256.50 \$269.25 June 11, 2024 0.50 Clement Li \$359 Clement Li Clement Li Clement Li Clement Li Ian Jarvis Clement Li 0.50 2.50 3.50 0.75 1.00 \$359 \$359 \$359 \$359 June 12, 2024 June 12, 2024 June 14, 2024 June 17, 2024 June 17, 2024 June 19, 2024 June 19, 2024 \$359 \$359.00 1.00 Ian Jarvis Preparation of Interrogatories \$359 \$359.00 Ian Jarvis
Clement Li
Clement Li
Clement Li
Clement Li
Ian Jarvis
Gillian Henderson
Clement Li July 8, 2024 July 15, 2024 July 16, 2024 July 17, 2024 July 17, 2024 July 18, 2024 July 19, 2024 July 19, 2024 July 19, 2024 July 20, 2024 July 20, 2024 July 22, 2024 July 22, 2024 July 22, 2024 July 8, 2024 2.50 5.00 Review Interrogatory Responses \$359 \$897.50 Review Interrogatory Responses Review Interrogatory Responses Technical Conference Preparation \$350 \$1.795.00 0.50 1.00 0.50 0.50 \$359 \$359 \$359 \$359 \$179.50 \$179.50 \$359.00 \$179.50 \$179.50 \$359 0.50 \$359 \$179.50 1.00 Ian Jarvis \$359 \$359.00 lan Jarvis
Gillian Henderson
Clement Li
Gillian Henderson
lan Jarvis
Gillian Henderson Technical Conference Preparation Technical Conference Attendance 0.50 \$359 \$179.50 \$179.50 0.50 0.75 1.00 1.00 \$359 \$359 \$359 \$269.25 \$359.00 \$359.00 \$359 3.00 Gillian Henderson \$359 \$1,077.00 July 22, 2024 4.00 Gillian Hendersor Technical Conference Attendance \$359 \$1,436,00 Gillian Henderson Gillian Henderson Gillian Henderson Gillian Henderson Gillian Henderson \$1,436.00 \$269.25 \$987.25 \$1,256.50 \$718.00 \$1,346.25 0.75 2.75 3.50 2.00 3.75 July 23, 2024 Technical Conference Preparation \$359 July 23, 2024 July 23, 2024 July 23, 2024 July 24, 2024 July 24, 2024 July 25, 2024 July 25, 2024 Technical Conference Preparation Technical Conference Attendance Technical Conference Attendance Technical Conference Attendance Technical Conference Attendance Technical Conference Preparation Technical Conference Follow-up Technical Conference Follow-up \$359 \$359 \$359 \$359 \$359 Gillian Henderson 0.50 \$359 \$179.50 0.25 Gillian Henderson \$359 \$89.75 July 29, 2024 0.50 Gillian Hendersor \$359 \$179.50 July 29, 2024 August 16, 2024 August 16, 2024 August 20, 2024 August 20, 2024 August 21, 2024 August 23, 2024 August 23, 2024 Technical Conference Follow-up
Review procedural documents
Technical Conference Follow-up
Technical Conference Follow-up
Read and Research Application and Evidence
Technical Conference Follow-up
Read and Research Application and Evidence Clement Li Clement Li Clement Li Clement Li \$359 \$359 \$359 \$359 1.00 \$359.00 2.00 1.00 3.00 0.50 2.00 \$718.00 \$359.00 \$1,077.00 \$179.50 Ian Jarvis \$359 Clement Li \$359 \$718.00 Preparation for Settlement Conference Preparation for Settlement Conference August 23, 2024 0.50 Ian Jarvis \$359 \$179.50 September 3, 2024 2.00 Clement Li \$359 \$718.00 September 9, 2024 Preparation for Settlement Conference \$179.50 0.50 Ian Jarvis \$359 September 10, 2024 6.50 Clement Li Attendance at Settlement Conference \$359 \$2,333,50 Clement Li Clement Li Clement Li Clement Li Clement Li Clement Li Attendance at Settlement Conference
Attendance at Settlement Conference \$359 \$359 \$359 \$359 \$359 September 11, 2024 6.00 5.00 3.75 0.50 6.00 2.00 3.25 \$2.154.00 September 11, 2024 September 12, 2024 September 13, 2024 September 17, 2024 September 18, 2024 \$1,795.00 \$1,346.25 \$179.50 \$2,154.00 \$359 Attendance at Settlement Conference September 19, 2024 \$359 \$718.00 September 20, 2024 Clement Li Attendance at Settlement Conference \$359 \$1.166.75 Clement Li October 7, 2024 5.50 5.50 5.00 0.50 0.50 0.50 Attendance at Settlement Conference \$359 \$1,974.50 October 7, 2024 October 8, 2024 October 9, 2024 October 21, 2024 October 22, 2024 October 24, 2024 Attendance at Settlement Conference Attendance at Settlement Conference Attendance at Settlement Conference Preparation of Settlement Proposal \$359 \$359 \$359 \$359 \$359 \$1,974.50 \$1,795.00 \$1,795.00 \$179.50 \$179.50 \$179.50 \$359 October 28, 2024 0.50 \$359 \$179.50 October 29, 2024 0.50 \$359 \$179.50 Clement Li Preparation of Settlement Proposal Preparation of Settlement Proposal Preparation of Settlement Proposal Review procedural documents Review procedural documents Preparation of Settlement Proposal Attendance at Presentation to Panel \$179.50 \$179.50 \$179.50 \$359.00 \$179.50 \$1,077.00 \$359 \$359 \$359 \$359 \$359 October 30, 2024 0.50 0.50 1.00 0.50 0.50 3.00 November 4, 2024 November 6, 2024 November 11, 2024 November 15, 2024 November 18, 2024 \$359 \$359 November 18, 2024 3.00 1.00 Clement Li Attendance at hearing on Motion (s) \$359 \$1,077.00 December 2, 2024 Clement Li Preparation for Oral Hearing \$359 \$359.00 0.50 1.00 7.75 4.00 Clement Li Clement Li Clement Li Clement Li December 6, 2024 Preparation for Oral Hearing \$359 \$179.50 \$359.00 December 16, 2024 December 16, 2024 December 17, 2024 December 19, 2024 February 5, 2025 Preparation for Oral Hearing
Attendance at Oral Hearing \$359 \$2,782.25 \$1,436.00 Attendance at Oral Hearing \$359 1.50 Clement Li Written Submissions \$359 \$538.50 February 7, 2025 1.00 Clement Li Written Submissions \$359 \$359.00 0.50 1.00 2.50 2.00 0.50 **157.50** February 7, 2025 Ian Jarvis Written Submissions \$359 \$179.50 \$179.50 \$359.00 \$897.50 \$718.00 \$179.50 \$56,542.50 Clement Li Clement Li Clement Li Clement Li \$359 \$359 \$359 \$359 February 11, 2025 Written Submissions February 14, 2025 February 18, 2025 May 30, 2025 Written Submissions Written Submissions Written Submissions Review Decision

HST	\$7,350.53
Tatal Americal	662 002 02