

EB-2024-0198 : 1 : Kelly Avalos

COST CLAIM NUMBER
2909

SUBMISSION DEADLINE DATE
November 20, 2025

CLAIM STATUS
Submitted

EB#
EB-2024-0198: Rates: Distribution: Enbridge Gas
Inc.

OTHER EB#S

PHASE #*
1

INTERVENOR
Avalos, Kelly; +1 (416) 862-4405
Kelly.Avalos@ca.gowlingwlg.com

INTERVENOR COMPANY*
Industrial Gas Users Association.,
Ottawa: Corporation

INTERVENOR TYPE
Full Registrant

HST RATE ONTARIO
13.00

EXCHANGE RATE

COUNTRY

HST NUMBER
89659 3323 RT0001

LATE SUBMISSION ALLOWED
No

EXTENSION DEADLINE DATE

PARTICIPANTS

New	Non-Filing Participant First, Last Name	Filing Participant	Total (\$)	Total Hours	Participant Claim Status
No	,	Mondrow, Ian; +1 (416) 369-4670 ian.mondrow@gowlingwlg.com	18,458.00	45.50	Submitted

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT/OTHER FEES
16,334.50

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS
0.00

TOTAL HST
2,123.50

TOTAL CLAIM
18,458.00

TOTAL AMOUNT AWARDED

TOTAL HOURS CLAIMED
45.50

TOTAL HOURS DISALLOWED

REASON FOR
DISALLOWANCE

REASON FOR
DISALLOWANCE - 2

REASON FOR
DISALLOWANCE - 3

MAKE CHEQUE PAYABLE TO
Industrial Gas Users Association

SEND PAYMENT TO ADDRESS
851 Industrial Ave, P.O. Box 30
Ottawa, ON K1G 4L3

ATTENTION
Dr. Shahrzad Rahbar

SUBMIT SECTION

I am a representative of the Party. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim. The costs incurred and time spent are directly related to the Party's participation in the OEB Process referred to above.

This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in section 6.05 and 6.09 of the OEB's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

The information (fees and disbursements) filed in this cost claim is complete and accurate and in accordance with the OEB's Practice Direction for Cost Awards and Appendix A, the Cost Awards Tariff.

SUBMITTED BY
Kelly Avalos

DATE SUBMITTED
November 19, 2025

CASE EB-2024-0198: Rates: Distribution: Enbridge Gas Inc.	COST CLAIM EB-2024-0198 : 1 : Kelly Avalos	INTERVENOR NAME Avalos, Kelly; +1 (416) 862-4405 Kelly.Avalos@ca.gowlingwlg. com	PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS Submitted
FILING PARTICIPANT Mondrow, Ian; +1 (416) 369-4670 ian.mondrow@gowlingwlg.com	NEW PARTICIPANT No	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME
SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE* Legal Counsel	YEAR CALLED TO BAR* 1991	COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF RELEVANT EXPERIENCE* 34	HOURLY RATE 359
HST RATE CHARGED* 13.00	CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST) CV Required	LAST CV DATE	OVERRIDE HOURLY RATE No
HST NUMBER 89659 3323 RT0001	HEARINGS Yes	CONSULTATIONS No	DISBURSEMENTS No

HEARINGS

Hearings Hours 45.50	Hearings Subtotal (\$) 16,334.50	Hearings Total Tax (\$) 2,123.50	Hearings Total (\$) 18,458.00
--------------------------------	--	--	---

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
DISCOVERY						
Read and Research Application and Evidence	13.40	359	4,810.60	13.00	625.38	5,435.98
Preparation of Interrogatories		359		13.00		
Review Interrogatory Responses		359		13.00		
Technical Conference Preparation	3.00	359	1,077.00	13.00	140.01	1,217.01
Technical Conference Attendance	7.50	359	2,692.50	13.00	350.03	3,042.53
Technical Conference Follow-up	1.60	359	574.40	13.00	74.67	649.07
Subtotal of DISCOVERY	25.50		9,154.50		1,190.09	10,344.59
PROCEDURAL						
Preparation of Issues List Submission	2.70	359	969.30	13.00	126.01	1,095.31
Attendance at Issues List Conference		359		13.00		
Preparation for a Confidentiality Request		359		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality		359		13.00		
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		359		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)	4.30	359	1,543.70	13.00	200.68	1,744.38
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		359		13.00		
Review Procedural Documents	5.50	359	1,974.50	13.00	256.69	2,231.19

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Subtotal of PROCEDURAL	12.50		4,487.50		583.38	5,070.88
INTERVENOR EVIDENCE						
Preparation of Intervenor Evidence		359		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		359		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing		359		13.00		
Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE						
Preparation for Settlement Conference		359		13.00		
Attendance at Settlement Conference		359		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		359		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		359		13.00		
Subtotal of SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
WRITTEN ARGUMENT						
Written Submissions	7.50	359	2,692.50	13.00	350.03	3,042.53
Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT	7.50		2,692.50		350.03	3,042.53
ORAL ARGUMENT						
Preparation for Oral Hearing		359		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		359		13.00		
Oral Submissions		359		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		359		13.00		
Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
DECISION						
Review Decision		359		13.00		
Review Rate/Accounting Order		359		13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order		359		13.00		
Subtotal of DECISION	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
OTHER						
Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor Conferences)		359		13.00		
Subtotal of OTHER	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES						
Total Service Provider Fees	45.50		16,334.50		2,123.50	18,458.00

Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
IGUA_EB-2024-0198_Time Dockets_20251119.pdf	Time Docket	
IGUA_EB-2024-0198_Rollover Decision Cost Claim Letter_20251119.pdf	Cover Letter	
IGUA_EB-2024-0198_Excel Working Spreadsheet_20251119.pdf	Other	An Excel working spreadsheet summarizing by invoice the hours allocated to various activity categories and the totals input into the Board's cost claim template.
IGUA_EB-2024-0198_Table of Revised Activities_20251119.pdf	Other	
IMondrow_Summary Page_20251119.pdf	Other	

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Claim Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
IGUA_EB-2024-0198_Time Dockets_20251119.pdf	Time Docket	Hearings	
IGUA_EB-2024-0198_Rollover Decision Cost Claim Letter_20251119.pdf	Cover Letter	Hearings	
IGUA_EB-2024-0198_Excel Working Spreadsheet_20251119.pdf	Other	Hearings	An Excel working spreadsheet summarizing by invoice the hours allocated to various activity categories and the totals input into the Board's cost claim template.
IGUA_EB-2024-0198_Table of Revised Activities_20251119.pdf	Other	Hearings	
IMondrow_Summary Page_20251119.pdf	Other	Hearings	

July 22, 2024
 INVOICE: 20310666

Industrial Gas Users Association
Our Matter: T1036289
EGI Multi-Year DSM Plan Application (EB-2024-0198) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-10)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

TC-PREP

Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
2024-06-11	0.70	Ian Mondrow	Review OEB Staff letter regarding pre-filing consultation and update to IGUA; reviewing related DSM correspondence relating to SAG and replacement HER+ program and budget variance;
2024-06-12	0.50	Ian Mondrow	Discussion with S. Rahbar regarding upcoming OEB Staff convened meeting and next steps for IGUA on policy/position readiness; updated note for IGUA members;

Total Fees for Professional Services

SUMMARY OF FEES

TK Name	Hours
Mondrow, Ian	1.20
Total	1.20

August 29, 2024
INVOICE: 20331947

Industrial Gas Users Association
Our Matter: T1036289
EGI Multi-Year DSM Plan Application (EB-2024-0198) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-10)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
TC-ATT	2024-07-31	1.90	Ian Mondrow	IGUA/EGI meeting to discuss opt out topic/options; review internal jurisdictional research memos for sharing with EGI;

Total Fees for Professional Services

SUMMARY OF FEES

TK Name	Hours
Mondrow, Ian	1.90
Total	1.90

September 30, 2024
 INVOICE: 20351193

Industrial Gas Users Association
Our Matter: T1036289
EGI Multi-Year DSM Plan Application (EB-2024-0198) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-10)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
TC-PREP	2024-08-12	0.60	Ian Mondrow	Retrieve and review EGI materials in preparation for Industrial & Commercial programs stakeholder session;
TC-ATT	2024-08-15	5.60	Ian Mondrow	Attend EGI Industrial/Commercial program consultation session;

Total Fees for Professional Services

SUMMARY OF FEES

TK Name	Hours
Mondrow, Ian	6.20
Total	6.20

November 30, 2024
INVOICE: 20391264

Industrial Gas Users Association
Our Matter: T1036289
EGI Multi-Year DSM Plan Application (EB-2024-0198) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-10)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

TC-
FLWUP

Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
2024-10-15	0.60	Ian Mondrow	Reporting to IGUA membership on tentative agreement with EGI on opt-out framework proposal;

Total Fees for Professional Services

SUMMARY OF FEES

TK Name	Hours
Mondrow, Ian	0.60
Total	0.60

February 13, 2025
 INVOICE: 20440857

Industrial Gas Users Association
Our Matter: T1036289
EGI Multi-Year DSM Plan Application (EB-2024-0198) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-10)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
RRA	2025-01-10	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Commence review of pre-filed materials;
	2025-01-13	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Continue review of pre-filed material;
	2025-01-13	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Correspondence with D. Francis regarding potential scope of IGUA evidence;
	2025-01-14	0.40	Ian Mondrow	Continue review of prefiled materials;
	2025-01-14	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Update to IGUA Ontario caucus;
MOT-SUB	2025-01-16	0.60	Ian Mondrow	Continue review of prefiled materials;
RRA	2025-01-16	0.80	Ian Mondrow	Complete and file intervention form and send to EGI;
	2025-01-17	0.40	Ian Mondrow	Continue review of prefiled material;
	2025-01-21	0.60	Ian Mondrow	Reviewing detailed EGI submission on intervention requests;
MOT-SUB	2025-01-27	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review CME response to EGI's intervenor request objection;
	2025-01-29	1.20	Ian Mondrow	Review numerous filings regarding EGI intervention objections and consider comments regarding interests represented and scope of intended participation/issues;

Total Fees for Professional Services

SUMMARY OF FEES

TK Name	Hours
Mondrow, Ian	5.30
Total	5.30

March 31, 2025
 INVOICE: 20466206

Industrial Gas Users Association
Our Matter: T1036289
EGI Multi-Year DSM Plan Application (EB-2024-0198) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-10)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

RRA

Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
2025-02-05	0.60	Ian Mondrow	Correspondence and discussion with N. Sebaa regarding IGUA carbon compliance expert;
2025-02-11	1.10	Ian Mondrow	Call with D. Francis, N. Sebaa and potential witness regarding IGUA evidence;
2025-02-24	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Correspondence with IGUA regarding potential experts;
2025-02-26	1.60	Ian Mondrow	Resume review of prefiled materials;

Total Fees for Professional Services

SUMMARY OF FEES

TK Name	Hours
Mondrow, Ian	3.50
Total	3.50

April 24, 2025
 INVOICE: 20481139

Industrial Gas Users Association
Our Matter: T1036289
EGI Multi-Year DSM Plan Application (EB-2024-0198) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-10)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
RPD	2025-03-04	1.10	Ian Mondrow	Review P.O. No. 1; correspondence with M. Buonaguro (for OGVG) regarding suggestion in P.O. of potential common interests; retrieve and review OGVG intervention request form for particulars of stated interests/focus;
RRA	2025-03-06	3.50	Ian Mondrow	Continue review of prefiled material;
IL-SUB	2025-03-06	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Draft brief letter regarding issues list comments;
	2025-03-07	0.90	Ian Mondrow	Review filing materials for issues list submission and providing guidance; review and revise submission on intervenor co-ordination proposal and instructions for filing; review OGVG response on the intervenor co-ordination;
MOT-SUB				
IL-SUB	2025-03-07	1.40	Ian Mondrow	Review issues list submissions;
	2025-03-19	0.50	Ian Mondrow	Review note from N. Sebaa and provide comment on points/questions raised;
MOT-SUB	2025-03-19	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Review submissions regarding P.O. No. 1 intervention directions;
RRA	2025-03-20	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Review EGI request for abeyance; review P.O. No. 1 regarding upcoming dates;
	2025-03-20	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Update note to IGUA regarding EGI request for abeyance and next steps;
	2025-03-24	0.80	Ian Mondrow	Review balance of issues list submissions; review OEB letter accepting abeyance request and update note to IGUA;
IL-SUB	2025-03-25	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Complete review of issues submissions;

Total Fees for Professional Services

SUMMARY OF FEES

TK Name	Hours
Mondrow, Ian	9.40
Total	9.40

May 30, 2025
 INVOICE: 20501751

Industrial Gas Users Association
Our Matter: T1036289
EGI Multi-Year DSM Plan Application (EB-2024-0198) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-10)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
RRA	2025-04-02	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Consider and respond to note from D. Johnson to discuss whether any carbon pricing change impacts on opt-out proposal; note to D. Francis to review and comment;
	2025-04-04	0.90	Ian Mondrow	Discussion with D. Francis and conference with EGI regarding carbon charge changes and LVC DSM;
RPD	2025-04-10	0.90	Ian Mondrow	Review decision on issues and IGUA/OGVG intervention combination;

Total Fees for Professional Services

SUMMARY OF FEES

TK Name	Hours
Mondrow, Ian	2.00
Total	2.00

June 24, 2025
 INVOICE: 20518874

Industrial Gas Users Association
Our Matter: T1036289
EGI Multi-Year DSM Plan Application (EB-2024-0198) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-10)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
RRA	2025-05-02	0.40	Ian Mondrow	Review update filing from EGI regarding timing for DSM Plan filing and interim rollover proposal; update to IGUA;
	2025-05-09	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Correspondence regarding update meeting with EGI;
	2025-05-12	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Follow-up with N. Sebaa regarding EGI suggested update discussion;
	2025-05-14	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Correspondence with N. Sebaa regarding discussion with EGI on further potential delays to DSM application and implications for IGUA;
	2025-05-15	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Review EGI correspondence regarding thinking on rollover and main plan application filing and process; review P.O. No. 3;
RPD	2025-05-22	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Update to IGUA BOD;
	2025-05-25	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Review correspondence from EGI regarding updated filing date for rollover application and review P.O. No. 3 regarding issues for rollover application;

Total Fees for Professional Services

SUMMARY OF FEES

TK Name	Hours
Mondrow, Ian	1.60
Total	1.60

July 22, 2025
 INVOICE: 20539418

Industrial Gas Users Association
Our Matter: T1036289
EGI Multi-Year DSM Plan Application (EB-2024-0198) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-10)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

RRA

Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
2025-06-17	0.30	Ian Mondrow	IGUA Ontario Caucus update briefing;
2025-06-19	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Review ED/GEC correspondence regarding mid-year 2026 rollover potential;
2025-06-27	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review EGI letter responding to GEC/ED regarding scope of 2026 rollover application;

Total Fees for Professional Services

SUMMARY OF FEES

TK Name	Hours
Mondrow, Ian	0.60
Total	0.60

August 25, 2025
 INVOICE: 20558738

Industrial Gas Users Association
Our Matter: T1036289
EGI Multi-Year DSM Plan Application (EB-2024-0198) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-10)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
RPD	2025-07-03	0.50	Ian Mondrow	Review P.O. to address 2026 rollover proposal and update to IGUA;
RRA	2025-07-09	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Review updated EGI filing addressing OEB directions;
RPD	2025-07-14	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review recent correspondence regarding evidence proposals;
	2025-07-16	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Review EGI response to intervenor evidence proposal letters;
	2025-07-17	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review additional correspondence regarding scope of 2026 considerations;
	2025-07-18	0.40	Ian Mondrow	Review P.O. No. 5 and check diarized dates; correspondence with J. Irving regarding upcoming Technical Conference (and IGUA deferral);
TC-PREP	2025-07-24	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Review material filed by Environmental Defence for technical conference;
	2025-07-30	0.80	Ian Mondrow	Review social cost of carbon materials filed by ED for technical conference;
	2025-07-31	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Review SEC correspondence regarding cost of carbon OEB jurisdiction question; retrieve TC transcripts for review; review proceeding schedule;

Total Fees for Professional Services

SUMMARY OF FEES

TK Name	Hours
Mondrow, Ian	2.90
Total	2.90

September 30, 2025
 INVOICE: 20580156

Industrial Gas Users Association
Our Matter: T1036289
EGI Multi-Year DSM Plan Application (EB-2024-0198) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-10)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
TC-FLWUP	2025-08-05	1.00	Ian Mondrow	Review Technical Conference transcripts regarding broader (non-residential) issues (in lieu of attendance); review EGI response to SEC request for position on social cost of carbon;
RPD	2025-08-07	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Review OEB correspondence clarifying exclusion of social cost of carbon issues from rollover considerations and limited scope of rollover proceeding;
	2025-08-12	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review correspondence re confidentiality and date for submissions;
	2025-08-13	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Review EGI response to SEC/PP confidentiality claim and scheduling comments;
	2025-08-18	0.80	Ian Mondrow	Consider brief IGUA submissions regarding 2026 rollover (and deferral of social cost of carbon issue); review P.O. 6 regarding confidentiality submissions process and deferral of dates for submissions;
SUB	2025-08-22	0.90	Ian Mondrow	Review TC UT responses; review and revise draft IGUA submission letter; update note to IGUA;; review confidentiality correspondence filed by parties;
	2025-08-28	1.10	Ian Mondrow	Review draft SEC submissions shared; respond to SEC (and other parties) on concerns with adoption of social cost of carbon proposal and share thoughts with IGUA;
RPD	2025-08-30	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Review confidentiality decision;
SUB	2025-08-30	0.80	Ian Mondrow	Review and revise draft IGUA submissions in light of intervenor exchanges/positions advocating basis for residential program continuation;

Total Fees for Professional Services

SUMMARY OF FEES

TK Name	Hours
Mondrow, Ian	5.30
Total	5.30

October 31, 2025
 INVOICE: 20600598

Industrial Gas Users Association
Our Matter: T1036289
EGI Multi-Year DSM Plan Application (EB-2024-0198) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-10)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
	2025-09-03	2.00	Ian Mondrow	Review Submissions on EGI rollover proposal; review and finalize IGUA Submission;
	2025-09-04	0.60	Ian Mondrow	Complete review of other parties' submissions; review and comment on IGUA member update;
SUB	2025-09-18	0.80	Ian Mondrow	Review EGI Reply Submisisons on 2026 Rollover application and update to IGUA;
	2025-09-25	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Review (late filed) CCC Submissions;

Total Fees for Professional Services

SUMMARY OF FEES

TK Name	Hours
Mondrow, Ian	3.70
Total	3.70



Client Code 190123
Client Name Industrial Gas Users Association
Nature of Client Business Member Associations and Organizations

Matter Code T1036289
Matter Name EGI Multi-Year DSM Plan Application (EB-2024-0198) (IGUA24-ON-EGI-10)
Client Reference Code
Matter Area of Law Not Available (NA)
Matter Service Area Advice, Opinion, Consulting, Strategy (ADV01)
Status Open Open and Active
Open Date Jun 13, 2024
Close Date
Billing Professional Mondrow, Ian (1760)
Nature of Work Participation on behalf of IGUA in OEB's facilitation of EGI's forthcoming DSM (Demand Side Management) Application.
Tax Jurisdiction Ontario HST (ONT)
Rate Level National Rates

WIP Fees Detail All Timekeepers ▾

	Date	Timekeeper	Remarks	Hours
SUB	Nov 5, 2025	Mondrow, Ian 1760	Review P. Probe letter re IESO/EGD program conditions regarding gas use;	0.1
RPD	Nov 7, 2025	Mondrow, Ian 1760	Review decision on 2026 rollover;	0.3
SUB	Nov 7, 2025	Mondrow, Ian 1760	Review EGI response to P. Probe letter re alleged program constraints; complete review of DSM decision and briefing note to IGUA;	0.9
Total				1.3

<https://gowlinks.gowlings.corp/site/rex/matterDesc/wipdetail.asp?matteruno=2471765>

November 19, 2025

Ian A. Mondrow
Direct 416-369-4670
ian.mondrow@gowlingwlg.com

VIA RESS

Mr. Ritchie Murray, Acting Registrar
ONTARIO ENERGY BOARD
P.O. Box 2319, 27th Floor
2300 Yonge Street
Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

Dear Mr. Murray:

Re: EB-2024-0198: Enbridge Gas Inc. (EGI) Application for 2026-2030 DSM Plan
Industrial Gas users Association (IGUA) Cost Claim (2026 Rollover Portion)

Submitted with this letter is a Statement of Costs for IGUA's engagement to date in the captioned proceeding.

We understand from OEB Staff that cost eligible parties are to submit at this time claims for costs related to activities from the outset of the captioned docket to date, including the period prior to determination by EGI to seek a one-year rollover of its current DSM programming. As reflected in the supporting materials submitted with this claim, for IGUA these earlier activities included time spent in pre-filing consultations with EGI. These pre-filing consultations included both broader stakeholder group meetings convened by EGI and/or OEB Staff, and meetings directly between EGI and IGUA to discuss EGI's opt-out proposal for large volume customers as included in EGI's initial filing. In the supporting material filed with IGUA's Statement of Costs we have denoted all of this pre-filing consultation time under the "Technical Conference" activity category.

Other categorization designations made include the following:

1. Time spent reporting to, and getting input/instructions from, IGUA has been categorized in accord with the phase of, or step in, the process in respect of which the reporting/input was related. For example, on July 3, 2025, we recorded time related to review of a Procedural Order and updating of IGUA in respect thereof. All of that time has been designated under the "Review Procedural Document" category of the OEB's list of eligible activity categories.
2. Time spent related to intervention submissions (IGUA's and those of other parties) and submissions on Hearing Panel consideration of intervenor co-ordination has been categorized as "Motion Submissions".
3. Time spent reviewing parties' correspondence regarding procedural matters (such as intervenor evidence proposals or the appropriate scope for consideration of EGI's rollover request) has been categorized as "Review of Procedural Documents".

We trust that the foregoing explanation is of assistance to OEB Staff reviewing IGUA's Statement of Costs. Should there be any questions in respect of our designation of activities in order to fit within the categories on the OEB's list of cost eligible activities we remain available to address them.

Yours truly,



Ian A. Mondrow

c: J. Irving (IGUA)
V. Ginis (EGI)
D. O'Leary (Aird & Berlis LLP)
M. Bell (OEB Staff)

913379471

IGUA: EB-2024-0198	Invoice: 20310666	Invoice: 20331947	Invoice: 20351193	Invoice: 20391264	Invoice: 20440857	Invoice: 20466206	Invoice: 20481139	Invoice:20501751
RRA					2.5	3.5	4.1	1.1
IR-PREP								
IR-REV								
TC-PREP	1.2		0.6					
TC-ATT		1.9	5.6					
TC-FLWUP				0.6				
IL-SUB							2.7	
IL-CONF								
CONF-REQ								
CONF-SUB								
MOT-MAT								
MOT-SUB					2.8		1.5	
MOT-ATT								
RPD							1.1	0.9
IE-PREP								
IE-IRR								
WIT-PREP								
SC-PREP								
SC-ATT								
SP-PREP								
SP-PRES								
SUB								
OH-PREP								
OH-ATT								
O-SUB								
ATT-O-SUB								
DEC								
RO-REV								
RO-SUB								
OTH-ATT								
Total	1.2	1.9	6.2	0.6	5.3	3.5	9.4	2

Appendix A Table of Revised Activities

Original Category	Original Activity	Revised Category	Revised Activity
Review Application and Evidence	Review Application and Evidence	Discovery	Read and Research Application [RRA]
Discovery	Preparation of Interrogatories	Discovery	Preparation of Interrogatories [IR-PREP]
Discovery	Review Interrogatory Responses	Discovery	Review Interrogatory Responses [IR-REV]
Discovery	Technical Conference Preparation	Discovery	Technical Conference Preparation [TC-PREP]
Discovery	Technical Conference Attendance	Discovery	Technical Conference Attendance [TC-ATT]
Discovery	Technical Conference Follow Up	Discovery	Technical Conference Follow-up [TC-FLWUP]
Issues List	Preparation	Procedural	Preparation of Issues List Submission [IL-SUB]
Issues List	Attendance at Issues Conference	Procedural	Attendance at Issues List Conference [IL-CONF]
Confidentiality	Preparation of Application for Confidentiality	Procedural	Preparation for a confidentiality request [CONF-REQ]
Confidentiality	Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality	Procedural	Prepare Submissions on confidentiality [CONF-SUB]
Confidentiality	Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality		Activity removed
Motions	Preparation of Motion(s) Materials	Procedural	Preparation of Motion(s) materials [MOT-MAT]
Motions	Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)	Procedural	Prepare submissions on the Motion(s) [MOT-SUB]
Motions	Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)	Procedural	Attendance at hearing on Motion(s) [MOT-ATT]
		Procedural (New)	Review procedural documents [RPD]
Intervenor Evidence	Preparation	Intervenor Evidence	Preparation of Intervenor Evidence [IE-PREP]
Intervenor Evidence	Interrogatory Responses	Intervenor Evidence	Interrogatory Responses [IE-IRR]
Intervenor Evidence	Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing	Intervenor Evidence	Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing [WIT-PREP]
Settlement/ADR	Preparation	Settlement	Preparation for Settlement Conference [SC-PREP]
Settlement/ADR	Attendance	Settlement	Attendance at Settlement Conference [SC-ATT]
Settlement/ADR	Preparation of Settlement Proposal	Settlement	Preparation of Settlement Proposal [SP-PREP]
Settlement/ADR	Attendance at Presentation to Panel	Settlement	Attendance at Presentation to Panel [SP-PRES]

Original Category	Original Activity	Revised Category	Revised Activity
Submissions	Written Submissions	Written Argument	Written Submissions [SUB]
Oral Hearing	Preparation	Oral Argument	Preparation for Oral Hearing [OH-PREP]
Oral Hearing	Attendance at Oral Hearing	Oral Argument	Attendance at Oral Hearing [OH-ATT]
Submissions	Oral Submissions	Oral Argument	Oral Submissions [O-SUB]
Submissions	Attendance at Oral Submissions	Oral Argument	Attendance at Oral Submissions [ATT-O-SUB]
Decision	Review	Decision	Review Decision [DEC]
Rate Order	Review	Decision	Review Rate/Accounting Order [RO-REV]
Rate Order	Prepare Submission on Rate Order	Decision	Prepare Submission on Rate Order [RO-SUB]
Other Attendance	Other Attendance	Other	Other attendance (e.g., [OTH-ATT]) Intervenor Conferences)
Communication	With Other Parties		Activity removed
Communication	With Client		Activity removed

CASE EB-2024-0198: Rates: Distribution: Enbridge Gas Inc.	COST CLAIM EB-2024-0198 : 1 : Kelly Avalos	INTERVENOR NAME Avalos, Kelly; +1 (416) 862-4405 Kelly.Avalos@ca.gowlingwlg.com	PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS In Progress
FILING PARTICIPANT Mondrow, Ian; +1 (416) 369-4670 ian.mondrow@gowlingwlg.com	NEW PARTICIPANT No	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME
SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE* Legal Counsel	YEAR CALLED TO BAR* 1991	COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF RELEVANT EXPERIENCE* 34	HOURLY RATE 359
HST RATE CHARGED* 13.00	CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST) CV Required	LAST CV DATE	OVERRIDE HOURLY RATE No
HST NUMBER 89659 3323 RT0001	HEARINGS Yes	CONSULTATIONS No	DISBURSEMENTS No

HEARINGS

Hearings Hours 45.50	Hearings Subtotal (\$) 16,334.50	Hearings Total Tax (\$) 2,123.50	Hearings Total (\$) 18,458.00
--------------------------------	--	--	---

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
DISCOVERY						
Read and Research Application and Evidence	13.40	359	4,810.60	13.00	625.38	5,435.98
Preparation of Interrogatories		359		13.00		
Review Interrogatory Responses		359		13.00		
Technical Conference Preparation	3.00	359	1,077.00	13.00	140.01	1,217.01
Technical Conference Attendance	7.50	359	2,692.50	13.00	350.03	3,042.53
Technical Conference Follow-up	1.60	359	574.40	13.00	74.67	649.07
Subtotal of DISCOVERY	25.50		9,154.50		1,190.09	10,344.59
PROCEDURAL						
Preparation of Issues List Submission	2.70	359	969.30	13.00	126.01	1,095.31
Attendance at Issues List Conference		359		13.00		
Preparation for a Confidentiality Request		359		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality		359		13.00		
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		359		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)	4.30	359	1,543.70	13.00	200.68	1,744.38
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		359		13.00		
Review Procedural Documents	5.50	359	1,974.50	13.00	256.69	2,231.19

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Subtotal of PROCEDURAL	12.50		4,487.50		583.38	5,070.88
INTERVENOR EVIDENCE						
Preparation of Intervenor Evidence		359		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		359		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing		359		13.00		
Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE						
Preparation for Settlement Conference		359		13.00		
Attendance at Settlement Conference		359		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		359		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		359		13.00		
Subtotal of SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
WRITTEN ARGUMENT						
Written Submissions	7.50	359	2,692.50	13.00	350.03	3,042.53
Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT	7.50		2,692.50		350.03	3,042.53
ORAL ARGUMENT						
Preparation for Oral Hearing		359		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		359		13.00		
Oral Submissions		359		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		359		13.00		
Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
DECISION						
Review Decision		359		13.00		
Review Rate/Accounting Order		359		13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order		359		13.00		
Subtotal of DECISION	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
OTHER						
Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor Conferences)		359		13.00		
Subtotal of OTHER	0.00		0.00		0.00	0.00
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES						
Total Service Provider Fees	45.50		16,334.50		2,123.50	18,458.00

Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
IGUA_EB-2024-0198_Time Dockets_20251119.pdf	Time Docket	
IGUA_EB-2024-0198_Rollover Decision Cost Claim Letter_20251119.pdf	Cover Letter	
IGUA_EB-2024-0198_Excel Working Spreadsheet_20251119.pdf	Other	An Excel working spreadsheet summarizing by invoice the hours allocated to various activity categories and the totals input into the Board's cost claim template.
IGUA_EB-2024-0198_Table of Revised Activities_20251119.pdf	Other	

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Claim Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
IGUA_EB-2024-0198_Time Dockets_20251119.pdf	Time Docket	Hearings	
IGUA_EB-2024-0198_Rollover Decision Cost Claim Letter_20251119.pdf	Cover Letter	Hearings	
IGUA_EB-2024-0198_Excel Working Spreadsheet_20251119.pdf	Other	Hearings	An Excel working spreadsheet summarizing by invoice the hours allocated to various activity categories and the totals input into the Board's cost claim template.
IGUA_EB-2024-0198_Table of Revised Activities_20251119.pdf	Other	Hearings	