

# EB-2024-0198 : 1 : Swaberene Baksh

COST CLAIM NUMBER  
2915

SUBMISSION DEADLINE DATE  
November 20, 2025

CLAIM STATUS  
Submitted

EB#  
EB-2024-0198: Rates: Distribution: Enbridge Gas  
Inc.

OTHER EB#S

PHASE #\*  
1

INTERVENOR  
Baksh, Swaberene; +1 (416) 863-0711  
sbaksh@willmsshier.com

INTERVENOR COMPANY\*  
Low-Income Energy Network,  
Toronto: Institution

INTERVENOR TYPE  
Qualifying Non-Profit

HST RATE ONTARIO  
13.00

EXCHANGE RATE

COUNTRY

HST NUMBER  
113627988RT0001

LATE SUBMISSION ALLOWED  
No

EXTENSION DEADLINE DATE

## PARTICIPANTS

<b>New</b>	<b>Non-Filing Participant First, Last Name</b>	<b>Filing Participant</b>	<b>Total (\$)</b>	<b>Total Hours</b>	<b>Participant Claim Status</b>
No	,	Baksh, Swaberene; +1 (416) 863-0711 sbaksh@willmsshier.com	8,719.66	30.50	Submitted

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT/OTHER FEES  
7,716.50

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS  
0.00

TOTAL HST  
1,003.16

TOTAL CLAIM  
8,719.66

TOTAL AMOUNT AWARDED

TOTAL HOURS CLAIMED  
30.50

TOTAL HOURS DISALLOWED

REASON FOR  
DISALLOWANCE

REASON FOR  
DISALLOWANCE - 2

REASON FOR  
DISALLOWANCE - 3

MAKE CHEQUE PAYABLE TO  
Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP

SEND PAYMENT TO ADDRESS  
1 Toronto Street  
Suite 900, Toronto  
ON  
M5C 2V6

ATTENTION  
Ali Naraghi

**SUBMIT SECTION**

I am a representative of the Party. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim. The costs incurred and time spent are directly related to the Party's participation in the OEB Process referred to above.

This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in section 6.05 and 6.09 of the OEB's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

The information (fees and disbursements) filed in this cost claim is complete and accurate and in accordance with the OEB's Practice Direction for Cost Awards and Appendix A, the Cost Awards Tariff.

**SUBMITTED BY**  
Swaberene Baksh

**DATE SUBMITTED**  
November 19, 2025

<b>CASE</b> EB-2024-0198: Rates: Distribution: Enbridge Gas Inc.	<b>COST CLAIM</b> EB-2024-0198 : 1 : Swaberene Baksh	<b>INTERVENOR NAME</b> Baksh, Swaberene; +1 (416) 863-0711 sbaksh@willmsshier.com	<b>PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS</b> Submitted
<b>FILING PARTICIPANT</b> Baksh, Swaberene; +1 (416) 863-0711 sbaksh@willmsshier.com	<b>NEW PARTICIPANT</b> No	<b>NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME</b>	<b>NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME</b>
<b>SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE*</b> Legal Counsel	<b>YEAR CALLED TO BAR*</b> 2016	<b>COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF RELEVANT EXPERIENCE*</b> 9	<b>HOURLY RATE</b> 253
<b>HST RATE CHARGED*</b> 13.00	<b>CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST)</b> CV Required	<b>LAST CV DATE</b>	<b>OVERRIDE HOURLY RATE</b> No
<b>HST NUMBER</b> 113627988RT0001	<b>HEARINGS</b> Yes	<b>CONSULTATIONS</b> No	<b>DISBURSEMENTS</b> No

**HEARINGS**

<b>Hearings Hours</b> 30.50	<b>Hearings Subtotal (\$)</b> 7,716.50	<b>Hearings Total Tax (\$)</b> 1,003.16	<b>Hearings Total (\$)</b> 8,719.66
--------------------------------	---	--	--

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
<b>DISCOVERY</b>						
Read and Research Application and Evidence	3.10	253	784.30	13.00	101.96	886.26
Preparation of Interrogatories		253		13.00		
Review Interrogatory Responses		253		13.00		
Technical Conference Preparation	0.30	253	75.90	13.00	9.87	85.77
Technical Conference Attendance		253		13.00		
Technical Conference Follow-up		253		13.00		
<b>Subtotal of DISCOVERY</b>	<b>3.40</b>		<b>860.20</b>		<b>111.83</b>	<b>972.03</b>
<b>PROCEDURAL</b>						
Preparation of Issues List Submission	1.20	253	303.60	13.00	39.47	343.07
Attendance at Issues List Conference		253		13.00		
Preparation for a Confidentiality Request		253		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality		253		13.00		
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		253		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)	0.20	253	50.60	13.00	6.58	57.18
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		253		13.00		
Review Procedural Documents	4.00	253	1,012.00	13.00	131.56	1,143.56

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
<b>Subtotal of PROCEDURAL</b>	<b>5.40</b>		<b>1,366.20</b>		<b>177.61</b>	<b>1,543.81</b>
<b>INTERVENOR EVIDENCE</b>						
Preparation of Intervenor Evidence		253		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		253		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing		253		13.00		
<b>Subtotal of INTERVENOR EVIDENCE</b>	<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>0.00</b>
<b>SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE</b>						
Preparation for Settlement Conference		253		13.00		
Attendance at Settlement Conference		253		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		253		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		253		13.00		
<b>Subtotal of SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE</b>	<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>0.00</b>
<b>WRITTEN ARGUMENT</b>						
Written Submissions	20.30	253	5,135.90	13.00	667.67	5,803.57
<b>Subtotal of WRITTEN ARGUMENT</b>	<b>20.30</b>		<b>5,135.90</b>		<b>667.67</b>	<b>5,803.57</b>
<b>ORAL ARGUMENT</b>						
Preparation for Oral Hearing		253		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		253		13.00		
Oral Submissions		253		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		253		13.00		
<b>Subtotal of ORAL ARGUMENT</b>	<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>0.00</b>
<b>DECISION</b>						
Review Decision	1.40	253	354.20	13.00	46.05	400.25
Review Rate/Accounting Order		253		13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order		253		13.00		
<b>Subtotal of DECISION</b>	<b>1.40</b>		<b>354.20</b>		<b>46.05</b>	<b>400.25</b>
<b>OTHER</b>						
Other Attendance (e.g., Intervenor Conferences)		253		13.00		
<b>Subtotal of OTHER</b>	<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	<b>0.00</b>
<b>TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES</b>						
<b>Total Service Provider Fees</b>	<b>30.50</b>		<b>7,716.50</b>		<b>1,003.16</b>	<b>8,719.66</b>

## Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
LIEN_CostClaim_20251119.pdf	Time Docket and Invoice	

## Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Claim Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
LIEN_CostClaim_20251119.pdf	Time Docket and Invoice	Hearings	

Direct Dial: 416.862.4825  
File: 11089

Sent by RESS Filing

November 19, 2025

Ritchie Murray – Acting Registrar  
Ontario Energy Board  
2300 Yonge Street, 27<sup>th</sup> Floor  
Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

Dear Mr. Murray:

**Re: Board File No. EB-2024-0198 – Enbridge Gas Inc. 2026 DSM Application  
Cost Claim of the Low-Income Energy Network**

---

Please find attached the cost claim of the Low-Income Energy Network (“LIEN”) for LIEN’s intervention in EB-2024-0198 regarding Enbridge Gas Inc.’s 2026 DSM Application.

Yours truly,



Matt Gardner  
Partner  
*Certified as a Specialist in Environmental  
by the Law Society of Ontario*

cc: LIEN Legal Subcommittee  
Judy Simon

Encl.

1413-4544-0538, v. 1

Low Income Energy Network  
c/o Advocacy Centre for Tenants Ontario (ACTO)  
1500 - 55 University Ave  
Toronto, ON M5J 2H7  
Attention: Zeenat Bhanji

Date: November 19, 2025  
File #: 11089  
Invoice #: -draft-

**Re: LIEN – EB-2024-0198 re Enbridge Gas Inc. – 2026-2030 – Demand Management (DSM) Plan**

---

## INVOICE SUMMARY

(As Per Attached Details)

Fees	\$9,994.40
<b>Total Fees &amp; Disbursements</b>	<b>\$9,994.40</b>
GST/HST	\$1,299.27
<b>Total</b>	<b>\$11,293.67</b>
<b>Balance Due</b>	<b>\$11,293.67</b>

**All amounts due are in CANADIAN funds.**

Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP

Matthew Gardner

Please make cheque payable to:  
**Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP**

Payment accepted by VISA, Mastercard or Discovery accept. Contact Accounting at 416.862.4824.

In accordance with the Solicitor's Act, interest will be charged on any unpaid balance commencing one month after delivery at the following rate: 0.80%

GST/HST#: 113627988RT0001

INVOICE

Low Income Energy Network  
c/o Advocacy Centre for Tenants Ontario (ACTO)  
1500 - 55 University Ave  
Toronto, ON M5J 2H7  
Attention: Zeenat Bhanji

Date: November 19, 2025  
File #: 11089  
Invoice #: -draft-

**Re: LIEN – EB-2024-0198 re Enbridge Gas Inc. – 2026-2030 – Demand Management (DSM) Plan**

<b>Fees Date</b>	<b>Explanation</b>	<b>Lawyer</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Amount</b>
2024-12-23	review documents shared by Low Income Energy network (LIEN) including the Enbridge Gas Notice of Application to the Ontario Energy Board dated November 29, 2024;	AN	0.40	92.00
2025-01-06	consider next steps in response to Enbridge's 2026-2030 DSM Plan application;	MG	0.40	116.00
2025-01-09	prepare intervenor request submission for EB-2024-0198;	MG	0.40	116.00
2025-01-15	emails with LIEN legal subcommittee obtaining instructions to intervene and with comments on intervention request form language and finalize intervention request form; emails with D. Stevens and D. O'Leary about providing copy of LIEN intervention request to Enbridge;	MG	0.60	174.00
2025-01-21	receipt and review of Enbridge's letter responding to intervenor requests for status including Enbridge's proposal that LIEN and VECC combine interventions; emails with J. Simon re same;	MG	0.40	116.00
2025-01-22	emails with S. Grice about Enbridge's letter responding to intervenor requests for status including Enbridge's proposal that LIEN and VECC combine interventions; phone call with S. Grice re same; phone call with S. Grice about Enbridge's letter proposing LIEN and VECC combine interventions and reasons why this creates a conflict of interest due to differing mandates and membership and points to include in letters to the OEB and Enbridge; consider points to include in our letter to the OEB and Enbridge;	MG	0.60	174.00
2025-01-27	revise our draft letter to OEB opposing Enbridge's request to combine LIEN and VECC interventions and send to S. Grice for comment;	MG	0.40	116.00
2025-01-29	receipt and review of VECC's letter in response to EGI's letter pressing for LIEN and VECC combined interventions and send to LIEN legal subcommittee;	MG	0.20	58.00

2025-03-04	review OEB's Procedural Order 1 and consider timing for next procedural steps including comments on Draft Issues List and reporting to LIEN legal subcommittee; emails with J. Simon about Draft Issues List and comments; emails with T. McClenaghan copying LIEN legal subcommittee members about Draft Issues List and tracking coordination with VECC;	MG	0.40	116.00
2025-03-06	revise and send LIEN's draft comments on Draft Issues List to LIEN legal subcommittee and to S. Grice (VECC consultant) for comments/coordination;	MG	0.40	116.00
2025-03-07	receipt and review of VECC's proposed comments on Draft Issues List from S. Grice; discuss same with J. Simon; revise joint letter with LIEN and VECC comments on Draft Issues List and send to LIEN legal subcommittee; send to S. Grice; emails from T. McClenaghan and Z. Bhanji with instructions; instruct filing;	MG	1.00	290.00
2025-03-07	draft and send an email to the OEB and other intervenors attaching LIEN and VECC submissions re the Issues List; forward the communication to LIEN clients;	AN	0.20	46.00
2025-03-13	review the OEB and EGI reply submissions to the Interveners' comments relating to the issues list;	AN	1.00	230.00
2025-03-20	receipt and review of Enbridge's letter requesting holding application in abeyance due to federal carbon pricing and emails with J. Simon about pausing preparation of interrogatories until early next week in case OEB decides in favour of Enbridge's request and updated evidence must be filed; send update to LIEN legal subcommittee;	MG	0.60	174.00
2025-04-10	review the Procedural Order 2 issued by the OEB in relation to EB-2024-0198;	AN	0.60	138.00
2025-04-17	receipt and review of the OEB's Natural Gas Achievable Potential Study Report and supporting model outputs; forward the reports to LIEN Team;	AN	0.50	115.00
2025-05-02	receipt and review of the status update letter from Enbridge Gas Inc. to the OEB relating to the abeyance of EB-2024-0198;	AN	0.20	46.00
2025-05-12	review comments by Pollution probe responding to EGIs May 2, 2025 letter to the OEB requesting a one year roll-over of the DSM plan in light of delays;	AN	0.40	92.00
2025-06-20	receipt and review of an email from Enbridge Gas (EGI) addressed to the OEB attaching EGI's Application and Pre-Filed evidence re OEB File No. EB-2024-0198, 2026 DSM Plan	AN	0.50	126.50
2025-06-23	draft and send an email LIEN client's attaching EGI's revised application and evidence filed with OEB on June 20, 2025 for EB-2024-0198;	AN	0.10	25.30
2025-07-03	receipt and review of the OEB's Procedural Order 4 (PO4); draft and send an email to clients with a summary of PO4;	AN	1.10	278.30

2025-07-09	review latest correspondence from EGI including EGI's pre filed evidence, forward to clients;	AN	0.70	177.10
2025-07-10	receipt and review of an email from M. Bell of the OEB re proposed new dates for the technical conference; communicate with J. Simon about her availability on proposed dates;	AN	0.20	50.60
2025-07-14	review EGI's pre filed evidence dated July 9, 2025;	AN	2.10	531.30
2025-07-17	email S. Grice about coordination in advance of technical conference; attend Teams meeting with Z. Bhanji, T. McClenaghan, J. Simon and A. Naraghi to discuss plan and questions for technical conference and coordination with VECC and ED/GEC;	MG	1.00	303.00
2025-07-18	review OEB's Procedural Order 5 dated July 18, 2025;	AN	0.50	126.50
2025-07-21	phone call with K. Elson and A. Naraghi re scope of questions for technical conference and to avoid duplication;	MG	0.30	90.90
2025-07-21	receipt and review of emails from J. Simon re coordination of submissions with VECC; attend a phone call with S. Grice of VECC to discuss same;	AN	0.40	101.20
2025-07-22	attend Teams meeting with J. Simon, S. Grice and A. Naraghi to prepare/revise questions and prepare for technical conference;	MG	0.80	242.40
2025-07-24	attend a phone call with with J. Simon to debrief about the Technical Conference and possible coordination with VECC for written arguments;	AN	0.30	75.90
2025-08-07	coordinate and schedule a call with LIEN and VECC on August 13, 2025;	AN	0.20	50.60
2025-08-11	commence review of EGI's responses to undertakings by the intervenors received on August 8, 2025;	AN	1.70	430.10
2025-08-13	attend a MS Teams meeting with J. Simon, S. Grice and M. Gardner to discuss and strategize about LIEN's and VECC's joint written submissions in support of EGI's 2026 Roll Over DSM Application;	AN	1.20	303.60
2025-08-14	review EGI's pre filed evidence and EGI's responses to undertakings and commence; commence drafting LIEN's and VECC's joint submissions;	AN	5.50	1,391.50
2025-08-18	receipt and review of Procedural Order # 6 from the OEB noting the revised submission deadline of September 3, 2025; continue reviewing the transcript of the July 24, 2025 Technical Conference and EGI's responses to undertakings and continue drafting LIEN and VECC's joint submissions;	AN	3.60	910.80
2025-08-19	receipt and review of emails from Enbridge Gas Inc. (EGI); continue reviewing the evidence, transcript of the July 24, 2025 Technical Conference and EGI's responses to undertakings; continue drafting LIEN and VECC's joint submissions re EGI's 2026 DSM Application;	AN	4.70	1,189.10

2025-08-21	revise LIEN's draft submission about Enbridge's DSM Plan rollover application;	MG	0.50	151.50
2025-08-26	receipt and review of an email from J. Sheppard attaching the School Energy Coalition's (SEC) draft submissions; receipt and review of an email from J. Simon suggesting revisions to LIEN and VECC's joint submissions to support SEC's re supporting SEC's recommendation that the OEB increase the TRC Plus Test adder from 15% to 65% from 15%;	AN	0.70	177.10
2025-08-28	make further revisions to the draft joint submissions by LIEN and VECC; consult with J. Sheppard, of SEC about SEC's methodology in calculating the recommended TRC Plus adder value of 65%; receipt and a response email from J. Sheppard; make further revisions to the joint submissions and consult with S. Grice and J. Simon; send revised draft joint submissions to LIEN Legal Subcommittee for review and comment by September 2, 2025;	AN	2.10	531.30
2025-09-03	finalize and submit via email to the OEB, joint submissions by the Low-Income Energy Network and the Vulnerable Energy Consumers Coalition on Enbridge Gas Inc.'s 2026 DSM Plan Rollover Application;	AN	0.20	50.60
2025-11-06	receipt and review of the OEB's Decision and Order re EGI's Rollover Application;	AN	1.40	354.20
<b>Total Fees</b>			<b>38.50</b>	<b>\$9,994.40</b>

**TIME SUMMARY**

	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Rate</b>	<b>Amount</b>
Matthew Gardner	5.40	290.00	1,566.00
Matthew Gardner	2.60	303.00	787.80
Ali Naraghi	3.30	230.00	759.00
Ali Naraghi	<u>27.20</u>	253.00	<u>6,881.60</u>
	<b>38.50</b>		<b>9,994.40</b>

Total GST/HST on Fees \$1,299.27

Total Fees & Disbursements	\$9,994.40
GST/HST	<u>\$1,299.27</u>
<b>Total</b>	<b>\$11,293.67</b>
<b>Balance Due</b>	<b><u>\$11,293.67</u></b>

**All amounts due are in CANADIAN funds.**

**Fee Listing**  
**Willms and Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP**  
**All Dates**

Client File Date Entry	Description Info Explanation	Inv	Earnr	Task	Worked	Billable	Resp Amount
<b>1052</b> <b>11089</b>	<b>Low Income Energy Network</b> <b>Re: LIEN – EB-2024-0198 re Enbridge Gas Inc. – 2026-2030 – Demand Management (DSM) Plan</b>						<b>MG</b>
2024-12-23 651935	FEE: AN 0.40 Hrs @ 230.00 review documents shared by Low Income Energy network (LIEN) including the Enbridge Gas Notice of Application to the Ontario Energy Board dated November 29, 2024;	REQ	AN	bw	0.40	0.40	92.00
2025-01-06 587006	FEE: MG 0.40 Hrs @ 290.00 consider next steps in response to Enbridge's 2026-2030 DSM Plan application;	REQ	MG	bw	0.40	0.40	116.00
2025-01-09 587271	FEE: MG 0.40 Hrs @ 290.00 prepare intervenor request submission for EB-2024-0198;	REQ	MG	bw	0.40	0.40	116.00
2025-01-15 588851	FEE: MG 0.60 Hrs @ 290.00 emails with LIEN legal subcommittee obtaining instructions to intervene and with comments on intervention request form language and finalize intervention request form; emails with D. Stevens and D. O'Leary about providing copy of LIEN intervention request to Enbridge;	REQ	MG	bw	0.60	0.60	174.00
2025-01-21 589766	FEE: MG 0.40 Hrs @ 290.00 receipt and review of Enbridge's letter responding to intervenor requests for status including Enbridge's proposal that LIEN and VECC combine interventions; emails with J. Simon re same;	REQ	MG	bw	0.40	0.40	116.00
2025-01-22 590085	FEE: MG 0.60 Hrs @ 290.00 emails with S. Grice about Enbridge's letter responding to intervenor requests for status including Enbridge's proposal that LIEN and VECC combine interventions; phone call with S. Grice re same; phone call with S. Grice about Enbridge's letter proposing LIEN and VECC combine interventions and reasons why this creates a conflict of interest due to differing mandates and membership and points to include in letters to the OEB and Enbridge; consider points to include in our letter to the OEB and Enbridge;	REQ	MG	bw	0.60	0.60	174.00
2025-01-27 591016	FEE: MG 0.40 Hrs @ 290.00 revise our draft letter to OEB opposing Enbridge's request to combine LIEN and VECC interventions and send to S. Grice for comment;	REQ	MG	bw	0.40	0.40	116.00
2025-01-29 591346	FEE: MG 0.20 Hrs @ 290.00 receipt and review of VECC's letter in response to EGI's letter pressing for LIEN and VECC combined interventions and send to LIEN legal subcommittee;	REQ	MG	bw	0.20	0.20	58.00
2025-03-04 598974	FEE: MG 0.40 Hrs @ 290.00 review OEB's Procedural Order 1 and consider timing for next procedural steps including comments on Draft Issues List and reporting to LIEN legal subcommittee; emails with J. Simon about Draft Issues List and comments; emails with T. McClenaghan copying LIEN legal subcommittee members about Draft Issues List and tracking coordination with VECC;	REQ	MG	bw	0.40	0.40	116.00
2025-03-06 599512	FEE: MG 0.40 Hrs @ 290.00 revise and send LIEN's draft comments on Draft Issues List to LIEN legal subcommittee and to S. Grice (VECC consultant) for comments/coordination;	REQ	MG	bw	0.40	0.40	116.00
2025-03-07 599585	FEE: MG 1.00 Hrs @ 290.00 receipt and review of VECC's proposed comments on Draft Issues List from S. Grice; discuss same with J. Simon; revise joint letter with LIEN and VECC comments on Draft Issues List and send to LIEN legal subcommittee; send to S. Grice; emails from T. McClenaghan and Z. Bhanji with instructions; instruct filing;	REQ	MG	bw	1.00	1.00	290.00
2025-03-07 603173	FEE: AN 0.20 Hrs @ 230.00 draft and send an email to the OEB and other intervenors attaching LIEN and VECC submissions re the Issues List; forward the communication to LIEN clients;	REQ	AN	bw	0.20	0.20	46.00
2025-03-13 602314	FEE: AN 1.00 Hrs @ 230.00 review the OEB and EGI reply submissions to the Interveners' comments relating to the issues list;	REQ	AN	bw	1.00	1.00	230.00
2025-03-20 602214	FEE: MG 0.60 Hrs @ 290.00 receipt and review of Enbridge's letter requesting holding application in abeyance due to federal carbon pricing and emails with J. Simon about pausing preparation of interrogatories until early next week in case OEB decides in favour of Enbridge's request and updated evidence must be filed; send update to LIEN legal subcommittee;	REQ	MG	bw	0.60	0.60	174.00
2025-04-10 608070	FEE: AN 0.60 Hrs @ 230.00 review the Procedural Order 2 issued by the OEB in relation to EB-2024-0198;	REQ	AN	bw	0.60	0.60	138.00
2025-04-17 609207	FEE: AN 0.50 Hrs @ 230.00 receipt and review of the OEB's Natural Gas Achievable Potential Study Report and supporting model outputs; forward the reports to LIEN Team;	REQ	AN	bw	0.50	0.50	115.00
2025-05-02 614607	FEE: AN 0.20 Hrs @ 230.00 receipt and review of the status update letter from Enbridge Gas Inc. to the OEB relating to the abeyance of EB-2024-0198;	REQ	AN	bw	0.20	0.20	46.00
2025-05-12 616210	FEE: AN 0.40 Hrs @ 230.00 review comments by Pollution probe responding to EGIs May 2, 2025 letter to the OEB requesting a one year roll-over of the DSM plan in light of delays;	REQ	AN	bw	0.40	0.40	92.00
2025-06-20 651897	FEE: AN 0.50 Hrs @ 253.00 receipt and review of an email from Enbridge Gas (EGI) addressed to the OEB attaching EGI's Application and Pre-Filed evidence re OEB File No. EB-2024-0198, 2026 DSM Plan	REQ	AN	bw	0.50	0.50	126.50

		Fee Listing Willms and Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP All Dates					2025-11-19
Client File Entry	Description Info Explanation	Inv	Earnar	Task	Worked	Billable	Resp Amount
2025-06-23 651901	FEE: AN 0.10 Hrs @ 253.00 draft and send an email LIEN client's attaching EGI's revised application and evidence filed with OEB on June 20, 2025 for EB-2024-0198;	REQ	AN	bw	0.10	0.10	25.30
2025-07-03 651903	FEE: AN 1.10 Hrs @ 253.00 receipt and review of the OEB's Procedural Order 4 (PO4); draft and send an email to clients with a summary of PO4;	REQ	AN	bw	1.10	1.10	278.30
2025-07-09 651905	FEE: AN 0.70 Hrs @ 253.00 review latest correspondence from EGI including EGI's pre filed evidence, forward to clients;	REQ	AN	bw	0.70	0.70	177.10
2025-07-10 651906	FEE: AN 0.20 Hrs @ 253.00 receipt and review of an email from M. Bell of the OEB re proposed new dates for the technical conference; communicate with J. Simon about her availability on proposed dates;	REQ	AN	bw	0.20	0.20	50.60
2025-07-14 652628	FEE: AN 2.10 Hrs @ 253.00 review EGI's pre filed evidence dated July 9, 2025;	REQ	AN	bw	2.10	2.10	531.30
2025-07-17 651917	FEE: MG 1.00 Hrs @ 303.00 email S. Grice about coordination in advance of technical conference; attend Teams meeting with Z. Bhanji, T. McClenaghan, J. Simon and A. Naraghi to discuss plan and questions for technical conference and coordination with VECC and ED/GEC;	REQ	MG	bw	1.00	1.00	303.00
2025-07-18 651925	FEE: AN 0.50 Hrs @ 253.00 review OEB's Procedural Order 5 dated July 18, 2025;	REQ	AN	bw	0.50	0.50	126.50
2025-07-21 651926	FEE: MG 0.30 Hrs @ 303.00 phone call with K. Elson and A. Naraghi re scope of questions for technical conference and to avoid duplication;	REQ	MG	bw	0.30	0.30	90.90
2025-07-21 651955	FEE: AN 0.40 Hrs @ 253.00 receipt and review of emails from J. Simon re co-ordination of submissions with VECC; attend a phone call with S. Grice of VECC to discuss same;	REQ	AN	bw	0.40	0.40	101.20
2025-07-22 651918	FEE: MG 0.80 Hrs @ 303.00 attend Teams meeting with J. Simon, S. Grice and A. Naraghi to prepare/revise questions and prepare for technical conference;	REQ	MG	bw	0.80	0.80	242.40
2025-07-24 651952	FEE: AN 0.30 Hrs @ 253.00 attend a phone call with with J. Simon to debrief about the Technical Conference and possible coordination with VECC for written arguments;	REQ	AN	bw	0.30	0.30	75.90
2025-08-07 651951	FEE: AN 0.20 Hrs @ 253.00 coordinate and schedule a call with LIEN and VECC on August 13, 2025;	REQ	AN	bw	0.20	0.20	50.60
2025-08-11 651959	FEE: AN 1.70 Hrs @ 253.00 commence review of EGI's responses to undertakings by the intervenors received on August 8, 2025;	REQ	AN	bw	1.70	1.70	430.10
2025-08-13 651960	FEE: AN 1.20 Hrs @ 253.00 attend a MS Teams meeting with J. Simon, S. Grice and M. Gardner to discuss and strategize about LIEN's and VECC's joint written submissions in support of EGI's 2026 Roll Over DSM Application;	REQ	AN	bw	1.20	1.20	303.60
2025-08-14 651948	FEE: AN 5.50 Hrs @ 253.00 review EGI's pre filed evidence and EGI's responses to undertakings and commence; commence drafting LIEN's and VECC's joint submissions;	REQ	AN	bw	5.50	5.50	1,391.50
2025-08-18 651947	FEE: AN 3.60 Hrs @ 253.00 receipt and review of Procedural Order # 6 from the OEB noting the revised submission deadline of September 3, 2025; continue reviewing the transcript of the July 24, 2025 Technical Conference and EGI's responses to undertakings and continue drafting LIEN and VECC's joint submissions;	REQ	AN	bw	3.60	3.60	910.80
2025-08-19 651944	FEE: AN 4.70 Hrs @ 253.00 receipt and review of emails from Enbridge Gas Inc. (EGI); continue reviewing the evidence, transcript of the July 24, 2025 Technical Conference and EGI's responses to undertakings; continue drafting LIEN and VECC's joint submissions re EGI's 2026 DSM Application;	REQ	AN	bw	4.70	4.70	1,189.10
2025-08-21 651919	FEE: MG 0.50 Hrs @ 303.00 revise LIEN's draft submission about Enbridge's DSM Plan rollover application;	REQ	MG	bw	0.50	0.50	151.50
2025-08-26 651921	FEE: AN 0.70 Hrs @ 253.00 receipt and review of an email from J. Sheppard attaching the School Energy Coalition's (SEC) draft submissions; receipt and review of an email from J. Simon suggesting revisions to LIEN and VECC's join submissions to support SEC's re supporting SEC's recommendation that the OEB increase the TRC Plus Test adder from 15% to 65% from 15%;	REQ	AN	bw	0.70	0.70	177.10
2025-08-28 651920	FEE: AN 2.10 Hrs @ 253.00 make further revisions to the draft joint submissions by LIEN and VECC; consult with J. Sheppard, of SEC about SEC's methodology in calculating the recommended TRC Plus adder value of 65%; receipt and a response email from J. Sheppard; make further revisions to the joint submissions and consult with S. Grice and J. Simon; send revised draft joint submissions to LIEN Legal Subcommittee for review and comment by September 2, 2025;	REQ	AN	bw	2.10	2.10	531.30
2025-09-03 652617	FEE: AN 0.20 Hrs @ 253.00 finalize and submit via email to the OEB, joint submissions by the Low-Income Energy Network and the Vulnerable Energy Consumers Coalition on Enbridge Gas Inc.'s 2026 DSM Plan Rollover Application;	REQ	AN	bw	0.20	0.20	50.60

Client File Date Entry	Description Info Explanation	Inv	Earner	Task	Worked	Billable	Resp Amount					
2025-11-06 651928	FEE: AN 1.40 Hrs @ 253.00 receipt and review of the OEB's Decision and Order re EGI's Rollover Application;	REQ	AN	bw	1.40	1.40	354.20					
		Unbld Hrs	Unbld Amt	Bld Hrs	Bld Amt	38.50	9,994.40					
		38.50	9,994.40	0.00	0.00	38.50	9,994.40					
<b>Summary by Fee Earner</b>												
Earner	Unbld	%	Amount	%	Bld	%	Amount	%	Total	%	Amount	%
AN	30.50	79.22	7,640.60	76.45					30.50	79.22	7,640.60	76.45
MG	8.00	20.78	2,353.80	23.55					8.00	20.78	2,353.80	23.55
<b>Total</b>	<b>38.50</b>	<b>100.00 %</b>	<b>\$9,994.40</b>	<b>100.00 %</b>	<b>0.00</b>	<b>100.00 %</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>100.00 %</b>	<b>38.50</b>	<b>100.00 %</b>	<b>\$9,994.40</b>	<b>100.00 %</b>
<b>Summary by Responsible</b>												
Resp	Unbld	%	Amount	%	Bld	%	Amount	%	Total	%	Amount	%
MG	38.50	100.00	9,994.40	100.00					38.50	100.00	9,994.40	100.00
<b>Total</b>	<b>38.50</b>	<b>100.00 %</b>	<b>\$9,994.40</b>	<b>100.00 %</b>	<b>0.00</b>	<b>100.00 %</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>100.00 %</b>	<b>38.50</b>	<b>100.00 %</b>	<b>\$9,994.40</b>	<b>100.00 %</b>

Report Selections:

- Completed : November 19, 2025 12:30 PM; ver: 1.9.119
- Requested By : Liba Kocian
- File : 11089 - Re: LIEN – EB-2024-0198 re Enbridge Gas Inc. – 2026-2030 – Demand Management (DSM) Plan
- Include Billed/Unbilled : Unbilled
- AssumeBillCorrectionAsAdjustment : true
- Pmt Type : Cash, Che, eChe, Drft, Cert, EFT, Wire, Chrg, CC, DC, Int, NSF, Err, Ord, Void, Oth
- Entry Type : Billable Fees, Non-Billable Fees
- FileTypesWanted : With Numbers or Entries