

EGI 2026-2030 DSM Plan
 EB-2024-0198
 J. Simon on behalf of LIEN

Tasks	Date	Hours	Fees
OEB Staff Pre-Application Meeting - EGI 2026-2030 DSM Plan			330/hr
Attend meeting	27-Jun-25	6.87	
Prepare and send meeting notes to Counsel	28-Jun-25	1.2	
Issues List			
Review draft Issues List and provide initial questions to Counsel	4-Mar-25	0.5	
Develop and provide suggested strategy for VECC collaboration to Counsel	4-Mar-25	0.5	
Review VECC comments on proposed joint filing on Issues List	7-Mar-25	0.25	
Review intervenor filed comments on draft Issues List	9-Mar-25	0.5	
Review responses to intervenor comments on draft Issues List	13-Mar-25	0.5	
Review OEB Decision on Issues List and Procedural Order No.2	10-Apr-25	0.25	
Interrogatories			
Begin to review Enbridge application	8-Mar-25	1.5	
Review Natural Gas DSM SAG Report to OEB (November 11, 2024)	8-Mar-25	2	
Continue reviewing EGI application	10-Mar-25	3	
Continue reviewing EGI application and begin to identify potential IR topics, issues	12-Mar-25	1	
Continue reviewing EGI application and identify potential IR topics, issues	13-Mar-25	1	
Continue reviewing EGI application and identify potential IR topics, issues	15-Mar-25	2.5	
Begin to prepare draft IRs	16-Mar-25	2	
Continue preparing draft IRs	17-Mar-25	1.5	
Continue preparing draft IRs	19-Mar-25	1	
Total hours		26.07	\$ 8,603.10
Total fees (excluding HST)			\$8,603.10
HST			\$1,118.40
Total fees (including HST)			\$9,721.50

EB-2024-0198

Enbridge Gas 2026 DSM Plan

Judy Simon, on behalf of LIEN

Tasks	Date	Hours	Fees
EGI 2026 DSM Plan			\$359/hr
Review EGI pre-filed evidence			
Review pre-filed evidence and related letters	12-Jul-25	3	
Complete review of EGI pre-filed evidence	13-Jul-25	1	
Technical Conference			
Draft questions for Technical Conference	16-Jul-25	2.75	
Client and Counsel meeting to discuss Technical Conference approach and questions	17-Jul-25	1	
Meeting with VECC and with LIEN Counsel to finalize questions for Technical Conference	22-Jul-25	0.5	
Draft final questions for Technical Conference	22-Jul-25	1	
Attend Technical Conference (Ask questions on behalf of LIEN and VECC)	24-Jul-25	7	
Prepare briefing on and discuss with Counsel on Technical Conference	24-Jul-25	1.2	
Review Technical Conference Transcript	4-Aug-25	4.1	
Review Undertaking responses and prepare strategy	10-Aug-25	2.25	
Prepare submission			
Develop draft approach for submission for discussion with Counsel and list of submission components	11-Aug-25	1.75	
Attend meeting with LIEN Counsel and VECC to develop submission strategy/content	13-Aug-25	1	
Review update to undertaking responses, assess implications for submission, discuss with Counsel	14-Aug-25	1	
Review and provide tracked edits on Counsel draft submission	25-Aug-25	2.5	
Review and provide comment on proposed edits from VECC and Counsel on draft submissionv2	28-Aug-25	1	
Total Hours		31.05	\$ 11,146.95
Total Fees			
Total Fees (excluding HST)			\$ 11,146.95

HST	\$	1,449.10
Total Fees (including HST)	\$	12,596.05
Aggregate Total (2026-2030 DSM Plan + 2026 DSM Plan)		
Total Fees (2026-2030 DSM Plan + 2026 DSM Plan)	\$	19,750.05
Total HST (2026-2030 DSM Plan +2026 DSM Plan)	\$	2,567.50
Total Fees (2026-2030 DSM Plan + 2026 DSM Plan) including HST	\$	22,317.55