IN THE MATTER OF the *Ontario Energy Board Act*, 1998, S.O. 1998, c. 15, Schedule B;

AND IN THE MATTER OF an Application by Ontario Power Generation Inc. pursuant to section 78.1 of the *Ontario Energy Board Act, 1998* for an Order or Orders determining payment amounts for the output of certain of its generating facilities.

SUPPLEMENTAL COST CLAIM OF

CANADIAN MANUFACTURERS & EXPORTERS ("CME")

November 25, 2008

Peter C. P. Thompson, Q.C.

Borden Ladner Gervais LLP 100 Queen Street Suite 1100 Ottawa, ON K1P 1J9

Telephone (613) 237-5160 Facsimile (613) 230-8842 Counsel for CME

TABLE OF CONTENTS

Description	<u>Tab Nos.</u>
Form 3 – Affidavit in Support of Cost Claim	1
Cost Claim of Peter C.P. Thompson	2
Form 1 – Summary of Statement of Hours	
Form 2 – Summary of Disbursements	
Cost Claim of Vincent J. DeRose	3
Form 1 – Summary of Statement of Hours	

.

OTT01\3598724\1

AFFIDAVIT IN SUPPORT OF COST CLAIM

Board File No.:	EB	-2007-0905				
Party Name / Intervenor:	e / Intervenor: Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters ("CME")					
Items Claimed excluding G	ST:					
Legal / Consultant Fees	+	Disbursements	=	Net Sub-Total		
\$ 8,846.00		\$ 190.53	=	\$ 9,036.53		
(Peter C.P. Thompson) (Vincent J. DeRose)		(Peter C.P. Thompson)				
	ing GST ng GST a Total G	at 5%)		Profit (Claiming GST at 2.5%) aiming no GST) \$ 451.82		
GST Registration No. 8690969	74 (BLG)					
Total of Cost Claim:						
Net Sub-Total	+	Total GST Claimed	=	Total Cost Claim		
\$ 9,036.53		\$ 451.82	=	\$ 9,488.35		
I, Peter C.P. Thompson, of th	e City of	^f Ottawa, in the Provinc	e of Ontario, M	AKE OATH AND SAY:		
 I am a representative of matters attested to here 		ve-noted party (the "pa	rty") and as suc	ch have knowledge of the		
2. I have examined the ab	ove Cos	t Claim, and all of the d	ocumentation i	n support of it.		
				essarily by the party for the le number of which is set out		
SWORN BEFORE ME at the C 2008.	ity of Ott	awa, in the Province of	Ontario on the	25th day of November,		
COMMISSIONER for taking Affice	davits, etc	 C.	Peter C.P	100000		

COMPLEMOND Jennings, a Commissioner, etc., reconnected Ontario, for Borden Ladner, second calle, Barristers and Solicitors. Scond Jenuary (1), 2009.

Norma Jean Jennings, a Commissioner, etc., Province of Ontario, for Borden Ladner, Gervais LLP, Barristers and Solicitors. Expires January 31, 2009

SUMMARY STATEMENT OF HOURS - CONSULTANT AND LEGAL COUNSEL

EB-2007-0905 Board File No.			Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters ("CME") Party Name / Intervenor				
Peter C.P. Thompson Legal Counsel Name	1967 Year of (Call		Borden L Law Firm	adner Gerva	ais LLP	
N/A Consultant Name		N/A Years of Relevant Experience (curriculum vitae must be attached)			N/A Consultant Firm		
		Hours	Hourly Rate	Sub-Total	GST	Total	
Preparation	(Prep)	25.9	\$330.00	8,547.00	427.35	8,974.35	
Attendance Technical Conference	e (Attend TC)	0.0	\$330.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	
Attendance Settlement Conference	e (Attend SC)	0.0	\$330.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	
Attendance Oral Hearing	(Attend OH)	0.00	\$330.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	
Argument	(Argument)	0.0	\$330.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	
Case Management	(CM)	0.0	\$330.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	
TOTALS:		25.9		\$8,547.00	\$ 427.35	\$8,974.35	

A separate form is required for each consultant or legal counsel

Note: All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate: _____; and country of initial currency: _____;

	DETAILED STATEMENT OF HOURS - Peter C.P. Thompson						
Date	Description of Services	Time	Allocation				
28-Oct-08	Considering and responding to e-mail from Mr. Warren	0.2	Prep				
28-Oct-08	Considering implications of OEB's October 15 letter re: RPP price changes for pending OPG Decision; e-mail to Mr. Clipsham	0.8	Prep				
30-Oct-08	Considering OEB's "lock-up" letter and e-mail to Mr. Clipsham	0.2	Prep				
30-Oct-08	Considering e-mail from Mr. Clipsham	0.1	Prep				
31-Oct-08	Considering e-mail from Mr. Clipsham	0.1	Prep				
03-Nov-08	Conducting preliminary review of OEB Decision and e-mail to Mr. Clipsham and Mr. Humphries	1.5	Prep				
04-Nov-08	Conducting detailed review of OEB Decision; drafting and finalizing preliminary report to CME	3.8	Prep				
05-Nov-08	E-mail to Mr. Clipsham re: percentage impacts	0.3	Prep				
05-Nov-08	Telephone call from Mr. Humphries re: bills to electricity consumers	0.2	Prep				
05 -N ov-08	Telephone call to Mr. Battista of OEB	0.2	Prep				
05-Nov-08	E-mail to Ms Reuber of OPG	0.2	Prep				
11-Nov-08	Considering e-mail from Ms Reuber of OPG; e-mail to Mr. Clipsham; e-mail to Ms Reuber re: possible briefing meeting between OPG and CME	0.2	Prep				
11-Nov-08	Reviewing notes from Mr. Adams and Mr. Murphy of AMPCO re: impacts of OPG Decision	0.2	Prep				
13-Nov-08	Reviewing payment amounts in OPG Order, plus rate riders and their percentage increase impacts	1.5	Prep				
14-Nov-08	Reviewing Draft Rate Order	2.5	Prep				
14-Nov-08	Telephone call to Mr. Adams of AMPCO	0.2	Prep				
14-Nov-08	Considering and responding to e-mails from Mr. Adams re: Draft Rate Order	0.5	Prep				
14-Nov-08	Telephone call to Mr. Barrett (voicemail)	0.1	Prep				
14-Nov-08	Considering and responding to Mr. Barrett's e-mail	0.1	Prep				
17 - Nov-08	Considering specific provisions of Draft Rate Order and Appendices; considering and drafting propose amendments to Rate Order; letter to OPG	4.8	Prep				
17-Nov-08	Reviewing and finalizing letter to Mr. Barrett of OPG; reviewing and finalizing proposed amendments to Draft Rate Order	2.5	Prep				
17-Nov-08	E-mail to Mr. Barrett, Board Secretary, Board Staff and interested parties	0.2	Prep				
18-Nov-08	Considering e-mail from OPG re: conference call	0.1	Prep				
19-Nov-08	Preparation for conference call	0.2	Prep				

			6
19-Nov-08	Conference call with OPG representatives, along with AMPCO and OEB representatives	1.0	Prep
19-Nov-08	E-mail to Mr. Barrett; considering his response; dictating, reviewing and finalizing letter to OEB re: OPG's Draft Rate Order	2.9	Prep
19-Nov-08	Considering e-mail from Mr. Adams	0.1	Prep
20-Nov-08	Telephone call from Ms Girvan	0.1	Prep
20-Nov-08	Finalizing letter of comments to OEB on OPG's Draft Rate Order	0.5	Prep
20-Nov-08	Considering IESO comments on OPG's Draft Rate Order	0.3	Prep
20-Nov-08	Considering AMPCO comments on OPG's Draft Rate Order	0.1	Prep
20-Nov-08	Considering SEC and VECC letters to OEB	0.1	Prep
20-Nov-08	Considering OPG's revised Appendix F	0.1	Prep

TOTAL HOURS:

25.9

SUMMARY OF DISBURSEMENTS

Board File No.: EB-2007-0905						
Party Name / Intervenor:		Canadian Man	Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters ("CME")			
Party or Group that made the	e disbursement:	Borden Ladner	Borden Ladner Gervais – Peter C.P. Thompson			
	NET	гсоят	GST			
Photocopies	16	5.25	8.26			
Courier	2	5.28	1.26			
	(0.00	0.00			
				GRAND TOTAL:		
SUB-TOTAL:	\$ 19	0.53	\$ 9.52	\$ 200.05		

SUMMARY STATEMENT OF HOURS - CONSULTANT AND LEGAL COUNSEL

A separate form is required for each consultant or legal counsel

EB-2007-0905		<u>Canadian Man</u>	u facturers & Exporters ("CME")
Board File No.		Party Name / Inter	venor
Vincent J. DeRose	2001		Borden Ladner Gervais LLP
Legal Counsel Name	Year of Call		Law Firm
N/A Consultant Name	N/A Years of Relev (curriculum vitae m	ant Experience	N/A Consultant Firm

	Hours	Hourly Rate	Sub-Total	GST	Total
Preparation (Prep)	1.3	\$230.00	299.00	14.95	313.95
Attendance Technical Conference (Attend TC)	0.0	\$230.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
Attendance Settlement Conference (Attend SC)	0.0	\$230.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
Attendance Oral Hearing (Attend OH)	0.0	\$230.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
Argument (Argument)	0.0	\$230.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
Case Management (CM)	0.0	\$230.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
TOTALS:	1.3		\$ 299.00	\$ 14.95	\$ 313.95

Note: All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate: _____; and country of initial currency: _____;

.

DETAILED STATEMENT OF HOURS - Vincent J. DeRose							
Date	Description of Services	Time	Allocation				
05-Nov-08	Reviewing OPG Decision	1.3	Prep				
	TOTAL HOURS:	1.3					